### 1. SEDGWICK COUNTY WORK RELEASE MASTER CONTROL, PARKING LOT & ADA UPGRADES-FACILITIES DEPARTMENT FUNDING - FACILITIES DEPARTMENT

(Request sent to 229 vendors)

#### RFB #16-0031 S/C #8000086337

	Walz Harman Huffman Construction Inc.		Compton Construction Services	
Lump Sum, Base Bid	\$859,0	00.00	\$837,000.00	
Days to Substantial Completion	28	0		220
Days to Final Completion	20	)	30	
Total Calendar Days	30	0	250	
Alternate 1, ADA Holding Cell Improvements	\$25,00	00.00	\$20,300.00	
Alternate 2, Detention Door Improvements	\$131,0	00.00	\$137,800.00	
Alternate 3, Facility-Wide Paging System	\$56,00	00.00	\$54,800.00	
Alternate 4, Floor Improvements in Dormitories	\$33,00	00.00	\$64,800.00	
Alternate 5, Floor Improvements in Administration	\$6,600.00		\$10,500.00	
Each, Wheel Stops	\$44.00		\$46.00	
Bid Bond	Y		Y	
Acknowledge Addenda	Y	•	Y	
No Bids	Evans Building Co., Inc.	American Control & Engineering Service, Inc.	Key Construction, Inc.	Hentzen Contractors, Inc.
	Andale Paving, Inc.	The Best Home Guys	Mark Goldman & Associates	Wildcat Construction Company, Inc.
	Dustrol Inc.	G & G Dozer	Morrow Engineering, Inc.	Surface Protections Services, LLC
	Accel Construction LLC	Van Asdale Construction Company	Bauer & Son Construction Co., Inc.	Sauerwein Construction Co., Inc.
	Com-Tec Security LLC	Greening Construction, Inc.	RFIP, Inc.	McConnell & Associates Corp.
	Dondlinger & Sons Construction	DLR Group		

On behalf of the Facilities Department, recommend to accept the base bid with alternates 1 and 4 in the amount of \$917,000.00 from Walz Harman Huffman Construction, Inc.

This work includes upgrades to the Master Control System, ADA and parking lot improvements at the Work Release Facility located at 701 W. Harry.

## 2. POINT TO POINT CONNECTIONS and INTERNET ACCESS--DIVISION OF INFORMATION AND OPERATIONS FUNDING -- DIVISION OF INFORMATION AND OPERATIONS

(Request sent to 2 vendors)

### RFB #16-0048 Contract

	Cox Communications Kansas, LLC		Level 3 Communications, Inc.	
	One-Time Installation	Monthly Rate (60 months fixed	One-Time Installation	Monthly Rate (60 months fixed
	Charges	rate)	Charges	rate)
Internet Access - 714 N Main	\$0.00	\$2,000.00	\$0.00	\$1,218.82
Point to Point 1919 N Amidon to 714 N Main	\$0.00	\$850.00	\$0.00	\$895.35
Point to Point 1210 S Topeka to 714 N Main	\$0.00	\$850.00	\$0.00	\$1,001.61
Point to Point 1921 W 21st St North to 714 N Main	\$0.00	\$850.00	\$0.00	\$895.35
Point to Point 1144 S Seneca to 714 N Main	\$0.00	\$850.00	\$0.00	\$895.35
Point to Point 4035 E Harry to 714 N Main	\$0.00	\$850.00	\$0.00	\$895.35
Taxes	\$0.00	\$277.53	\$0.00	\$0.00
Total	\$0.00	\$6,527.53	\$0.00	\$5,801.83
Grand Total (60 months service)	\$391,6	551.80	\$34	8,109.80

On behalf of the Division of Information and Operations, recommend to accept the low bid from Level 3 Communications, Inc. for an estimated monthly cost of \$5,801.83 for 60 months for an estimated grand total of \$348,109.80.

This project will add Internet access to the data center at 714 N. Main and run new point to point circuits from the locations listed above back to this data center. This will expand bandwidth around the county and provide a backup Internet circuit for the county as well.

Cox Communications Kansas, LLC has been the single provider of data circuits with Internet access until Level 3 Communications, Inc. recently entered the Wichita market providing these services.

## 3. ON-CALL TORNADO SIREN MAINTENANCE & REPAIR -- EMERGENC FUNDING -- EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT

(Request sent to 27 vendors)

### RFP #16-0045 Contract

	ANS Services	
1. Cost plus percent mark up for all parts	5.00%	
2. Hour, Normal Working Hours Monday-Friday 7 a.m 6:00 p.m.	\$110.00	
3. Hour, Overtime Monday - Friday 6:00 p.m. to 6:59 a.m.	\$155.00	
4. Hour, Saturday, Sunday and Holidays	\$155.00	
5. Hour, Service Call Charge	No Charge	
6. Hour, Emergency Call Charge	No Charge	
7. Storage Fees (if applicable)	No Charge	
8. Each Pole Installation	\$7500.00	
9. Each Pole Removal	\$3750.00	
10.Each 55 Foot Class 2 Wooden Poles	\$950.00	
11. Complete Siren Maintenance and Management	\$217,000.00 Per Year	
	Code 3, Inc.	
No Bids	Honeywell First Responder	
	Safer Services Corp.	

On behalf of Emergency Management, recommend to accept the proposal from P establish contract pricing for three (3) years with two (2) one (1) year options to

A review committee comprised of John Crosby - Emergency Management and Kris reviewed the responses and agreed that Phillips Southern Electric offered the best s the county.

Philips Southern Electric has provided Sedgwick County with tornado siren repair a years.

### 'Y MANAGEMENT

Phillips Southern Electric			
15.00%			
\$106.00			
\$126.50			
\$170.00			
No Charge			
No Charge			
No Charge			
\$5500.00			
\$1000.00			
\$1000.00			
Included in hourly rate, one hour maximum			
Sims Electric Service, Inc.			
Rapid Notify, Inc.			
Safetycom, Inc.			

## 'hillips Southern Electric and to renew.

sten McGovern - Purchasing solution to meet the needs of

and maintenance for over 25

# 4. ON-CALL TRANSLATION SERVICES -- VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS <u>FUNDING -- VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS</u>

(Request sent to 88 vendors)

### RFP #16-0034 Contract

	Bridging The Gap Interpreting, LLC
1. Rates for standard service	\$60.00 per hour in person (2 hour minimum) plus round trip mileage @ \$.054 per mile
2. Rates for evenings, weekends, and holidays	\$60.00 per hour in person (2 hour minimum) plus round trip mileage @ \$.054 per mile
3. Rates for emergency service	\$60.00 per hour in person (2 hour minimum) plus round trip mileage @ \$.054 per mile
4. Monthly Flat Rate for 18th Judicial District Court	\$15,000.00
	JRivera Associates, Inc.
1. Rates for standard service	\$40.00-\$90.00* per hour in person, \$39.00 per hour telephonic, \$0.17 per word translation.
2. Rates for evenings, weekends, and holidays	\$40.00-\$90.00* per hour in person \$39.00 per hour (depending on language), \$45.00 - \$50.00 telephonic, \$0.17- \$0.21 per word translation.
3. Rates for emergency service	\$50.00-\$90.00* per hour in person, \$55.00 telephonic, \$0.26 per word translation.
4. Monthly Flat Rate for 18th Judicial District Court	\$11,250.00
	Multilingual Links, LLC

1. Rates for standard service	\$45.00 per hour (2 hour minimum), \$45.00 per hour in person, \$0.33 per word document translation
2. Rates for evenings, weekends, and holidays	\$45.00 per hour in person (2 hour minimum)
3. Rates for emergency service	\$55.00 per hour in person (2 hour minimum)
4. Monthly Flat Rate for 18th Judicial District Court	\$19,300.00
,	World Wide Interpreters
1. Rates for standard service	\$85.00 per hour in person translation. \$0.54 per minute telephonic interpretation. \$45.00 per page document translation.
2. Rates for evenings, weekends, and holidays	\$110.00 per hour in person translation. \$0.56 per minute telephonic interpretation. \$50.00 per page document translation.
3. Rates for emergency service	\$110.00 per hour in person translation. \$0.56 per minute telephonic interpretation. \$55.00 per page document translation.
Monthly Flat Rate for 18th Judicial District Court	\$26,532.50
1. Rates for standard service	Access 2 Interpreters  \$0.18 - \$0.30 per word (\$65.00 per document minimum, plus \$40.00 per hour formatting fee)

No Bid
\$15.00 next day turn around less than 360 words. Rush fee \$80.00 for documents in non-editable format.
No Bid
Reliable Interpretations & Translations
\$29.00 per hour in person translation (2 hour minimum)
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
Confluent
Corporate Translation Servi
Optimal Phor
Interpreting S Reyes-Alcala Hispan
Reyes-Aicaia Hispan Leyda's
Carmazzi Glo

On behalf of various county departments recommend to accept the proposals from Bridging The All World Language Consultants, Inc., JRivera Associates, Inc., Foreign Language Interpret Propio Language Services for items 1-3, Interlingual Services items 1 & 4, Reliable Interpret for item 1 only, and establish contract pricing for three (3) years with two (2) one (1) year opt

In evaluating the County's past and current usage of translation services it was determined to be in to establish contracts with more than one vendor. Having this flexibility will minimize possible sch provide more options in choosing the best rates based on the anticipated length of the service call.

<sup>\*</sup>Range based on selected language.

<sup>\*\*20</sup> miles outside Wichita

## All World Language Consultants, Inc.

\$65.00 per hour in person interpretation, \$1.25 per minute telephonic interpretation

\$70.00 per hour in person interpretation, \$1.25 per minute telephonic interpretation

\$70.00 per hour in person interpretation, \$1.25 per minute telephonic interpretation

No Bid

### **Interlingual Services**

\$42.50 per hour in person and telephonic interpretation

No Bid

No Bid

\$10,000.00

**Propio Language Services** 

\$1.45 - \$2.95 per video-remote, maximum monthly charge per department is \$50.00 or \$300.00 maximum for entire county. \$0.55 -\$0.94 per minute telephonic. \$0.10 -\$0.26 per word document translation \$25.00 minimum same as above same as above No Bid **Foreign Language Interpreter Services Inc.** \$35.00-\$45.00\*\* per hour in person interpretation plus \$0.40 per mile outside of Wichita same as above same as above No Bid **Indus Translation Services** 

\$0.15 - \$0.22 per word document translation

## \$0.15 - \$0.22 per word document translation

\$0.15 - \$0.22 per word document translation

### No Bid

### Telelanguage

\$79.00 - \$89.00 per hour in person translation. \$1.29 per minute telephonic interpretation. \$0.23 - \$0.34 per word document translation.

\$79.00 - \$89.00 per hour in person translation. \$1.29 per minute telephonic interpretation. \$0.23 - \$0.34 per word document translation.

\$79.00 - \$89.00 per hour in person translation. \$1.29 per minute telephonic interpretation. \$0.23 - \$0.34 per word document translation.

\$19,750.00 On Site \$13,350.00 Telephonic Interpretation

**Franslations** 

es dba CTS Language Link

e Interpreters

olutions, LLC

c Consulting Service

Services

bal Solutions

**:** Gap Interpreting, LLC, ter Services, Inc. and tations & Translations tions to renew.

the County's best interests reduling conflicts and