BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACT JUNE 2, 2016

1. 2016 COLD IN-PLACE RECYCLING (R175D) -- PUBLIC WORKS <u>FUNDING -- R175 PREVENTIVE MX-16</u>

(Request sent to 46 vendors)

RFB #16-0055 S/C #8000087428

Engineer's Estimate: \$1,326,565.75	Coughlin Company I, Inc.	Koss Construction Company
Cold In-Place Recycling and Pavement Marking on selected roads in Sedgwick County, Kansas	\$880,743.11	\$1,064,467.21
Bid Bond	Y	Y
Acknowledge Addenda	Y	Y
	Cornejo & Sons, LLC	Wildcat Construction Co., Inc.
	Unruh Excavating	Dondlinger & Sons Construction
No Bids	Nowak Construction	Bob Bergkamp Construction
	Reece Construction	APAC-Kansas, Inc., Shears Division
	Pearson Construction LLC	Hacker Brothers

On behalf of Public Works, recommend to accept the low bid from Coughlin Company I, Inc. in the amount of \$880,743.11.

This is a pavement preservation process that requires specialized equipment, materials and knowledge. As a result, there are a limited number of vendors in the county that can perform this process.

This project is for approximately 8.82 miles of selected county roads.

2. ALL-WHEEL DRIVE, ARTICULATED CENTER, WHEEL LOADER -- FLEET MANAGEMENT <u>FUNDING -- ALL WHEEL DRIVE ARTICULATED CENTRAL LOAD</u>

(Request sent to 84 vendors)

RFP #16-0047 SC #8000087305

	Murphy Tractor & Equipment	Berry Tractor & Equipment Co.	GW VanKeppel	
Make/Model	John Deerer 644K	Komatsu WA380- 8	Volvo L110H	
1 each, All-Wheel Drive, Articulated Center, Wheeled Loaders	\$263,471.00	\$232590.00 - A	\$284,325.00	
1 each, All-Wheel Drive, Articulated Center, Wheeled Loaders, Unit Price with bucket and forks	\$263,471.00	\$252500.00 - B	\$284,325.00	
3 each, Operators Manuals	\$25.00 ea \$75.00	Included	Included	
3 each, Parts Manuals	\$124.33 ea \$373.00	Included	Included	
3 each, Repair Manuals	\$90.00 ea \$270.00	Included	Included	
Total Extended Price	\$526,942.00	\$485,090.00	\$568,650.00	
Delivery	45 - 60 Days	40 - 90 Days	60 - 90 Days	
	Hourly Labor	Rate		
Cost Year 1	\$105.00	\$85.00	\$125.00 Shop \$135.00 Field	
Cost Year 2	\$105.00	\$85.00	\$125.00 Shop \$135.00 Field	
Cost Year 3	\$105.00	\$85.00	\$125.00 Shop \$135.00 Field	
Parts: cost + mark up	8.00%	15.00%	2.00%	
Freight Charge for pick up and delivery (one way)	\$200.00	\$250.00	\$350.00	
	Wichita Kenworth	Andy Mohr Truck Center	John Deere Company	Doonan Truck
	Hoxie Implement	Altec Inc.	American Equipment	Rusty Eck Ford
No Bid	Bobcat of Salina, Inc.	Leachrod, LLC	Stamm Manufacturing	Kirby-Smith Machnery
	Halco Inc.	Prairieland Partners	Konecranes	Wichita Tractor
	Jayhawk Crane	Sellers Equipment	Victor L Phillips	Foley Equipment

On behalf of Fleet Management, recommend to accept the best proposal from Berry Tractor & Equipment Co. in the amount of \$485,090.00 and establish contract pricing for labor, parts, and freight for repairs for three (3) years.

A review committee consisting of Penny Poland and Rex Victory - Fleet Management, Robert Kraus and Jon Medlam - Public Works, and Britt Rosencutter - Purchasing, evaluated proposals and short-listed and received two (2) demonstrations on Komatsu WA380-8 and John Deere 644K. The Komatsu WA380-8 is the best choice based on meeting specifications, low bid and operatior evaluation of Loader demo.

These are replacement vehicles for Public Works, surplus to be sold on Purple Wave, Inc.

BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS JUNE 2, 2016

BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS JUNE 2, 2016

3. ON-CALL CARPET SERVICES -- FACILITIES DEPARTMENT <u>FUNDING -- FACILITIES DEPARTMENT</u>

(Request sent to 36 vendors)

RFB #16-0032 Contract

KFB #10-0032 Collifact	Harry Street Carpet, LLC
Broadloom	
Manufacturer: Patcraft, IO164	
1. Per Sq. Yd., Broadloom installed with vendor moving furniture	\$20.95
1a. Per Sq.Yd., Broadloom installed with county staff moving furniture	\$18.95
Carpet Tiles	
Manufacturer: Patcraft, IO166	
3. Per Sq. Yd., Carpet Tiles installed with vendor moving furniture	\$31.99
3a. Per Sq. Yd., Carpet Tiles installed with county staff moving furniture	\$29.99
Manufacturer: Patcraft, IO274	
4. Per Sq. Yd., Carpet Tiles installed with vendor moving furniture	\$30.49
4a. Per Sq. Yd., Carpet Tiles installed with county staff moving furniture	\$28.49
Manufacturer: Mannington Commercial, 43161	
5. Per Sq. Yd., Carpet Tiles installed with vendor moving furniture	\$33.96
5a. Per Sq. Yd., Carpet Tiles installed with county staff moving furniture	\$31.96
ECOWORX Performance Broadloom	
Manufacturer: Patcraft IO165	
6. Per Sq. Yd., ECOWORX Performance Broadloom installed with vendor moving furniture	\$26.23
6a. Per Sq. Yd., ECOWORX Performance Broadloom installed with county staff moving furniture	\$24.23
Manufacturer: Patcraft, IO278	
7. Per Sq. Yd., ECOWORX Performance Broadloom installed with vendor moving furniture	\$26.23
7a. Per Sq. Yd., ECOWORX Performance Broadloom installed with county staff moving furniture	\$24.23
8. Per Linear ft., Vinyl 4" Base installation, including removing existing vinyl base, prepping wall and re-installation new wall base vinyl (labor and material)	\$1.54
9. Hourly Labor Rate, standard business hours	\$30.00
10. Hourly Labor Rate, overtime/after hours	\$30.00
11. Percentage of mark-up added to vendor's material costs for extraordinary floor	
prep work, and for materials and hard surface product materials such as VCT or	10%
ceramic materials	
	The Décor Center
	National Flooring, Inc.
	Daniksco Office Interiors
No Bids	LLC dba Scott Rice Office
	Interiors

BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS JUNE 2, 2016

Continental Flooring
Lowes

On behalf of the Facilities Department, recommend to accept the bid from Harry Street Carpet, LLC at the rates listed for one (1) year with two (2) one (1) year options to renew.

This vendor will provide carpet and installation services for various county projects. Harry Street Carpet, LLC is currently providing these services. The county spent approximately \$107,222.27 in 2015.

Vendors that did not bid stated that they did not have the time or staffing to service the county's needs on a regular on-call basis.

4. HVAC SUPPLIES -- FACILITIES DEPARTMENT <u>FUNDING -- FACILITIES DEPARTMENT</u>

(Request sent to 45 vendors)

RFB #16-0051 CONTRACT

	Tri-Dim Filter Corporation		Wichita Air	Wichita Air Filter Supply		Grainger	
Filter Size	Price Per Each	Brand Quoted	Price Per Each	Brand Quoted	Price Per Each	Brand Quoted	
1. 10x20x1	\$2.03	Tri-Dim	\$2.03	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	\$2.75	Air Handler	
2. 10x59x.5	\$3.25	Tri-Dim	\$7.34	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	No Bid	No Bid	
3. 11x16x1	\$2.03	Tri-Dim	\$2.95	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	No Bid	No Bid	
4. 11x45.75x1	\$6.50	Tri-Dim	\$7.34	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	No Bid	No Bid	
5. 12x20x1	\$2.03	Tri-Dim	\$2.08	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	\$2.89	Air Handler	
6. 12x24x1	\$2.03	Tri-Dim	\$2.03	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	\$2.46	Air Handler	
7. 12x24x2	\$2.04	Tri-Dim	\$2.17	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	\$2.41	Air Handler	
8. 14x20x2	\$2.13	Tri-Dim	\$2.64	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	\$3.11	Air Handler	
9. 14x24x2	\$3.56	Tri-Dim	\$4.53	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	No Bid	No Bid	
10. 14x25x1	\$2.28	Tri-Dim	\$2.27	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	\$2.69	Air Handler	
11. 14x25x2	\$2.37	Tri-Dim	\$2.55	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	\$3.54	Air Handler	

12. 15.75x65.75x1	\$8.50	Tri-Dim	\$9.88	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	No Bid	No Bid
13. 15x20x2	\$2.13	Tri-Dim	\$2.31	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	\$4.05	Air Handler
14. 16x16x2	\$2.26	Tri-Dim	\$2.97	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	\$4.20	Air Handler
15. 16x20x1	\$2.08	Tri-Dim	\$1.82	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	\$2.29	Air Handler
16. 16x20x2	\$2.13	Tri-Dim	\$2.19	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	\$2.28	Air Handler
17. 16x20x4	\$3.34	Tri-Dim	\$3.65	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	\$5.07	Air Handler
18. 16x24x1	\$2.22	Tri-Dim	\$2.85	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	\$2.95	Air Handler
19. 16x24x2	\$2.37	Tri-Dim	\$2.94	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	\$3.28	Air Handler
20. 16x25x1	\$2.10	Tri-Dim	\$2.22	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	\$2.48	Air Handler
21. 16x25x2	\$2.37	Tri-Dim	\$2.50	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	\$2.56	Air Handler
22. 16.25x25x1	\$2.22	Tri-Dim	\$4.60	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	No Bid	No Bid
23. 16.875x16.875x1	\$3.17	Tri-Dim	\$3.69	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	No Bid	No Bid
24. 17x19x1	\$3.62	Tri-Dim	\$4.15	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	\$3.48	Air Handler

25. 18x18x1	\$3.27	Tri-Dim	\$4.10	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	\$3.25	Air Handler
26. 18x20x2	\$2.37	Tri-Dim	\$2.94	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	\$3.49	Air Handler
27. 18x24x2	\$2.47	Tri-Dim	\$2.85	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	\$4.36	Air Handler
28. 19.5x30.5x2	\$2.35	Tri-Dim	\$5.40	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	No Bid	No Bid
29. 20x20x1	\$2.22	Tri-Dim	\$2.23	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	\$2.48	Air Handler
30. 20x20x2	\$2.37	Tri-Dim	\$2.53	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	\$2.59	Air Handler
31. 20x21x1	\$3.94	Tri-Dim	\$4.59	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	\$3.84	Air Handler
32. 20x22x1	\$2.22	Tri-Dim	\$4.10	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	\$3.94	Air Handler
33. 20x24x1	\$2.25	Tri-Dim	\$2.60	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	\$3.46	Air Handler
34. 20x24x2	\$2.57	Tri-Dim	\$2.98	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	\$2.96	Air Handler
35. 20x25x1	\$2.42	Tri-Dim	\$2.55	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	\$2.76	Air Handler
36. 20x25x2	\$2.62	Tri-Dim	\$2.89	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	\$3.00	Air Handler
37. 20x20x2	\$2.37	Tri-Dim	\$2.54	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	\$2.59	Air Handler

38. 20x30x1	\$3.01	Tri-Dim	\$3.33	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	\$4.38	Air Handler
39. 20x32x1	\$3.15	Tri-Dim	\$5.33	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	No Bid	No Bid
40. 22x30x1	\$5.29	Tri-Dim	\$5.33	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	No Bid	No Bid
41. 24x24x1	\$2.62	Tri-Dim	\$2.90	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	\$3.53	Air Handler
42. 24x24x2	\$2.85	Tri-Dim	\$3.25	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	\$3.09	Air Handler
43. 25x25x1	\$2.95	Tri-Dim	\$3.25	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	\$4.35	Air Handler
44. 25x29x4	\$10.50	Tri-Dim	\$6.63	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	\$10.12	Air Handler
45. 33.5x9x1	\$5.95	Tri-Dim	\$4.15	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	No Bid	No Bid
46. 69.75x10.875x.75	\$10.50	Tri-Dim	\$8.27	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	No Bid	No Bid
47. 8.25x43.75x1	\$5.78	Tri-Dim	\$5.93	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	No Bid	No Bid
48. 8.5 x 27.5 x .5	\$2.50	Tri-Dim	\$3.33	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	No Bid	No Bid
49. 8.875x19.125x1	\$2.50	Tri-Dim	\$2.97	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	No Bid	No Bid
50. 8.875x24.125x1	\$2.50	Tri-Dim	\$3.35	Glasfloss ZL Pleat from Wichita Air Filter Supply	No Bid	No Bid

				Glasfloss ZL Pleat		
51. 8.875x33.625x1	\$2.85	Tri-Dim	\$4.15	from Wichita Air Filter Supply	No Bid	No Bid
				Glasfloss ZL Pleat		
52. 8.875x42.125x1	\$2.95	Tri-Dim	\$5.93	from Wichita Air Filter Supply	No Bid	No Bid
				Glasfloss ZL Pleat		
53. 8.875x61.125x1	\$3.50	Tri-Dim	\$7.35	from Wichita Air	No Bid	No Bid
				Filter Supply		
				Glasfloss ZL Pleat		
54. 8x20x1	\$3.30	Tri-Dim	\$2.97	from Wichita Air	\$3.15	Air Handler
				Filter Supply Glasfloss ZL Pleat		
55. 8x32x1	\$4.00	Tri-Dim	\$3.69	from Wichita Air	No Bid	No Bid
55. 085281	ψπου		ψ5.07	Filter Supply	No Dia	No blu
				Glasfloss ZL Pleat		
56. 9x24x1	\$2.98	Tri-Dim	\$3.35	from Wichita Air	\$3.64	Air Handler
				Filter Supply		
57 Mar 12 10 04 10	# 31 .00	T : D:	¢<1.15	Glasfloss Magna	¢10.54	A
57. Merv 13 12x24x12	\$31.00	Tri-Dim	\$61.15	from Wichita Air Filter Supply	\$12.54	Air Handler
				Glasfloss Magna		
58. Merv 13 24x24x12	\$42.00	Tri-Dim	\$87.50	from Wichita Air	\$16.37	Air Handler
				Filter Supply		
				Glasfloss Fiberglass		
59. Fiber Filter 9.75x21x.75x1	\$1.50	Tri-Dim	\$2.29	Disposable from	No Bid	No Bid
				Wichita Air Filter		
				Glasfloss Fiberglass		
60. Fiber Filter 22x22x.5 (1/2")	\$1.75	Tri-Dim	\$2.69	Disposable from	\$0.88	Air Handler
00. 1100 1 Hor 22x22x10 (1/2)	<i>Q</i>		¢2.09	Wichita Air Filter	\$0.00	
Belt Type	Price Per Each	Brand Quoted	Price Per Each	Brand Quoted	Price Per Each	Brand Quoted
1. 4L240	\$2.82	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$1.49	Dayton
2. A41	\$4.49	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3. A42	\$4.59	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$3.58	Dayton
4. A46	\$4.83	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$3.78	Dayton
5. A51	\$5.08	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$3.87	Dayton
6. 1-B46	\$6.97	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$5.05	Dayton
7. 1-5vx530	\$16.47	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$18.08	Dayton

8. 2-5vx500	\$15.81	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9. 2-5vx530	\$16.47	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10. 2-5vx590	\$18.15	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
11. 2-5vx630	\$20.88	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12. 2-5vx710	\$22.12	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13. 2-B60	\$7.53	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$25.01	Dayton
14. 2-B62	\$7.73	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$29.27	Dayton
15. 2-B72	\$8.70	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$34.01	Dayton
16. 2-B78	\$9.41	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$32.53	Dayton
17. 2-B82	\$10.04	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$34.19	Dayton
18. 2-B87	\$10.50	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$36.29	Dayton
19. 2-B88	\$10.58	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
20. 2-BX40	\$7.43	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
21. 2-BX60	\$9.72	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
22. 2-BX62	\$9.95	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
23. 2-BX70	\$10.97	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
24. 2-BX93	\$14.56	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
25. 2-CX60	\$17.49	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
26. 3-5vx1120	\$35.51	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
27. 3-5vx530	\$16.47	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
28. 3-B73	\$8.80	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$45.66	Dayton
29. 3-B88	\$10.58	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
30. 3-B89	\$10.70	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
31. 3-BX103	\$15.88	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
32. 3-BX85	\$13.28	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
33. 3-BX88	\$13.67	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
34. 3L-210	\$2.67	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$1.76	Dayton
35. 3L250	\$2.67	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$1.76	Dayton
36. 4-5vx1180	\$37.44	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
37. 4L160	\$2.82	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$1.44	Dayton
38. 4L170	\$2.82	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$1.78	Dayton
39. 4L180	\$2.82	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$1.70	Dayton
40. 4L190	\$2.82	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$1.76	Dayton
41. 4L200	\$2.82	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$1.40	Dayton
42. 4L210	\$2.82	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$1.49	Dayton
43. 41220	\$2.82	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$4.34	Dayton
44. 4L-230	\$2.82	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$1.49	Dayton
45. 4L-300	\$3.04	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$2.00	Dayton
46. 4L440	\$3.92	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$3.02	Dayton
47. 4L450	\$3.97	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$2.80	Dayton
48. 4L530	\$4.31	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$3.44	Dayton

49. 4L550	\$4.41	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$3.22	Dayton
50. 5VX450	\$14.22	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$14.18	Dayton
51. 5VX690	\$21.47	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$16.83	Dayton
52. A20	\$3.30	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$1.84	Dayton
53. A21	\$3.30	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$2.08	Dayton
54. A24	\$3.33	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$3.76	Dayton
55. A26	\$3.36	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$2.07	Dayton
56. A28	\$3.58	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$2.46	Dayton
57. A36	\$4.10	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$2.14	Dayton
58. A37	\$4.20	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$2.80	Dayton
59. A39	\$4.35	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$3.24	Dayton
60. A40	\$4.42	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$2.39	Dayton
61. A42	\$4.59	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$2.39	Dayton
62. A43	\$4.67	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$3.31	Dayton
63. A45	\$4.79	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$3.66	Dayton
64. A46	\$4.83	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
65. A46 (4L480)	\$4.35	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$3.22	Dayton
66. A50	\$5.00	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$3.78	Dayton
67. A56	\$5.38	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$4.46	Dayton
68. A63	\$5.83	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$5.00	Dayton
69. AX36	\$5.27	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$4.98	Dayton
70. AX38	\$5.52	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$5.16	Dayton
71. AX39	\$5.62	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$5.80	Dayton
72. AX40	\$5.69	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$5.42	Dayton
73. AX42	\$5.93	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$5.58	Dayton
74. AX44	\$6.11	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$6.88	Dayton
75. AX48	\$6.35	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$5.98	Dayton
76. AX49	\$6.41	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$6.00	Dayton
77. AX50	\$6.50	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$8.10	Dayton
78. B57	\$7.87	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$6.15	Dayton
79. B60	\$8.04	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$6.45	Dayton
80. B66	\$8.66	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$6.86	Dayton
81. B68	\$8.83	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$7.27	Dayton
82. BX38	\$7.58	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$7.88	Dayton
83. BX41	\$8.11	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$8.62	Dayton
84. BX42	\$8.26	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$8.58	Dayton
85. BX44	\$8.64	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$8.75	Dayton
86. BX47	\$9.12	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$9.74	Dayton

87. BX48	\$9.24	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$9.56	Dayton
88. BX49	\$9.39	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$10.17	Dayton
89. BX52	\$9.78	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$10.16	Dayton
90. BX62	\$10.62	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$11.04	Dayton
91. BX63	\$10.75	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	\$10.20	Dayton
92. M401182 (A65)	\$5.93	Continental	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

On behalf of the Facilities Department, recommend to accept the overall low bid from Tri-Dim Filter Corporation and establish contract pricing for one (1) year, with two (2) one year options to renew.

A review committee consisting of Greg Tuxhorn - Facilities Department and Britt Rosencutter - Purchasing, reviewed bids received and chose Tri-Dim Filter Corporation based on low pricing and having the most complete inventory available for Sedgwick County's needs.