
BID OPENING APRIL 30, 2013

      RFB #13-0040

Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

Kansas 

Filtration
Johnstone Supply Fastenal

Total Filtration 

Services

1. 10x20x1 2.07 2.00 2.35 2.4035 1.66

2.  10x59x5 1.15 3.22 No Bid 7.6600 7.36

3.  11x16x1 2.07 3.02 3.66 3.9900 4.43

4.  11x45.75x1 6.25 5.89 7.90 9.4500 7.36

5.  12x20x1 2.07 3.07 2.47 3.1500 1.76

6.  12x24x1 2.07 2.16 2.55 2.7056 1.75

7.  12x24x2 2.27 1.93 2.28 2.6794 2.03

8.  14x20x2 2.43 2.20 2.60 2.8895 2.15

9.  14x24x2 5.35 4.82 5.19 6.6300 5.69

10.  14x25x1 2.59 2.46 2.89 2.9026 1.95

11.  14x25x2 2.77 2.48 2.93 3.2647 2.44

12.  15.75x65.75x1 8.93 8.32 13.00 17.3000 15.07

13.  15x20x2 2.53 2.27 2.68 2.6500 2.14

14.  16x16x2 3.81 3.95 4.85 3.0400 2.67

15.  16x20x1 2.03 2.07 2.46 2.3641 1.72

16.  16x20x2 2.24 2.15 2.53 2.8283 1.85

17.  16x20x4 3.80 4.19 5.52 5.7828 4.37

18.  16x24x1 2.63 3.64 2.44 3.2000 2.00

19.  16x24x2 2.75 2.38 2.82 3.2800 2.40

20.  16x25x1 2.33 2.12 2.60 2.3463 1.92

21.  16x25x2 2.49 2.41 2.89 3.2323 2.12

22.  16.25x25x1 5.39 3.94 2.60 5.9700 5.73

23.  16.875x16.875x1 4.39 3.69 3.92 4.0800 5.02

24.  17x19x1 5.05 3.67 3.70 5.2300 5.22

25.  18x18x1 4.39 4.07 2.75 3.0700 2.56

26.  18x20x2 3.59 3.25 2.80 3.2100 2.79

27.  18x24x2 2.84 2.49 2.94 3.0300 2.65

28.  19.5x30.5x2 4.59 5.77 10.49 11.0200 10.93

29.  20x20x1 2.31 2.20 2.74 2.3463 1.92

30.  20x20x2 2.49 2.40 2.93 3.2323 2.11

31.  20x21x1 4.82 4.14 3.73 5.9800 5.73

32.  20x22x1 4.82 4.14 4.07 5.9800 3.05

33.  20x24x1 2.59 2.46 2.89 3.4100 2.22

34.  20x24x2 2.90 2.63 3.10 3.3000 2.74

35.  20x25x1 2.61 2.48 3.02 2.6732 2.22

36.  20x25x2 2.79 2.73 3.34 3.7374 2.46

37.  20x20x2 2.49 2.40 2.93 2.6500 2.10

38.  20x30x1 3.49 4.66 3.00 3.9400 3.33

39.  20x32x1 6.18 5.29 8.14 6.1400 8.35

Filters

4.  HVAC SUPPLIES -- FACILITIES DEPARTMENT 

     FUNDING -- FACILITIES DEPARTMENT 

     ( Request sent to 27 vendors) 

4.  HVAC SUPPLIES -- FACILITIES DEPARTMENT 

     FUNDING -- FACILITIES DEPARTMENT 

     ( Request sent to 27 vendors) 



BID OPENING APRIL 30, 2013

40.  22x30x1 7.43 4.87 4.55 6.1400 8.59

41.  24x24x1 2.90 2.74 3.24 3.7879 2.27

42.  24x24x2 3.09 2.85 3.35 4.1919 2.78

43.  25x25x1 3.51 3.10 3.65 3.7700 2.58

44.  25x29x4 7.41 13.04 7.58 11.5200 7.79

45.  33.5x9x1 5.15 5.01 7.48 5.2300 6.94

46.  69.75x10.875x.75 6.99 11.58 12.79 9.9600 15.02

47.  8.25x43.75x1 5.09 5.01 7.48 9.2300 6.94

48.  8.5x27.5x.5 1.01 2.56 2.27 3.0900 4.73

49.  8.875x19.125x1 3.89 2.56 1.98 2.9300 4.42

50.  8.875x24.125x1 4.32 2.65 2.04 3.0900 4.73

51.  8.875x33.625x1 5.23 2.65 2.15 3.0900 6.60

52.  8.875x42.125x1 5.37 2.78 4.50 6.7000 6.94

53.  8.875x61.125x1 6.59 3.22 4.78 6.9700 13.28

54.  8x20x1 3.59 3.11 3.65 3.9900 4.42

55.  8x32x1 3.93 3.69 7.48 4.0800 6.60

56.  9x24x1 4.06 2.95 3.92 4.0800 4.73

57.  Merv 13; 12x24x12 48.30 37.50 34.39 no bid 33.64

58.  Merv 13; 24x24x12 69.95 53.50 45.32 no bid 48.41

59.  Fiber Filter; 9.75x21x.75x1 2.22 2.65 2.04 no bid 2.41

60.  Fiber Filter; 22x22x.5 (1/2 inch) 2.49 3.00 2.35 no bid 2.87

Brand Glasfloss Koch Flanders Koch Purolator

61. 4L240 4.62 3.03 1.5444 3.14

62.  A41 6.96 5.50 6.7375 4.69

63.  A42 7.11 5.64 7.0224 4.79

64.  A46 7.44 5.90 7.4305 5.03

65.  A51 7.88 6.24 8.1158 5.31

66.  B46 10.76 8.52 6.0255 7.26

67.  5VX530 27.68 20.87 13.9789 18.55

68.  5VX500 28.14 20.04 13.4356 17.82

69.  5VX530 29.29 20.87 15.5610 18.55

70.  5VX590 32.30 23.00 16.6009 20.45

71.  5VX630 34.77 24.77 18.7881 22.03

72.  5VX710 39.35 28.03 12.5741 24.92

73.  B60 13.88 9.83 7.1369 8.37

74.  B62 14.24 12.60 8.1646 8.60

75.  B72 16.04 11.35 8.8302 9.69

76.  B78 17.34 12.29 8.8302 10.48

77.  B82 18.50 13.10 9.4144 11.17

78.  B87 19.32 13.69 9.8355 11.68

79.  B88 19.52 13.82 9.9306 11.78

80.  BX40 12.51 9.34 7.7570 8.35

81.  BX60 17.32 12.28 10.1752 10.68

82.  BX62 17.80 12.60 19.9892 11.15

83.  BX70 19.58 13.87 11.4929 12.29

84.  BX93 26.74 18.42 15.2559 16.31

85.  CX60 29.38 22.08 18.3126 19.58

BELTS

NO BID
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86.  5VX1120 63.11 44.97 30.1451 40.00

87.  5VX530 29.29 20.87 13.9789 18.55

88.  B73 16.23 11.50 8.2597 9.79

89.  B88 19.52 13.82 9.9306 11.78

90.  B89 17.65 13.94 10.0257 11.90

91.  BX103 28.31 20.05 16.6145 17.77

92.  BX85 23.68 16.77 13.8974 14.87

93.  BX88 24.36 17.25 no bid 15.31

94.  3L-210 4.35 2.88 2.3909 2.99

95.  3L250 4.35 2.88 2.3909 2.99

96.  5VX1180 66.55 47.40 71.3000 42.18

97.  4L160 1.69 3.03* 3.1416 3.14

98.  4L170 4.62 3.03 4.9973 3.14

99.  4L180 4.62 3.03 1.5440 3.14

100.  4L190 4.62 3.03 4.9973 3.14

101.  4L200 4.62 3.03 1.5444 3.14

102.  4L210 4.62 3.03 1.5444 3.14

103.  4L220 4.62 3.03 1.5444 3.14

104.  4L-230 4.62 3.03 1.5444 3.14

105.  4L-300 5.00 3.27 5.0743 3.40

106.  4L440 6.41 4.20 6.7760 4.35

107.  4L450 6.53 4.28 6.7375 4.44

108.  41530 7.09 4.64 7.0070 4.79

109.  4L550 7.26 4.74 7.1225 4.91

110.  5VX450 24.02 18.03 15.2845 16.04

111.  5VX690 36.08 53.55 23.4080 24.18

112.  A20 4.41 4.00 3.6806 3.46

113.  A21 4.62 4.03 4.1657 3.46

114.  A24 5.21 4.14 4.4506 3.53

115.  A26 5.38 4.27 4.8433 3.63

116.  A28 5.55 4.39 4.6508 3.74

117.  A36 6.32 5.02 2.2333 4.27

118.  A37 6.50 5.14 6.1831 4.38

119.  A39 6.74 5.34 6.5835 4.55

120.  A40 6.84 5.42 2.4000 4.60

121.  A42 7.11 5.64 7.0224 4.79

122.  A43 7.25 5.73 7.6153 4.88

123.  A45 7.41 5.87 7.8155 5.00

124.  A46 7.44 4.46 7.4305 5.03

125.  A46 (4L480) 6.70 4.46 6.6220 4.55

126.  A50 7.78 6.15 8.0234 5.24

127.  A56 8.31 6.58 8.4161 5.62

128.  A63 9.03 7.14 8.8165 6.09

129.  AX36 8.31 6.27 8.4469 5.54

130.  AX38 8.80 6.54 8.3083 5.81

131.  AX39 8.91 6.68 7.0147 5.91

132.  AX40 9.08 6.80 8.8319 5.99

133.  AX42 9.35 7.04 8.5085 6.24

NO BID
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134.  AX44 9.61 7.18 7.5845 6.42

135.  AX48 10.02 7.53 9.1014 6.67

136.  AX49 10.14 7.58 8.0234 6.76

137.  AX50 10.17 7.73 9.8945 6.81

138.  B57 12.17 9.63 11.6809 8.21

139.  B60 12.43 9.83 12.5741 8.37

140.  B66 13.41 10.62 12.6665 9.05

141.  B68 13.67 10.80 12.8821 9.05

142.  BX38 11.96 9.00 12.9668 7.97

143.  BX41 12.78 9.63 13.3749 8.53

144.  BX42 13.05 9.83 14.2142 8.69

145.  BX44 13.70 10.15 14.0679 9.06

146.  BX47 14.27 10.82 11.2122 9.58

147.  BX48 14.58 10.97 14.8533 9.72

148.  BX49 14.88 11.14 11.5577 9.86

149.  BX52 15.38 11.58 15.9390 10.27

150.  BX62 16.74 12.60 19.9892 11.15

151.  BX63 16.97 12.77 19.6042 11.31

152.  M401182 4.00 5.43 no bid 20.00

Brand NA Gates Browning/*EJames Bando Gates

Other Supplies/Percentage Mark-Up 13% 20% Varies
23% (discount 

off list)
20%

QTab, Inc.
Abatement 

Technologies

Midwest Machinery 

KC

Comfort 

Products

P & E 

Commercial

Innovative 

Building 

Solutions, Inc.

AMC 

Industries, 

LLC

Koch Filter 

Corporation

GT Midwest - 

Wichita 

Division

No Bid 

NO BID


