ITEMS REQUIRING BOCC APPROVAL April 14, 2022 (4 Items)

1. CORRUGATED STEEL (ALUMINIZED) CULVERTS -- PUBLIC WORKS <u>FUNDING -- PUBLIC WORKS</u> (Request sent to 19 vendors)

RFB #22-0026 S/C #Pending

RFB #22-0026 S/C #Pending		I % I Dunius a	- Des du eta Ca
Item – Aluminized Type 2 Material	J & J Drainage Products Co. Ouantity Unit Price Extended P		Extended Price
71	Quantity		\$39,900.00
1. 21"x15"x30' corrugated steel pipe 14 GA	40 16	\$33.25 per foot	\$39,900.00
2. 42"x29"x30' corrugated steel pipe 14 GA	11	\$64.95 per foot	
3. 21"x15"x24' corrugated steel pipe 14 GA	6	\$33.25 per foot	\$8,778.00
4. 28"x20"x24' corrugated steel pipe 14 GA		\$44.35 per foot	\$6,386.40
5. 35"x24"x24' corrugated steel pipe 14 GA	6	\$54.45 per foot	\$7,840.80
6. 18" dimple band	40	\$21.00	\$840.00
7. 24" dimple band	10	\$27.00	\$270.00
8. 36" dimple band	6	\$44.00	\$264.00
9. Freight			\$0.00
Total			\$95,455.20
When can successful vendor start delivery after award of contract?		7-10 days	
T			e Accessories
Item – Aluminized Type 2 Material	Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price
1. 21"x15"x30" corrugated steel pipe 14 GA	40	\$1,148.00	\$12,628.00
2. 42"x29"x30" corrugated steel pipe 14 GA	16	\$2,241.33	\$35,861.28
3. 21"x15"x24' corrugated steel pipe 14 GA	11	\$918.40	\$36,736.00
4. 28"x20"x24' corrugated steel pipe 14 GA	6	\$1,224.53	\$7,347.18
5. 35"x24"x24' corrugated steel pipe 14 GA	6	\$1,503.46	\$9,020.76
6. 18" dimple band	40	\$27.76	\$1,110.40
7. 24" dimple band	10	\$35.92	\$359.20
8. 36" dimple band	6	\$57.70	\$346.20
9. Freight			\$1,200.00
Total			\$104,609.02
When can successful vendor start delivery after award of contract?	3-6 weeks for delivery		
	T	Metal Cul	,
Item – Aluminized Type 2 Material	Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price
1. 21"x15"x30' corrugated steel pipe 14 GA	40	\$945.00	\$37,800.00
2. 42"x29"x30' corrugated steel pipe 14 GA	16	\$1,827.00	\$29,232.00
3. 21"x15"x24' corrugated steel pipe 14 GA	11	\$756.00	\$8,316.00
4. 28"x20"x24' corrugated steel pipe 14 GA	6	\$1,008.00	\$6,048.00
5. 35"x24"x24' corrugated steel pipe 14 GA	6	\$1,226.40	\$7,358.40
6. 18" dimple band	40	\$63.00	\$2,520.00
7. 24" dimple band	10	\$84.00	\$840.00
8. 36" dimple band	6	\$121.80	\$730.80
9. Freight			\$0.00
Total			\$92,845.20
When can successful vendor start delivery after award of contract?		4-5 weeks ARO	
		Contech Engineered Solutions dba	
Transfer of the control of the contr	0 ::	8	ed Solutions, LLC
Item – Aluminized Type 2 Material	Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price
1. 21"x15"x30' corrugated steel pipe 14 GA	40	\$766.80	\$30,672.00
2. 42"x29"x30" corrugated steel pipe 14 GA	16	\$1,533.60	\$24,537.60
3. 21"x15"x24' corrugated steel pipe 14 GA	11	\$613.44	\$6,747.84
4. 28"x20"x24' corrugated steel pipe 14 GA	6	\$817.92	\$4,907.52
5. 35"x24"x24' corrugated steel pipe 14 GA	6	\$1,022.40	\$6,134.40
6. 18" dimple band	40	\$19.29	\$771.60
7. 24" dimple band	10	\$23.22	\$232.20
8. 36" dimple band	6	\$29.64	\$177.84
9. Freight			\$0.00
Total			\$74,181.00
When can successful vendor start delivery after award of contract?		3-4 weeks	

		Wellborn Sales, Inc.	
Item – Aluminized Type 2 Material	Quantity	Unit Price	Extended Price
1. 21"x15"x30' corrugated steel pipe 14 GA	40	\$787.50	\$31,500.00
2. 42"x29"x30' corrugated steel pipe 14 GA	16	\$1,543.50	\$24,696.00
3. 21"x15"x24' corrugated steel pipe 14 GA	11	\$630.00	\$6,930.00
4. 28"x20"x24' corrugated steel pipe 14 GA	6	\$831.60	\$4,989.60
5. 35"x24"x24' corrugated steel pipe 14 GA	6	\$1,058.40	\$6,350.40
6. 18" dimple band	40	\$27.30	\$1,092.00
7. 24" dimple band	10	\$35.70	\$357.00
8. 36" dimple band	6	\$47.25	\$283.50
9. Freight			\$0.00
Total			\$76,198.50
When can successful vendor start delivery after award of contract?	4-6 weeks		
No Bid	Star Commercial Flooring		

On the recommendation of Lee Barrier, on behalf of Public Works, Tim Myers moved to accept the low bid from Contech Engineered Solutions dba Contech Engineered Solutions, LLC in the amount of \$74,181.00. Anna Meyerhoff-Cole seconded the motion. The motion passed unanimously.

Public Works uses corrugated steel pipe to construct drainage culverts under driveways and gravel roadways.

Questions and Answers

Tim Myers: Have we used Contech Engineered Solutions before?

Lynn Packer: Yes. We have used Contech in the past. They are known to vendor with us.

BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS APRIL 14, 2022

2. 2022 BM-2 OVERLAYS (R175-E) -- PUBLIC WORKS FUNDING -- R175 PREVENTATIVEMX-16+

(Request sent to 46 vendors)

RFB #22-0023 S/C #8000199745

Engineer's Estimate: \$2,291,742.10	APAC-Kansas, Inc. Shears Division	Cornejo & Sons, LLC	Pearson Construction, LLC	
2022 BM-2 Overlays (R175-E)	\$1,949,468.99	\$2,014,623.99	\$1,734,185.21	
Bid Bond	Yes	Yes	Yes	
Acknowledge Addendum	Yes	Yes	Yes	
No Bid	L & M Contractors, Inc.	Nowak Construction Co., Inc.	Unruh Excavating	
	Wildcat Construction			

On the recommendation of Lee Barrier, on behalf of Public Works, Anna Meyerhoff-Cole moved to accept the low bid from Pearson Construction, LLC in the amount of \$1,734,185.21. Brandi Baily seconded the motion. The motion passed unanimously.

Sedgwick County Project 2022 BM-2 Overlays (R175-E) will result in asphalt overlays and new pavement markings on 15 miles of county maintained roadways. This is one of several types of preventive maintenance projects used by Public Works that will improve the riding surface and extend the life of these roads. Pearson Construction, LLC is a known contractor to Public Works and has successfully worked on past county projects.

BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS APRIL 14, 2022

3. PREVENTION / EARLY INTERVENTION SERVICES #3 -- DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS FUNDING -- DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS

(Request sent to 117 vendors)

RFP #22-0007 Contract

	Community Solutions, Incorporated	Seventh Direction Inc.	Untamed Athletes Inc.
Program Name	Multisystemic Therapy (MST)	Living Choice Youth Program (LCYP)	Untamed Athletes
Prevention / Early Intervention Services #3	\$180,000.00	\$149,225.00	\$150,000.00
	Affiliated Family Counselors, LLC	Boy Scouts of America Quivira Counsel	Catholic Charities Wichita
	Center for Human Development	Central Kansas Foundation	Change Your Life Enterprises, Inc.
No Bid	Child Advocacy Center of Sedgwick County	COMCARE of Sedgwick County	Corner House, Inc.
	Crosswinds Counseling and Wellness	Heartland 180 Inc.	Higher Ground
	Kansas Department for Aging and Disability Services	Kansas Children's Service League	Mid-American All-Indian Center
	Mirror, Inc.	Nan Putnam	New Chance, Inc.
	New Hope	Rainbows United	Recovery Concepts Inc.
	South Central Mental Health Counseling Center	Therapy Services	Wichita Indochinese Center
		Youth for Christ Wichita	

On the recommendation of Britt Rosencutter, on behalf of the Department of Corrections, Anna Meyerhoff-Cole moved to accept the proposals and execute service provider agreements with Community Solutions, Incorporated, Seventh Direction Inc., and Untamed Athletes Inc. for the amounts shown above for a term of 18 months beginning July 1, 2022 and ending December 31, 2023. Tim Myers seconded the motion. The motion passed unanimously.

A committee comprised of Abigail Lessman, Project Manager and Chase Tipton, Evidence-Based Coordinator - Department of Corrections; Jeannette Livingston, Assistant Director - SCDDO; Delores Craig-Morland, Ph.D., Consultant from WSU; and Britt Rosencutter, Purchasing Agent - Purchasing evaluated all proposal responses based on the criteria set forth in the RFP. The committee agreed unanimously to accept the proposals as stated above.

The Sedgwick County Community Crime Prevention Fund utilizes current research to target grant dollars to achieve the greatest crime prevention impact and assist youth at risk of offending to improve the quality of their lives. The targeted population includes youth at moderate to high risk for delinquency and their families. The programs funded should provide services that are designed to prevent youth from entering the juvenile justice system or preclude further involvement in the system.

The initial proposal from Community Solutions, Inc. was for \$194,946.00. After further discussion and clarification of the budget, a revised allocation of \$180,000.00 was agreed upon. The initial proposal from Seventh Direction Inc. was for \$178,050.00 in funding over 18 months. After clarifying our desired target population would be under 22.5 years of age, they recalculated their expected number served and submitted a revised budget of \$149,225.00. The proposal from Untamed Athletes Inc. was for \$150,000.00 and has been awarded in the full amount requested.

Notes

Sedgwick County is allocating approximately \$582,000.00 annually (approximately \$873,574.00 over 18 months) in support of prevention and early intervention programs targeted to youth at risk for juvenile delinquency. Two (2) programs are currently funded through December 31, 2022 for a total of \$208,125.00 annually, with one (1) additional option to renew for 2023. Additional use of the funding has included support of a training on risk-needs-responsivity and support for additional work by WSU for communication and connection with the community on funding opportunities.

This is a proposal and not a bid. Proposals are scored based on criteria set forth in our RFP. There were (6) components to evaluate:

Component	Points
a. Overall Project Plan/Agency Capability	20
b. Evidence Based Practice(s)	20
c. Risk-Need-Responsivity	20
d. Data Collection Methods	15
e. Relevant Measurable Outcome(s)	15
f. Assessment	10
Total Points	100

Questions and Answers

Brandi Baily: How do we determine which of these services we use? Do we pay this fee whether they are used or not used?

Abigail Lessman: When we put the RFP out, these were the only three (3) proposals we received and their funding requests were within the available funds within the 18 month period. As far as the service provisions and how the payments are determined, I believe that could be negotiated during the contract portion whether it be a monthly amount received or more of a service provision.

Russell Leeds: Could you tell us which two (2) programs are currently funded through the end of this year?

Abigail Lessman: Currently with the Crime Prevention Fund, we are funding CBAR or McAdams Academy, an educational service for expelled or suspended youth, as well as the MHA PATHS program, a prevention program for younger children in elementary school. They have a one (1) year renewal option at the end of this calendar year.

Russell Leeds: To follow up on that, can you tell me how the three (3) programs we are going to fund through this RFP fill the gaps based on the programs we had funded for fiscal year 2021? You got education and you got Mental Health Association, which is providing some type of alternative thinking strategies, the three (3) programs that are going to be funded Untamed Athletes, Seventh Direction Living Choices, and Community Solutions Therapy. It sounds kind of self-explanatory but can you explain how they are going to fill the gaps to address the mid to high risk youth population? What services are they going to provide and how are they going to fill the gap since we have education and MHA still on contract?

Abigail Lessman: We have previously funded substance abuse treatment through this grant through Higher Ground. I believe it's been a year since we've had any services with them. The option with Seventh Direction really will fill a gap for that need. As far as having some treatment options for uninsured or underinsured youth coming through JIAC without having to be under any form of supervision, as well as providing the ability to help financially some youth who are on the older end of the juvenile system or youth who would be eligible to live in their sober living home if they are experiencing homelessness or home insecurity. That is a gap we have now that we haven't in the past. This would provide that service we had through this fund previously.

Russell Leeds: So Seventh Direction is providing some substance treatment and also they have housing opportunities?

Abigail Lessman: Yes. Those would have to be the 18-22.5 population. So we'll work with them on the referral population but they do serve that population either with referrals from foster care or from youth that are in the system through probation officers and such. They are serving that population now. This would just fund and help them develop that program for that target population.

Russell Leeds: Community Solutions?

Abigail Lessman: Community Solutions is Multisystemic Therapy (MST) so that would address the family need and families in crisis that are coming to JIAC for youth that score high on our risk assessments as far as the family domain and families that are willing to participate in it. They are currently funded for our evidence-based funding so this would kind of provide them the opportunity to receive referrals directly from JIAC rather than waiting until the youth is in the system for them to engage in services with the family.

Russell Leeds: We had Ember Hope previously, does this kind of fill the gap for Ember Hope?

Abigail Lessman: Ember Hope is not actually FFT (Family Functional Therapy). That is what we received previously with Ember Hope but it is within the same thing, yes.

Russell Leeds: Untamed Athletes?

Abigail Lessman: They are primarily a recreation based program. This would be for youth who do score moderate to high especially in the domains of leisure and recreation. They do have a component that is mentoring and education-based through their services. They are another one that was just this year funded through evidence-based programming for youth again that are deeper into the system who are referred through our intensive supervision office and probation officers. This would be a direct referral source through JIAC for youth who are identified at that initial screening as potentially benefitting from that program.

Russell Leeds: Can you give me some idea of the population size of each of these programs? Do we have a confirmed target size for each of these programs yet, the number of youth we're expecting them to serve?

Dr. Craig-Morland: The Multisystemic Therapy, that is the Community Solutions, expects to serve between 15 and 20 per year, which would make for the 18 month period would be 22 to 30. The Untamed Athletes, for the 18 month period, they put they will serve between 60 and 100. The Seventh Direction has numbers for each component and I honestly don't have that in front of me but the total of services for them was going to serve roughly 104 or 105 I believe. I did want to add that as a part of my consulting process, we review the risk factors that are unique to kids who live in Sedgwick County and we believe we have elevated risks in the substance abuse area and in the leisure and recreation we're looking for prosocial behavior to combat some antisocial behavior. We know we have elevated risk in the family area with particular interest in working with the female juvenile offenders. We also have a continuing issue around education with suspensions and expulsions. That's why we need McAdams. Finally the secondary prevention program that Mental Health offers gives us one (1) shot at kids at an age that is prior to any possible offending.

Russell Leeds: So the number of youth expected to be served for these programs is reasonable based on the type of work they're doing based on your estimation as our consultant?

Dr. Craig-Morland: Yes it is reasonable. In reviewing them, I calculated the costs per projected client and with the organizations that these clients had prior experience with, we know they estimate quite well with the numbers. I can tell you from our Juvenile Intake Assessment Center numbers and from our Juvenile Field Services numbers and Court Services numbers, there should be an adequate supply of youth who need these services.

Anna Meyerhoff-Cole: These are new programs for us. How often will we assess their success rate during this 18 month period?

Abigail Lessman: We would have quarterly site visits with these providers to evaluate how they are doing with their outcome and address any concerns we have.

Brandi Baily: In the notes section, we see there are currently two (2) programs funded through December with options to renew. Are we planning to renew those contracts so then we have five (5) intervention prevention providers?

Abigail Lessman: Correct.

Russell Leeds: Just to clarify, historically we've run about five (5) providers providing different types of services correct?

Abigail Lessman: Yes. That is correct.

Russell Leeds: I did want to ask one (1) additional question about referrals. I know the past couple years some of the difficulties we've had with these programs has been limited number of referrals because of the pandemic and the issues it created with availability and in-person activities. Do you have some insight on where you think we're going to be in the coming year as far as the ability for these organizations to get the referrals and provide services? I know that's a loaded question because of the pandemic wanes but we're on the upside of it.

Dr. Craig-Morland: I would say the two (2) programs that are very closely associated with the schools because we have no reason at the moment to believe the schools will go back to a virtual delivery system, I think those two (2) programs that include the educational program at McAdams and the Mental Health Association PATHS Program have their numbers coming up so we have reason to believe those issues are in the past. When it comes to the substance abuse, which is Seventh Direction, the Untamed Athletes Program, the Community Solutions, all of those are delivered on a basis that is not dependent on a mass gathering environment that has to be strongly impacted by something like the pandemic. I believe with these choices, particularly with the age groups and the substance abuse and the Untamed Athletes Program, the chances are quite good that we should see reasonable numbers. I also can say Untamed Athletes and the Community Solutions Program have a period now where they are funded through the evidence-based funding and they have been able to achieve their numbers.

Notes:

In reference to payment, the providers will invoice DOC Financials quarterly. The invoices are reviewed for service provision and then approved for payment.

BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS APRIL 14, 2022

4. ALTERNATIVE DISPUTE RESOLUTION – DOMESTIC CONCILIATION SERVICES – 18TH JUDICIAL DISTRICT COURT FUNDING -- AMERICAN RESCUE PLAN ACT (ARPA)

(Request sent to 26 vendors)

RFP #21-0080 Contract

Cindy L. Cleous dba Cindy L. Cleous LLC	Collaborative Success, Inc.		
\$600.00 (Retainer)	Domestic Conciliation		
\$150.00/hr. per person (witnesses, data review, etc.)	Retainer \$1,600.00		\$800.00
Testimony Fee Below	Conciliation Fee per Hour	\$200.00	\$100.00
\$600.00 (Additional Retainer)			
\$300.00/hr. for preparation for and time spent in Court			
Holly S. Kelly	Diane Sherwood, dba The Center for Peace		
\$250.00/hr.		Joint Rate	Individual Rate
	Joint Session - Fee per Hour	\$280.00	\$140.00
	Meeting with clients individually per Hour		\$200.00
	Phone Calls or Emails per Hour	\$280.00	
James W. Wilson	N. Trip Shav	vver	
Sliding Scale Fee Below Each Person Pays Based On Their Income Level (per person income)	\$250.00/hr.		
\$50,000.00 or less - \$75.00/hr.			
\$51,000.00 - \$70,000.00 - \$100.00/hr.	Reported a Sliding Scale Fee	range not identified	l)
\$71,000.00 - \$90,000.00 - \$125.00/hr.			
Jonathan Olsen	Stacy L. Ortega dba McDonald Tinker PA		
\$160.00/hr.		Joint Rate	Individual Rate
	ADR Services per Hour	\$250.00	\$125.00
	Legal Assistant Support per Hour	\$150.00	\$75.00
	Discounted Services per Hour (based on income)	\$100.00	\$50.00
Shannon A. Kelly	Tina Huntington		
dba Kelly Law Offices	dba Huntington Law Firm		
\$250.00/hr.	\$165.00/h	r	
	Sliding Scale of Combined Income Fee Below		
	Under \$40,000.00 - \$110.00/hr.		
	\$40,000.00 - \$50,000.00 - \$120.00/hr.		
	\$50,000.00 - \$60,000.00 - \$130.00/hr.		
	\$60,000.00 - \$80,000.00 - \$150.00/hr.		
	\$80,000.00 and over - \$165.00/hr.		
	No Bid		
Suzanne Dwyer, Attorney	Jeanne Erikson, PhD		
Paula Langworthy, Attorney	Larry Linn, Attorney		

On the recommendation of Joe Thomas, on behalf of the 18th Judicial District Court, Russell Leeds moved to accept the proposals from Cindy L. Cleous dba Cindy L. Cleous, LLC; Collaborative Success, Inc.; Holly S. Kelly; Diane Sherwood dba The Center for Peace and Forgiveness; James W. Wilson; N. Trip Shawver; Jonathan Olsen; Stacy L. Ortega dba McDonald Tinker PA; Shannon A. Kelly dba Kelly Law Offices; and Tina Huntington dba Huntington Law Firm for a contract period extending until all assigned ARPA funding has been utilized. Tim Myers seconded the motion. The motion passed unanimously.

A committee comprised of 18th Judicial District Court personnel included Courtney Douty - Court Program Analyst, Lorrie Seltzer - Dispute Resolutions Coordinator, Judge Jeff Dewey, Judge Kellie Hogan, Judge Linda Kirby, and Judge Quentin Pittman; and Joe Thomas - Purchasing reviewed and scored all proposal responses and unanimously agreed to award all respondents.

In the years prior to the pandemic, the Family Law Department saw an explosion of divorce cases. A full-time judge was moved from the Civil Department to the Family Law Department leaving five (5) judges to cover all Civil cases and making five (5) judges assigned to Family Law.

Alternative Dispute Resolution (ADR) is a tool necessary to assist in disposing of Family Law cases. When parties are unable to agree on issues such as division of assets, custody, visitation, etc. the judge can order them to ADR for a neutral third party to assist in conciliation and if not successful, make the recommendation to the court. Conciliation is expensive and many parties cannot afford to participate in this process.

The Supreme Court of Kansas put into effect January 1, 2020 rules governing Rules Relating to Dispute Resolution. Domestic Conciliation means a non-confidential process in which a neutral person assists the parties in reconciliation efforts by improving communication, reconciling differences, and helping the parties develop solutions to a dispute, complaint, or conflict.

Maximum allocated cost per case is \$4,000.00.

Funding provided by the American Rescue Plan Act (ARPA) is being used to address court backlogs.

Notes:

This is a proposal and not a bid. Proposals are scored based on criteria set forth in our RFP. There were four (4) components to evaluate:

Components	Points
A. Accuracy and Completion of Proposal Submission	20
B. Experience (Low 20, Average 25, High 30)	30
C. References and Professionalism	35
D. Cost*	15
Total Points	100

Questions and Answers

Russell Leeds: It seems self explanatory but the court will pay for these services when you refer a family to these services. They are not paying out of pocket. The court pays up to a maximum of \$4,000.00 per case.

Judge Kellie Hogan: Right, under this proposal.

Russell Leeds: The proposal quotes or the amounts they are charging is fairly close but it varies and it really it doesn't matter because they have a \$4,000.00 cap.

Judge Kellie Hogan: Correct.

Russell Leeds: I was curious as to the volume of cases you are running through Family Court with this type of service. If you have some idea at the top of your head.

Judge Kellie Hogan: I have no idea. I just know there is a lot.

Russell Leeds: It said it exploded so......

Judge Kellie Hogan: Love doesn't last apparently. We have plenty of cases. We have no doubt we'll be able to utilize these funds appropriately.