BOCC APPROVAL JANUARY 18, 2023

BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS JANUARY 12, 2023

4. ON-CALL PRESS PRINTING SERVICES -- VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

FUNDING -- VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

(Request sent to 125 vendors)

RFB #22-0041 (page 1) Contract

City Print, Inc. Valley Print Logistics
Description Text Ink: | Estimated Quantity (Annual) Unit Price (Per 1,000) Virgin Stock
Letterhead
1. Four (4) Color Logo Letterhead, Paper- Minimum 1,000 $125.00 Q(f)tfyo(t"tls(())ooo :;2322
81 X 11, White, 24#,  25% Cotton, C;:‘?'&?gi“:’lg’_'gﬁgifsél/fck 50,000 Qty of 1,500 $212.18
Laser Imaging ? ? Any additional 1,000 $75.16 Qty of 2,000 $193.38
Qty of 2,500 $181.97
Envelopes

2. Return Address Minimum 1,000 $399.00 Q?\tfyu[;'asll)):))o :::;(5):
Size/Paper: #10, 24#, White, C;:‘:'&?gi‘:lg’_'gﬁgif;{fck 30,000 Qty of 1,500 $281.94
25% Cotton, Regular Any additional 1,000 $147.00 Qty of 2,000 $261.87
Qty 0 2,500 $249.82
Qty of 1,000 $129.87
Qty of 1,500 $110.25
Qty of 2,000 $100.44
Qty of 2,500 $94.74
Black 1 Side 1/0 $44.16 Qty of 5,000 $78.91
Qty of 7,500 $72.90
Qty of 10,000 $69.90
Qty of 15,000 $66.93
100,000 Qty of 20,000 $65.45
Qty of 1,000 $159.70
Qty of 1,500 $139.67
Qty 0f 2,000 $129.65
Qty of 2,500 $122.05
Black 2 Sides 1/1 $49.65 Qty of 5,000 $100.71
Qty of 7,500 $93.59
Qty of 10,000 $90.04
Qty of 15,000 $86.56
Qty of 20,000 $84.83
Qty of 1,000 $174.36
Qty of 1,500 $136.54
Qty 0f 2,000 $117.63
Qty of 2,500 $132.85
1-Color 1 Side 1/0 $44.16 Qty of 5,000 $83.58
Qty of 7,500 $76.02
Qty of 10,000 $57.02
Qty of 15,000 $68.45
Qty of 20,000 $66.56
100,000 Qty of 1,000 $219.07
Qty of 1,500 $172.50
Qty 0f 2,000 $149.22
3. Size/Paper: #10, 24#, Qty of 2,500 $135.25
White, Regular 1-Color 2 Sides 1/1 $49.65 Qty of 5,000 $107.31
Qty of 7,500 $97.99
Qty of 10,000 $93.34
Qty of 15,000 $88.68
Qty of 20,000 $86.35
Qty of 1,000 $190.04
Qty of 1,500 $146.99
Qty 0f 2,000 $125.47
Qty of 2,500 $112.55
2-Color 1 Side 2/0 $61.00 Qty of 5,000 $86.72
Qty of 7,500 $78.11
Qty of 10,000 $73.81
Qty of 15,000 $69.54
5.000 Qty of 20,000 $67.41
’ Qty of 1,000 $250.42
Qty of 1,500 $193.40
Qty 0f 2,000 $164.90
Qty of 2,500 $147.79
2-Color 2 Sides 2/2 $69.54 Qty of 5,000 $113.58
Qty of 7,500 $102.17
Qty of 10,000 $96.48
Qty of 15,000 $90.85
Qty of 20,000 $88.04
$60.00 Qty of 500 $247.04
Qty of 1,000 $185.55
4-Color 1 Side 4/0 Qty of 1,500 $165.05
2,500 Minimum Qty 0f 2,000 $154.81
20,000 Qty of 2,500 $148.66
$90.00 Qty of 500 $331.26
Qty of 1,000 $268.48
4-Color 2 Sides 4/4 Qty of 1,500 $247.55
2,500 Minimum Qty 0f 2,000 $237.10
Qty of 2,500 $230.82




BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS JANUARY 12, 2023

4. ON-CALL PRESS PRINTING SERVICES -- VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

FUNDING -- VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
(Request sent to 125 vendors)

RFB #22-0041 (page 2) Contract

City Print, Inc.

Valley Print Logistics

Description I Text Ink:

4. Size/Paper: #10, 24#,
White, Window

| Estimated Quantity (Annual) Unit Price (Per 1,000) Virgin Stock
Envelopes

Qty of 1,000 $134.37
Qty of 1,500 $114.71
Qty 0f 2,000 $104.89
Qty of 2,500 $98.99
Black 1 Side 1/0 $47.41 Qty of 5,000 $83.34
Qty of 7,500 $77.32
Qty of 10,000 $74.32
Qty of 15,000 $71.34
100,000 Qty of-Z0,000 $69.86
Qty of 1,000 $164.20
Qty of 1,500 $144.13
Qty 0f 2,000 $134.10
Qty of 2,500 $126.53
Black 2 Sides 1/1 $52.90 Qty of 5,000 $105.14
Qty of 7,500 $98.02
Qty of 10,000 $94.46
Qty of 15,000 $90.96
Qty of 20,000 $89.23
Qty of 1,000 $178.97
Qty of 1,500 $141.07
Qty 0f 2,000 $122.13
Qty of 2,500 $110.76
1-Color 1 Side 1/0 $47.41 Qty of 5,000 $88.02
Qty of 7,500 $80.44
Qty of 10,000 $76.65
Qty of 15,000 $72.86
100,000 Qty of-Z0,000 $70.97
Qty of 1,000 $223.68
Qty of 1,500 $177.04
Qty 0f 2,000 $153.72
Qty of 2,500 $139.73
1-Color 2 Sides 1/1 $52.90 Qty of 5,000 $111.74
Qty of 7,500 $102.42
Qty of 10,000 $97.75
Qty of 15,000 $93.09
Qty of 20,000 $90.76
Qty of 1,000 $194.65
Qty of 1,500 $151.53
2-Color 1 Side 2/0 $64.25 Qty 0f 2,000 $129.97
Qty of 2,500 $117.03
5,000 Qtyot:S.OOO $91.15
Qty of 1,000 $255.03
Qty of 1,500 $197.94
2-Color 2 Sides 2/2 $72.79 Qty 0f 2,000 $169.40
Qty of 2,500 $152.27
Qty of 5,000 $118.01
$64.00 Qty of 500 $251.66
Qty of 1,000 $190.03
4-Color 1 Side 4/0 Qty of 1,500 $169.52
2,500 Minimum Qty 0f 2,000 $159.25
20,000 Qty of 2,500 $153.09
$94.00 Qty of 500 $335.86
Qty of 1,000 $272.98
4-Color 2 Sides 4/4 Qty of 1,500 $252.02
2,500 Minimum Qty 0f 2,000 $241.54
Qty of 2,500 $235.25




BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS JANUARY 12, 2023

4. ON-CALL PRESS PRINTING SERVICES -- VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

FUNDING -- VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
(Request sent to 125 vendors)

RFB #22-0041 (page 3) Contract

City Print, Inc.

Valley Print Logistics

Description | Text Ink:

5. Size/Paper: #10, 24#,
White, Regular, Security

| Estimated Quantity (Annual) Unit Price (Per 1,000) Virgin Stock
Envelopes

Qty of 1,000 $137.58
Qty of 1,500 $117.45
Qty 0f 2,000 $107.39
Qty of 2,500 $101.35
Black 1 Side 1/0 100,000 $66.87 Qty of 5,000 $85.65
Qty of 7,500 $79.46
Qty of 10,000 $76.37
Qty of 15,000 $73.31
Qty of 20,000 $71.78
Qty of 1,000 $167.40
Qty of 1,500 $146.87
Qty 0f 2,000 $136.60
Qty 0f 2,500 $128.93
Black 2 Sides 1/1 100,000 $72.36 Qty of 5,000 $107.45
Qty of 7,500 $100.15
Qty of 10,000 $96.51
Qty of 15,000 $92.93
Qty of 20,000 $91.15
Qty of 1,000 $182.27
Qty of 1,500 $143.87
Qty 0f 2,000 $124.68
Qty of 2,500 $113.16
1-Color 1 Side 1/0 $66.87 Qty of 5,000 $90.32
Qty of 7,500 $82.57
Qty of 10,000 $78.70
Qty of 15,000 $74.83
100,000 Qty of-Z0,000 $72.89
Qty of 1,000 $226.98
Qty of 1,500 $179.84
Qty 0f 2,000 $156.27
Qty of 2,500 $142.13
1-Color 2 Sides 1/1 $72.36 Qty of 5,000 $114.05
Qty of 7,500 $104.55
Qty of 10,000 $99.81
Qty of 15,000 $95.06
Qty of 20,000 $92.68
Qty of 1,000 $196.49
Qty of 1,500 $153.35
2-Color 1 Side 2/0 $83.71 Qty 0f 2,000 $131.79
Qty of 2,500 $118.84
5,000 Qty ot: 5,000 $92.97
Qty of 1,000 $258.33
Qty of 1,500 $200.74
2-Color 2 Sides 2/2 $92.25 Qty of 2,000 $171.95
Qty of 2,500 $154.67
Qty of 5,000 $120.32
Qty of 500 $299.72
8271 Qty of 1,000 $214.98
4-Color 1 Side 4/0 Qty of 1,500 $186.74
2,500 Minimum Qty of 2,000 $172.62
20,000 Qty of 2,500 $164.14
Qty of 500 $383.72
sz Qty of 1,000 $297.91
4-Color 2 Sides 4/4 Qty of 1,500 $169.24
2,500 Minimum Qty of 2,000 $254.91
Qty of 2,500 $246.30




BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS JANUARY 12, 2023

4. ON-CALL PRESS PRINTING SERVICES -- VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

FUNDING -- VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
(Request sent to 125 vendors)

RFB #22-0041 (page 4) Contract

City Print, Inc.

Valley Print Logistics

Description | Text Ink:

6. Size/Paper: #10, 24#
White, Window, Security

| Estimated Quantity (Annual) Unit Price (Per 1,000) Virgin Stock
Envelopes
Qty of 1,000 $145.79
Qty of 1,500 $125.53
Qty of 2,000 $115.40
Qty of 2,500 $109.32
Black 1 Side 1/0 $59.41 Qty of 5,000 $93.60
Qty of 7,500 $87.36
Qty of 10,000 $84.24
Qty of 15,000 $81.16
100,000 Qty of 20,000 $79.62
’ Qty of 1,000 $175.62
Qty of 1,500 $154.95
Qty of 2,000 $144.61
Qty of 2,500 $137.11
Black 2 Sides 1/1 $64.90 Qty of 5,000 $111.34
Qty of 7,500 $102.74
Qty of 10,000 $98.45
Qty of 15,000 $94.23
Qty of 20,000 $92.13
Qty of 1,000 $190.69
Qty of 1,500 $152.09
Qty of 2,000 $132.79
Qty of 2,500 $121.20
1-Color 1 Side 1/0 100,000 $59.41 Qty of 5,000 $98.28
Qty of 7,500 $90.48
Qty of 10,000 $86.58
Qty of 15,000 $82.68
Qty of 20,000 $80.73
Qty of 1,000 $235.39
Qty of 1,500 $188.05
Qty of 2,000 $164.38
Qty of 2,500 $150.17
1-Color 2 Sides 1/1 100,000 $64.90 Qty of 5,000 $122.00
Qty of 7,500 $112.46
Qty of 10,000 $107.68
Qty of 15,000 $102.91
Qty of 20,000 $100.52
Qty of 1,000 $206.37
Qty of 1,500 $162.54
2-Color 1 Side 2/0 $76.25 Qty of 2,000 $140.63
Qty of 2,500 $127.48
5,000 Quy of 5,000 $101.41
Qty of 1,000 $266.69
Qty of 1,500 $208.91
2-Color 2 Sides 2/2 $84.79 Qty of 2,000 $180.03
Qty of 2,500 $162.69
Qty of 5,000 $128.27
Qty of 500 $315.32
§76.00 Qty of 1,000 $226.68
4-Color 1 Side 4/0 Qty of 1,500 $197.14
2,500 Minimum Qty of 2,000 $182.37
L o
y o .
$106.00 Qty of 1,000 $309.61
4-Color 2 Sides 4/4 Qty of 1,500 $279.64
2,500 Minimum Qty of 2,000 $264.66
Qty of 2,500 $255.66




BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS JANUARY 12, 2023

'S

(Request sent to 125 vendors)

RFB #22-0041 (page 5) Contract

. ON-CALL PRESS PRINTING SERVICES -- VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
FUNDING -- VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

City Print, Inc.

Valley Print Logistics

Description Text Ink: | Estimated Quantity (Annual) Unit Price (Per 1,000) Virgin Stock
Envelopes
Qty of 500 $412.04
Qty of 1,000 $313.60
Black 1 Side 1/0 $78.20 Qty of 1,500 $280.79
Qty of 2,000 $264.38
7. Size/Paper: #9, 10.000 Qty of 2,500 $254.54
Policy Brown Kraft ’ Qty of 500 $485.30
Qty of 1,000 $368.71
Black 2 Sides 1/1 $83.70 Qty of 1,500 $329.85
Qty of 2,000 $310.42
Qty of 2,500 $298.76
Qty of 1,000 $129.87
Qty of 1,500 $110.25
Qty of 2,000 $100.44
Qty of 2,500 $94.55
Black 1 Side 1/0 $44.16 Qty of 5,000 $78.91
Qty of 7,500 $72.90
Qty of 10,000 $69.90
Qty of 15,000 $66.92
100,000 Qty of 20,000 $65.44
Qty of 1,000 $159.70
Qty of 1,500 $139.67
Qty of 2,000 $129.65
Qty of 2,500 $122.05
Black 2 Sides 1/1 $49.65 Qty of 5,000 $100.71
Qty of 7,500 $93.59
Qty of 10,000 $90.04
Qty of 15,000 $86.53
Qty of 20,000 $84.79
Qty of 1,000 $174.36
Qty of 1,500 $136.54
Qty of 2,000 $117.63
Qty of 2,500 $106.28
1-Color 1 Side 1/0 $44.16 Qty of 5,000 $83.58
Qty of 7,500 $76.02
Qty of 10,000 $72.24
Qty of 15,000 $68.45
. 100,000 Qty of 20,000 $66.56
8. Size/Paper: #9, 24#, Qty of 1,000 $219.07
White, Regular Qty of 1,500 $172.50
Qty of 2,000 $149.22
Qty of 2,500 $135.25
1-Color 2 Sides 1/1 $49.65 Qty of 5,000 $107.31
Qty of 7,500 $97.99
Qty of 10,000 $93.34
Qty of 15,000 $88.68
Qty of 20,000 $86.35
Qty of 1,000 $190.04
Qty of 1,500 $146.99
2-Color 1 Side 2/0 $61.00 Qty of 2,000 $125.47
Qty of 2,500 $112.55
5,000 Qty of 5,000 $86.72
Qty of 1,000 $250.42
Qty of 1,500 $193.40
2-Color 2 Sides 2/2 $69.54 Qty of 2,000 $164.90
Qty of 2,500 $147.79
Qty of 5,000 $113.58
$60.00 Qty of 500 $247.04
Qty of 1,000 $185.55
4-Color 1 Side 4/0 Qty of 1,500 $165.05
2,500 Minimum Qty of 2,000 $154.81
T e
ty of .
§90.00 Qty of 1,000 $268.48
4-Color 2 Sides 4/4 Qty of 1,500 $247.55
2,500 Minimum Qty of 2,000 $237.10
Qty of 2,500 $230.82




BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS JANUARY 12, 2023

4. ON-CALL PRESS PRINTING SERVICES -- VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

FUNDING -- VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
(Request sent to 125 vendors)

RFB #22-0041 (page 6) Contract

City Print, Inc.

Valley Print Logistics

Description | Text Ink: | Estimated Quantity (Annual) Unit Price (Per 1,000) Virgin Stock
Envelopes
Qty of 1,000 $158.18
Qty of 1,500 $137.71
Qty 0f 2,000 $127.47
Qty of 2,500 $121.33
Black 1 Side 1/0 $84.16 Qty of 5,000 $105.60
Qty of 7,500 $99.28
Qty of 10,000 $96.14
Qty of 15,000 $93.02
100,000 Qty of 20,000 $91.47
Qty of 1,000 $188.00
Qty of 1,500 $167.12
Qty 0f 2,000 $156.68
Qty of 2,500 $149.10
Black 2 Sides 1/1 $89.65 Qty of 5,000 $127.40
Qty of 7,500 $119.97
Qty of 10,000 $116.30
Qty of 15,000 $112.67
9. Size/Paper: #11, 24#, Qty of 20,000 $110.86
White, Regular Qty of 1,000 $203.38
Qty of 1,500 $164.47
Qty of 2,000 $145.01
Qty of 2,500 $133.34
1-Color 1 Side 1/0 $84.16 Qty of 5,000 $110.27
Qty of 7,500 $102.40
Qty of 10,000 $98.46
Qty of 15,000 $94.52
100,000 Qty of 20,000 $92.55
Qty of 1,000 $248.08
Qty of 1,500 $200.43
Qty 0f 2,000 $176.60
Qty of 2,500 $162.30
1-Color 2 Sides 1/1 $89.65 Qty of 5,000 $134.00
Qty of 7,500 $124.37
Qty of 10,000 $119.56
Qty of 15,000 $114.75
Qty of 20,000 $112.34
Qty of 1,000 $169.66
Qty of 1,500 $148.24
Qty 0f 2,000 $137.57
Qty of 2,500 $131.13
Black 1 Side 1/0 $93.16 Qty of 5,000 $115.44
Qty of 7,500 $108.72
Qty of 10,000 $105.38
Qty of 15,000 $102.06
100,000 Qty of 20,000 $100.41
Qty of 1,000 $199.48
Qty of 1,500 $177.65
Qty 0f 2,000 $166.78
Qty of 2,500 $158.97
Black 2 Sides 1/1 $98.65 Qty of 5,000 $137.24
Qty of 7,500 $129.41
Qty of 10,000 $125.54
10. Size/Paper: #11, 24#, Qty of 15,000 $121.71
White, Window Qty of 20,000 $119.80
Qty of 1,000 $210.40
Qty of 1,500 $172.18
Qty 0f 2,000 $152.88
Qty of 2,500 $141.36
1-Color 1 Side 1/0 $93.16 Qty of 5,000 $118.30
Qty of 7,500 $110.63
Qty of 10,000 $106.80
Qty of 15,000 $102.95
100,000 Qty of 20,000 $101.04
Qty of 1,000 $259.86
Qty of 1,500 $211.11
Qty 0f 2,000 $186.78
Qty of 2,500 $172.17
1-Color 2 Sides 1/1 $98.65 Qty of 5,000 $143.84
Qty of 7,500 $133.81
Qty of 10,000 $128.80
Qty of 15,000 $123.79
Qty of 20,000 $121.28




BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS JANUARY 12, 2023

4. ON-CALL PRESS PRINTING SERVICES -- VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
FUNDING -- VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

(Request sent to 125 vendors)

RFB #22-0041 (page 7) Contract

City Print, Inc.

Valley Print Logistics

Description Text Ink: I Estimated Quantity (Annual) Unit Price (Per 1,000) Virgin Stock
Envelopes
Qty of 1,000 $154.23
Qty of 1,500 $133.21
Qty of 2,000 $122.78
Qty of 2,500 $116.42
Black 1 Side 1/0 $66.61 Qty of 5,000 $100.73
Qty of 7,500 $94.17
Qty of 10,000 $90.94
Qty of 15,000 $87.70
100,000 Qty of 20,000 $86.08
Qty of 1,000 $184.05
Qty of 1,500 $162.63
Qty of 2,000 $151.94
Qty of 2,500 $144.11
Black 2 Sides 1/1 $78.20 Qty of 5,000 $122.53
Qty of 7,500 $114.87
Qty of 10,000 $111.12
Qty of 15,000 $107.37
Qty of 20,000 $105.50
11. Size/Paper: 6 x 9 Booklet Qty of 1,000 $195.47
Envelope, White Qty of 1,500 $157.45
Qty of 2,000 $138.29
Qty of 2,500 $126.84
2-Color 1 Side 2/0 $90.00 Qty of 5,000 $103.93
Qty of 7,500 $96.30
Qty of 10,000 $92.49
Qty of 15,000 $88.68
100,000 Qty 0f 20,000 $86.78
Qty of 1,000 $244.05
Qty of 1,500 $195.83
Qty of 2,000 $171.76
Qty of 2,500 $157.31
2-Color 2 Sides 2/2 $110.00 Qty of 5,000 $129.13
Qty of 7,500 $119.27
Qty of 10,000 $114.34
Qty of 15,000 $108.40
Qty 0f 20,000 $106.93
Three (3) Color Process Black, .

R(ed), and Gold 1 Side 1,000 $230.00 No Bid
Qty of 1,000 $184.94
Qty of 1,500 $163.13
Qty of 2,000 $152.27
Qty of 2,500 $145.71
Black 1 Side 1/0 $78.61 Qty of 5,000 $130.01
Qty of 7,500 $123.13
Qty of 10,000 $119.74
Qty of 15,000 $116.34
100,000 Qty of 20,000 $114.65
Qty of 1,000 $214.76
Qty of 1,500 $192.54
Qty of 2,000 $181.48
Qty of 2,500 $173.69
Black 2 Sides 1/1 $90.20 Qty of 5,000 $151.81
Qty of 7,500 $143.83
Qty of 10,000 $139.92
12. Size/Paper: 6 X 9 Window Qty of 15,000 $136.02
Booklet Envelope, White Qty of 20,000 $134.07
Qty of 1,000 $225.19
Qty of 1,500 $186.77
Qty of 2,000 $167.33
Qty of 2,500 $155.74
2-Color 1 Side 2/0 $102.00 Qty of 5,000 $132.54
Qty of 7,500 $124.82
Qty of 10,000 $120.96
Qty of 15,000 $117.10
100,000 Qty of 20,000 $115.17
Qty of 1,000 $275.53
Qty of 1,500 $226.25
Qty of 2,000 $201.65
Qty of 2,500 $186.89
2 Color 2 Sides 2/2 $122.00 Qty of 5,000 $158.41
Qty of 7,500 $148.23
Qty of 10,000 $143.14
Qty of 15,000 $138.04
Qty of 20,000 $135.50




BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS JANUARY 12, 2023
4. ON-CALL PRESS PRINTING SERVICES -- VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
FUNDING -- VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

(Request sent to 125 vendors)

RFB #22-0041 (page 8) Contract

City Print, Inc. Valley Print Logistics
Description | Text Ink: | Estimated Quantity (Annual) Unit Price (Per 1,000) Virgin Stock
Envelopes
Black 1 Side 1/0 100,000 $111.00
13. Size/Paper: A-2 Invitation Envelope, Qty of 1,000 $459.00 .
White Linen . Qty 0f 2,500 $924.00 No Bid
4-Color 1 Side 4/0 100,000 = .
Qty of 5,000 $546.53
Qty of 100,000 $133.63
14. Size/Paper: 6.5 x 9.5 Booklet Black 1 Side 1/0 100,000 $111.61 No Bid
Envelope, White 2-Color 1 Side 2/0 100,000 $123.20
Qty of 1,000 $134.37
Qty of 1,500 $114.71
Qty 0f 2,000 $104.89
Qty 0f 2,500 $98.99
100,000 $44.16 Qty of 5,000 $83.34
Qty of 7,500 $77.32
Qty of 10,000 $74.32
Qty 0f 15,000 $71.30
15. Size Paper: 6 % Envelope, White Qty 0f 20,000 $69.81
Qty of 1,000 $194.65
Qty of 1,500 $151.53
Qty of 2,000 $129.97
Qty 0f 2,500 $117.03
2-Color 1 Side 2/0 100,000 $61.00 Qty of 5,000 $91.15
Qty of 7,500 $82.53
Qty of 10,000 $78.22
Qty of 15,000 $73.90
Qty 0f 20,000 $71.76
Carbonless Five-Part Reverse
16. Paper: 8 /2 X 11, 20# Estimated Annual Quantity not $757.00 Per 1,000 sets
Color Sequence: White; Canary; Black, 1 Side 1/0 available Same Original No bid
Pink; Gold; Manila Tag No Numbering
Miscellaneous
17. Typesetting Hourly Rate $38.00 Hourly Rate $65.00
Set-up for Black $43.00
Set-up for Color $180.00
18. Set-Up Estimated l:\l,i:i‘il:]i 1Ce)uanmy not These fees are only for specialty items and are not in Included in the prices listed above.
addition to the prices listed above.
19. Color Wash (Other than Black) $18.00 Included in the prices listed above.
Acknowledged Addendum Yes Yes
Concepts for Business Docutronics Graphic Designs International, Inc. HC3
No Bid Identity Group Image Quest Konica Minolta Business Solutions Mennonite Press
Quik Print Universal Products Wichita Press, Inc. Wichita Screen Printing
X-Press Signs and Graphics, LLC

On the recommendation of Jaimee Witmer, on behalf of various departments, Brandi Baily moved to accept the bids from City Print, Inc. and Valley Print Logistics at the firm fixed rates
listed above for a period six (6) months and establish a contract for a period of one (1) year with four (4) one (1) year options to renew. Jennifer Blasi seconded the motion. The motion
passed unanimously.

The purpose of the on-call press printing services is to fulfill the gap between the services offered by Sedgwick County's Print Shop and requests made by county departments. Generally, this
gap in services includes, but is not limited to, envelope printing, large format posters, and promotional items.

Notes:

Due to the volatility of the paper and printing services markets, after the firm fixed pricing for six (6) months, the vendors have the opportunity to base the pricing for the balance of the year on
pricing options such as escalation/de-escalation clauses, price change based on market indexes, or other options. All price changes must have written justification and approval by the county.
Questions and Answers

Brandi Baily: What kind of increase did you see this year?

Jaimee Witmer: It's hard to say because some of the products have changed over the years. Last time this was done was in 2016. I did look at some various items from previous rates. For
example, if you want to look at Item #3 on the table the size paper #10, 24#, White, Regular the rates were $36.20/M for Black/1 Side and for Black/2 Side was $40.70/M so that's not a really
big increase for that large period of time. In that same section for 1 Color/1 Side was $36.20/M and for 1 Color/2 Side was $40.70/M. Again, not a large increase. For so many years, I didn't

think the prices were really that different. I did look at envelopes, which seems to be one of the larger items that we print and they didn't seem to be too drastically different.

David Adams: We have seen an increase based on the prices of envelopes nationwide. I'm pretty pleased the pricing hasn't gone up more than what's represented here. Nationwide we're
looking at an increase of anywhere between 25% and 30% in envelopes and that pricing does not seem to be reflected here. I think we're getting a pretty good deal.

Joe Thomas: That paper market has consolidated considerably?




David Adams: Yes.

Joe Thomas: Also as a note, we wanted to point out that as listed above you will notice just the bolded items in each category are what we are referring to.

Brandi Baily: In my office, we are looking at ways to cut back on envelopes and paper, consolidating our bills into one or maybe not sending out a return envelope to somebody.
Russell Leeds: We're utilizing both vendors but using the lowest priced vendor for different items?

Joe Thomas: Correct.

Brandi Baily: Have we used Valley Print before? I know City Print has been used.

Jaimee Witmer: To my knowledge, we haven't used Valley Print Logistics before. We are currently using City Print, Inc. They are our current vendor that has been providing this service but I
looked previously and I haven't seen that we've used Valley Print Logistics so we'll be offering a new vendor a new opportunity basically.
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