BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS JANUARY 28, 2016

CAREER DEVELOPMENT TRAINING COURSES -- HUMAN RESOURCES

FUNDING -- HUMAN RESOURCES

(Request sent to 73 vendors)

RFP #15-0108 Contract

Allen, Gibbs &

Dr. Audrey

Etc. Executive

The Austin Peters

Butler County

Cross Cultural

Counseling and

Houlik, L.C. Curtis Hane Trammg_ and Group, Inc. Community Institute, LLC Mediation
Coaching College Center, Inc.

1. Interpersonal Skills in the Workplace no bid $1,250.00 $7,000.00 $1,800.00 $2,320.00 no bid $1,400.00
2. Presentation Skills no bid $1,000.00 $7,000.00 no bid $2,320.00 no bid no bid
3. Organization and Time Management Skills $925.00 no bid no bid no bid $775.00 no bid $760.00
4. Maximizing your Full Potential no bid $750.00 $5,500.00 no bid $775.00 no bid $740.00
5. Ethics and Creditability no bid no bid no bid $1,200.00 $800.00 no bid $760.00
6. Listening and Communication Skills no bid no bid $5,500.00 no bid $775.00 no bid $760.00
7. Balance between Work and Home no bid $800.00 no bid no bid $775.00 no bid $760.00
8. Emotional Intelligence $1,325.00 no bid no bid no bid $1,170.00 no bid $1,400.00
9. Leadership in the Workplace no bid $1,250.00 $7,500.00 $1,800.00 $1,170.00 no bid $1,400.00
10. Motivating and Coaching Positive Behaviors $1,575.00 no bid $7,500.00 no bid $1,770.00 no bid $1,400.00
11. Building a Successful Team $1,575.00 no bid no bid no bid $1,170.00 no bid no bid
12. Delegation Skills $825.00 no bid no bid no bid $775.00 no bid no bid
13. Cultural Awareness no bid no bid $3,000.00 no bid $700.00 $260.00 no bid

. Wichita State Leader Beacon Trainin . .

Jim Maddox University Systems, Inc. e — Inc.g Pyxis, Inc. ProBizAssoc.com
1. Interpersonal Skills in the Workplace no bid $1,032.00 no bid $2,000.00 $840.00 $3,000.00
2. Presentation Skills $1,100.00 no bid no bid $2,000.00 $840.00 $4,200.00
3. Organization and Time Management Skills $500.00 $774.00 $750.00 $2,000.00 $560.00 $3,000.00
4. Maximizing your Full Potential no bid $774.00 $750.00 $2,000.00 $470.00 $2,760.00
5. Ethics and Creditability no bid $774.00 no bid $1,000.00 $560.00 $2,520.00
6. Listening and Communication Skills $500.00 no bid $750.00 $2,000.00 $560.00 $2,280.00
7. Balance between Work and Home no bid no bid no bid $2,000.00 $560.00 $2,760.00
8. Emotional Intelligence $1,100.00 no bid $1,500.00 $2,000.00 $840.00 $2,760.00
9. Leadership in the Workplace $1,100.00 $1,161.00 $1,500.00 $2,000.00 $910.00 $3,240.00
10. Motivating and Coaching Positive Behaviors no bid no bid $1,500.00 $2,000.00 $980.00 $3,000.00
11. Building a Successful Team $1,100.00 $1,161.00 no bid $2,000.00 $980.00 $3,000.00
12. Delegation Skills no bid $774.00 $750.00 $2,000.00 $490.00 $2,160.00
13. Cultural Awareness no bid no bid no bid $2,000.00 $280.00 $2,280.00
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. Priority
ToucanEd, Inc Ryan Bond John Belt Fred P ryor Den_1arche InterAct Training Management
Seminars Consulting Group Group -
Kansas City
No bid Ori Project Transf i
Lewis G. Bender, Training Telephone Next Element rion rojec ranstormative
. Development Management Concepts
PhD Systems, Inc. Doctor, Inc. Consulting > .
Group Institute Consulting Group

On the recommendation of Kara Kingsley, on behalf of Human Resources, Davis Spears moved to accept the best proposals from Dr. Audrey Curtis Hane (item #2), Butler
County Community College (item #7), Cross Cultural Institute, LLC (item #13), Jim Maddox (items #3, 6, 8, 9, 11), Wichita State University (items #1, 5), Leader Systems,
Inc. (items #4, 10, 12) and establish contract pricing for two (2) years with two (2) one (1) year options to renew. Tim Kaufman seconded the motion. The motion passed
unanimously.

A committee comprised of Greg Baker, Roberta Berry and Eileen McNichol-Human Resources and Kara Kingsley-Purchasing reviewed all proposals based on the vendors ability to
meet all proposal conditions and instructions, clarity, completeness and comprehensiveness of the proposal and the most advantageous and prudent methodology and costs to the
county. The committee unanimously chose the above mentioned vendors as offering the best proposals that meet the criteria.

Pyxis, Inc. did not provide any details regarding the content of the courses for which they submitted proposals, preventing the committee from determining the alignment of their
course material with our employee development program. Pyxis, Inc. is not a general employee or management development business. It was developed initially to serve at-risk
youth in the state. Over time, it has expanded its services to include vocational rehabilitation, mental health, juvenile offenders, transitional youth and foster care youth. Pyxis, Inc.
lists its main function as an employment services contractor. Although the main facilitators possess the requisite qualifications to lead the courses they proposed, their backgrounds
are in Physical Education, Social Services, Mental Health, Customer Care, Finance & Budget, and Student Recruiting and Testing. Their experience appears to be more aligned with
assisting individuals facing various life challenges and learning to establish a consistent path to securing employment.

Counseling and Mediation Center requires use of an online tool that is time consuming for the class attendees, offering basic courses that weren't necessarily designed for public
employees or were not aligned methods used by Human Resources.

Human Resources offers a variety of training courses on a rotating and as-needed basis to all county employees including line staff, as well as new and experienced supervisors alike.
These courses are used by county employees for personal and professional development. The estimated annual spend for these services will be $24,882.00.
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2. ONBASE INTEGRATION FOR HANSEN PERMIT SOFTWARE -- METROPOLITAN AREA

BUILDING AND CONSTRUCTION DEPARTMENT (MABCD)

FUNDING -- MABCD-COW REIMB
(Hardware Software Maintenance)

#16-2003 SC #8000078347

Konica Minolta Business
Solutions USA, Inc.

OnBase/Hansen Integration

$58,051.34

On the recommendation of Kimberly Evans, on behalf of the MABCD, Jennifer Dombaugh moved to accept
the quote from Konica Minolta Business Solutions USA, Inc. in the amount of $58,051.34. David Spears

seconded the motion. The motion passed unanimously.

This project will create an interface to OnBase (county standard document management system) that will
allow the MABCD to scan, store and retrieve their documents electronically. This interface includes the
ability to connect directly with Hansen (MABCD permit software) and will move documents from Laserfiche

document storage at the City of Wichita to OnBase.
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3. FIRE ALARM TESTING AND INSPECTION -- FACILITIES DEPARTMENT
FUNDING -- FACILITIES DEPARTMENT
(Request sent to 40 vendors)

RFB #16-0004

. DG Investment
Tyco Fire & .
. Intermediate .
Security (US) . AmeriSafe .
Holdings 2, Inc. . Commercial Trade
Management, Inc. . Services, Inc. dba .
. dba Convergint . Services, LLC
dba Simplex h AmeriSafe Alarms
Grinnell. LP Technologies,
' LLC
Annual Cost
1. Juvenile Detention Facility, 700 S. Hydraulic St., Wichita, KS 67211 $3,689.00 $7,075.00 $1,485.00 $1,835.00
2. Juvenile Residential Facility, 881 S. Minnesota Ave., Wichita, KS 67211 $759.00 $625.00 $280.00 $397.50
3. Judge Riddel Boys Ranch, 25331 W. 39th St. S., Goddard, KS 67052 $1,358.00 $1,530.00 $610.00 $928.75
4. Ark Valley Lodge, 615 N. Main St., Wichita, KS 67203 $17,550.00 $234.00 $85.00 $187.50
5. Adult Detention Facility, 141 W. Elm St., Wichita, KS 67203 $367.00 $21,796.00 $8,470.00 $10,485.00
6. EMS Administration, 1015 W. Stillwell St., Wichita, KS 67213 $343.00 $1,415.00 $95.00 $205.00
7. Extension Service Center, 7001 W. 21st St., Wichita, KS 67203 $1,141.00 $2,115.00 $205.00 $522.50
8. Historic Courthouse, 510 Main St., Wichita, KS 67203 $1,713.00 $3,095.00 $610.00 $735.00
9. Juvenile Courthouse, 1900 E. Morris St., Wichita, KS 67211 $3,081.00 $3,000.00 $955.00 $1,835.00
10. Main Courthouse, 525 Main St., Wichita, KS 67203 $6,649.00 $7,180.00 $1,810.00 $2,935.00
11. Munger Building, 538 Main St., Wichita, KS 67203 $1,400.00 $995.00 $220.00 $383.00
12. Parking Garage, 603 Main St., Wichita, KS 67203 $395.00 $225.00 $85.00 $225.00
13. Regional Forensic Science Center, 1109 N. Minneapolis St., Wichita, KS 67214 $1,266.00 $2,775.00 $250.00 $485.00
14 Work Release, 701 W. Harry St., Wichita, KS 67213 $795.00 $950.00 $230.00 $475.00
15. 271 Building, 271 W. 3rd St., Wichita, KS 67202 $1,139.00 $1,600.00 $445.00 $810.00
16. Fleet Management, 1021 W. Stillwell St., Wichita, KS 67213 $326.00 $990.00 $85.00 $260.00
Total $41,971.00 $55,600.00 $15,920.00 $22,704.25
type of system & | fire panel $150.00 | $5 per device, total number of
Formula for determining cost of future facilities difficulty of + $15.00 per audible/visible units at each
inspection device devices included location
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Formula for determining cost of future facilities

(set-up/report
hours + testing
hours) x service
rate

price per device

device calculation

Pinnacle Fire & Absolute Marmic Fire &
Automation, LLC | Protection, Inc. Safety No Bid
Annual Cost
1. Juvenile Detention Facility, 700 S. Hydraulic St., Wichita, KS 67211 $1,933.00 $3,787.00 $2,290.00
2. Juvenile Residential Facility, 881 S. Minnesota Ave., Wichita, KS 67211 $472.00 $550.00 $310.00 Seg?r':rt'yTE‘f_C
3. Judge Riddel Boys Ranch, 25331 W. 39th St. S., Goddard, KS 67052 $605.00 $1,044.00 $615.00
4. Ark Valley Lodge, 615 N. Main St., Wichita, KS 67203 $148.00 $99.00 $120.00 Feld Fire
5. Adult Detention Facility, 141 W. EIm St., Wichita, KS 67203 $9,275.00 $10,505.00 $3,224.00
6. EMS Administration, 1015 W. Stillwell St., Wichita, KS 67213 $525.00 $481.00 $450.00 . )
7. Extension Service Center, 7001 W. 21st St., Wichita, KS 67203 $618.00 $822.00 $775.00 Frg;g;zvfggmg
8. Historic Courthouse, 510 Main St., Wichita, KS 67203 $923.00 $1,264.00 $1,010.00 o
9. Juvenile Courthouse, 1900 E. Morris St., Wichita, KS 67211 $934.00 $1,902.00 $1,160.00 . .
10. Main Courthouse, 525 Main St., Wichita, KS 67203 $1,896.00 $3,042.00 $2,460.00 S';enr:lflggﬁ:(e:
11. Munger Building, 538 Main St., Wichita, KS 67203 $411.00 $396.00 $345.00
12. Parking Garage, 603 Main St., Wichita, KS 67203 $146.00 $145.00 $135.00 National Fire
13. Regional Forensic Science Center, 1109 N. Minneapolis St., Wichita, KS 67214 $721.00 $935.00 $830.00 Suppression
14 Work Release, 701 W. Harry St., Wichita, KS 67213 $522.00 $517.00 $385.00 .
15. 271 Building, 271 W. 3rd St., Wichita, KS 67202 $658.00 $955.00 $470.00 Jerré'ggersact]:"e
16. Fleet Management, 1021 W. Stillwell St., Wichita, KS 67213 $482.00 $424.00 $375.00
Total $20,269.00 $26,868.00 $14,954.00

ProTec Security
Services, Inc.

On the recommendation of Britt Rosencutter, on behalf of the Facilities Department, Tim Kaufman moved to accept the lowest and best bid from Marmic Fire and
Safety at the rates listed, and establish contract pricing for one (1) year, with three (3) one (1) year options to renew. Jennifer Dombaugh seconded the motion.

The motion passed unanimously.

Annual spend for 2015 was $25,489.00.
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4. SAP MAINTENANCE RENEWAL - ENTERPRISE RESOURCE PLANNING
FUNDING - ENTERPRISE RESOURCE

(Hardware/Software Maintenance)

#16-2006 SC #8000079194

SAP Public
Services, Inc.
1. SAP Enterprise Support - Appendix 8 effective 3/25/2011; (PPS and BPC modules) - $175124.18
1/1/2015 - 12/31/2015 e
2. SAP Enterprise Support - Amendment 2 to Appendix 1 - 1/1/2015 - 12/31/2015 $188,432.42
3. SAP Enterprise Support - Appendix 3 (Additional mySAP.com users) - 1/1/2015 - $49 092,12
12/31/2015 T
4. SAP Enterprise Support - Appendix 7 effective 12/23/2010; (Additional users) - 1/1/2015 - $39 061.44
12/31/2015 U
5. SAP BSI US Payroll Tax module-1/1/2016-12/31/2016 $8,013.60
6. SAP Enterprise Support (TDMS Software)-Appendix 6-1/1/2016-12/31/2016 $792.41
Total $460,516.17

On the recommendation of Kimberly Evans, on behalf of Enterprise Resource Planning, Tim Kaufman moved to
accept the quote from SAP Public Services, Inc. in the amount of $460,516.17. David Spears seconded the
motion. The motion passed unanimously.

SAP Enterprise Support pricing is based on the number and types of licenses (standard and professional) currently in
use by the County and can fluctuate from year to year.

Last year the County spent $453,245.81 on this maintenance.



