
1.  INMATE CLOTHING, LINENS, AND TOILETRIES -- SHERIFF'S OFFICE / DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS
     FUNDING -- SHERIFF'S OFFICE / DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS
     (Request sent to 30 vendors)

     RFP #20-0010   Contract

Item # Description PKG Bob Barker Company, 
Inc.

PKG Charm-Tex PKG ICS Jail Supplies, 
Inc. PKG Uniforms Manufacturing of 

Arizona LLC PKG Victory Supply LLC

CLOTHING
1 Bra Sports White sizes 32, 34, 36, 38, 40 12 $18.98 DZ $19.90 DZ $26.26 DZ $17.03 DZ $16.77
2 Bra Sports White sizes 42, 44, 46, 48 12 $21.98 DZ $19.90 DZ $28.56 DZ $19.26 DZ $16.77
3 Bra Sports White sizes 50, 52, 54 12 $21.98 DZ $21.90 DZ $32.75 DZ $20.18 DZ $18.11
4 Boxers Small, Medium, Large, XL  Brown 12 $16.48 DZ $17.36 DZ $17.24 DZ $16.48 DZ $14.27
5 Boxers 2XL Brown 12 $16.48 DZ $19.54 DZ $18.41 DZ $17.14 DZ $15.27
6 Boxers 3XL Brown 12 $16.48 DZ $19.90 DZ $19.57 DZ $17.80 DZ $15.94
7 Boxers 4XL Brown 12 $16.98 DZ $22.90 DZ $21.86 DZ $19.47 DZ $16.49
8 Boxers 5XL Brown 12 $16.98 DZ $23.90 DZ $22.90 DZ $20.79 DZ $16.94
9 Boxers 6XL Brown 12 $16.98 DZ $24.36 DZ $24.12 DZ $22.11 DZ $16.94
10 Brief White Small, Medium, Large, XL 12 $10.98 DZ $9.90 DZ $13.25 DZ $8.26 DZ $9.32

11 Brief White 2 XL, 3XL, 4XL 12 $12.48  2XL                
$13.48 3XL, 4XL

DZ $12.72 DZ $14.63 DZ $11.20 DZ $11.77

12 Panty Cotton sizes 5, 6, 7, 8 12 $7.56 DZ $7.54 DZ $11.05 DZ $6.55 DZ $6.31
13 Panty Cotton sizes 9 & 10 12 $8.96 DZ $7.90 DZ $11.80 DZ $7.86 DZ $6.97
14 Panty Cotton sizes 11, 12, 13, 14 12 $9.96 DZ $9.90 DZ $14.21 DZ $9.64 DZ $8.34
15 Women's Cotton Panties, Brown Size 5 12 $7.48 DZ $9.90 DZ $14.94 DZ $11.64 DZ $7.33
16 Women's Cotton Panties, Brown Size 6 12 $7.48 DZ $9.90 DZ $14.94 DZ $11.64 DZ $7.33
17 Women's Cotton Panties, Brown Size 7 12 $7.48 DZ $9.90 DZ $14.94 DZ $11.64 DZ $7.33
18 Women's Cotton Panties, Brown Size 8 12 $7.48 DZ $9.90 DZ $14.94 DZ $11.64 DZ $7.33
19 Shoes 7 oz. step-in sizes 6-17 1 PR $3.48 PR $3.90 EA $6.10 PR $6.55 PR $3.27

20 Shoes, Low-Top Velcro Canvas Tennis Shoes sizes 5-17 1 PR $5.98 5-9                      
$6.48 10-17

PR $6.36 EA $9.13 PR $7.16 PR $5.38

21 Translucent Unifoot PVC Sandal Small 6 $19.87 6 PR/1 CS $16.90 EA $5.83 PR $4.23 PR $2.39
22 Translucent Unifoot PVC Sandal Med 6 $19.87 6 PR/1 CS $16.90 EA $5.83 PR $4.23 PR $2.39
23 Translucent Unifoot PVC Sandal Lg 6 $19.87 6 PR/1 CS $16.90 EA $5.83 PR $4.23 PR $2.39
24 Translucent Unifoot PVC Sandal XL 6 $19.87 6 PR/1 CS $16.90 EA $5.83 PR $4.23 PR $2.39
25 Translucent Unifoot PVC Sandal 2XL 6 $19.87 6 PR/1 CS $16.90 EA $5.83 PR $4.23 PR $2.39
26 Translucent Unifoot PVC Sandal 3XL 6 $19.87 6 PR/1 CS $16.90 EA $5.83 PR $4.23 PR $2.39

27 Sandals Shoes Bio-Chek, Small to 2XL 1 PR $2.16 SM-XL               
$2.96 3XL

PR $2.40 EA $1.90  NO BID PR $2.49

28 Belt Tips 12 $0.80 PKG $0.90 DZ $2.40 NO BID EA $0.12
29 Belt Buckles 12 $7.92 PKG $9.90 DZ $8.32 NO BID DZ $6.25
30 Belt Webbing color Navy/Khaki 1 ROLL $30.89 PKG $29.90 RL $41.18 NO BID EA $33.00
31 Sock Sport White 10-13 Terry 12 $4.49 DZ $6.72 DZ $6.49 DZ $7.95 DZ $5.11
32 Sock Tube White one size fits all 12 $7.22 10 DZ/1 CS $43.30 DZ $6.16 DZ $4.95 DZ $4.66
33 Socks, Low Cut Sports fits 10-13 12 $4.49 DZ $5.72 DZ $6.16 DZ $4.95 DZ $5.11
34 Socks No Show one size fits all 12 $5.66 DZ $5.90 DZ $7.18  NO BID DZ $4.24

*35 T-shirt 100% cotton Small, Medium, Large, & XL 4.6 oz. 12
$23.88 SM-MED    

$26.88 LG             
$27.88 XL

DZ $24.36 DZ $44.23 DZ $31.38 DZ $24.11

*36 T-shirt 100% Cotton 2XL 4.6 oz. 12 $29.88 $28.09 DZ $47.45 DZ $39.60 DZ $27.44
*37 T-shirt 100% Cotton 3XL 4.6 oz. 12 $32.98 $32.36 DZ $49.73 DZ $42.24 DZ $29.97
*38 T-shirt 100% Cotton 4XL 4.6 oz. 12 $33.98 $34.54 DZ $62.08 DZ $44.88 DZ $32.11
*39 T-shirt 100% Cotton 5XL 4.6 oz. 12 $33.98 $35.54 DZ $65.10 DZ $47.52 DZ $33.44
* SC#3SEDKS2 (JDF in Black 5 1/2" letters on back of shirt)  FREE Per Letter $0.54 INCLUDED INCLUDED
40 50/50 Blend T-Shirts, Small 12 $33.39 EA 2.90 EA DZ $45.08 DZ $28.58 EA $1.72
41 50/50 Blend T-Shirts, Med 12 $33.39 EA $2.90 DZ $45.08 DZ $28.58 EA $1.72
42 50/50 Blend T-Shirts, Large 12 $33.39 EA $2.90 DZ $45.08 DZ $28.58 EA $1.72
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43 50/50 Blend T-Shirts, XL 12 $33.39 EA $2.90 DZ $45.08 DZ $28.58 EA $1.72
44 50/50 Blend T-Shirts, 2XL 12 $56.39 EA $4.54 DZ $74.22 DZ $32.54 EA $2.39
45 50/50 Blend T-Shirts, 3XL 12 $60.39 EA $6.90 DZ $98.96 DZ $36.50 EA $2.39
46 50/50 Blend T-Shirts, 4XL 12 $60.39 EA $6.90 DZ $99.22 DZ $37.82 EA $2.39
47 Crew Neck Sweatshirt Small, Medium, Large, XL 1 $6.29 EA $6.18 EA $10.07 EA $9.77 EA $5.31
48 Crew Neck Sweatshirt 2XL 1 $7.29 EA $7.36 EA $11.09 EA $11.42 EA $6.11
49 Crew Neck Sweatshirt 3XL 1 $7.29 EA $7.90 EA $12.45 EA $12.41 EA $6.11
50 Crew Neck Sweatshirt 4XL 1 $7.29 EA $8.72 EA $13.47 EA $13.07 EA $6.39
51 Crew Neck Sweatshirt 5XL 1 $7.29 EA $9.36 EA $14.82 EA $13.73 EA $6.39
52 Crew Neck Sweatshirt 6XL 1 $7.29 EA $9.90 EA $15.85 EA $15.05 EA $7.39

*53 Crew Neck Sweatshirts, Gray Size Medium 1 $6.88 EA $6.18 EA $12.00 EA $9.77 EA $6.06
*54 Crew Neck Sweatshirts, Gray Size Large 1 $6.88 EA $6.18 EA $12.00 EA $9.77 EA $6.06
*55 Crew Neck Sweatshirts, Gray Size XL 1 $6.88 EA $6.18 EA $12.00 EA $9.77 EA $6.06
*56 Crew Neck Sweatshirts, Gray Size 2XL 1 $7.88 EA $7.36 EA $13.05 EA $11.42 EA $6.86
*57 Crew Neck Sweatshirts, Gray Size 3XL 1 $7.88 EA $7.90 EA $14.42 EA $12.41 EA $6.86
* SC#3SEDKS2 (JDF in Black 5 1/2" letters on back of shirt)  FREE EA $0.54 INCLUDED INCLUDED
58 Sweatpants, Gray, Small, Medium, Large 1 $5.42 EA $6.90 EA $10.07 EA $9.77 EA $5.41
59 Sweatpants, Gray XL 1 $5.42 EA $7.54 EA $10.07 EA $9.77 EA $5.41
60 Sweatpants, Gray 2XL 1 $5.72 EA $7.90 EA $11.09 EA $11.42 EA $5.88
61 Sweatpants, Gray 3XL 1 $5.72 EA $8.54 EA $12.45 EA $12.41 EA $5.88
62 Sweatpants, Gray 4XL 1 $6.42 EA $8.90 EA $13.47 EA $13.07 EA $6.99
63 Sweatpants, Gray 5XL 1 $6.42 EA $9.54 EA $14.82 EA $13.73 EA $7.99
64 Sweatpants, Gray 6XL 1 $7.42 EA $9.90 EA $15.85 EA $15.05 EA $7.99
65 Sweatpants w/Pockets Black Small 1 $7.98 EA $6.90 EA $11.07 EA $9.77 EA $7.49
66 Sweatpants w/Pockets Black Med 1 $7.98 EA $718.00 EA $11.07 EA $9.77 EA $7.49
67 Sweatpants w/Pockets Black Lg 1 $7.98 EA $7.54 EA $11.07 EA $9.77 EA $7.49
68 Sweatpants w/Pockets Black XL 1 $7.98 EA $7.54 EA $11.07 EA $9.77 EA $7.49
69 Sweatpants w/Pockets Black 2XL 1 $7.98 EA $7.90 EA $12.09 EA $11.42 EA $8.19
70 Sweatpants w/Pockets Black 3XL 1 $7.98 EA $8.54 EA $13.45 EA $12.41 EA $8.19
71 Sweatpants w/Pockets Black 4XL 1 $7.98 EA $8.90 EA $14.80 EA $13.07 EA $9.99
72 Sweatpants w/Pockets Black 5XL 1 $7.98 EA $9.54 EA $15.82 EA $13.73 EA $10.49

*73 Short, Navy 5" Inseam, Size Medium 6 $26.50 EA $4.90 EA $7.35 EA $6.04 EA $3.77
*74 Short, Navy 5" Inseam, Size Large 6 $26.50 EA $4.90 EA $7.35 EA $6.04 EA $3.77
*75 Short, Navy 5" Inseam, Size XL 6 $26.50 EA $4.90 EA $7.35 EA $6.04 EA $3.77
*  (JDF in White 2" letters on lower right leg) FREE Per Letter $0.54 INCLUDED INCLUDED
76 Mesh Shorts Orange 9" Inseam (Med) 1 $3.98 EA $6.54 EA $10.47 EA $4.95 EA $4.38
77 Mesh Shorts Orange 9" Inseam (Large) 1 $3.98 EA $6.54 EA $10.47 EA $4.95 EA $4.38
78 Mesh Shorts Orange 9" Inseam (XL) 1 $3.98 EA $6.54 EA $10.47 EA $4.95 EA $4.38
79 Mesh Shorts Orange 9" Inseam (2XL) 1 $4.24 EA $6.90 EA $12.15 EA $4.95 EA $5.66
80 Mesh Shorts Orange 9" Inseam (3XL) 1 $4.24 EA $6.90 EA $12.15 EA $4.95 EA $5.66
81 Walking shorts 9", Knee Length, Medium, Large, XL, 2XL 1 $4.48 EA $4.90 EA NO BID EA $4.95 EA $3.95
82 Walking shorts 9'', Knee Length, 3XL, 4XL, 5XL, 6XL 1 $5.48 EA $4.90 EA NO BID EA $4.95 EA $4.65

*83
Inmate Uniforms, Medical Scrub Style Poly/Cotton Twill 7-7.5 oz. 
Shirts, Small-8XL Red, Green, Orange, Tan, Yellow, Orange, White 
Striped

1

$5.98 SM-XL               
$6.48 2XL                   

$7.48 3XL            $8.48 
7XL-8XL

EA $6.54 EA $11.02 EA $5.42 EA $5.11

* "Sedgwick County Jail" imprinted on back FREE Per Letter $0.54 INCLUDED INCLUDED

*84 Inmate Uniforms, Medical Scrub Style Pants, Small-8XL Red, Green, 
Orange, Tan, Yellow, Orange, White Striped 1 $7.78 SM-2XL           

$8.78 3XL-8XL
EA $6.90 EA $12.54 EA $6.52 EA

$5.97 SM-3XL                                     
$6.34 4XL-6XL                     
$6.69 7XL-8XL

* "Sedgwick County Jail" imprinted on back FREE Per Letter $0.54 INCLUDED INCLUDED
*85 Jumpsuit, Green No Pockets - Size Medium 6 $74.98 EA $13.90 EA $17.15 EA $12.60 EA $13.97
*86 Jumpsuit, Green No Pockets - Size Large 6 $74.98 EA $13.90 EA $17.15 EA $12.60 EA $13.97
*87 Jumpsuit, Green No Pockets - Size XL 6 $76.98 EA $13.90 EA $17.15 EA $12.60 EA $13.97
*88 Jumpsuit, Green No Pockets - Size 2XL 6 $79.98 EA $13.90 EA $17.15 EA $12.60 EA $13.97
*89 Jumpsuit, Green No Pockets - Size 3XL 6 $81.98 EA $13.90 EA $20.17 EA $13.23 EA $14.97
*90 Jumpsuit, Green No Pockets - Size 4XL 6 $85.98 EA $15.90 EA $20.17 EA $13.86 EA $14.97
*91 Jumpsuit, Green No Pockets - Size 5XL 6 $90.98 EA $16.90 EA $20.17 EA $14.49 EA $14.97
*92 Jumpsuit, Green No Pockets - Size 6XL 6 $95.98 EA $16.90 EA $20.17 EA $15.12 EA $15.44
* SC#3SEDKS2 (JDF in White 5 1/2" letters on back) FREE EA $0.54 INCLUDED  INCLUDED
93 Nightshirt, Ash Gray, Size Regular (Fits S - 2XL) 1 $4.44 EA $5.90 EA $8.77 NO BID EA $4.77



94 Gowns Suicide (Smock) 1 $82.98 EA $65.90 EA $66.95 NO BID EA $53.99
LINENS

95 Bags Mesh White 18" x 24" 12 $20.88 DZ $22.18 DZ $38.19 NO BID DZ $20.99
96 Bedspread 76'' x 110'' 12 $154.92 EA $16.90 NO BID NO BID EA $11.44
97 Blanket Beige 66''x90'' 10 $187.98 EA $6.54 EA $6.40 NO BID EA $6.28
98 Blanket 80% Wool Woven 66'' x 84'' 1 $7.88 EA $8.90 EA $8.96 NO BID EA $8.44
99 Blanket 66'' x 90'' 70% Wool 3.7 lbs. 1 $8.11 EA $7.36 EA $8.96 NO BID EA $6.97

100 Blanket 50% Wool/50% Synthetic 15 $99.48 EA $5.54 EA $8.96 NO BID EA $6.44
101 Blanket Suicide 54'' x 80'' 1 $72.22 EA $59.90 EA $57.50 NO BID EA $48.44
102 Mattress 25" x 75" x 4" 1 $64.98 EA $46.90 EA $48.79 NO BID EA $46.41
103 Mattress Cover 25'' x 75'' x 4''   6-8 oz. Off-White 12 $79.11 DZ $40.54 DZ $78.19 NO BID EA $44.71
104 Mattress Cover 25'' x 75'' x 4'' 3.8 oz. 12 $50.98 EA $10.36 EA $11.14 NO BID EA $12.44
105 Clear, Sealed Seam Poly Mattress, 30x75 1 $56.88 EA $59.90 EA $59.55 NO BID EA $56.91
106 Green, Sealed Seam Poly Mattress, 30x75 1 $75.88 EA $48.90 EA $55.71 NO BID EA $49.11
107 Innerspring Mattress, Navy (36"x 75"x 8") 1 $179.99 EA $354.90 NO BID NO BID EA $149.00
108 Mattress Mending Patch 1 $2.22 CS $20.18 EA $16.16 NO BID EA $6.00
109 Pillow Poly-Vented White HD 4 $38.14 EA $7.36 EA NO BID NO BID EA $6.44
110 Pillow Poly/Vinyl 20'' x 26'' 4 $29.44 EA $5.90 EA $6.88 NO BID EA $7.50
111 Pillow Poly Core Microvent Vinyl Cover Pillow 20''x26'' 4 $27.66 EA $5.15 EA $5.39 NO BID EA $5.44
112 Pillowcases 42'' x 34'' 12 $10.82 DZ $8.72 DZ $14.17 NO BID DZ $9.50
113 Pillowcases White T130 42'' x 34'' 12 $10.82 DZ $8.72 DZ $14.17 NO BID DZ $7.99
114 Pillows Cotton Core with Microvent Cover 4 $38.14 EA $9.00 EA $10.95 NO BID EA $8.50
115 Sheets Fitted White Muslin 36'' x 80'' x 6'' NO BID DZ $35.90  NO BID NO BID DZ $34.77
116 Sheets Flat White T130 66" x 104" 12 $37.44 DZ $39.90 DZ $49.09 NO BID DZ $29.11
117 Sheets Fitted White Muslin 36'' x 80'' x 6'' NO BID DZ $35.90  NO BID NO BID DZ $34.77
118 Sheets Flat 66" x 104'' T180 12 $46.98 DZ $59.90 DZ $57.09 NO BID DZ $39.50
119 Sheets Fitted 36'' x 80'' x 6'' T180 12 $39.42 DZ $60.90  NO BID NO BID DZ $44.11
120 Brown Flat Sheet, 180 Thread Count 58" x 90" (12/cs) 12 $41.42 DZ $46.90 DZ $102.62 NO BID DZ $41.99
121 Towel Bath 22'' x 44'' Institutional 12 $13.88 DZ $16.18 DZ $14.63 NO BID DZ $12.34
122 Towel White 20" x 40'' Regular Institutional 12 $15.24 DZ $15.18 DZ $10.26 NO BID DZ $11.37
123 Towel Bath 24'' x 48'' Premium 12 $31.88 DZ $28.90 DZ $19.92 NO BID DZ $19.44
124 Wash Cloth White 12'' x 12'' 12 $3.66 DZ $3.26 DZ $2.96 NO BID DZ $1.89
125 Wash Cloth Colored 12'' x 12'' Terry Institutional 12 $3.82 DZ $3.90 DZ $2.51 NO BID DZ $2.77
126 Wash Cloth White 12" x 12" Regular Institutional 12 $2.92 DZ $2.36 DZ $1.97 NO BID DZ $1.69
127 Wash Cloth White 12'' x 12'' Terry Institutional 12 $2.72 DZ $3.36 DZ $1.86 NO BID DZ $2.69
128 White Hand Towels, 15 x 25 12 $8.68 DZ $6.90 DZ $5.66 NO BID DZ $6.24
129 Navy Towel 12 $20.68 DZ $18.90 DZ $17.52 NO BID DZ $28.97
130 Washcloth, 12 x 12 ORG 12 $2.72 DZ $3.90 DZ $2.51 NO BID DZ $2.99
131 Washcloth, 12 x 12 BWN 12 $3.82 DZ $3.90 DZ $2.51 NO BID DZ $2.99

TOILETRIES  
132 Hair and Scalp Conditioner 4 oz. 12 $21.80 CS $21.90 12/CS $26.41 NO BID DZ $22.99
133 Hair and Scalp Conditioner 7 oz. 12 $64.98 CS $59.90 NO BID NO BID DZ $58.20
134 Styling Gel Alcohol Free 7 oz. 6 $17.82 CS $39.90 NO BID NO BID DZ $33.99
135 Hair Dressing 4 oz. 12 $22.42 CS $20.90 12/CS $26.41 NO BID DZ $2.99
136 Comb 5'', Pocket, Black 2,160 $38.22 CS $3.90 2,160/CS $40.47 NO BID 144 $2.97
137 Shampoo  .75 oz. 288 $84.98 CS $69.90 1,000/CS $48.81 NO BID 288 $46.11

138 Shampoo & Conditioner 14.5 oz. 6 $16.11 - Shampoo                     
$16.11 - Conditioner

CS $16.90 6/CS $21.23 NO BID 6 $16.99

139 Shampoo Balsam 8 oz. 12 $20.48 CS $15.90 36/CS $33.53 NO BID DZ $17.90
140 Deodorant, Alcohol & Scent Free, 2 oz. 24 $30.42 CS $25.90 96/CS $42.03 NO BID 96 $33.91
141 Deodorant, Ladies Stick 2.25 oz. 24 $26.98 CS $25.90 144/CS $174.13 NO BID 24 $25.99
142 Soap Deodorant Wrapped Antibacterial 3 oz. 144 $34.88 CS $36.90 72/CS $24.70 NO BID 144 $34.11
143 Soap Deodorant Wrapped Antibacterial 3 oz. 144 $34.88 CS $36.90 72/CS $24.70 NO BID 144 $34.11
144 Soap Box, 2 Piece Clear 12 $4.99 CS $3.90 144/CS $50.41 NO BID DZ $2.99
145 Lip Balm .15 oz. 12 $15.98 CS $31.90 12/BX $7.91 NO BID 24 $24.11
146 Lotion, Hand and Body 4 $48.24 CS $49.90 96/CS $26.93 NO BID 4 $42.11
147 Lotion, Suave Skin Therapy 10 oz. Advanced Relief 6 $17.29 CS $14.90 NO BID NO BID 6 $13.99
148 Twin Blade Razor 600 $39.92 CS $49.90 2,000/CS $148.20 NO BID 600 $43.81
149 Security Razor 600 $45.42 CS $7.54 500/CS $47.50 NO BID 600 $39.11



150 Shaving Cream 11 oz. 12 $27.54 CS $19.90 12/CS $17.47 NO BID DZ $18.12
151 Maxi-Pads 500 $25.11 CS $43.18 576/CS $43.27 NO BID 500 $23.48
152 Maxi Thins Long Super w/ Wings L 288 $23.11 CS $30.90 192/CS $37.13 NO BID 192 $28.99
153 Sanitary Napkin, Individually Wrapped 576 $35.11 CS $23.99 288/CS $23.37 NO BID 288 $32.40
154 Tampon Non-Vended Paper Wrap 500 $50.44 CS $49.90 500/CS $52.19 NO BID 500 $44.11
155 Plastic Applicator Boxed Tampons 240 $46.44 CS $125.90 NO BID NO BID 240 $46.44
156 Tampon Super Non-Vended 500 $51.44 CS $54.90 480/CS $53.05 NO BID 500 $51.11
157 Toothbrush 40 Tuft Soft 144 $12.98 CS $8.18 144/BX $7.74 NO BID 144 $7.81
158 Toothbrush No Shank 72 $3.92 CS $50.90 1,000/CS $269.27 NO BID 144 $8.59
159 Toothbrush Covers 144 $9.88 CS $2.90 144/BX $9.17 NO BID DZ $1.77
160 No-Shank Toothbrush 100 $40.46 CS $50.90 1,000/CS $269.27 NO BID 144 $8.59
161 Colgate Wrapped Toothbrushes 144 $33.98 CS $65.90 144/CS $33.94 NO BID 72 $39.11
162 Toothpaste 1.5 oz. Unboxed 144 $32.00 CS $32.90 144/CS $33.55 NO BID 144 $30.77
163 Toothpaste .85 oz. Unboxed 144 $19.92 CS $19.36 144/CS $22.20 NO BID 144 $18.97
164 Toothpaste 2.75 oz. Unboxed 144 $59.92 CS $54.90 144/CS $58.87 NO BID 144 $48.77
165 Colgate Toothpaste 2.5 oz 24 $27.88 CS $30.90 24/CS $35.80 NO BID 24 $25.13
166 Shower Mat 14'' x 22 1/2'' Suction Backed 1 $2.99 CS $6.90 EA $15.70 NO BID EA $3.99
167 Fingernail Clippers-No File 24 $8.42 CS $6.54 12/BX $3.14 NO BID 24 $6.34
168 Toenail Clippers-No File 12 $6.42 CS $6.90 12/BX $6.42 NO BID DZ $6.34
169 Bergamot, 4 oz. Conditioner 12 $21.80 CS $22.90 12/CS $22.49 NO BID DZ $21.17
170 Comb Black 9'' Large 144 $13.11 CS $13.72 1,008/CS $91.40 NO BID 144 $16.99
171 Comb, Lice 3'' Black Double Sided 12 $1.31 CS $1.64 144/CS $19.18 NO BID DZ $1.60
172 Anti-Perspirant, Mennon Speed Stick 0.5 oz 144 $38.70 CS $23.90 36/CS $30.62 NO BID 24 $21.12
173 Roll-On Anti-Perspirant 1.5 oz. 96 $35.88 CS $30.90 96/CS $32.36 NO BID 96 $30.11
174 Hair Gel, SuperWet Clear 8.8 oz. 24 $31.98 CS $39.90 NO BID NO BID 24 $40.44
175 Petroleum Jelly, 2oz. 144 $77.22 CS $109.90 144/CS $80.63 NO BID 144 $32.11
176 Liceall Lice Control (1 gal) 1 $48.88 EA $39.90 EA $53.78 NO BID EA $44.11
177 Lucky Dandruff 2-in-1 Shampoo, 12oz 12 $25.82 CS $26.90 NO BID NO BID DZ $23.11

OTHER ITEMS
178 Janitor Carts 1 $204.41 EA $136.90 EA $406.40 NO BID EA $133.00
179 Mop Heads 1 $6.64 EA $4.54 12/CS $55.38 NO BID EA $4.69
180 Mop Handles 12 $109.98 EA $89.90 12/CS $109.07 NO BID DZ $94.99
181 Wet Floor Signs 6 $50.66 EA $12.90 NO BID NO BID EA $6.99
182 Dust Pans 1 $2.76 EA $2.54 24/CS $67.28 NO BID EA $2.75
183 Duffel Bag, Black, 18'' x 10'' x 10'' NO BID EA $7.90 NO BID NO BID EA $5.50
184 Mini Stereo Earphones 1 $0.98 EA $1.72 NO BID NO BID EA $1.70
185 Radio AM/FM Silver 1 $5.88 EA $5.90 NO BID NO BID EA $7.99
186 All Ultra Laundry Detergent 2oz, Single 100 $44.74 CS $44.72 NO BID NO BID 100 $42.11

MISCELLANEOUS
187 Percentage off of List Pricing 5% 5% 5% NO BID 22%

On the recommendation of Lee Barrier, on behalf of Sheriff's Office and Department of Corrections, Linda Kizzire moved to accept proposals from Bob Barker Company, Inc. and Victory Supply LLC and to establish 
contract pricing for a period of two (2) years with three (3) one (1) year options to renew. Russell Leeds seconded the motion. The motion passed three to one with Jared Schechter abstaining from the vote.

A review committee consisting of Captain Jared Schechter and Lieutenant Keekee Taylor - Sheriff's Office; Stephanie Mueller, Raquel Berrios-Lithgow, and Elaine Stull - Department of Corrections; Lee Barrier - Purchasing
evaluated all proposals based on the criteria set forth in the RFP. The two (2) vendors chosen offered a comprehensive line of products at competitive pricing.

Note:
2019 spend with Bob Barker was $141,404.56.

Questions and Answers

Anna Meyerhoff: The note shows you have done previous business with Bob Barker but have we ever used Victory Supply?

Lee Barrier: No we have not. They would be a new vendor.



2.  CLOUD SOLUTIONS -- VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
     FUNDING -- VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
     (Joint Governmental Purchase - NASPO ValuePoint contract #AR2472; State of Kansas contracts 43262 and 43262AA)

     #20-2045   Contract
Carahsoft Technology Corporation

Sirius Computer Solutions, Inc.
Cloud Solutions Pricing listed on above State of Kansas contracts

 

 

On behalf of various departments, recommend to utilize the State of Kansas contract 43262; 43262AA created from source NASPO ValuePoint 
contract #AR2472 with Carahsoft Technology Corporation and Sirius Computer Solutions, Inc. good through 09/16/2026.

What is this? Why is it needed? How will it benefit the county?

Note:
For additional information please visit: 

https://www.carahsoft.com/buy/slg-contracts/kansas-state-contracts/state-kansas-cloud-solutions-contract-naspo
https://www.naspovaluepoint.org/portfolio/cloud-solutions-2016-2026/

https://da.ks.gov/purch/contracts/view_contract.aspx?ContractID=0000000000000000000043262
https://da.ks.gov/purch/contracts/view_contract.aspx?ContractID=43262AA

On the recommendation of Joe Thomas, on behalf of various departments, Jared Schechter moved to utilize the State of Kansas 
Cloud Solutions contracts - NASPO with Carahsoft Technology Corporation (#43262) and Sirius Computer Solutions, Inc. 
(#43262AA) good through November 15, 2026. Anna Meyerhoff seconded the motion. The motion passed unanimously.

A cloud solution is the on-demand availability of computer system resources, such as data storage and computing power without 
direct management by the consumer. The cloud provider would manage the infrastructure hardware necessary for the product being 
hosted. Some benefits include a smaller up-front and pay-as-you-go investment, resulting in right sizing the resources for the 
solution. This also allows for additional flexibility over time to expand the solution.

Carahsoft Technology Corporation and Sirius Computer Solutions, Inc. are technology VARs (value added resellers) that provide
consulting, expertise, and other services while reselling products that the manufacturer may not have a direct sales channel for.

A Request for Proposal (RFP) was issued by the State of Utah on behalf of NASPO ValuePoint participating states and their 
eligible end users for the following scope of work: Software as a Service (SaaS), Infrastructure as a Service (IaaS), and Platform as 
a Service (PaaS). Eighty (80) proposals were received on July 6, 2018 through the State of Utah’s eProcurement system. The 
preliminary evaluation stage was conducted by the State of Utah to ensure compliance with the RFP’s minimum qualifications.

Note:
The NASPO ValuePoint Cloud Solutions solicitation #CH16012 allows for a refresh of products and contractors every two (2) 
years.

For additional information please visit: 

Questions and Answers

Linda Kizzire: So we don't have any idea of how much the spend is going to be on this since it's a new product and vendor?

Joe Thomas: Right. This originally came up in Finance as a request for a piece of software to track the requests being made for the 
CARES money. So based on that and knowing there might be possibly more needed solutions in the future, we decided to take 
advantage of the whole blanket cloud solutions, which would encompass a variety of various items. Some of those items are things
we might not anticipate right now but maybe need in the future. We don't have a price as to what we would spend. Does that make 
sense?

Linda Kizzire: Yes.

Jared Schechter: So the goal is to have stored information off sight? Is this what this is about. When I think cloud, that's what I 
think about.

Joe Thomas: Yes. So we don't have to buy any of the on premise servers? Am I right Joe?

Joe Currier: Yes.

Joe Thomas: Cloud solutions would mean we wouldn't have to buy on premise servers. We wouldn't have to spend large  amounts 
of money for infrastructure. That's why they call these software as a service (SaaS). Some are the infrastructure service, which are 
servers. I'm not too sure what the platform necessarily is.

Joe Currier: Same thing.

https://www.carahsoft.com/buy/slg-contracts/kansas-state-contracts/state-kansas-cloud-solutions-contract-naspo

https://www.naspovaluepoint.org/portfolio/cloud-solutions-2016-2026/

https://da.ks.gov/purch/contracts/view_contract.aspx?ContractID=0000000000000000000043262

https://da.ks.gov/purch/contracts/view_contract.aspx?ContractID=43262AA

https://da.ks.gov/purch/contracts/view_contract.aspx?ContractID=12178AA
https://www.naspovaluepoint.org/portfolio/cloud-solutions-2016-2026/
https://da.ks.gov/purch/contracts/view_contract.aspx?ContractID=0000000000000000000043262
https://da.ks.gov/purch/contracts/view_contract.aspx?ContractID=43262AA
https://www.carahsoft.com/buy/slg-contracts/kansas-state-contracts/state-kansas-cloud-solutions-contract-naspo
https://www.naspovaluepoint.org/portfolio/cloud-solutions-2016-2026/
https://da.ks.gov/purch/contracts/view_contract.aspx?ContractID=0000000000000000000043262
https://da.ks.gov/purch/contracts/view_contract.aspx?ContractID=43262AA


   g

Joe Thomas: So it would save money. As I mentioned, it allows you to not make a big investment but you could pay for what you
need at this time and expand without a giant monetary investment.

Jared Schechter: So the individual departments will be picking what they want to use?

Joe Thomas: Yes. That's why it's hard for us to wrap our hands around the quantity or price because it's open to all departments. 
There may be some future needs we just don't anticipate at this time. We'll be covered by very competitive pricing with the State of 
Kansas participating with NASPO.

Russell Leeds: So to be clear, we are doing something new and different correct?

Joe Thomas: This is not so much on IT's part. Purchasing pushed this because we saw what happened with CARES and consultants.
There's so many things we are not experienced with. We are just trying to get ahead of the curve and having this in place will fill 
the need.

Russell Leeds: Currently there is no costs associated with this contract correct?

Joe Thomas: Correct.

Russell Leeds: It will be a per purchase, per item evaluation? It will be based on existing budget authority within each department's 
budget?

Joe Thomas: Yes, sir. That's kind of the pay-as-you-go. As long as you have the budget, you can pay as you need it.

Russell Leeds: This is identified as a State of Kansas Cloud Solutions contract. It was initiated by the State of Utah but the State of 
Kansas adopted it and we're continuing to utilize it.

Joe Thomas: Yes, sir. NASPO stands for the National Association of State Procurement Officers. They  have one state that is the 
lead agency and they create it for other states to participate in. So the State of Kansas does an agreement with the overall huge 
NASPO contract. Karen has worked with these types of contracts many times.

Karen Powell: Yes.

Joe Thomas: Does that explain it?

Russell Leeds: Yes. For me it does.
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