BOARD OF BIDS & CONTRACTS

BoCC Meeting Room at 10:00 a.m.
April 30, 2015
(7 Items)

AGENDA ITEMS

Six Wheel Broom Street Sweeper

On-Call Electrical Services

Fleet Management

-Facilities Department

2015 Nova Chip Overlay (R175-B) Public Works
2015 Asphalt Surface Recycling (R175-M) ----Public Works
Pre-Cast Reinforced Concrete Box & End Sections Public Works
AB-3 Rock Public Works
CM-=-G Chat=mmmmmmmm e mm e e e e e e e Public Works




BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS APRIL 30, 2015

1. SIXWHEEL BROOM STREET SWEEPER -- FLEET MANAGEMENT
EFUNDING -- STREET SWEEPER

(Request sent to 71 vendors)

RFP #15-0034 SC #8000063239

Truck Component Services
dba The Larson Group

Key Equipment &
Supply Co. (Option 1)

Key Equipment &
Supply Co. (Option 2)

Key Equipment &
Supply Co. (Option 3)

1. Street Sweeper $318,271.00 $318,990.00 $334,690.00 $263,450.00
Body model 2015 Wayne Centurion (2015 Elgin Eagle Waterless| 2015 Elgin Eagle Waterless |2015 Elgin Pelican Waterless
Chasis model 2016 Freighliner M2-106 2016 Freightliner M2 2016 Autocar N/A

2. Operation manuals included included included included

3. Service manuals included included included included

4. Parts manuals included included included included

5. Service manuals for the N/A included included included

auxiliary engine

6. Operator manuals for N/A included included included

the auxiliary engine

7. Parts books for the NIA included included included

auxiliary engine
Total $318,271.00 $318,990.00 $334,690.00 $263,450.00
Delivery Date 3/1/2016 2/2/2016 2/2/2016 180 days ARO

Hourly labor rate, year 1 $100.00 $100.00 $100.00 $100.00

Hourly labor rate, year 2 $105.00 $100.00 $100.00 $100.00

Hourly labor rate, year 3 $110.00 $100.00 $100.00 $100.00

Parts: cost + % markup List less 5% 25% 25% 25%

No Bid

Stamm Manufacturing

Logan Contractors Supply

John Deere Company

Don Hattan Chevrolet

Murphy Tractor & Equipment Link, Inc. PrairieLand Partners, Inc. Midway Freightliner, Inc.
Equipment Co.
Altec, Inc. Leachrod, LLC The Victor L. Phillips Co. Bobcat of Salina
Halco, Inc. Agri Center Fabick CAT Rusty Eck Ford
Kirby-Smith G.W. Van Doonan Truck & Equipment Cummings, McGowan
Machinery, Inc. Keppel Company of Wichita, Inc. & West, Inc.

On behalf of Fleet Management, recommend to accept the low responsive bid from Key Equipment & Supply Co. (Option 1) in the amount
of $318,990.00 and establish contract pricing for labor and parts for three (3) years.

A committee comprised of Bob Krause and Jon Medlam - Public Works, Rex Victory and Penny Poland - Fleet Management, and Gunda
Angelica - Purchasing, reviewed and evaluated submitted proposals based on specifications and price. Key Equipment & Supply Co. Option 3
and Truck Component Services dba The Larson Group did not meet specifications.

These are replacement vehicles for Public Works; surplus will be sold on Purple Wave, Inc.

Notes:

Key Equipment & Supply Co. (Option 3) is a "pelican” model and is not mounted on a chassis. This equipment does not meet specifications for
the sweeper engine, hydraulic system, electrical system and many other specifications.

Truck Component Services dba The Larson Group did not meet paint specification prior to assembly. This makes the sweeper vulnerable to
corrosion and could potentially decrease the life expectancy.




BID OPENING APRIL 21, 2015

2. ON-CALL ELECTRICAL SERVICES -- FACILITIES DEPARTMENT
FUNDING -- FACILITIES DEPARTMENT

(Request sent to 66 vendors)

RFP #15-0035 Contract

Advance . Southwestern Electrical
. Shelley Electric, Inc.
Electric, Inc. Company, Inc.
1. Cost + % for materials 15.00% 12.00% 9.75%
Labor Rate - Master Electrician
2. M-F 8am - 5pm $45.00/ hr $51.43/hr $50.00/hr
3. M-F 5:01pm - 7:59am $67.50/hr $77.15/hr $70.00/hr
4. Saturday/Sunday/Holidays $67.50/hr $102.86/hr $90.00/hr
5. Emergency $67.50/hr $102.86/hr $90.00/hr
Labor Rate - Journeyman
6. M-F 8am - 5pm $45.00/hr $46.75/hr $50.00/hr
7. M-F 5:01pm - 7:59am $67.50/hr $70.13/hr $70.00/hr
8. Saturday/Sunday/Holidays $67.50/hr $93.50/hr $90.00/hr
9. Emergency $67.50/hr $93.50/hr $90.00/hr
Labor Rate - Apprentice
10. M-F 8am - 5pm $38.00/hr $38.00/hr $34.00/hr
11. M-F 5:01pm - 7:59am $58.00/hr $57.00/hr $45.00/hr
12. Saturday/Sunday/Holidays $58.00/hr $76.00/hr $57.00/hr
13. Emergency $58.00/hr $76.00/hr $57.00/hr
. Sims Electric AFIas Belford
No Bid Electric, LLC Electric, Inc.

Kansas Electric, Inc.

Weber & Associates, Inc.

On behalf of the Facilities Department, recommend to accept the overall low proposals from Advance Electric, Inc.
and Southwestern Electrical Company, Inc. and establish contract pricing for one (1) year with two (2) one (1)

year options to renew.

Greg Tuxhorn-Facilities and Kim Evans-Purchasing reviewed the responses. The county has done business with all
vendors in the past with favorable results.

The estimated average annual spend on these services is $50,000.00.




BID OPENING APRIL 21, 2015



BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS APRIL 30, 2015

3. 2015 NOVA CHIP OVERLAYS (R175-B) -- PUBLIC WORKS
FUNDING -- R175 PREVENTIVE MX-15

(Request sent to eight vendors)

RFB #15-0036 SC #8000062730

APAC-Kansas, Inc.

Engineer's Estimate: $4,312,120.00 Shears Division

Cornejo & Sons, LLC

Nova Chip Overlays $3,657,948.00 $3,589,200.50
Bid bond Yes Yes
Acknowledge addendum Yes Yes

On behalf of Public Works, recommend to accept the low bid from Cornejo & Sons, LLC in the
amount of $3,589,200.50.

Nova Chip Overlays are one of the tools used by Public Works to prolong the life of a road by adding
a 1/2" overlay. This preventive maintenance project includes approximately 55 miles of county roads.



BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS APRIL 30, 2015

4. 2015 ASPHALT SURFACE RECYCLING (R175-M) -- PUBLIC WORKS
FUNDING -- R175 PREVENTIVE MX-15

(Request sent to 10 vendors)

RFB #15-0037 SC #8000062731

Engineer's Estimate: $1,218,254.20 EleiilE Asphalt < Dustrol, Inc.
Construction, Inc.

Asphalt Surface Recycling $992,710.47 $922,487.20

Bid bond Yes Yes

Acknowledge addenda Yes Yes

No Bid

Cutler Repaving, Inc.

On behalf of Public Works, recommend to accept the low bid from Dustrol, Inc. in the

amount of $922,487.20.

This is a process that rehabilitates the existing asphalt surface and adds a 1" overlay of new

asphalt on top. This preventive maintenance project includes approximately 9 miles of

county roads.

Dustrol, Inc. is a new vendor to the county. They are based in Towanda and have been in
business since 1973. Dustrol, Inc. is a provider of asphalt recycling and related highway

maintenance services.




BOARD OF BIDS AND

CONTRACTS APRIL 30, 2015

5. PRE-CAST REINFORCED CONCRETE BOX & END SECTIONS -- PUBLIC WORKS

FUNDING -- PUBLIC WORKS
(Request sent to 14 vendors)

RFB #15-0039 Contract

Old Castle Precast, Inc.
Price per Price per Price per Price per .
Lineal Foot @ | Lineal Foot @ | Lineal Foot @ | Lineal Foot @ ng gz::tEigﬁh
48'to 84' 90'to 120' 126'to 162' 168' or more

1. Reinforced concrete box 4' x 2' $177.15 $171.82 $170.40 $167.51 $1,884.37
2. Reinforced concrete box 4' x 3' $194.79 $189.47 $188.04 $185.15 $2,047.73
3. Reinforced concrete box 4' x 4' $215.77 $210.44 $209.02 $206.13 $2,173.58
4. Reinforced concrete box 5' x 2' $215.47 $212.40 $210.79 $207.58 $2,156.41
5. Reinforced concrete box 5' x 3' $241.65 $238.58 $236.97 $233.76 $2,370.96
6. Reinforced concrete box 5' x 4' $262.05 $256.76 $255.62 $250.80 $2,484.82
7. Reinforced concrete box 5' x 5' $262.05 $286.76 $285.62 $280.80 $2,722.32
8. Reinforced concrete box 6' x 2' $251.10 $247.73 $246.20 $245.32 $2,408.67
9. Reinforced concrete box 6' x 3' $285.50 $280.21 $279.07 $274.25 $2,659.04
10. Reinforced concrete box 6' x 4' $304.51 $301.13 $299.60 $298.72 $2,786.60
11. Reinforced concrete box 6' x 5' $325.74 $322.37 $320.83 $319.95 $2,971.49
12. Reinforced concrete box 6' x 6' $346.16 $342.79 $341.25 $340.37 $3,094.00
13. Reinforced concrete box 7' x 2' $299.49 $296.12 $294.58 $293.71 $2,732.54
14. Reinforced concrete box 7' x 3' $322.05 $318.68 $317.14 $316.26 $2,925.39
15. Reinforced concrete box 7' x 4' $345.16 $341.79 $340.25 $339.38 $3,064.07
16. Reinforced concrete box 7' x 5' $389.87 $386.50 $384.96 $384.08 $3,389.81
17. Reinforced concrete box 7' x 6' $411.24 $408.24 $406.95 $403.74 $3,527.01
18. Reinforced concrete box 7' x 7' $435.65 $432.65 $431.37 $428.15 no bid
19. Reinforced concrete box 8' x 2' $348.50 $345.50 $344.21 $341.00 $3,064.33
20. Reinforced concrete box 8' x 3' $372.63 $369.63 $368.34 $365.13 $3,266.60
21. Reinforced concrete box 8' x 4' $396.11 $393.11 $391.82 $388.61 $3,407.49
22. Reinforced concrete box 8' x 5' $418.77 $415.77 $414.48 $411.27 $3,600.94
23. Reinforced concrete box 8' x 6' $441.57 $438.57 $437.28 $434.07 $3,737.74
24, Reinforced concrete box 8' x 7' $463.71 $460.71 $459.43 $456.21 no bid
25. Reinforced concrete box 8' x 8' $487.72 $484.72 $483.43 $480.22 $4,129.65
26. Reinforced concrete box 9' x 3' $427.38 $424.38 $423.10 $419.88 $3,628.66
27. Reinforced concrete box 9' x 4' $452.39 $449.39 $448.10 $444.89 $3,778.70
28. Reinforced concrete box 9' x 5' $478.17 $475.17 $473.89 $470.67 $3,990.92
29. Reinforced concrete box 9' x 6' $502.24 $499.24 $497.96 $494.74 $4,135.34
30. Reinforced concrete box 9' x 8' $617.83 $614.83 $613.54 $610.33 $4,943.83
31. Reinforced concrete box 10' x 3' $545.04 $545.04 $545.04 $545.04 $4,413.17
32. Reinforced concrete box 10' x 4' $572.18 $572.18 $572.18 $572.18 $4,576.01
33. Reinforced concrete box 10' x 5' $599.58 $599.58 $599.58 $599.58 $4,797.92
34. Reinforced concrete box 10' x 6' $627.09 $627.09 $627.09 $627.09 $4,962.95
35. Reinforced concrete box 10' x 7' $653.67 $653.67 $653.67 $653.67 no bid
36. Reinforced concrete box 10' x 8' $836.40 $836.40 $836.40 $836.40 no bid
37. Reinforced concrete box 10' x 10' $905.87 $905.87 $905.87 $905.87 no bid
38. Reinforced concrete box 11' x 8' $934.28 $934.28 $934.28 $934.28 no bid
39. Reinforced concrete box 12' x 3' $845.91 $845.91 $845.91 $845.91 $6,285.48
40. Reinforced concrete box 12' x 4' $884.31 $884.31 $884.31 $884.31 $6,515.85
41. Reinforced concrete box 12' x 6' $962.57 $962.57 $962.57 $962.57 $7,042.94
42. Reinforced concrete box 12' x 7' $1,002.79 $1,002.76 $1,002.76 $1,002.76 no bid
43. Reinforced concrete box 12' x 8' $1,042.84 $1,042.84 $1,042.84 $1,042.84 no bid
44, Reinforced concrete box 12' x 10' $1,123.84 $1,123.84 $1,123.84 $1,123.84 no bid
45, Reinforced concrete box 14' x 14' $1,229.33 $1,229.33 $1,229.33 $1,229.33 no bid
46. Reinforced concrete box 14' x 16' $1,232.25 $1,232.25 $1,232.25 $1,232.25 no bid
47. Reinforced concrete box 16' x 4' $1,072.09 $1,072.09 $1,072.09 $1,072.09 $8,152.94
48. Reinforced concrete box 16' x 6' $1,152.09 $1,152.09 $1,152.09 $1,152.09 $8,690.45
49. Reinforced concrete box 16' x 8' $1,204.28 $1,204.28 $1,204.28 $1,204.28 no bid
50. Reinforced concrete box 16' x 10’ $1,282.94 $1,282.94 $1,282.94 $1,282.94 no bid
51. Ea., Rubber gasket and geotextile fabric $14.00 per linear foot
52. Ea., Curb 9" x 9" per foot, cast with unit $18.67 per linear foot
53. Ea., Curb 12" x 12" per foot, cast with unit $25.22 per linear foot
Acknowledge addendum Yes
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Wichita Concrete Pipe Co.
Price per Lineal|Price per Lineal|Price per Lineal|Price per Lineal .
X X \ . Price per Each
Foot @ 48'to | Foot @ 90" to | Foot @ 126" to | Foot @ 168’ or End Section
84' 120* 162' more
1. Reinforced concrete box 4' x 2" $234.16 $197.74 $185.59 $179.51 $2,904.95
2. Reinforced concrete box 4' x 3' $226.71 $190.28 $178.14 $172.06 $2,860.25
3. Reinforced concrete box 4' x 4' $238.75 $202.33 $190.18 $184.11 $2,932.51
4. Reinforced concrete box 5' x 2' $253.40 $216.96 $204.83 $198.75 $3,020.38
5. Reinforced concrete box 5' x 3' $244.98 $208.19 $196.04 $189.97 $2,969.90
6. Reinforced concrete box 5' x 4' $250.38 $213.96 $201.81 $195.74 $3,002.29
7. Reinforced concrete box 5' x 5' $259.48 $223.06 $210.91 $204.85 $3,056.89
8. Reinforced concrete box 6' x 2' $265.67 $228.92 $217.10 $211.03 $3,094.03
9. Reinforced concrete box 6' x 3' $256.43 $220.00 $207.86 $201.79 $3,038.60
10. Reinforced concrete box 6' x 4' $264.19 $227.77 $215.62 $209.54 $3,085.14
11. Reinforced concrete box 6' x 5' $274.25 $237.82 $225.68 $219.61 $3,145.52
12. Reinforced concrete box 6' x 6' $291.43 $254.99 $242.86 $236.78 $3,248.57
13. Reinforced concrete box 7' x 2 $288.16 $251.72 $239.59 $233.51 $3,228.95
14. Reinforced concrete box 7' x 3' $274.63 $238.21 $226.06 $220.00 $3,147.81
15. Reinforced concrete box 7' x 4' $301.45 $256.62 $241.68 $234.21 $3,308.70
16. Reinforced concrete box 7' x 5' $314.57 $276.22 $263.45 $257.06 $3,387.43
17. Reinforced concrete box 7' x 6' $324.73 $286.38 $273.60 $267.22 $3,448.38
18. Reinforced concrete box 7' x 7' $332.06 $293.71 $280.93 $274.54 $3,492.38
19. Reinforced concrete box 8' x 2' $288.18 $253.75 $242.28 $236.54 $3,229.08
20. Reinforced concrete box 8' x 3' $296.99 $260.75 $248.67 $242.63 $3,281.94
21. Reinforced concrete box 8' x 4' $308.11 $271.88 $259.80 $253.76 $3,348.66
22. Reinforced concrete box 8' x 5' $316.21 $279.96 $267.89 $261.85 $3,397.26
23. Reinforced concrete box 8' x 6' $324.27 $288.04 $275.95 $269.91 $3,435.62
24. Reinforced concrete box 8'x 7' $331.61 $295.37 $283.29 $277.26 $3,489.66
25. Reinforced concrete box 8' x 8' $351.84 $315.60 $303.52 $297.48 $3,611.04
26. Reinforced concrete box 9' x 3' $319.97 $283.73 $271.66 $265.62 $3,419.82
27. Reinforced concrete box 9' x 4' $337.11 $300.88 $288.80 $282.42 $4,022.66
28. Reinforced concrete box 9' x 5' $347.58 $311.35 $299.27 $293.23 $4,085.48
29. Reinforced concrete box 9' x 6' $358.73 $322.50 $310.42 $304.38 $4,152.38
30. Reinforced concrete box 9' x 8' $374.04 $337.80 $325.72 $319.68 $4,244.00
31. Reinforced concrete box 10' x 3' $351.66 $315.42 $303.34 $297.30 $4,109.96
32. Reinforced concrete box 10' x 4' $363.02 $326.77 $314.70 $308.66 $4,178.12
33. Reinforced concrete box 10' x 5' $369.35 $333.11 $321.04 $315.00 $4,216.10
34. Reinforced concrete box 10' x 6' $308.95 $344.71 $332.64 $326.60 $4,285.70
35. Reinforced concrete box 10' x 7' $390.36 $354.12 $342.05 $336.01 $4,342.16
36. Reinforced concrete box 10' x 8' $397.93 $361.70 $349.62 $343.57 $4,387.58
37. Reinforced concrete box 10' x 10' $462.39 $424.96 $412.50 $406.26 $4,772.00
38. Reinforced concrete box 11' x 8' $465.27 $427.17 $415.21 $408.69 $4,791.62
39. Reinforced concrete box 12' x 3' $401.00 $364.21 $352.63 $346.31 $4,406.00
40. Reinforced concrete box 12' x 4' $434.73 $398.94 $386.31 $381.05 $4,608.38
41. Reinforced concrete box 12' x 6' $454.73 $418.94 $406.31 $400.00 $4,728.38
42. Reinforced concrete box 12' x 7' $464.21 $428.42 $415.78 $410.58 $4,766.72
43. Reinforced concrete box 12' x 8' $483.15 $446.31 $434.20 $428.42 $4,898.90
44. Reinforced concrete box 12' x 10' $506.31 $470.52 $457.89 $456.84 $5,037.86
45. Reinforced concrete box 14' x 14' $838.04 $801.08 $788.04 $781.52 $7,028.24
46. Reinforced concrete box 14' x 16' $978.26 $941.30 $928.26 $921.73 $7,869.56
47. Reinforced concrete box 16' x 4' $746.73 $709.78 $696.73 $690.21 $6,480.38
48. Reinforced concrete box 16' x 6' $766.31 $728.26 $716.30 $709.79 $6,597.86
49. Reinforced concrete box 16' x 8' $796.74 $759.79 $747.42 $740.23 $6,780.44
50. Reinforced concrete box 16' x 10' $865.24 $828.36 $815.86 $809.56 $7,191.44
51. Ea., Rubber gasket and geotextile fabric $79.04 $79.04 $79.04 $79.04 $79.04
52. Ea., Curb 9" x 9" per foot, cast with unit $302.00 $302.00 $302.00 $302.00 $302.00
53. Ea., Curb 12" x 12" per foot, cast with unit $346.00 $346.00 $346.00 $346.00 $346.00
54. Reinforced concrete box 12' x 5' $444.73 $408.94 $396.31 $391.00 $4,505.00
Acknowledge addendum Yes
No Bid Cretex Concrete Products Midwest, Inc.

On the recommendation of Public Works, recommend to accept the overall low bid from Wichita Concrete Pipe Co. and establish
contract pricing for one (1) year with two (2) one (1) year options to renew.

Wichita Concrete Pipe Co. provided pricing for all items. The bid from Old Castle Precast, Inc. was missing a number of end section
sizes. End sections and box sections must be cast by the same pre-caster to get the joints to match.
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6. AB-3 ROCK -- PUBLIC WORKS
FUNDING -- R175 PREVENTIVE MX-15

(Request sent to 21 vendors)

RFB #15-0041 SC# 8000062284

Oty Whitaker Aggregates, Inc. South West Butler Quarry, LLC
' Price per Ton Extended Price Price per Ton Extended Price
AB-3 Rock 13,200 tons $6.00 $79,200.00 $6.60 $87,120.00
Availability date immediately immediately
Location of plant site 34196 162nd Rd., Dexter 9423 SW 165th, Augusta
Martins Central Sand Co., Inc dba Martins Central Sand Co., Inc dba
Qty. Central Sand Co., Inc. (Option 1) Central Sand Co., Inc. (Option 2)
Price per Ton Extended Price Price per Ton Extended Price
AB-3 Rock 13,200 tons $18.35 $242,220.00 $18.40 $242,880.00
Availability date 7 days March 31, 2017
Location of plant site 8001 W. 53rd St. N., Maize Kansas

APAC- Central, Inc.

Trinity Industries

No Bid

Bentley Sand Co., LLC

Bob Bergkamp
Construction Co., Inc.

On behalf of Public Works, recommend to accept the bid from South West Butler Quarry, LLC for an
initial purchase in the amount of $87,120.00 and establish contract pricing for one (1) year with two (2)

one (1) year options to renew.

The bid from Whitaker Aggregates, Inc. was a lower material cost by $.60 /ton but would result in a higher
delivered cost per ton for the County. The bid is quoted based on County pickup of loads from the quarry and
delivery to the North, Andale, West and Clonmel Yards. The average round trip is 138 miles for the four
facilities from Whitaker Aggregates resulting in a premium of $14.50/ton to the base cost when factoring in
the extra mileage and labor rates. The location of the Whitaker Aggregates' quarry is more than twice the
distance of the South West Butler quarry.

AB-3 rock is used for making the edge of road pavement, thus creating a rock shoulder edge.
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7. CM-G CHAT -- PUBLIC WORKS
FUNDING -- R175 PREVENTIVE MX-15

(Request sent to 28 vendors)

RFB #15-0045 SC #8000063197

A Plus Logistics, LLC dba

Fremar Corporation

Qty. A Plus Trucking
Price per Ton Extended Price Price per Ton Extended Price
CM-G Chat 4,000 tons $22.90 $91,600.00 $22.90 for 1/2 $91,600.00
washed rock
Delivery start date immediately 7 days

No Bid

Bentley Sand Co., LLC

Bob Bergkamp Construction Co., Inc.

On behalf of Public Works, recommend to accept the bid from A Plus Logistics, LLC dba A Plus Trucking in
the amount of $91,600.00 and establish contract pricing for one (1) year with two (2) one (1) year options to

renew.

Fremar Corporation did not meet specification. The specification calls for all of the material to pass though a 1/2
inch sieve. Fremar Corporation noted on their bid that this did not meet the specification outlined by KDOT.




