
BID OPENING, DECEMBER 9, 2003 
 
TWO-MAN PLATFORM BUCKET TRUCK – FLEET MANAGEMENT  
FUNDING – FLEET MANAGEMENT 
(Request for Bid sent to fifteen vendors) 
 
RFB #03-13412 
 Elliott 

Equipment Co. 
Altec 

Industries, 
Inc.  

Rusty Eck Roberts Truck 
Center Inc. 

1 ea. 2004 Two-Man Platform 
Bucket Truck for Public Works  

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
$76,806.00 

 
$95,710.56 

Make   Ford F650 Diamond SPEC 
TRADE-IN:     
1994 Ford F350 Bucket Lift 
Truck (310-0102)  

  $3,000.00  
$2,500.00 

Grand Total with Trade-In    $73,806.00 $93,210.56 
Manuals   $335.00 No Response 
CD Rom Manual    $500.00 2,500.00 
Delivery Date   4-6 weeks 20 weeks 
Warranty    2 yrs/unlimited 2 yrs/unlimited 
     
 Drake Scuggs 

Equipment 
(Option 1) 

Drake Scuggs 
Equipment  
(Option 2) 

Drake Scruggs 
Equipment  
(Option 3) 

 

1 ea. 2004 Two-Man Platform 
Bucket Truck for Public Works  

 
$77,006.00 

 
$107,800.00 

 
$106,212.00 

 

 Versalift VST-
236I 

Versalift 
VST-5000 

 
Elliott L55R 

 

TRADE-IN:     
1994 Ford F350 Bucket Lift 
Truck (310-0102)  

 
$2,000.00 

 
$2,000.00 

 
$2,000.00 

 

Grand Total with Trade-In  $75,006.00 $105,800.00 $104,212.00  
Manuals $335.00 $335.00 335.00  
CD Rom Manual  $500.00 $500.00 500.00  
Delivery Date 18 weeks 18 weeks 18 weeks  
Warranty  1 year 1 year 1 year  
 



 
BOARD OF BIDS & CONTRACTS, DECEMBER 11, 2003 
 
TWO-MAN PLATFORM BUCKET TRUCK – FLEET MANAGEMENT  
FUNDING – FLEET MANAGEMENT 
(Request for Bid sent to fifteen vendors) 
 
RFB #03-13412 
 Elliott 

Equipment Co. 
Altec 

Industries, 
Inc.  

Rusty Eck Roberts Truck 
Center Inc. 

1 ea. 2004 Two-Man Platform 
Bucket Truck for Public Works  

 
No Bid 

 
No Bid 

 
$76,806.00 

 
$95,710.56 

Make   Ford F650 Diamond SPEC 
TRADE-IN:     
1994 Ford F350 Bucket Lift 
Truck (310-0102)  

   
$3,000.00 

 
$2,500.00 

Total less Trade-In    $73,806.00 $93,210.56 
Manuals   $335.00 No Response 
Grand Total less trade, including 
manuals 

   
$74,141.00 

 
$93,210.56 

CD Rom   $500.00 $2,500.00 
Delivery Date   4-6 weeks 20 weeks 
Warranty    2 yrs/unlimited 2 yrs/unlimited 
 
 Drake Scuggs 

Equipment (Option 
1) 

Drake Scuggs 
Equipment  
(Option 2) 

Drake Scruggs 
Equipment  
(Option 3) 

1 ea. 2004 Two-Man Platform 
Bucket Truck for Public Works  

 
$77,006.00 

 
$107,800.00 

 
$106,212.00 

 Versalift VST-236I Versalift VST-5000  
Elliott L55R 

TRADE-IN:    
1994 Ford F350 Bucket Lift Truck 
(310-0102)  

 
$2,000.00 

 
$2,000.00 

 
$2,000.00 

Total less Trade-In  $75,006.00 $105,800.00 $104,212.00 
Manuals $335.00 $335.00 $335.00 
Grand Total less trade, including 
manuals 

 
$75,341.00 

 
$106,135.00 

 
$104,547.00 

CD Rom $500.00 $500.00 $500.00 
Delivery Date 18 weeks 18 weeks 18 weeks 
Warranty  1 year 1 year 1 year 
 
On the recommendation of Iris Baker, on behalf of Fleet Management, David Spears moved to accept the 
low bid, including trade-in and manuals for a total of $74,141.00.  Ron Holt seconded the motion.  
The motion passed unanimously. 
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