1. TABLES, CHAIRS & DOLLIES - COWTOWN

FUNDING - COWTOWN

(Request for Bid sent to thirteen vendors)

RFB #04-20409

Mity-Lite American Fun Adirondack Carstone Berry
Food Direct Industries Workspace
15 ea. Tables $188.60 ea. $159.62 ea. $145.00 ea. No Bid All
(Indoor) $2,829.00 $2,394.30 $2,175.00 No Bid Items
30 ea. Tables $188.60 ea. $211.69 ea. $122.00 ea. No Bid
(Outdoor) $5,658.00 $6,350.70 $3,660.00
120 ea. Chairs $58.04 ea. $26.50 ea. $27.68 ea. $49.25
(Stackable) $6,964.80 $3,180.00 $3,321.60 $5,910.00
240 ea. Chairs $34.01 ea. $11.86 ea. $11.75 ea. No Bid
(Outdoor) $8,162.40 $2,846.40 $2,820.00
6 ea. Caddie $314.25 ea $293.35 ea. $321.00 ea. No Bid
(Round Table) $1,885.50 $1,760.10 $1,926.00
5 ea. Chair $180.20 ea. $94.61 ea. $61.00 ea.
Dolly $901.00 $473.05 $305.00 No Bid
(Stackable
Chairs
5 ea. Chair $265.20 $157.95 ea $105.00 ea.
Dolly (Folding $1,326.00 $789.75 $525.00 No Bid
Chairs)
(+$791.51
Total S&H) $17,794.30 $14,732.60 $5,910.00
$28,518.21
Delivery Date 40-45 days 4-6 weeks 30 days ARO 4-6 weeks

The recommendation of Purchasing and Cowtown is to accept the low complete bid from Adirondack

Direct for $14,732.60.
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