
APPROVED, OCTOBER 30, 2007 

1. COLOR CODED CASE FILE FOLDERS – DISTRICT COURT 
FUNDING – DISTRICT COURT 
(Request for Bid sent to seventeen vendors) 
 
RFB 07-0195 

 Systematic 
Filing 

Records 
Retrieval 
Systems 

Midwest 
Single 
Source 

Concepts for 
Business 

1.  20,100 ea, CR, FG, CV SC, DM RC No bid $0.456 ea 
$9,165.60 

$0.461 ea 
$9,266.10 

$0.53 ea 
$10,653.00 

2.  3,500 ea, PR, CT, AD, JC, JV No bid $0.4617 ea 
$1,616.00 

$0.461 ea 
$1,613.50 

$0.43 ea 
$1,505.00 

3.  900 EA, appeals -  blank (not end tabs) No bid $0.407 ea 
$366.37 

$0.393 ea 
$353.70 

$1.09 ea 
$981.00 

4.  2,300 ea, Blank No bid $0.35 ea 
$805.00 

$0.564 ea 
$1,297.20 

$0.48 ea 
$1,104.00 

Grand Total No bid $11,952.97 $12,530.50 $14,243.00 
Days for delivery ARO, delivery must be by 12/28/07  30-40 

working days 
40  

working days
45-50 days 

     
 Der Graphics Retrieval 

Business 
Systems 

Ames Safety 
Envelope 

 

1.  20,100 ea, CR, FG, CV SC, DM RC $0.62 ea 
$12,462.00 

$0.394 ea 
$7,919.40 

$0.535 ea 
$10,753.50 

 

2.  3,500 ea, PR, CT, AD, JC, JV $0.62 ea 
$2,170.00 

$0.274 ea 
$959.00 

$0.535 ea 
$1,872.50 

 

3.  900 EA, appeals -  blank (not end tabs) $0.62 ea 
$558.00 

$0.486 ea 
$437.40 

$0.782 ea 
$703.80 

 

4.  2,300 ea, Blank $0.62 ea 
$1,426.00 

$.322 ea 
$740.60 

$0.527 ea 
$1,212.10 

 

Grand Total $16,616.00 $10,056.40 $14,541.90  
Days for delivery ARO, delivery must be by 12/28/07 As requested 35-40 days 65 days  

The recommendation of Purchasing and District Court is to accept the low bid from Retrieval Business 
Systems, Inc. in the amount of $10,056.40. 

 


