
BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS NOVEMBER 8, 2007 

RENTAL UNIFORMS – VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS 
FUNDING – VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS 
(Request for Bid sent to seven vendors) 
 
RFB 07-0203 

  AmeriPride Unifirst 

1 65%/35% Blend Guard Shirt – White  $0.30 ea $0.29 ea 
2 65%/35% Blend Industrial Shirts – Light Blue $0.15 ea $0.15 ea 
3 65%/35% Blend Industrial Shirts – Blue (narrow) & Grey (wide)

Vertical Strips 
$0.18 ea $0.19 ea 

4 65%/35% Blend Industrial Shirts – Grey $0.15 ea $0.15 ea 
5 65%/35% Blend Industrial Shirts – White & Charcoal 

 Vertical Strips 
$0.18 ea $0.17 ea 

6 65%/35% Blend Regular Dress Shirts – Blue $0.23 ea $0.21 ea 
7 65%/35% Blend Denim Shirts – Navy Blue $0.23 ea $0.24 ea 
8 100% Cotton Shirts – Grey $0.19 ea $0.23 ea 
9 100% Cotton Shirts – Khaki & Navy Striped $0.39 ea Deleted by vendor 
10 65%/35% Blend Pleated Women’s Pants – Black $0.22 ea $0.28 ea 
11 65%/35% Blend Pleated Women’s Pants – Navy $0.22 ea $0.28 ea 
12 65%/35% Blend Pleated Men’s Pants – Black $0.22 ea $0.28 ea 
13 65%/35% Blend Pleated Men’s Pants – Navy $0.22 ea $0.28 ea 
14 65%/35% Blend Pleated Pant – Khaki $0.22 ea $0.28 ea 
15 65%/35% Blend Western Cut Industrial Pant – Charcoal $0.22 ea $0.22 ea 
16 100% Cotton Pant – Charcoal $0.22 ea $0.29 ea 
17 100% Cotton Denim Jeans – Blue $0.19 ea $0.25 ea 
18 100% Cotton Carpenter Style Jeans – Blue $0.27 ea $0.045 ea* 

Riggs by Wrangler carpenter 
 jean, non-stock buyout required

19 65%/35% Team Jackets – Navy $0.50 ea $0.44 ea 
20 65%/35% Ike Jackets – Navy $0.50 ea $0.44 ea 
21 Cloth Name Tag, furnish and attach Screen print 

No charge 
$0.70 ea 

22 Price to sew County Logo Patch (County to provide patch) No charge $0.45 ea 
OVERSIZE PRICING (If applicable) 

65%/35% Blend Shirts 
23 2X – Large No charge $1.00 ea 

Additional one time fee 
24 3X – Large No charge $1.00 ea 

Additional one time fee 
25 4X – Large No charge $1.00 ea 

Additional one time fee 
   65%/35% Blend Pants 

26 2X – Large No charge $1.00 ea 
Additional one time fee 

27 3X – Large No charge $1.00 ea 
Additional one time fee 

28 4X – Large No charge $1.00 ea 
Additional one time fee 

100% Cotton Shirts 
29 2X – Large No charge $1.00 ea 

Additional one time fee 
30 3X – Large No charge $1.00 ea 

Additional one time fee 
31 4X - Large No charge $1.00 ea 

Additional One time fee 
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100% Cotton Pants and Denim 
32 2X – Large No charge $1.00 ea 

Additional one time fee 
33 3X – Large No charge $1.00 ea 

Additional one time fee 
34 4X - Large No charge $1.00 ea 

Additional one time fee 
Other Items 

35 Red Shop Towels 14” x 14” No bid Not available 
36 Red Shop Towels 15” x 15” No bid Not available 
37 Red Shop Towels 16” x 16” $0.05 ea,  

18” X 18” 
w/2% inventory 
maintenance  at $ .40 

$0.05 ea  
plus 2% replaced at $0.40 

38 White Shop Towels 15” x 15” No bid Not available 
39 White Shop Towels 16” x 16” $0.05 ea,  

18” x 18” 
w/2% inventory 
maintenance  @ $ .40 

$0.09 ea 
plus 2% replaced 
at $0.40 

40 Huck Towels 15” x 26” $0.10 ea 
w/2% inventory 
maintenance  @ $ .40 

Not available 

41 Huck Towels 16” x 24” No bid $0.12 ea 
Plus 2% replaced at $0.65 

42 Huck Towels 17” x 22” No bid Not available 
43 Huck Towels 17” x 30” No bid Not available 
44 Bath Towels 28” x 55” $0.40 ea 

24” x 48” 
w/2% inventory 
maintenance 

$0.25 ea 
20” x 40” 

45 Bath Towels 30” x 54” No bid $0.30 ea 
24” x 48” 

46 Bath Towels 32” x 54” No bid Not available 
47 Mop Treated 18” $0.70 ea $0.55 ea 
48 Mop Treated 24” $0.90 ea $0.70 ea 
49 Mop Treated 36” $1.15 ea $0.85 ea 
50 Mop Treated 48” $1.55 ea $1.05 ea 
51 Mop Treated 60” $2.10 ea $1.20 ea 
52 Mop Tool 18” No charge No charge 
53 Mop Tool 24” No charge No charge 
54 Mop Tool 36” No charge No charge 
55 Mop Tool 48” No charge No charge 
56 Mop Tool 60” No charge No charge 
57 Mop Wet Medium $1.00 ea $0.75 ea 
58 Mop Wet Large $1.50 ea $1.25 ea 
59 Mop Wet Tool Medium No charge No charge 
60 Mop Wet Tool Large No charge No charge 
61 Entryway Mats 3’ x 4’ $1.50 ea $1.75 ea 
62 Entryway Mats 3’ x 5’ $1.50 ea $1.75 ea 
63 Entryway Mats 4’ x 6’ $2.50 ea $2.90 ea 
64 Entryway Mats 3’ x 10’ $3.50 ea $3.90 ea 
65 Anti Fatigue Mat 2’ x 3’ $1.00 ea $1.50 ea 
66 Anti Fatigue Mat 3’ x 5’ $1.50 ea $1.75 ea 
67 Safety Mat 3’ x 4’ $2.25 ea $1.90 ea 
68 Safety Mat 3’ x 5’ $2.25 ea $1.90 ea 
69 Safety Mat 4’ x 6’ $3.25 ea $3.05 ea 
70 Fender Cover $1.00 ea $0.40 ea 
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On the recommendation of Dallas Shaffer, on behalf of Various Departments of Sedgwick County, Anne 
Smarsh moved to accept the overall low bid* from AmeriPride Uniform Services and establish 
contract pricing for one (1) year with two (2) one (1) year options to renew.  Jennifer Dombaugh 
seconded the motion.  The motion passed unanimously. 
 
Note:  The annual spend for last year was $35,000.00.  There are currently 21 different departments that 
will utilize the contract.  Overall analysis consists of what each vendor priced and the estimated quantities 
of usage for items. 


