BOARD OF BIDS CONTRACTS DECEMBER 04, 2008

3. CISCO EQUIPMENT AND MAINTENANCE -- COMCARE
FUNDING -- COMCARE

(Request for Bid sent to fifty-two vendors)

RFB 08-0296 Req 10036322

AT&T Howard Industries, Inc ACS Continuant
Item # Description Qty Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

CISCO CSS 11501 CONTENT SERVICES
SWITCH-LOAD BALANCING DEVICE

1 PN# CSS11501-2PK 1ea $11,797.05| $11,797.05 $14,040.00 $14,040.00| $12,242.00[ $12,242.00 $13,436.64 $13,436.64
THREE YEAR SMARTNET 8X5XNBD
FOR CISCO CSS11501

2 PN # CON-SNT-CSS115012 -- 3 YEARS 1ea $5,152.47 $5,152.47 $2,253.00 $2,253.00] $5,648.00 $5,648.00 $5,845.76 $5,845.76
CISCO UNIFIED PRESENCE 7.0 SERVEH
WITH CISCO UNIFIED PRESENCE

3 PRE-INSTALLED PN# MCS782513-K9-CUP 2ea $5,307.05[ $10,614.10 $6,315.00 $12,630.00 $5,370.00 $10,740.00 $6,044.64 $12,089.28
THREE YEAR ESSENTIAL SOFTWARE F
FOR CUP-SERVER 7.0-K9 ON
MCS782513-K-9

4 PN# CON-ESW-2513UP7 2ea $4,044.87 $8,089.74 $1,768.00 $3,536.00 $3,362.00 $6,724.00 $1,636.14 $3,272.28
CISCO UNIFIED PRESENCE LICENSE

5 PN# CUP-SERVERS-LICENSE 450 ea $29.50| $13,275.00 $1,402.00 $630,900.00 $31.00 $13,950.00 $33.60 $15,120.00
3 YEAR ESSENTIAL SOFTWARE FOR
CUP-SERVER-LIC

6 PN# CON-ESW-CUPSVLIC 450 ea $12.78 $5,751.00 $6.00 $2,700.00 $6.00 $2,700.00 $5.40 $2,430.00
UCSS FOR CISCO UNIFIED PRESENCE

7 FOR 3 YEAR PN#UCSS-CUP-3-10 Sea $92.63 $463.15 $61.00 $305.00 $109.00 $545.00 $107.25 $536.25
UCSS FOR CISCO UNIFIED PRESENCE

8 FOR 3 YEAR; PN#UCSS-CUP-3-100 4ea $929.25 $3,717.00 $615.00 $2,460.00 $1,084.00 $4,336.00 $1,074.67 $4,298.68
THREE YEAR SMARTNET 8X5XNBD
CISCO CUP SERVER 7.0

9 PN# CON-SNT-2513UP7, 3 YRS 2ea $1,533.60 $3,067.20 $524.00 $1,048.00] $1,823.00 $3,646.00 $1,750.66 $3,501.32

Grand total $61,926.71 $669,872.00 $60,531.00 $60,530.21
Acknowledge Addendum Y
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Infinity Micro Computer, | Leverage Information Systems | En Pointe Technologies Alexander Open Systems
Item # Description Qty Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price
CISCO CSS 11501 CONTENT SERVICES
SWITCH-LOAD BALANCING DEVICE
1 PN# CSS11501-2PK 1ea $13,595.00[ $13,595.00[ $12,403.32 $12,403.32 $11,714.24 $10,597.35 $10,597.35
THREE YEAR SMARTNET 8X5XNBD
FOR CISCO CSS11501
2 PN # CON-SNT-CSS115012 -- 3 YEARS 1ea $2,225.00 $2,225.00 $5,558.01 $5,558.01 $5,644.32 $5,660.46 $5,660.46
CISCO UNIFIED PRESENCE 7.0 SERVEH
WITH CISCO UNIFIED PRESENCE
3 PRE-INSTALLED PN# MCS782513-K9-CUP 2ea no bid $5,579.79 $11,159.58 $5,269.80] $10,539.60 $4,767.35 $9,534.70
THREE YEAR ESSENTIAL SOFTWARE F
FOR CUP-SERVER 7.0-K9 ON
MCS782513-K-9
4 PN# CON-ESW-2513UP7 2 ea $4,935.00]  $9,870.00]  $4,340.26 $8,680.52|* $4,420.26 $8,840.52
CISCO UNIFIED PRESENCE LICENSE
5 PN# CUP-SERVERS-LICENSE 450 ea no bid $31.02 $13,959.00 $29.29 $13,180.50 $26.50 $11,925.00
3 YEAR ESSENTIAL SOFTWARE FOR
CUP-SERVER-LIC
6 PN# CON-ESW-CUPSVLIC 450 ea $19.50 $8,775.00 $13.79 $6,205.50 $14.04 $6,318.00
UCSS FOR CISCO UNIFIED PRESENCE
7 FOR 3 YEAR PN#UCSS-CUP-3-10 5ea no bid $97.39 $486.95 $83.21 $416.05
UCSS FOR CISCO UNIFIED PRESENCE
8 FOR 3 YEAR; PN#UCSS-CUP-3-100 4 ea no bid $977.01 $3,908.04 $834.75 $3,339.00
THREE YEAR SMARTNET 8X5XNBD
CISCO CUP SERVER 7.0
9 PN# CON-SNT-2513UP7, 3 YRS 2 ea no bid $1,654.31 $3,308.62|  $1,680.00 $3,360.00 $1,684.80 $3,369.60
Grand total $34,465.00 $65,669.54 $44,438.66 $60,000.68
Shipping $600.01
Grand Total $60,600.69
Acknowledge Addendum Y
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CDW-G Solutions
Item # Description Qty Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

CISCO CSS 11501 CONTENT SERVICES
SWITCH-LOAD BALANCING DEVICE
1 PN# CSS11501-2PK 1ea no bid no bid

THREE YEAR SMARTNET 8X5XNBD
FOR CISCO CSS11501
2 PN # CON-SNT-CSS115012 -- 3 YEARS 1ea

CISCO UNIFIED PRESENCE 7.0 SERVEF
WITH CISCO UNIFIED PRESENCE

3 PRE-INSTALLED PN# MCS782513-K9-CUP 2ea

THREE YEAR ESSENTIAL SOFTWARE F
FOR CUP-SERVER 7.0-K9 ON
MCS782513-K-9

4 PN# CON-ESW-2513UP7 2ea
CISCO UNIFIED PRESENCE LICENSE
5 PN# CUP-SERVERS-LICENSE 450 ea

3 YEAR ESSENTIAL SOFTWARE FOR

CUP-SERVER-LIC
6 PN# CON-ESW-CUPSVLIC 450 ea

UCSS FOR CISCO UNIFIED PRESENCE
7 FOR 3 YEAR PN#UCSS-CUP-3-10 5ea

UCSS FOR CISCO UNIFIED PRESENCE
8 FOR 3 YEAR; PN#UCSS-CUP-3-100 4 ea

THREE YEAR SMARTNET 8X5XNBD

CISCO CUP SERVER 7.0
9 PN# CON-SNT-2513UP7, 3 YRS 2 ea

Grand total

Acknowledge Addendum

On the recommendation of Kimberly Lee on behalf of Comcare, Irene Hart moved to accept the low complete bid from Continuant in the amount of
$60,530.21. Don Brace seconded the motion. The motion passed unanimously.

This is equipment for the Office Communications Server implementation at Comcare.

Note-Infinity Micro and En Pointe Technologies did not submit complete responses.



