BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS DECEMBER 11, 2008

ITEMS REQUIRING BOCC APPROVAL
7 ltems

1. ZTR MOWER AND ACCESSORIES- JUVENILE DETENTION FACILITY
FUNDING - JUVENILE DETENTION FACILITY MAINTENANCE

(Request for Bid sent to six vendors)
RFB 08-0317 Req 10036788

Item Qty Description Oxford Saw & |Jim's Tire & Auto| Andover Auto Maximum J & M Ag Service
Mower Parts Tractor
1 lea |ZTR Mower without deck, $7,655.51 $7,250.00 $7,200.00 $7,360.00 $8,383.75
with large wheel in back
Brand Name Grasshopper Walker Walker Walker Grasshopper
Model/Part # 723/3348 MTSD-23HP MTSD-32HP MTSD-23HP 531883-986
Options
2 lea Suspension Seat $187.14 $699.00 $600.00 $772.80 $202.50
3 lea  |46" Dozer Blade $551.03 $549.00 $616.00 $552.00 $596.25
4 lea Implement Hitch #1H-6620 No Bid $849.00 $900.00 $856.00 No Bid
5 lea Curb Jumper Ramp $69.00 $108.00 $138.00 $109.54 $75.00
6 lea Operator Soft Cab $1,278.81 $1,550.00 $1,525.00 $1,408.33 $1,332.09
7 lea Foamed Rubber on all Wheels No Bid n/a $180.00 $222.70 $65.25
8 lea [Tail weights: 85 Ibs No Bid $350.00 $444.00 $352.08 No Bid
9 lea [Tire Chains $114.36 $115.00 $150.00 $33.27 $123.75
10 2 ea Spacers for Tire Chains #870-31 No Bid $44.00 included $37.60 No Bid
11 lea Instrument Panel Cover No Bid $29.00 $37.00 $25.43 No Bid
Total $9,855.85 $11,543.00 $11,790.00 $11,729.75 $10,778.59
. 1 yr tractor, 1yr base
2 yrs engine, . .
. 1 yr accessories, 2 yrs engine
2yrs 1 yr machine, 2 yrs engine 3yrs/1000 hrs 2yrs
Warranty y 1 yr attachments, y gine, y y
. 3yrs/3000hrs hydro & gear
all limited
hydro & gear axle axle
Days to Deliveryl 2 weeks 15 days estimate 2 weeks 15 days 15 days ARO
Addendum Acknowledged N Y Y Y Y

On the recommendation of Dallas Shaffer, on behalf of Juvenile Detention Facility Department, Ron Estes moved to accept the low complete bid meeting

specifications from Maximum Tractor in the amount of $11,729.75. Anne Smarsh seconded the motion. The motion passed unanimously.

Note: The two bids for the Grasshopper brand did not meet the specifications of the bid. Jim's Tire and Auto was contacted about the foamed filled tires

but wasn't interested in getting a price for it. This is dual purpose equipment that will be used for mowing and snow removal.




