
REGULAR MEETING 
BOARD OF BIDS & CONTRACTS 

BoCC Meeting Room at 10:00 A.M. 
 

June 24, 2010 
(8 Items) 

 
AGENDA ITEMS 
 
 
1. Tables for NCAT CATIA & Computer Labs ------------------------------------ Facilities Department 

(10041557) 
2. Bookstore Shelving and Installation for NCAT ---------------------------------- Facilities Department 

(10041814) 
3. Automotive Paint Products for Fleet Body Shop ------------------------------------ Fleet Management 

(N/A) 
4. Medical Billing -------------------------------------------------------------- Emergency Medical Services 

(N/A) 
5. Digital X-ray Machine ----------------------------------------------------------- Forensic Science Center 

(10041566) 
6. In-Home Telehealth Services ------------------------------------------------------- Department on Aging 

(N/A) 
7. Quality Improvement Specialist ------------------------------------------------------- Health Department 

(1004) 
8. Employee Medical and Pharmacy Benefits ------------------------------------------- Human Resources 

(1004) 
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       RFP #10-0148  Req 10041557

PS Furniture/ 
Palmer Snyder 

Tables-N-
Chairs Mity-Lite 2M SPORTS

Records 
Retrieval 
Systems

John A. 
Marshall Encompas iFurn.Com, Inc

24" x 36"  no bid no bid no bid no bid n/a n/a n/a n/a
24" x 72"     $732.275 ea. $600.35 ea. $379.07 ea. $315.03 ea.
30" x 36" $653.52 ea. n/a $308.80 ea. n/a
30" x 72" $770.07 ea. $468.38 ea. $356.31 ea. $499.52 ea.
30" x 48" $548.00 ea. $445.51 ea. $321.33 ea. $297.70 ea.
Shipping/Installation Included Included Included $6,450.00 

Brand Quoted SMI Systems Versteel Tim
Chromcraft 

Task HON Huddle
Addenda Y Y Y Y
Delivery Date 8 weeks 4 weeks 4-5 weeks 4-5 weeks

Integrated 
Facilities 
Option #1

Integrated 
Facilities 
Option #2

Versa 
Products, Inc

Business 
Interiors by 

Staples

Business 
Interiors by 

Staples

Midwest 
Single Source 

Option #1

Midwest 
Single Source 

Option #2 Scott Rice
24" x 36"  $331.02 ea. $386.02 ea. $291.50 ea. $538.78 ea. $447.98 ea. $285.95 ea. $316.15 ea. $255.20 ea.
24" x 72" $437.42 ea. $492.42 ea. n/a $596.56 ea. $506.74 ea. $351.25 ea. $392.30 ea. n/a
30" x 36" $323.79 ea. $323.79 ea. $319.00 ea. $552.56 ea. $461.99 ea. $264.35 ea. $288.80 ea. $294.09 ea.
30" x 72" $430.19 ea. $430.19 ea. n/a $622.78 ea. $510.81 ea. $332.90 ea. $379.35 ea. n/a
30" x 48" $349.35 ea. $349.35 ea. $329.00 ea. $575.67 ea. $485.50 ea. $272.60 ea. $331.90 ea. $319.64 ea.
Shipping/Installation Included Included Included Included Included Included Included Included

1.  TABLES FOR THE NATIONAL CENTER FOR AVIATION TRAINING'S CATIA & COMPUTER LABS - FACILITIES
     DEPARTMENT
     FUNDING - NCAT FURNITURE FIXTURES & EQUIPMENT
     (Request for Proposal sent to thirty vendors)

ITEMS REQUIRING BOCC APPROVAL
8 Items
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Brand Quoted

Global Bungee 
(Generic 

power strips)

Global Bungee 
(Teknion 

power strips)
Versa BCT 

Series
Surface Tech 

Bent Leg
Surface Tech 

Post Leg

Paragon 
Intuitive 
computer 

training tables

Paragon Space 
Saving training 
work stations

Special.T 
Delta Series

Addenda Y Y Y Y Y Y Y Y
Delivery Date 4-5 weeks 4-5 weeks 6-8 weeks 4-6 weeks 4-6 weeks 4 weeks 4 weeks 5 weeks

On behalf of the Facilities Department, recommend to accept the proposal from Midwest Single Source Option #1 for an initial purchase of $39,443.65 
and establish contract pricing for one (1) year.

A review committee comprised of Paula Downs and Kelli Grant (Facilities Department), Kirk Peterson (Operations Manager for WATC), Shawn Ehrstein 
(Director of CAD/CAM Labs for NIAR), and Joe Thomas (Purchasing) reviewed proposals as to content, pricing and delivery.  Another important consideration
was the functionality of the tables in a laboratory environment.  Midwest Single Source Option #1 offered the best proposal.

The initial purchase will include 48 tables 24" x 72" for 4 computer labs, 13 tables 30" x 72" and 1 table 30" x 36" for 1 CATIA lab, and 66 tables 30" x 48" for 
3 CATIA labs.


