
BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS APRIL 15, 2010

      RFB 10-0071   Req 10041502

Engineer's Estimate:  $147,160.00
Lafarge North 

America
APAC - 

Kansas, Inc
Cornejo & 

Sons
1.  Cedar Hills Estates $153,656.15 $144,901.00 $141,810.50
Bid Bond Y Y Y

ITEMS REQUIRING BoCC APPROVAL
7 Items

1.  ROAD IMPROVEMENTS - PUBLIC WORKS
FUNDING - CEDAR HILLS ESTATES (SPECIAL ASSESSMENT)
(Request for Bid sent to thirteen vendors)

On the recommendation of Joe Thomas, on behalf of Public Works, Ron Estes moved to accept the low bid 
from Cornejo & Sons in the amount of $141,810.50. Irene Hart seconded the motion.  The motion passed 
unanimously.

This project is new road construction in a residential housing development located on 151st St. West between 
Maple & Central.



BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS APRIL 15,2010

      RFB 10-0110  Req # 10041099
Foley Equipment Co Victor L Phillips Co

1.  1 ea, Ingersoll Rand P185W1R Portable Air Compressor $12,727.00 $13,981.30

Make/Model
Sullivan                  

D185P3CA
Ingersoll Rand 

P185W1R 
2.  1 ea, Manual included $0.00
Grand total $12,727.00 $13,981.30

Warranty

2 yrs on cat engine; 3 
yrs on air end; 1 yr all 

other components

1 yr/2000 hrs all 
components; 2 

yrs/4000 hrs air end; 
2 yrs/2000 hrs engine

Delivery Date  2 weeks 8-12 weeks

2. PORTABLE AIR COMPRESSOR -- PUBLIC WORKS
FUNDING- RISK MANAGEMENT RESERVE
(Request for Bid sent to twenty-eight vendors)

On the recommendation of Brandy McCune, on behalf of Public Works, Ron Estes moved to accept the bid 
meeting specifications from Victor L. Phillips for the amount of $13,981.30. Irene Hart seconded the 
motion.  The motion passed unanimously.

This is a replacement air compressor for the one stolen from the Public Works North Yard during the Fall of 
2009.  The Sullivan air compressor did not  meet specification for the horse power. 



BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS APRIL 15, 2010

      RFB 10-0065

Rusty Eck Ford Parks Motors
Mel Hambelton Ford            

Alternate #1
Mel Hambelton Ford      

Alternate #2
Mel Hambelton Ford                

Alternate #3
Shawnee Mission 

Ford

1.  1 ea, 4WD Regular Cab, Dual Rear Wheel Truck $35,379.00 $38,340.00 $36,185.00 $36,185.00 $36,185.00 $36,804.00

Make/Model
Ford F450 4WD 

Chassis
2011 Dodge Ram 

4500 Ford F450 Ford F450 Ford F450
2011 Ford F450; 

Regular Cab 4X4 XL

2.  10 ft Flatbed $5,117.00 $4,956.00 $4,955.00 $5,117.00 $5,489.00 $4,943.00
3.  One set, Manuals    paper or CD ROM $180.00 cd rom $150.00 cd rom $180.00 cd rom $180.00 cd rom $180.00 cd rom $178.00 cd rom
Factory Engine Fast Idol Control $376.00 Included Included Included Included not included
Grand total $41,052.00 $43,446.00 $41,320.50 $41,482.00 $41,854.00 $41,925.00

Option -custom built tool box +  $70.00 n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a

Warranty

3 yrs/36,000 miles; 
powertrain 

5yrs/60,000 miles; 
diesel engine 

5yr/100,000 miles

3 yrs/36,000 miles 
bumper to bumper; 

engine 5yrs/100,000 
miles; 3yrs/180,000 

transmission

3 yrs/36,000 miles 
bumper to bumper; 

powertrain 
5yrs/60,000 miles; 

diesel engine 
5yrs/100,000 miles

3 yrs/36,000 miles 
bumper to bumper; 

powertrain 
5yrs/60,000 miles; 

diesel engine 
5yrs/100,000 miles

3 yrs/36,000 miles 
bumper to bumper; 

powertrain 
5yrs/60,000 miles; 

diesel engine 
5yrs/100,000 miles

3 yrs/36,000 miles; 
5yrs/60,000 miles 

powertrain

Delivery date 9-12 weeks   ARO           90-120 days 90-120 days ARO 90-120 days ARO 90-120 days ARO 90-100 ARO 

Acknowledge Addendum Y Y Y Y Y Y

Northcutt, Inc Whiteside Chevrolet Victor L Phillips Kansas City Peterbilt
no bid no  bid no bid no bid

3.  ONE TON 4WD 10ft FLATBED TRUCK -- FLEET MANAGEMENT
FUNDING -- FLEET MANAGEMENT
(Request for Bid sent to eight-five vendors)

On the recommendation of Brandy McCune, on behalf of Fleet Management, Irene Hart moved to accept the low bid from Rusty Eck Ford for the amount of $41,052.00
Ron Estes seconded the motion.  The motion passed unanimously.

This is a replacement vehicle for Noxious Weeds.  Surplus will be sold on Purplewave.
Question was asked, "what is a fast idle control?"  A device that increases engine rpm to maintain hydraulic pressure during use. This truck supports  hydraulic spray appartus.

Question was also asked about the age of the vehicle and the lifecycle for the vehicle.  This replacement falls within the current replacement policy.



BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS APRIL 15, 2010

      RFB 10-0083

Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price

1.  Hustler 4600  Self Propelled Zero-
Turning Radius Riding Mower 1 no bid $26,853.00 $26,853.00
2.  Operator Manuals 2 included $0.00
3.  Repair Manuals 2 included $0.00
4.  Parts Manuals 2 included $0.00
Grand total $26,853.00
Warranty
Delivery date
Hourly labor rate $62.00
Parts cost + markup 20%
Freight charge, pick up and delivery (one 
way) $50.00

5/14/10

Qty

Oxford Saw & Mower Sales 
& Services Hale's Sales & Service

1 yr/1200 hrs

4.  SELF PROPELLED RIDING LAWNMOWER -- FLEET MANAGEMENT
FUNDING -- FLEET MANAGEMENT
(Request for Bid sent to twenty-six vendors)

On the recommendation of Brandy McCune, on behalf of Fleet Management, Ron Estes moved to accept the bid from 
Hale's Sales & Service for the amount of $26,853.00 and establish contract pricing for parts and labor for 3 
years. David Spears seconded the motion.  The motion passed unanimously.

This is a replacement mower for Lake Afton and Sedgwick County Park.  Surplus will be sold on Purplewave.
Note:  Per fleet, this mower is brand specific because and has a 72" deck (smaller size)  and has the capability of 
attaching and operating a stump grinder currently owned by Sedgwick County. 



BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS APRIL 15, 2010

     RFP#10-0051

Murphy 
Tractor & 

Equipment Co 

Murphy 
Tractor & 

Equipment Co  
Alternate #1

Victor L 
Phillips Co

Foley 
Equipment 

Co
Van Keppel 
Company

1.  1ea. Industrial Loader/Backhoe 
4WD $78,556.00 $69,047.00 $81,118.05 $72,357.00 no bid
2.  2 ea. Operator manuals $40.00 $40.00 $81.21 Included
3.  1 ea.  Parts manual N/C N/C $239.49 Included
4.  1 ea. Repair manual $398.00 $398.00 $476.44 Included
Grand Total $78,994.50 $69,485.00 $81,915.19 $72,357.00

Make/Model

John Deere 
410-J (New 

2010)
John Deere 

310-SJ
Case 590 SMT  
Canopy/ROPS

Caterpillar 
420-E

Warranty

1 year 
Standard, 
Extended 

Warranty of 3 
years/1500 
hours on 

powertrain

1 year 
Standard, 
Extended 

Warranty of 3 
years/1500 
hours on 

powertrain

1 year Full 
Machine  2 

year/2000HR 
Powertrain

3 year of 5000 
hr. Full 

Machine
Acknowledged Addendum Y Y Y Y

5.  INDUSTRIAL LOADER/BACKHOE -- FLEET MANAGEMENT
FUNDING -- FLEET MANAGEMENT
(Request for Proposal sent to nineteen vendors)

On the recommendation of Brandy McCune, on behalf of Fleet Management, Irene Hart moved to accept low 
proposal meeting specifications from Foley Equipment Co. for the amount of $72,357.00. David Spears 
seconded the motion.  The motion passed unanimously. 

The low proposal, alternate #1 from Murphy Tractor & Equipment offered smaller equipment that did not meet 
specifications for horsepower, hydraulic pump flow and loader/dump clearance.  

This is a replacement for the Public Works Bridge Crew.  Surplus will be sold on Purplewave.



BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS APRIL 15, 2010

     RFB #10-0117  Req 10041481
Dell HP/Compaq

30 ea, desktop computers
$854.58 ea    
$25,637.40

$956.00 ea   
$28,680.00

6.  DESKTOP COMPUTERS -- COMCARE
FUNDING-COMCARE INFORMATION TECHNOLOGY
(WSCA CONTRACT A63306, A63307)

On the recommendation of Kimberly Evans, on behalf of Comcare, Irene Hart moved to accept the quote from Dell 
in the amount of $25,637.40. David Spears seconded the motion.  The motion passed unanimously.

These are replacement computers following the computer replacement cycle.  The old equipment will be sent to 
surplus.



BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS APRIL 15, 2010

      RFB #10-0100 PR 10041374

Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price
1.  Liebert GXT3-2000RT120, 2000 VA/1800 
Watts Capacity, 120VAC input and output 7 $1,017.00 $7,119.00 $1,223.73 $8,566.11 $1,035.00 $7,245.00
2.  Liebert GXT3-3000RT120, 3000 VA/2700 
Watts Capacity, 120VAC input and output 3 $1,762.00 $5,286.00 $2,133.85 $6,401.55 $1,800.00 $5,400.00
3.  Center Mount Kit, 2UTELECOMRKIT 
brackets for 19” wide telecom/relay racks that 
mount (1) 2U UPS. 10 $54.00 $540.00 $67.36 $673.60 $51.00 $510.00
Grand total $12,945.00 $15,641.26 $13,155.00
Shipping included included included
Days for delivery

Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price Unit Price Ext Price
1.  Liebert GXT3-2000RT120, 2000 VA/1800 
Watts Capacity, 120VAC input and output 7 $1,048.00 $7,336.00 $1,049.71 $7,347.97

$944.00 
Minuteman $6,608.00

2.  Liebert GXT3-3000RT120, 3000 VA/2700 
Watts Capacity, 120VAC input and output 3 $1,818.00 $5,454.00 $1,819.94 $5,459.82

$1,299.00 
Minuteman $3,897.00

3.  Center Mount Kit, 2UTELECOMRKIT 
brackets for 19” wide telecom/relay racks that 
mount (1) 2U UPS. 10 $53.18 $531.80 $65.70 $657.00 included $0.00
Grand total $13,321.80 $13,464.79 $10,505.00
Days for delivery

Alexander Open Systems

15 days ARO 1 week ARO 7-10 days

Qty

Heartland Technology 
Solutions Gruber Technical

Power Systems Engineering

30 days ARO 20 days ARO 8 days

Qty
Aprisa Technology

Communications 
Professionals, Inc

7.  UNINTERUPPTIBLE POWER SUPPLIES-NATIONAL CENTER for AVIATION TRAINING - FACILITIES DEPARTMENT
FUNDING-NCAT FURNITURE FIXTURES & EQUIPMENT
(Request for Bid sent to eleven vendors)

On the recommendation of Kimberly Evans, on behalf of the FacilitiesDepartment, Ron Estes moved to accept the low bid meeting specifications from Heartland 
Technology Solutions in the amount of $12,945.00. David Spears seconded the motion.  The motion passed unanimously.

These are small UPS units for networking equipment at NCAT.  Liebert is the County standard for these types of power supplies.  The low bid from Power Systems 
Engineering did not meet the specification as they bid an alternate brand.
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