BOARD OF BIDS & CONTRACTS
BoCC Meeting Room at 10:00 A.M.
March 27, 2014
(5 Items)

AGENDA ITEMS

. Culvert on Ridge Rd between 109" &117" Streets N (R264-21)-------------- Public Works
. 2014 Bituminous Frictional Seal (R175-K)----=-=-=-=-=-==mmmmmememm oo Public Works
. Skid Steer Loader-----=======s=s=somomomom e e e oo Fleet Management
. 2014 Dodge Charger Police Package Vehicles Fleet Management

. Sheriff’s Detention/Summer Uniform---------=-===-m-m-mmmmmmmmm oo Sheriff’s Office



BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS MARCH 27, 2014

1. CULVERT ON RIDGE RD BETWEEN 109TH & 117TH STREETS N (R264-21) -- PUBLIC WORKS

FUNDING -- PUBLIC WORKS

(Request sent to 18 vendors)

RFB #14-0010

Engineer's Estimate: $15,401.40

Mies Construction, Inc.

Alan's Excavating, Inc.

Culvert

$27,012.00

$37,316.00

Bid Bond

Yes

Yes

No Bid

Duling Construction

Nowak Construction

Reece Construction

On behalf of Public Works, recommend to reject both submitted bids.

The low bid from Mies Construction, Inc. is 175% of the engineer's estimate. K.S.A. 68-521 does not allow the
letting of contracts exceeding 110% of the engineer's estimate.

This project will have to be rebid sometime in the future.
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2. 2014 BITUMINOUS FRICTIONAL SEAL (R175-K) -- PUBLIC WORKS
FUNDING -- R175 PREVENTIVE MAINTENANCE 2014

(Request sent to seven vendors)

RFB #14-0016 S/C 8000037234

Engineer's Estimate: $1,178,646.40

Circle C Paving and
Construction, LLC

Cornejo & Sons, LLC

Bituminous Frictional Seal

$715,912.17

$734,798.48

Bid Bond

Yes

Yes

No Bid

Traffic Control Services, Inc.

Vance Brothers, Inc.

Crossroads Asphalt
Preservation

American Road Maintenance

APAC-Kansas, Inc. Shears Division

On behalf of Public Works, recommend to accept the low bid from Circle C Paving and Construction,

LLC in the amount of $715,912.17.

Bituminous Frictional Seal is a thin bond overlay with aggregate that increases skid resistance, reduces
road slickness and protects the underlying pavement.

This project will cover 32 (2-lane) miles of selected roads in the county.
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3. SKID STEER LOADER -- FLEET MANAGEMENT
FUNDING -- SKID STEER LOADER

(Request sent to 20 vendors)

RFB #14-0013 S/C 8000037261

Berry Companies, Inc. dba White

Star Machinery & Supply Co. Bousiig e

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
1. Skid Steer Loader, 1 ea. $72,401.00 $72,401.00 $109,425.00 $109,425.00
2. Make/Model Bobcat S750 Bobcat S750
3. Equipment Manual, 1 ea. $101.45 $101.45 Included Included
4. Repair & Parts Manual, 1 ea. $86.96 $86.96 Included Included
5. Operator Manuals, 2 ea. $50.72 50.72* Included Included
Grand Total $72,640.13 $109,425.00
Days to Delivery 60-90 days 30-45 days
Hourly Labor Rate $100.00 Included
Parts = cost + markup List Price Included
Freight Charge (one way) $250.00 $240.00
Acknowledge Addendum Yes Yes

The Victor L. Phillips Co.

McCullough Enterprises, Inc. dba

Wichita Tractor Company

Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
1. Skid Steer Loader, 1 ea. $77,777.77 $77,777.77 $79,960.00 $79,960.00
2. Make/Model Case SV300 Newholland L230
3. Equipment Manual, 1 ea. Included Included Included Included
4. Repair & Parts Manual, 1 ea. Included Included $50.00 $50.00
5. Operator Manuals, 2 ea. Included Included Included Included
Grand Total $77,777.77 $80,010.00
Days to Delivery 42-56 days 60 days
Hourly Labor Rate $105.00 $94.00
Parts = cost + markup List Price List Price
Freight Charge (one way) $100.00 $50.00
Acknowledge Addendum Yes Yes

No Bid KC Bobcat

*One manual at no charge

On behalf of Fleet Management, recommend to accept the low bid from Berry Companies, Inc., dba

White Star Machinery & Supply Co., in the amount of $72,640.13.

This purchase is for a new piece of equipment at Lake Afton. The life cycle for these machines is about
10 years. A 1999 Vermeer Tree Spade was sold as surplus on Purple Wave and not replaced.
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4. 2014 DODGE CHARGER POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES -- FLEET MANAGEMENT
FUNDING -- FLEET MANAGEMENT
(Request sent to 12 vendors)

RFB #14-0017 Contract Pricing

Davis-Moore
Automotive, Inc.
1. 2014 Dodge Charger, ea. $28,274.00
2. Manuals, ea. $150.00
Total $28,424.00
Delivery Date 8-10 Weeks

On behalf of Fleet Management, recommend to accept the bid from Davis-Moore Automotive, Inc. for
an initial purchase of 15 vehicles for a total cost of $426,360.00. Contract pricing is good through July
25, 2014.

These are replacement vehicles for the Sherriff's Office; surplus will be sold on Purple Wave.



BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS MARCH 27, 2014

5. SHERIFF'S DETENTION/SUMMER UNIFORM -- SHERIFF'S OFFICE

FUNDING -- SHERIFF'S OFFICE

(Request sent to 12 vendors)

RFB #14-0019 Contract Pricing

. . . Southern Uniform
Bagj'pnjir IPnocllce Galls, LLC W-W. Iﬁ(r;amger, & Equipment,
T ’ LLC
Apprommate Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost
Quantity
1. Men's Short Sleeve $34.99 ea. $39.40 ea. $45.52 ea.
2. Women's Short Sleeve 1,300-1,400 $34.99 ea. $39.40 ea. $45.52 ea. No Bid
3. Men's Long Sleeve $36.99 ea. $41.57 ea. $48.03 ea.
4. Pants 1,000 $29.62 ea. $27.50 ea. $28.97 ea. $24.90 ea.
5. Hat 300-400 $2.99 ea. $5.19 ea. $8.76 ea. $4.78 ea.
Acknowledge Addenda Yes Yes Yes Yes
Unifirst AmeriPride Chief Supply On Duty Gear,
No Bid Corporation Services Company LLC
Cintas Corporation Logo Depot

On behalf of the Sheriff's Office, recommend to accept the overall low bid from Baysinger Police Supply, Inc. at

the unit rates shown above for a not to exceed total purchase of $85,000.00.

These are uniform upgrades for the Sheriff's Office which includes shirts, pants and hats.




