
BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS JUNE 12, 2014

1.  BRIDGE ON 103RD ST W BETWEEN 71ST & 79TH STREETS S (B456) -- PUBLIC WORKS

     FUNDING -- B456 103RD ST W B/T 71ST & 79TH ST

     (Request sent to five vendors) 

     RFB #14-0037     S/C 8000042197

Engineer's Estimate: $1,070,459.50

King 

Construction 

Company, Inc.

Bridges, Inc.

Dondlinger & 

Sons Construction 

Co., Inc.

Bridge on 103rd St W between 71st & 79th Streets S $940,163.55 $1,087,469.48 $1,125,526.70

Bid Bond Yes Yes Yes

No Bid
Cornejo & Sons, 

LLC
APAC-Kansas, Inc. Shears Division

ITEMS REQUIRING BOCC APPROVAL

4 ITEMS

On the recommendation of Gunda Angelica, on behalf of Public Works, David Spears moved to accept the low bid 

from King Construction Company, Inc. in the amount of $940,163.55.  Tim Kaufman seconded the motion.  

The motion passed unanimously. 

 

This project involves a full bridge replacement with guardrail, along with grading and asphalt surfacing.  
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2.  45TH ST N BETWEEN WEBB RD & GREENWICH RD (R324) -- PUBLIC WORKS

     FUNDING -- R324 45TH N: WEBB TO GREENWICH

     (Request sent to three vendors) 

     RFB #14-0040     S/C 8000042193

Engineer's Estimate: $1,681,495.00
APAC-Kansas, Inc. 

Shears Division
Cornejo & Sons, LLC

45th St N between Webb Rd & Greenwich Rd $1,649,463.75 $1,541,051.11

     RFB #14-0037     S/C 8000042197 Yes Yes

No Bid Mies Construction, Inc.

On the recommendation of Gunda Angelica, on behalf of Public Works, David Spears moved to accept 

the low bid from Cornejo & Sons, LLC in the amount of $1,541,051.11.  Tim Kaufman seconded 

the motion.  The motion passed unanimously. 

 

This project is road construction involving subgrade stabilization, asphalt paving, replacing reinforced 

concrete box structures, seeding and pavement marking. 
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3.  UNIFORM AND MAT RENTAL SERVICES -- VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

     FUNDING -- VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

     (Request sent to 17 vendors) 

     RFB #14-0041  Contract

Rental Cost 

per Item

Replacement 

Cost per Item

Rental Cost 

per Item

Replacement 

Cost per Item

Rental Cost per 

Item

Replacement 

Cost per Item

     RFB #14-0037     S/C 8000042197 $0.35 $28.26 $0.18 $15.00 $0.25 $18.00

2. 65%/35% Blend Industrial Shirts - Light Blue $0.15 $9.69 $0.18 $15.00 $0.13 $10.00

3. 65%/35% Blend Industrial Shirts - Blue (narrow) & Grey 

(wide) Vertical Stripes
$0.17 $14.96 $0.18 $15.00 $0.15 $12.00

4. 65%/35% Blend Industrial Shirts - Light Grey $0.15 $9.69 $0.18 $15.00 $0.13 $10.00

5. 65%/35% Blend Industrial Shirts - Dark Grey $0.15 $9.69 $0.18 $15.00 $0.13 $10.00

6. 65%/35% Blend Industrial Shirts - White & Charcoal Vertical 

Stripes
$0.17 $13.58 $0.18 $15.00 $0.15 $12.00

7. 65%/35% Blend Regular Dress Shirts - Blue $0.22 $17.42 $0.25 $21.00 $0.20 $14.00

8. 65%/35% Blend Denim Shirts - Navy Blue $0.19 $14.46 not avaliable not avaliable $0.20 $16.00

9. 100% Cotton Shirts - Dark Grey $0.23 $15.53 not avaliable not avaliable $0.20 $13.00

10. 100% Cotton Shirts - Light Grey $0.23 $15.53 not avaliable not avaliable $0.20 $13.00

11. 100% Cotton Shirts - Light Blue $0.23 $15.53 $0.24 $17.00 $0.20 $13.00

12. 100% Polyester Knit Polo with front pocket - Navy $0.22 $14.10 $0.25 $19.75 $0.17 $16.00

13. Blend (Polyester & Cotton) Knit Polo with front pocket - 

Navy
$0.23 $15.97 not avaliable not avaliable $0.17 $16.00

14. 100% Cotton Shirts - Khaki & Navy Striped N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

15. 65%/35% Blend Pleated Women's Pants - Black $0.23 $20.84 $0.25 $21.00 $0.24 $16.00

16. 65%/35% Blend Pleated Women's Pants - Navy $0.23 $20.84 $0.25 $21.00 $0.24 $16.00

17. 65%/35% Blend Pleated Men's Pants - Black $0.23 $17.42 $0.25 $21.00 $0.24 $16.00

18. 65%/35% Blend Pleated Men's Pants - Navy $0.23 $17.42 $0.25 $21.00 $0.24 $16.00

19. 65%/35% Blend Pleated Plant - Khaki $0.23 $17.42 $0.25 $21.00 $0.24 $16.00

20. 65%/35% Blend Western Cut Industrial Pant - Charcoal $0.22 $16.67 not avaliable not avaliable $0.18 $14.00

21. 100% Cotton Pant - Charcoal $0.25 $19.43 not avaliable not avaliable $0.25 $16.00

22. 100% Cotton Denim Jeans - Blue $0.25 $16.58 $0.29 $26.62 $0.20 $18.00

23. 100% Cotton Carpenter Style Jeans - Blue $0.29 $17.88 $0.39 $29.00 $0.25 $18.00

24. 65%/35% Blend Lightweight Coveralls - Blue $0.35 $24.72 $0.30 $29.50 $0.20 $20.00

25. Aprons - Knee Length $0.15 $2.46 $0.30 $5.00 $0.09 $4.98

26. 65%/35% Team Jackets - Charcoal $0.25 $30.30 $0.41 $29.50 $0.20 $22.00

27. 65%/35% Team Jackets - Navy $0.25 $30.30 $0.41 $29.50 $0.20 $22.00

28. 65%/35% Ike Jackets - Charcoal $0.25 $26.12 $0.41 $29.50 $0.20 $22.00

29. 65%/35% Ike Jackets - Navy $0.25 $26.12 $0.41 $29.50 $0.20 $22.00

30. Cloth Name Tag, furnish and attach $0.35 $0.35 $0.25 $0.25 $0.25 $0.25

31. Price to Sew County Logo Patch (county to provide patch) no charge no charge no charge no charge no charge no charge

32. Price to create County patches $2.00 $2.00 $0.54 $0.54 $1.25 $1.25

33. Embroidery of information on shirts $3.00 $3.00 $4.95 $4.95 $3.50 $3.50

34. 65%/35% Blend Shirts, 2XL $0.15 $9.69 $0.18 $15.00 $0.13 $10.00

35. 65%/35% Blend Shirts, 3XL $0.15 $9.69 $0.18 $15.00 $0.13 $10.00

36. 65%/35% Blend Shirts, 4XL $0.15 $9.69 $0.18 $15.00 $0.13 $10.00

37. 65%/35% Blend Pants, 2XL $0.22 $16.67 $0.25 $21.00 $0.18 $14.00

38. 65%/35% Blend Pants, 3XL $0.22 $16.67 $0.25 $21.00 $0.18 $14.00

39. 65%/35% Blend Pants, 4XL $0.22 $16.67 $0.25 $21.00 $0.18 $14.00

40. 100% Cotton Shirts, 2XL $0.23 $15.53 $0.24 $17.00 $0.20 $13.00

41. 100% Cotton Shirts, 3XL $0.23 $15.53 $0.24 $17.00 $0.20 $13.00

42. 100% Cotton Shirts, 4XL $0.23 $15.53 $0.24 $17.00 $0.20 $13.00

43. 100% Cotton Pants and Denim, 2XL
$0.25 cotton 

$0.25 denim

$19.43 cotton 

$16.58 denim

cotton not 

avaliable       

$0.29 denim 

cotton not 

avaliable      

$26.62 denim 

$0.25 cotton $0.20 

denim

$16.00 cotton 

$18.00 denim

44. 100% Cotton Pants and Denim, 3XL
$0.25 cotton 

$0.25 denim

$19.43 cotton 

$16.58 denim 

cotton not 

avaliable       

$0.29 denim 

cotton not 

avaliable      

$26.62 denim 

$0.25 cotton $0.20 

denim

$16.00 cotton 

$18.00 denim

45. 100% Cotton Pants and Denim, 4XL
$0.25 cotton 

$0.25 denim

$19.43 cotton 

$16.58 denim 

cotton not 

avaliable       

$0.29 denim 

cotton not 

avaliable      

$26.62 denim 

$0.25 cotton $0.20 

denim

$16.00 cotton 

$18.00 denim

UniFirst Corporation Cintas Aramark Uniform Services
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46. Red Shop Towels 18" x 18" $0.07 $0.49 $0.06 $0.45 $0.03 $0.30

47. White Shop Towels 18" x 18" $0.07 $0.49 $0.13 $0.45 $0.03 $0.30

48. Bath Towels 32" x 54" $0.30 $3.00 $0.30 $3.00 $0.15 $6.00

49. Mop Treated 24" $0.50 $8.21 $0.80 $8.00 $0.30 $6.00

50. Mop Treated 36" $0.60 $11.52 $0.95 $8.00 $0.35 $8.00

51. Mop Treated 48" $0.65 $13.07 $1.25 $8.00 $0.55 $10.00

52. Mop Treated 60" $0.70 $15.17 not avaliable not avaliable $0.65 $12.00

53. Mop Tool 24" no charge $13.00 $0.00 $8.00 no charge $2.00

54. Mop Tool 36" no charge $13.00 $0.00 $8.00 no charge $2.00

55. Mop Tool 48" no charge $13.00 $0.00 $8.00 no charge $2.00

56. Mop Tool 60" no charge $13.00 not avaliable not avaliable no charge $2.00

57. Mop Wet Medium $1.00 $7.25 $1.38 $8.00 $0.50 $6.00

58. Mop Wet Tool Medium no charge $9.00 $0.00 $8.00 no charge $5.00

59. Mop Wet Tool Large no charge $9.00 no charge $8.00 no charge $5.00

60. Entryway Mats 3' x 4' not avaliable not avaliable $1.50 $45.00 $1.20 $40.00

61. Entryway Mats 3' x 5' $1.25 $38.61 not avaliable not avaliable $1.25 $45.00

62. Entryway Mats 4' x 6' $2.25 $59.12 $2.00 $70.00 $2.25 $65.00

63. Entryway Mats 3' x 10' $3.25 $78.95 $2.46 $90.00 $3.15 $80.00

64. Anti-Fatigue Mat 2' x 3' $1.00 $33.23 $2.00 $50.00 N/A N/A

65. Anti-Fatigue Mat 3' x 5' $1.50 $65.70 $2.63 $65.00 $1.50 $50.00

66. Safety Mat 3' x 4' not avaliable not avaliable $3.15 $65.00 $1.80 $60.00

67. Safety Mat 3' x 5' $1.50 $50.78 $3.15 $65.00 $1.85 $65.00

68. Safety Mat 4' x 6' not avaliable not avaliable not avaliable not avaliable not avaliable not avaliable

69. Fender Cover $0.50 $3.80 $0.65 $5.00 $0.25 $7.00

70. Air Freshener Dispensers $1.50 $1.50 $2.00 $25.00 $2.50 $15.00

Acknowledge Addendum

No Bid
Logo Depot

Chief Supply Company Grainger Industrial Supply Ameripride Services

Yes Yes Yes

On the recommendation of Kara Kingsley, on behalf of various county departments , Tim Kaufman moved to accept the overall low bid from Aramark 

Uniform Services and establish contract pricing at the rates listed for three (3) years, with two (2) one (1) year options to  renew.  David Spears seconded 

the motion.  The motion passed unanimously. 

 

Estimated total spend for 2013 was $54,000.00. 
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4.  2015 REGULAR CAB DUAL WHEEL TRUCK WITH ARTICULATING TELESCOPIC AERIAL DEVICE -- FLEET MANAGEMENT

     FUNDING -- TRUCK WITH ARTICULATING TELESCOPIC AERIAL

     (Request sent to 69 vendors) 

     RFP #14-0047  S/C 8000042124

Altec Industries, 

Inc. (Option 1)

Altec Industries, 

Inc.             

(Option 2)

Altec Industries, 

Inc.             

(Option 3)

Altec Industries, 

Inc.             

(Option 4)

Altec Industries, 

Inc.             

(Option 5)

Altec Industries, 

Inc.             

(Option 6)

World Industrial 

Equipment, Inc. 

dba Stamm 

Manufacturing 

(Option 1)

World Industrial 

Equipment, Inc. 

dba Stamm 

Manufacturing 

(Option 2)

Make/Model
2015 Dodge Ram 

5500 with AT40S

2015 Freightliner 

with AT40S

2015 International 

Terrastar with 

AT40S

2014 Dodge Ram 

5500 with AT40S*

2015 Freightliner 

with AT40S*

2015 International 

Terrastar with 

AT40S*

2015 Dodge 5500 

with Reading Body 

and Stamm 

ATR45I**

2015 Terrastar 

SFA 4x2 TA005**

     RFB #14-0037     S/C 8000042197 $128,313.00 $153,203.00 $134,975.00 $123,010.00 $147,900.00 $129,672.00 $126,529.00 $128,529.00

2.  Operator manuals included included included included included included included included

3.  Service/maintenance repair manuals included included included included included included included included

4.  Electrical diagrams included included included included included included included included

5.  Emissions diagnoses manual included included included included included included included included

Grand total $128,313.00 $153,203.00 $134,975.00 $123,010.00 $147,900.00 $129,672.00 $126,529.00 $128,529.00

Delivery date 240-270 days 240-270 days ARO 240-270 days ARO by 12/31/14 240-270 days 240-270 days 220 days ARO 220 days ARO

Cost year 1 99.00 99.00 99.00 99.00 99.00 99.00 included included

Cost year 2 103.00 103.00 103.00 103.00 103.00 103.00 75.00 75.00

Cost year 3 107.00 107.00 107.00 107.00 107.00 107.00 75.00 75.00

Cost year 1 Customer List Customer List Customer List Customer List Customer List Customer List Cost Cost
Cost year 2 Customer List Customer List Customer List Customer List Customer List Customer List 20% 20%
Cost year 3 Customer List Customer List Customer List Customer List Customer List Customer List 20% 20%

Cost year 1 $2.00/mile $2.00/mile $2.00/mile $2.00/mile $2.00/mile $2.00/mile included included

Cost year 2 $2.00/mile $2.00/mile $2.00/mile $2.00/mile $2.00/mile $2.00/mile $100.00 $100.00

Cost year 3 $2.00/mile $2.00/mile $2.00/mile $2.00/mile $2.00/mile $2.00/mile $100.00 $100.00

Acknowledge addendum Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Bobcat of Salina Don Hattan Leach Rod, LLC Nesco Rentals

Doonan Truck & 

Equipment

Murphy Tractor & 

Equipment Co.
Leach Rod, LLC

John Deere 

Government Sales

Murphy Tractor & 

Equipment Co.
Don Hatan

Straub International

Hourly labor rate

Parts:  cost + markup

Freight charge (one way)

Cummings McGowan & West

John Deere Government Sales

No Bid

On the recommendation of Gunda Angelica, on behalf of Fleet Management, David Spears moved to accept the best bid, Option 1 from Altec Industries, Inc., in the amount of $128,313.00 

and establish contract pricing for labor, parts and freight for repairs for three (3) years.  Tim Kaufman seconded the motion.  The motion passed unanimously.  

 

This vehicle will be used for a range of functions, including general routine electrical maintenance for emergency repair/replacement, including KDOT traffic signals.  Equipment will be used for 

lifting parts, equipment and people for overhead working conditions up to 40 feet.   

 

This is a replacement vehicle, surplus will be sold on Purplewave.  

 

*Options 1, 2 and 3 come with the articulating telescopic aerial device model AT40S built to specifications.  Options 4, 5 and 6 include the stock model AT40S, which does not meet 

specifications. 

**Does not meet specifications.  


