BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS AUGUST 28, 2014

1. BRIDGE ON 279TH ST W BETWEEN 109TH & 117TH STREETS N (B455) -- PUBLIC WORKS
FUNDING -- B455 11500 N 279TH ST W
(Request sent to five vendors)

RFB #14-0073 S/C 8000047009

Dondlinger &
. . . ) . Sons
Engineer's Estimate: $4,511,898.75 Bridges, Inc. .
Construction
Co., Inc.
Bridge on 279th St W between 109th & 117th Streets N $3,933,650.73 $3,744,816.73
Bid Bond Yes Yes
Acknowledge Addendum Yes Yes
W”d.c at King Construction
. Construction Co.,
No Bid Inc Company
DeAngelo Brothers, Inc.

On the recommendation of Kristen McGovern, on behalf of Public Works, Linda Kizzire moved to
accept the low bid from Dondlinger & Sons Construction Co., Inc. in the amount of
$3,744,816.73. Tim Kaufman seconded the motion. The motion passed unanimously.

This project involves a bridge improvement, beams, grading, surfacing, signing, pavement, markings,
seeding and guard rail.
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2. DISTRICT ATTORNEY-VICTIM/WITNESS WAITING ROOM -- FACILITIES DEPARTMENT
FUNDING -- VICTIM/WITNESS WAITING ROOM
(Request sent to 152 vendors)

RFB #14-0079 S/C 8000047063

Caro Construction Co., Inc. Van Asdale Construction
1. Base bid $115,000.00 $93,700.00
1a. Days to substantial completion 90 %0 (39 days employee
displacement)
1b. Days to final completion 14 5
1c. Total calendar days 104 95
2. Phased Construction no bid $93,700.00
2a. Days to substantial completion no bid 90
2b. Days to final completion no bid 10
2c. Total calendar days no bid 100
Bid bond Yes Yes
Acknowledge addendum Yes Yes
Wildcat Construction Co., Inc. Core Industries
Martin K. Eby Construction Co., Reinert Construction &
Inc. Remodeling, Inc.
Briggs Basement Foundation Handyman Matters of Greater
Repair, Inc. Wichita
No bid Innovative Construction Services Coonrod & Associates
Builder's Construction, Inc. TDH Construction
Zernco, Inc. Greening Construction, Inc.
Roof Mechanics Evans Building Co., Inc.
North American Buildings Dondlinger Construction
Law Kingdon Architecture Bauer & Son Construction
Hahner Foreman & Harness, Inc.

On the recommendation of Kim Evans, on behalf of Facilities Department, Tim Kaufman moved to accept
the low base bid from Van Asdale Construction in the amount of $93,700.00. Linda Kizzire seconded
the motion. The motion passed unanimously.

This project is to alter floor space currently being used by the Office of the District Attorney.
Modifications will consolidate functions, expand support services, provide better space for the witness
waiting area and provide access to one of the conference rooms from within the office space.
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3. ON-CALL MOVING AND DELIVERY SERVICES -- FACILITIES DEPARTMENT
FUNDING -- FACILITIES DEPARTMENT

(Request sent to 21 vendors)

RFB #14-0082 Contract Pricing

Daniel's Moving

Thomas Transfer

Gamoict, LLC dba

UOM and Storage & Stolr:é:]e Co., |OK Transfer, LLC Get a Move On
1. Box price each $4.85 $2.10 $3.00 $3.75
2. Labor price hour $32.00 $30.95 $45.00 $45.00
3. Mileage rate mile $3.50 $1.00 $2.00 $1.50

No Bid

Unishippers of Wichita

On the recommendation of Kristen McGovern, on behalf of Facilities Department, Linda Kizzire
moved to accept the lowest and best bid from Thomas Transfer & Storage Co., Inc. and establish
contract pricing for one (1) year with four (4) one (1) year options to renew. Tim Kaufman
seconded the motion. The motion passed unanimously.

These services are used primarily for relocation projects. Last year the county spent approximately
$33,000.00 for On-Call Moving and Delivery Services.
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