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1.  INMATE CLOTHING, LINENS & TOILETRIES -- DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS 
     FUNDING -- DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS 
     (Request sent to 57 vendors) 

     RFB #14-0101  Contract

Comments/Brands Price Comments/Brands Price Comments/Brands Price Comments/  Brands Price Comments/Brands Price

1. Bra sports white sizes 32, 34, 36, 38 & 40 dozen UMI #340-12 $17.74 ICS -C191OW $25.10 CT CL/SBRA $22.90 EBASPLS $18.89 Acme #72206 $24.00
2. Bra sports white sizes 42, 44, 46 & 48 dozen UMI #340-12 $17.74 ICS -C191OW $27.57 CT CL/SBRA $23.90 EBASPLS $18.89 Acme #72206 $24.00
3. Bar sports white sizes 50, 52 & 54 dozen UMI #340-12 $17.74 ICS -C191OW $31.06 CT CL/SBRA $24.36 EBASPLS $20.63 Acme #72206 $24.00
4. Boxers S, M, L, & XL brown dozen UMI #330-1 $12.95 ICS-C052BRW $14.13 CT CL/BRBOX $15.90 EBXBR $17.54 Acme# BX347 $15.00
5. Boxers 2XL brown dozen UMI #330-1 $13.95 ICS-C052BRW $15.38 CT CL/BRBOX $16.90 EBXBR $19.60 Acme # BX347 $15.00
6. Boxer 3XL brown dozen UMI #330-1 $13.95 ICS-C052BRW $16.49 CT CL/BRBOX $17.90 EBXBR $20.64 Acme# BX347 $18.00
7. Boxers 4XL brown dozen UMI #330-1 $14.75 ICS-C052BRW $17.73 CT CL/BRBOX $18.90 EBXBR $24.36 Acme# BX347 $18.00
8. Boxers 5XL brown dozen UMI #330-1 $14.75 ICS-C052BRW $19.01 CT CL/BRBOX $18.90 EBXBR $24.36 Acme # BX347 $18.00
9. Boxers 6XL brown dozen UMI #330-1 $21.25 ICS-C052BRW $20.23 CT CL/BRBOX $19.90 EBXBR $24.36 Acme #BX347 $18.00
10. Brief white S, M, L & XL dozen UMI #331-1 $11.38 ICS-C051W $9.96 CL/BRIEF $9.90 EBRLS $9.90 Acme #9228C $12.00
11. Brief white 2XL, 3XL, 4XL dozen UMI #331-1 $14.15 ICS-C051W $12.32 CL/BRIEF $11.90 EBRLS $12.85 Acme #9228C $12.00
12. Gowns suicide (smock) each ICS-H55-100-ICS $79.00 SM/SUICIDE $72.90 505, 505JR $74.47

13. Panty cotton sizes 5, 6, 7 & 8 dozen UMI #300-1 $7.80 ICS-C052W/BR $8.72-W      
$10.56-BR CL/PANT $7.90 ELBLCTN White $7.61 Acme #166CT $12.00

14. Panty cotton sizes 9 & 10 dozen UMI #300-1 $7.80 ICS-C052W/BR $9.33-W      
$10.56-BR CL/PANT $9.72 ELBLCTN White $7.61 Acme #166CT $12.00

15. Panty cotton sizes 11, 12, 13, & 14 dozen UMI #300-1 $7.80 ICS-CO5W/BR $10.58-W 
$12.22-BR CL/PANT $9.90 ELBLCTN White $9.30 Acme #166CT $12.00

16. Shoes 7 oz step-in sizes 6-17 black pair UMI #4880U $4.40 ICS-M143BLK $3.44 F/SO $3.10 155NV, 155OR, 
155WH, 155BK $3.48

17. Shoes low-top velcro canvas tennis shoes 
sizes 5-17 black pair UMI #4889 $7.00 ICS-SC1011BLK $5.26 854, B854, 854OR $6.79

18. Sandals shoes bio-chek sizes S to 2XL pair UMI #888 $2.73 ICS-M019 $1.60 F/ANTI $2.62 606 $2.42
19. Belt tips dozen UMI #WB14PT $0.84 ICS-NWPTIP $1.20 TIP $0.87
20. Belt buckles dozen UMI #WBBK $5.88 ICS-NWP-BKL $6.28 BUCKLE $6.39
21. Belt webbing navy 50 yd roll UMI #7LNB50 $28.60 ICS-VWP $24.39 WEB-NV $27.89
22. Sock sport white 10-13 terry pair UMI #502-22 $4.00 ICS-C452-1M $4.35/dz SCK/MSPORT $5.72 WTS16 $6.84 Acme #AG113 $5.00
23. Sock tube white one size fits all dozen UMI #500-1 $4.05 ICS-C068 $4.57 SCK/TUBE $6.18 3700W 120/case $4.33 Acme #31556 $5.00
24. Socks no show one size fits all dozen UMI #502-41 $4.55 ICS-C458W-1M $5.29 * $4.99 NS4595 $3.96 Acme #AG113 $4.00
25. T-shirt 100% cotton S, M, L & XL 4.6 oz dozen UMI #320-2 $32.25 ICS-CO49C $22.12 * $26.90 683 $24.57 Acme #85701 $18.00
26. T-shirt 100% cotton 2XL 4.6 oz dozen UMI #320-2 $59.25 ICS-CO49C $25.66 * $29.54 683 $28.11 Acme #85701 $20.00
27. T-shirt 100% cotton 3XL 4.6 oz dozen UMI #320-2 $59.25 ICS-CO49C $29.21 * $32.54 683 $32.38 Acme #85701 $24.00
28. T-shirt 100% cotton 4XL 4.6 oz dozen UM I#320-2 $60.00 ICS-CO49C $30.53 * $34.90 683 $34.62 Acme #85701 $28.00
29. T-shirt 100% cotton 5XL 4.6 oz dozen UMI #320-2 $71.50 ICS-CO49C $32.90 * $37.90 683 $35.55 Acme #85701 $30.00

30. Socks low cut sports fits 10-13 dozen UMI #502-22           
white only $4.00 ICS-CO49C $4.46 M4595 $5.84 Acme #85701 $5.00

31. Crew neck sweatshirt S, M, L & XL dozen UMI #700-0 Gray, 
Black or Navy $81.90 ICS-C045 $8.09 ea/ $97.08 

dz * $6.10 ea/ 
$88.32 dz SSGY $87.00 Acme #732AA $75.00

32. Crew neck sweatshirt 2XL dozen UMI #700-0 Gray, 
Black or Navy $89.70 ICS-C045 $9.55 ea/ 

$114.60 dz * $7.36 ea/ 
$94.80 dz SSGY $102.12 Acme #732AA $75.00

33. Crew neck sweatshirt 3XL dozen UMI #700-0 Gray, 
Black or Navy $89.70 ICS-C045 $10.43 ea/ 

$125.15 dz * $7.90 ea/ 
$104.64 dz SSGY $102.12 Acme #732AA $75.00

34. Crew neck sweatshirt 4XL dozen UMI #700-0 Gray, 
Black or Navy $101.40 ICS-C045 $11.13 ea/ 

$133.56 dz * $8.72 ea/ 
$104.64 dz SSGY $102.12 Acme #732AA $75.00

35. Crew neck sweatshirt 5XL dozen UMI #700-0 Gray, 
Black or Navy $109.20 ICS-C045 $11.82 ea/ 

$141.84 dz * $9.36 ea/ 
$112.32 dz SSGY $102.12 Acme #732AA $75.00
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36. Crew neck sweatshirt 6XL dozen UMI #700-0 Gray, 
Black or Navy $124.80 ICS-C045 $13.00 ea/ 

$156.00 dz * $9.90ea/ 
$118.80 dz SSGY $112.17 Acme #732AA $75.00

37. Sweatpants gray S, M, L dozen UMI #750-0 Gray, 
Black or Navy $70.20 ICS-C047 $8.09 ea/ $97.08 

dz * $6.90 ea/ 
$82.80 dz SPGY $75.00 Acme #77DGR $75.00

38. Sweatpants gray XL dozen UMI# 750-0 Gray, 
Black or Navy $70.20 ICS-C047 $8.09 ea/ $97.08 

dz * $6.90 ea/ 
$82.80 dz SPGY $90.60 Acme #77DGR $75.00

39. Sweatpants gray 2XL dozen UMI# 750-0 Gray, 
Black or Navy $78.00 ICS-C047 $9.55 ea/ 

$114.60 dz * $7.90ea/ 
$104.64 dz SPGY $90.60 Acme #77DGR $75.00

40. Sweatpants gray 3XL dozen  750-0 Gray, Black or $78.00 ICS-C047 $10.43 ea/ 
$125.16 dz * $7.90 ea/ 

$104.64 dz SPGY $94.21 Acme #77DGR $75.00

41. Sweatpants gray 4XL dozen UMI# 750-0 Gray, 
Black or Navy $93.60 ICS-C047  $11.13 ea/ 

$133.56 dz * $8.72 ea/ 
$104.64 dz SPGY $96.69 Acme #77DGR $75.00

42. Sweatpants gray 5XL dozen UMI# 750-0 Gray, 
Black or Navy $93.60 ICS-C047  $11.88 ea/ 

$142.56 dz * $9.36 ea/ 
$112.32 dz SPGY $110.64 Acme #77DGR $75.00

43. Sweatpants gray 6XL dozen UMI# 750-0 Gray, 
Black or Navy $101.40 ICS-C047  $13.00 ea/ 

$156.00 dz * $9.90 ea/ 
$118.80 dz SPGY $110.64 Acme #77DGR $75.00

44. Walking shorts, 9" knee length, M, L, XL, & 
2XL each

UMI #400-3 100% 
Polyester small 

mesh 
$4.68 ICS-BB848 $7.40 ea * $4.18 659 $3.97

45. Walking shorts, 9" knee length, 3XL, 4XL, 
5XL, 6XL each

UMI  #400-3 100% 
Polyester small 

mesh 
$5.55 ICS-BB848 $12.72 ea * $4.90 659, not available in 

3XL or 5XL $4.44

46. Inmate uniforms, medical scrub style 
poly/cotton twill 7-7.5 oz shirts, S-8XL red, 
green, orange & tan

each UMI #52-3
S-2XL $4.10, 
3-5XL $4.52 

6X-8XL $4.99
ICS-CS005 $7.02 ea *

S-2XL $5.90 
3XL-5XL 

$6.54           
6XL-$6.90 
8XL7.90

TRS RED, TGS 
GREEN, TOS 

ORANGE, TKS  
KHAKI

$5.48 Acme #AG151 $5.75

47. Inmate uniforms, medical scrub style pants, 
S-8XL red, green, orange & tan each UMI #64-10

S-2XL $5.45 
3XL-5XL 

$5.98          
6X-8XL $6.58

ICS-CP005 $7.58 ea *

S-2XL $6.54    
3XL-4XL 

$6.90        
5XL- 6XL 

$6.54         
8XL $7.90

TRS RED, TGS 
GREEN, TOS 

ORANGE, TKS 
KHAKI

$6.91 Acme #AG151 $6.25

48. Bags mesh white 18" x 24" dozen ICS-L056MS $30.60 BAG-SL182YWT $19.18 E1824 $22.18
49. Bedspread 76" x 110" each ICS $24.00 * $23.54 ZRCBN-(color) $13.70

50. Blanket beige 66" x 90" Case of 12 UMI# BSF669025 
Beige $151.05 ICS-L010-Grey $6.00 ea/ $72.00 

dz BL/XLRYDER-CM $98.00 CZ6690BG           
U/M 15 $97.16/c15 Acme #68560 $60.00

51. Blanket 80% wool woven 66" x 84" each ICS-L010X $8.64 BL/WB80 $8.18 WGB6690 $9.53
52. Blanket 66" x 90" 70% wool 3.7 lbs each ICS-L010 $7.52 POMONA70 $7.18 W6690 $7.53
53. Blanket 50% wool/50% synthetic each ICS-L010-52 $6.24 BL/DB50E $5.18 WSB6690 $7.14
54. Blanket suicide 54" x 80" each ICS-HSS-100-ICS $54.75 BL/SUICIDE $68.90 SB5480 $57.20
55. Mattress 25" x75" x 4" polyester each ICS-LPM25 $43.11 MT/DENS2575Y $33.18 SSPM25754 $47.92
56. Mattress cover 25" x 75" x 4" 6-8oz           
off white dozen ICS-L0265 $61.40 MC/25756TWLIM $68.90 MC30754 T130WH $40.89

57. Mattress cover 25" x 75" x 4" 3.8 oz dozen ICS-L0265 $61.40 MC/25756TWLIM $68.90 VMC25724 $10.49
58. Pillow poly-vented white HD each ICS-56220-W $6.37 PL/PCV26G-X $4.72 ANP56 $7.50

59. Pillow poly/vinyl 20" x 26" Case of 4 ICS-SG220-W $25.48 PDL/PCV266 $23.90 PS2026                
Dark Green $27.30

60. Pillow poly core microvent vinyl cover 20" 
x 26" each ICS-SG220-W $6.37 PL/PCV26G $5.90 C2026 (white) $5.17

61. Pillowcases 42" x 34" dozen UMI white only $11.60 ICS-L022 $6.06 Y23YW130 $9.54 PC4234 $8.90 Acme #29561 $9.00
62. Pillowcases white T130 42" x 34" dozen UMI white only $11.06 ICS-L022 $6.06 Y23YW130 $9.54 PC4234 $8.90 Acme #72771 $9.00
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63. Pillows cotton core with microvent cover Case of 4 ICS-L03PC $14.72 PL/COT26 $29.90 CMV2026           
Dark Green $36.11

64. Sheets flat colored 58" x 90" dozen ICS-L020 Navy $29.97 5890 $41.54 SH5890NVN           
(T130, Navy) $42.29 Acme #22158 $26.00

65. Sheets flat white T130 66" x 104" dozen UMI white only $47.87 ICS-L0202 $39.14 613W130 $42.54 SH66104L $51.18 Acme #26104 $38.00
66. Sheets fitted white muslin 36" x 80" x 6" dozen UMI white only $41.98 ICS-L3680 $72.00 * $33.90 FS63636L $36.03 Acme #3453U $38.00
67. Sheets flat 66" x 104" T180 dozen UMI white only $58.73 ICS-L0202-180 $54.64 * $79.90 SH66104P $63.92 Acme #22333 $49.00
68. Sheets fitted 36" x 80" x 6" T180 dozen UMI white only $50.39 ICS-FT3680 $72.00 * $75.90 FS63636P $65.99 Acme #24537 $49.00
69. Towel bath 22" x 44" institutional dozen UMI white only $15.05 ICS-L0162 $15.45 * $15.90 BT2244 $16.47 Acme #22244 $11.75
70. Towel white 20" x 40" regular institutional dozen UMI white only $13.79 ICS-L016 $12.50 * $14.90 41400 $15.38 Acme #22030 $8.45
71. Towel bath 24" x 48" premium dozen UMI white only $20.05 ICS-LCP482 $19.49 * $21.90 4300 $30.98 Acme #22448 $16.75
72. Wash cloth white 12" x 12" dozen UMI white only $2.05 ICS-L017E $1.38 WC121275E $2.36 41050 $3.41 Acme #21212 $2.25
73. Wash cloth colored 12" x 12" terry 
institutional dozen ICS-L017BR $2.35 WC1212Brown $3.90 WC1212 $2.31 Acme #21200-AC $2.25

74. Wash cloth white 12" x 12" regular 
institutional dozen UMI white only 

.5LB $1.85 ICS-L0172 $3.24 WC1212105 $3.54 41050 $3.41 Acme #21200 $2.25

75. Wash cloth white 12" x 12" terry 
institutional dozen UMI white only 

1LB $2.80 ICS-L017 $1.89 WC1212Brown $3.90 4040 (Premium) $3.75 Acme #1531Y $2.25

76. Hair and scalp conditioner 4 oz dozen 60/case                     
1 case min. $21.70/case Blue Magic-T095 $16.66/case 023 $20.60

77. Hair and scalp conditioner 7 oz dozen Ebdine-T020686 $41.40 L506 8oz $53.61

78. Styling gel alcohol free 7 oz dozen African Essence-
T746817 $22.12 SH60000 $35.53

79. Hair dressing 4 oz dozen styling gel 60/case $63.00/case Blue Magic-T094 $17.06 018 $18.98
80. Comb 5", pocket, black Case of 144 case of 1,440 only $56.00/case ICS-T123 $4.87 C-5 $3.21

81. Shampoo .75 oz Case of 288 Freshscent-
1,000/case $39.77 HS440 $66.15

82. Shampoo & conditioner 14.5 oz Case of 6 Suave-73796 $15.71 S73796 $14.92
83. Shampoo balsam 8 oz dozen 4oz, 60/case $37.80/case Suave-7228 $12.83 LA0234-8 $14.10

84. Deodorant, alcohol & scent free, 2 oz Case of 12 1.6oz           
144/case only $72.80 Freshscent-T0642 

96/case $37.48 MS6787 2.25 oz, 
12/case $23.96

85. Deodorant, ladies stick 2.25 oz Case of 24 Ladies Speedstick-
95440 $30.04 85165 $23.81

86. Soap deodorant wrapped antibacterial          
0.5 oz Case of 1000 to specs $41.50 Freshscent-T040 $38.68 H/S1/2 $44.90 62101 $48.97

87. Soap deodorant wrapped antibacterial           
3 oz Case of 144 72/case only $21.67 /case Freshscent-

T046NW $40.93 H/53 $33.90 62107 $37.23

88. Soap box, 2 piece clear dozen 100/case only $21.35/case ICS-T052L $3.51 2342N $3.08
89. Lip balm 0.15 oz Case of 24 Chap-T11503OR $6.35 8119 $31.00

90. Lotion, hand and body gallon 4 gal./case only $54.60/case Freshscent-T080 
2oz, 96/case $21.63/case 2173 $47.28

91. Lotion, Suave Skin Therapy 10 oz 
Advanced Relief Case of 6 Suave-T502162 $13.11 2264 $12.84

92. Twin blade razor Case of 600 500/case only $45.50/case ICS-T101 100/case $6.16 H/DR05X $47.40 RTB600 $45.55

93. Security razor Case of 100 500/case only $161.00/case ICS-RAZSEC $45.81 H/DR04 $6.90 CLTB600 600/case $45.55

94. Shaving cream 11 oz Case of 12 to specs $15.12 Freshscent-ASC11 $15.00 ASC11 $19.61

95. Maxi-pads Case of 576 288/case only $30.24/case Sanitex-T066-576 $29.28 H/FSNL864 
864/CASE $53.90 500IM-C $23.68
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96. Maxi thins long super w/wings Case of 288 250/case only $36.75/case Sanitex-TSN300 $15.48 SN288-C $19.24
97. Sanitary napkin, individually wrapped Case of 576 250/case only $43.75/case Sanitex-T066-576 $29.28 SN12-C $24.18
98. Tampon non-vended paper wrap Case of 500 to specs $70.00 Sanitex-T067 $40.70 H/FT500R $50.90 TPX500 $40.67
99. Tampon super non-vended Case of 500 Sanitex-T0675 $56.31 H/FT5005 $54.90 SBTPX500 $41.66
100. Toothbrush 40 tuft soft Case of 144 43 Tuft premium $16.63 ICS-T022 $7.43 BB37 $8.33

101. Toothbrush no shank Case of 100 500/case *fingertip 
toothbrush $385.00 ICS-NSTB $39.95 H/NSTB-1002 $50.90 NSTB $48.95

102. Toothbrush covers Case of 12 144/case only $28.20/case ICS-BCAP $0.63 422 $1.93

103. Toothpaste 1.5 oz unboxed Case of 144 1.5oz clear gel 
144/case $33.60 Freshmint-T010P $27.83 H/CTP15 $31.90 FM15 $32.92

104. Toothpaste .85 oz unboxed Case of 144 .85oz clear gel 
720/case only $119.95/case Freshmint-T008P $18.28 H/CTP085 $19.90 FM85 $19.40

105. Toothpaste 2.75 oz unboxed Case of 144 2.75oz clear gel 
144/case $57.40 Freshmint-T012P $48.82 FM275 $55.07

106. Shower mat 14" x 22.5" suction backed each RubberMaid-M014 $11.21 0405-06 $3.17
107. Fingernail clippers, no file Case of 24 to specs $11.76 ICS-T084 $5.66 PT1 $6.60
108. Toenail clippers, no file Case of 12 to specs $21.84 ICS-T084B $5.56 TC12 $6.94
109. Bergamot, 4 oz conditioner Case of 12 60/case only $71.40/case Blue Magic-T095 $16.66 024 $19.39
110. Comb black 9" large Case of 144 ICS-T124-9 $24.78 C-9 $13.88
111. Comb, lice 3" black double sided dozen ICS-M082 $2.04 LSC $1.65
112. Antiperspirant, Mennon Speed Stick           
0.5 oz Case of 24 Mennon-T064-24 $13.15 CG96624 $21.30

113. Roll-on antiperspirant 1.5 oz Case of 96 to specs $31.50 Freshscent-T064C $26.86 H/CTRD15 $30.90 PPI10150 $31.95
114. Hair gel, super wet clear 8.8 oz Case of 24 4oz gel,  60/case $63.00/case Xtreme-T250 $35.71 SH60000 $35.53
115. Janitor carts each ICS-G184GY $168.55 * $104.90 174 $137.68
116. Mop heads each ICS-J030 $2.26 * $5.54 V618 $4.69

117. Mop handles Case of 6 ICS-J12693 $30.48 * $45.90 70302/12 per case $90.81

118. Wet floor signs each ICS-J0205 $15.49 * $13.36 FS-400 $6.12
119. Dust pans each ICS-J027 $2.74 * $2.54 2006 $2.05
120. Duffel bag, black, 18" x 10" x 10" each ICS-BBBE014 $15.76 Z8805-BK $5.61
121. Mini stereo headphones each ICS-EBI86711 $1.79 EPH $1.79

122. Radio AM/FM silver each ICS-NAXA-
NR720BK $4.60 PR799 $4.80

Comments/Brands Price Comments/Brands UOM Price Comments/Brands Price Comments/Brands Price
1. Bra sports white sizes 32, 34, 36, 38 & 40 dozen Manhattan $22.34 Manhattan $23.10
2. Bra sports white sizes 42, 44, 46 & 48 dozen Manhattan $24.57 Manhattan $27.56
3. Bar sports white sizes 50, 52 & 54 dozen Manhattan $26.23 Manhattan $32.29
4. Boxers S, M, L, & XL brown dozen Cotton Plus $14.50 Rocky $16.65
5. Boxers 2XL brown dozen Cotton Plus $15.05 Rocky $17.81
6. Boxer 3XL brown dozen Cotton Plus $15.60 Rocky $18.74
7. Boxers 4XL brown dozen Cotton Plus $16.15 Rocky $20.06
8. Boxers 5XL brown dozen Cotton Plus $16.70 Rocky $21.22
9. Boxers 6XL brown dozen Cotton Plus $17.25 Rocky $22.37
10. Brief white S, M, L & XL dozen Cotton Plus $9.87 Rocky $11.55
11. Brief white 2XL, 3XL, 4XL dozen Cotton Plus $10.98 Rocky $14.85
12. Gowns suicide (smock) each
13. Panty cotton sizes 5, 6, 7 & 8 dozen Manhattan $9.53 Mighty Hugs $10.73
14. Panty cotton sizes 9 & 10 dozen Manhattan $10.09 Mighty Hugs $11.33
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15. Panty cotton sizes 11, 12, 13, & 14 dozen Manhattan $11.20 Mighty Hugs $11.94
16. Shoes 7 oz step-in sizes 6-17 black pair Shoecorp $5.69
17. Shoes low-top velcro canvas tennis shoes 
sizes 5-17 black pair Shoecorp $7.94

18. Sandals shoes bio-chek sizes S to 2XL pair
19. Belt tips dozen
20. Belt buckles dozen
21. Belt webbing navy 50 yd roll
22. Sock sport white 10-13 terry pair Cotton Plus $4.94
23. Sock tube white one size fits all dozen Cotton Plus $4.94 Manhattan $7.17
24. Socks no show one size fits all dozen Cotton Plus $4.94
25. T-shirt 100% cotton S, M, L & XL 4.6 oz dozen Goldan $18.67 Rocky $23.42
26. T-shirt 100% cotton 2XL 4.6 oz dozen Cotton Plus $28.33 Rocky $25.62
27. T-shirt 100% cotton 3XL 4.6 oz dozen Cotton Plus $29.44 Rocky $30.02
28. T-shirt 100% cotton 4XL 4.6 oz dozen Cotton Plus $31.11 Rocky $32.22
29. T-shirt 100% cotton 5XL 4.6 oz dozen Cotton Plus $31.11 Rocky $33.43
30. Socks low cut sports fits 10-13 dozen Cotton Plus $4.94

31. Crew neck sweatshirt S, M, L & XL dozen Gildon-Jerzees $5.72 ea/ 
$68.64 dz Anson-TarHeel $81.58

32. Crew neck sweatshirt 2XL dozen Gildon-Jerzees $6.83 ea/ 
$81.96 dz Anson-TarHeel $87.12

33. Crew neck sweatshirt 3XL dozen Gildon-Jerzees $7.39 ea/ 
$88.68 dz Anson-TarHeel $92.66

34. Crew neck sweatshirt 4XL dozen Gildon-Jerzees $7.50 ea/ 
$90.00 dz Anson-TarHeel $99.79

35. Crew neck sweatshirt 5XL dozen Gildon-Jerzees $7.61 ea/ 
$91.32 dz Anson-TarHeel $105.86

36. Crew neck sweatshirt 6XL dozen T&J $8.89 ea/ 
$106.68 dz Anson-TarHeel $113.39

37. Sweatpants gray S, M, L dozen T&J $6.08 ea/ 
$72.96 dz Anson-TarHeel $81.58

38. Sweatpants gray XL dozen T&J $6.08 ea/ 
$72.96 dz Anson-TarHeel $81.58

39. Sweatpants gray 2XL dozen T&J $6.72 ea/ 
$80.64 dz Anson-TarHeel $87.12

40. Sweatpants gray 3XL dozen T&J $7.22 ea/ 
$86.64 dz Anson-TarHeel $92.66

41. Sweatpants gray 4XL dozen T&J $7.84 ea/ 
$94.08 dz Anson-TarHeel $99.29

42. Sweatpants gray 5XL dozen T&J $8.52 ea/ 
$102.24 dz Anson-TarHeel $105.86

43. Sweatpants gray 6XL dozen T&J $9.15 ea/ 
$109.80 dz Anson-TarHeel $113.39

44. Walking shorts, 9" knee length, M, L, XL, & 
2XL each

45. Walking shorts, 9" knee length, 3XL, 4XL, 
5XL, 6XL each

46. Inmate uniforms, medical scrub style 
poly/cotton twill 7-7.5 oz shirts, S-8XL red, 
green, orange & tan

each ** $8.65

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid
no bid

no bid

no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid
no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid
no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid
no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid

no bid

no bid

no bid

United Exchange Corp.UOM Carolina Textiles O D Taragin & Bros., LLC Complete Kits, Inc. 
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Comments/Brands Price Comments/Brands Price Comments/Brands Price Comments/Brands Price
47. Inmate uniforms, medical scrub style pants, 
S-8XL red, green, orange & tan each ** $9.87

48. Bags mesh white 18" x 24" dozen AMS Products $33.78
49. Bedspread 76" x 110" each Interlan Corp $14.02

50. Blanket beige 66" x 90" Case of 12 American Woolen 
20/case $161.89 BB1 $123.48

51. Blanket 80% wool woven 66" x 84" each American Woolen $12.30
52. Blanket 66" x 90" 70% wool 3.7 lbs each
53. Blanket 50% wool/50% synthetic each
54. Blanket suicide 54" x 80" each
55. Mattress 25" x75" x 4" polyester each
56. Mattress cover 25" x 75" x 4" 6-8oz           
off white dozen

57. Mattress cover 25" x 75" x 4" 3.8 oz dozen
58. Pillow poly-vented white HD each
59. Pillow poly/vinyl 20" x 26" Case of 4 VP20 $20.00
60. Pillow poly core microvent vinyl cover           
20" x 26" each

61. Pillowcases 42" x 34" dozen PC42 $10.80
62. Pillowcases white T130 42" x 34" dozen WPC42 $8.91
63. Pillows cotton core with microvent cover Case of 4
64. Sheets flat colored 58" x 90" dozen
65. Sheets flat white T130 66" x 104" dozen FS1 $40.70
66. Sheets fitted white muslin 36" x 80" x 6" dozen FS2 $32.20
67. Sheets flat 66" x 104" T180 dozen FS3 $47.10
68. Sheets fitted 36" x 80" x 6" T180 dozen FS4 $40.25
69. Towel bath 22" x 44" institutional dozen BT1 $12.35
70. Towel white 20" x 40" regular institutional dozen BT2 $11.35
71. Towel bath 24" x 48" premium dozen BT3 $19.45
72. Wash cloth white 12" x 12" dozen WC1 $2.55
73. Wash cloth colored 12" x 12" terry 
institutional dozen WC2 $2.88

74. Wash cloth white 12" x 12" regular 
institutional dozen WC3 $2.53

75. Wash cloth white 12" x 12" terry 
institutional dozen WC4 $2.53

76. Hair and scalp conditioner 4 oz dozen
77. Hair and scalp conditioner 7oz dozen
78. Styling gel alcohol free 7 oz dozen
79. Hair dressing 4 oz dozen
80. Comb 5", pocket, black Case of 144 2,160/case $1.66
81. Shampoo .75 oz Case of 288 DU 2.35oz $13.25
82. Shampoo & conditioner 14.5 oz Case of 6
83. Shampoo balsam 8 oz dozen
84. Deodorant, alcohol & scent free, 2 oz Case of 12 96/case $3.73
85. Deodorant, ladies stick 2.25 oz Case of 24 Nu-Pore $24.00
86. Soap deodorant wrapped antibacterial           
0.5 oz Case of 1000 * $39.96

87. Soap deodorant wrapped antibacterial 3oz Case of 144 1,000/case $36.43
88. Soap box, 2 piece clear dozen 100/case $2.07
89. Lip balm 0.15 oz Case of 24

United Exchange Corp.
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Complete Kits, Inc. Carolina Textiles O D Taragin & Bros., LLCUOM
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Comments/Brands Price Comments/Brands Price Comments/Brands Price Comments/Brands Price
90. Lotion, hand and body gallon 4/case $7.62
91. Lotion, Suave Skin Therapy 10 oz 
Advanced Relief Case of 6

92. Twin blade razor Case of 600 2,000/case $34.50
93. Security razor Case of 100 2,000/case $8.05
94. Shaving cream 11 oz Case of 12 42/case $12.42
95. Maxi-pads Case of 576 Coralite 336/Case $24.00
96. Maxi thins long super w/wings Case of 288 Coralite 240/Case $24.00
97. Sanitary napkin, individually wrapped Case of 576
98. Tampon non-vended paper wrap Case of 500
99. Tampon super non-vended Case of 500
100. Toothbrush 40 tuft soft Case of 144 39 Tuft 1,440/case $6.62
101. Toothbrush no shank Case of 100 1,440/case $4.60
102. Toothbrush covers Case of 12 1,440/case $6.62
103. Toothpaste 1.5 oz unboxed Case of 144 * $31.40
104. Toothpaste .85 oz unboxed Case of 144 270/case $19.87
105. Toothpaste 2.75 oz unboxed Case of 144 * $55.00
106. Shower mat 14" x 22.5" suction backed each
107. Fingernail clippers, no file Case of 24 288/case $5.24
108. Toenail clippers, no file Case of 12 144/case $5.52
109. Bergamot, 4 oz conditioner Case of 12
110. Comb black 9" large Case of 144 8" 1,008/case $8.64
111. Comb, lice 3" black double sided dozen
112. Antiperspirant, Mennon Speed Stick           
0.5 oz Case of 24 576/Case $5.24

113. Roll-on antiperspirant 1.5 oz Case of 96 * $22.71
114. Hair gel, super wet clear 8.8 oz Case of 24
115. Janitor carts each Continental 184GY $139.95
116. Mop heads each #32 4-ply $3.30
117. Mop handles Case of 6 JMC $5.90
118. Wet floor signs each * $9.00
119. Dust pans each * $4.95
120. Duffel bag, black, 18" x 10" x 10" each
121. Mini stereo headphones each
122. Radio AM/FM silver each

Comments/Brands Price Comments/Brands Price Comments/Brands Price Comments/Brands Price
1. Bra sports white sizes 32, 34, 36, 38 & 40 dozen
2. Bra sports white sizes 42, 44, 46 & 48 dozen
3. Bar sports white sizes 50, 52 & 54 dozen
4. Boxers S, M, L, & XL brown dozen
5. Boxers 2Xl brown dozen
6. Boxer 3XL brown dozen
7. Boxers 4XL brown dozen
8. Boxers 5XL brown dozen
9. Boxers 6XL brown dozen
10. Brief white S, M, L & XL dozen
11. Brief white 2XL, 3XL, 4XL dozen

Goodwill Industries of Kansas, Inc.Paradise Pillow, Inc.

Yes

UOM

O D Taragin & Bros., LLC

Colonial Textile, LLC

Yes Yes

Carolina Textiles

Yes
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United Exchange Corp.UOM

Acknowledge addendum

Complete Kits, Inc. 
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Comments/Brands Price Comments/  
Brands Price Comments/Brands Price Comments/Brands Price

12. Gowns suicide (smock) each
13. Panty cotton sizes 5, 6, 7 & 8 dozen
14. Panty cotton sizes 9 & 10 dozen
15. Panty cotton sizes 11, 12, 13, & 14 dozen
16. Shoes 7 oz step-in sizes 6-17 black pair Goldwater M9922K $2.99
17. Shoes low-top velcro canvas tennis shoes 

  
pair Goldwater M9905K $5.46

18. Sandals shoes bio-chek sizes S to 2XL pair Goldwater SS101T $1.62
19. Belt tips dozen
20. Belt buckles dozen
21. Belt webbing navy 50 yd roll
22. Sock sport white 10-13 terry pair
23. Sock tube white one size fits all dozen
24. Socks no show one size fits all dozen
25. T-shirt 100% cotton S, M, L & XL 4.6 oz dozen
26. T-shirt 100% cotton 2XL 4.6 oz dozen
27. T-shirt 100% cotton 3XL 4.6 oz dozen
28. T-shirt 100% cotton 4XL 4.6 oz dozen
29. T-shirt 100% cotton 5XL 4.6 oz dozen
30. Socks low cut sports fits 10-13 dozen
31. Crew neck sweatshirt S, M, L & XL dozen
32. Crew neck sweatshirt 2XL dozen
33. Crew neck sweatshirt 3XL dozen
34. Crew neck sweatshirt 4XL dozen
35. Crew neck sweatshirt 5XL dozen
36. Crew neck sweatshirt 6XL dozen
37. Sweatpants gray S, M, L dozen
38. Sweatpants gray XL dozen
39. Sweatpants gray 2XL dozen
40. Sweatpants gray 3XL dozen
41. Sweatpants gray 4XL dozen
42. Sweatpants gray 5XL dozen
43. Sweatpants gray 6XL dozen
44. Walking shorts, 9" knee length, M, L, XL, & 
2XL each

45. Walking shorts, 9" knee length, 3XL, 4XL, 
5XL, 6XL each

46. Inmate uniforms, medical scrub style 
poly/cotton twill 7-7.5 oz shirts, S-8XL red, 
green, orange & tan

each Goodwill 

S-L $6.85,           
XL-2XL $7.05, 

3XL $7.10,       
4XL $7.25,       

5XL-6XL $7.45,            
7XL-8XL $7.85

47. Inmate uniforms, medical scrub style pants, 
S-8XL red, green, orange & tan each Goodwill 

S-L $6.85,            
XL-3XL $7.25, 

4XL $7.45,      
5XL-6XL $7.80,            

7XL $8.10,        
8XL $8.45

48. Bags mesh white 18" x 24" dozen PP 07776-WHTID $17.98
49. Bedspread 76" x 110" each PP 10052-76110 $21.99

UOM

no bid
no bid

no bid
no bid

no bid
no bid

no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid
no bid

Goodwill Industries of Kansas, Inc.
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Colonial Textile, LLC
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Gold Water Industries, Inc.
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Paradise Pillow, Inc.
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Comments/Brands Price Comments/Brands Price Comments/Brands Price Comments/Brands Price

50. Blanket beige 66" x 90" Case of 12 PP 00018 $91.38 Colonial Textile      
70" x 90" only

$5.35ea/ 
$64.20 dz

51. Blanket 80% wool woven 66" x 84" each PP 10048-WL80 $8.95 Colonial Textile      
62" x 84"  only $6.50

52. Blanket 66" x 90" 70% wool 3.7 lbs each PP 10048-WL70 $6.69 Colonial Textile      
66" x 84" only $6.50

53. Blanket 50% wool/50% synthetic each PP 10048-WL50 $6.36 Colonial Textile $4.50
54. Blanket suicide 54" x 80" each PP 10048-5480 $70.29
55. Mattress 25" x75" x 4" polyester each
56. Mattress cover 25" x 75" x 4" 6-8oz           
off white dozen PP 01001-2575B $66.21

57. Mattress cover 25" x 75" x 4" 3.8 oz dozen PP  01001-2575A $79.16
58. Pillow poly-vented white HD each PP 10102ST $4.42
59. Pillow poly/vinyl 20" x 26" Case of 4 PP 10102ST $22.52
60. Pillow poly core microvent vinyl cover           
20" x 26" each PP 10102ST $3.52

61. Pillowcases 42" x 34" dozen PP 10026-180 $10.22
62. Pillowcases white T130 42" x 34" dozen PP 10026-130 $8.69
63. Pillows cotton core with microvent cover Case of 4 PP  10102-MV $28.50
64. Sheets flat colored 58" x 90" dozen PP 10018-D5890 $39.26
65. Sheets flat white T130 66" x 104" dozen PP 10018XL-130 $40.62
66. Sheets fitted white muslin 36" x 80" x 6" dozen PP 10022-3680 $32.28
67. Sheets flat 66" x 104" T180 dozen PP 10018XL-180 $91.92

68. Sheets fitted 36" x 80" x 6" T180 dozen PP 10022-3680-180 $71.72

69. Towel bath 22" x 44" institutional dozen PP 10166-2244 $17.28

70. Towel white 20" x 40" regular institutional dozen PP 10166-2040 $16.87

71. Towel bath 24" x 48" premium dozen PP 10166-2448 $30.68
72. Wash cloth white 12" x 12" dozen PP 10158-1212 $2.31
73. Wash cloth colored 12" x 12" terry 
institutional dozen PP 10158-1212C $3.34

74. Wash cloth white 12" x 12" regular 
institutional dozen PP 10158-1212IR $3.29

75. Wash cloth white 12" x 12" terry 
institutional dozen PP 10158-12122 $4.17

76. Hair and scalp conditioner 4 oz dozen
77. Hair and scalp conditioner 7oz dozen
78. Styling gel alcohol free 7 oz dozen
79. Hair dressing 4 oz dozen
80. Comb 5", pocket, black Case of 144
81. Shampoo .75 oz Case of 288
82. Shampoo & conditioner 14.5 oz Case of 6
83. Shampoo balsam 8 oz dozen
84. Deodorant, alcohol & scent free, 2 oz Case of 12
85. Deodorant, ladies stick 2.25 oz Case of 24
86. Soap deodorant wrapped antibacterial          
0.5 oz Case of 1000

87. Soap deodorant wrapped antibacterial 3oz Case of 144
88. Soap box, 2 piece clear dozen
89. Lip balm 0.15 oz Case of 24
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no bid

no bid

no bid
no bid
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no bid

no bid
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no bid
no bid
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no bid
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no bid
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Gold Water Industries, Inc.
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UOM Goodwill Industries of Kansas, Inc. Colonial Textile, LLCParadise Pillow, Inc.
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Comments/Brands Price Comments/Brands Price Comments/Brands Price Comments/Brands Price
90. Lotion, hand and body gallon
91. Lotion, Suave Skin Therapy 10 oz 
Advanced Relief Case of 6

92. Twin blade razor Case of 600
93. Security razor Case of 100
94. Shaving cream 11 oz Case of 12
95. Maxi-pads Case of 576
96. Maxi thins long super w/wings Case of 288
97. Sanitary napkin, individually wrapped Case of 576
98. Tampon non-vended paper wrap Case of 500
99. Tampon super non-vended Case of 500
100. Toothbrush 40 tuft soft Case of 144
101. Toothbrush no shank Case of 100
102. Toothbrush covers Case of 12
103. Toothpaste 1.5 oz unboxed Case of 144
104. Toothpaste .85 oz unboxed Case of 144
105. Toothpaste 2.75 oz unboxed Case of 144
106. Shower mat 14" x 22.5" suction backed each
107. Fingernail clippers, no file Case of 24
108. Toenail clippers, no file Case of 12
109. Bergamot, 4 oz conditioner Case of 12
110. Comb black 9" large Case of 144
111. Comb, lice 3" black double sided dozen
112. Antiperspirant, Mennon Speed Stick           
0.5 oz Case of 24

113. Roll-on antiperspirant 1.5 oz Case of 96
114. Hair gel, super wet clear 8.8 oz Case of 24
115. Janitor carts each
116. Mop heads each
117. Mop handles Case of 6
118. Wet floor signs each
119. Dust pans each
120. Duffel bag, black, 18" x 10" x 10" each
121. Mini stereo headphones each
122. Radio AM/FM silver each

* No information provided
** No sample provided

YesAcknowledge addendum Yes

UOM

No Bid
Yes Yes

Jet Micro Corp.
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Hagemeyer North America Shoe Corporation of Birmingham

Goodwill Industries of Kansas, Inc. Colonial Textile, LLC Gold Water Industries, Inc.

On the recommendation of Kristen McGovern, on behalf of the Department of Corrections, Jennifer Dombaugh moved to accept the overall low bid from Bob Barker Company, Inc. for items numbered 
1-45 and items numbered 48-122, and the bid from Goodwill Industries of Kansas, Inc. for items numbered 46-47 and establish contract pricing as listed above for three (3) years with two (2) one 
(1) year options to renew.   Linda Kizzire seconded the motion.  The motion passed unanimously. 
 
The Department of Corrections performed wear testing of inmate uniforms, which included multiple washings and dryings of each of the samples provided.  Goodwill Industries of Kansas, Inc. had the least 
shrinkage and superior product quality. 
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2.  DESIGN SERVICES FOR 271 W 3RD ST N (formerly IRS Building) -- FACILITIES DEPARTMENT

     FUNDING -- ACQ/RENO IRS BUILDING     
     (Professional Service) 

     #14-2022  S/C 8000054227
Schaefer Johnson Cox Frey Architecture

Schematic design, construction documents and contract 
administration for renovations to 271 W. 3rd St. N., Wichita, KS not to exceed $329,772.00                                        

On the recommendation of Joe Thomas, on behalf of the Facilities Department, Linda Kizzire moved to accept the 
proposal from Schaefer Johnson Cox Frey Architecture for a not to exceed amount of $329,772.00.  Tim Kaufman 
seconded the motion.  The motion passed unanimously. 
 
This proposal provides for complete design services for the renovation of the existing building at 271 W. 3rd St. N., 
Wichita, KS.  Schaefer Johnson Cox Frey Architecture has already completed a program to address the needs of the 
various departments that will occupy this future location (Metropolitan Area Building and Construction Department, 
Metropolitan Area Planning Department, Tag Office, Appraiser's Office, Environmental Resources and the Professional 
Standards Unit for the Sheriff's Office). 
 
Already having completed cursory structural, mechanical and electrical evaluations of the building and being familiar 
with the County's needs, Schaefer Johnson Cox Frey Architecture has been chosen to complete schematic designs through 
construction documents and contract administration for the renovation of floors 1-6, a revised 3rd St. entrance, parking 
lot, sidewalk repairs and reconfiguration. 
 
Their services include architectural, mechanical and electrical drawings and specifications as required for a complete bid 
package. 
 
Schaefer Johnson Cox Frey Architecture is one of our on-call architectural & engineering service firms. 
 
Question: How does the cost quoted compare to similar work?  Steve Claassen from Facility Maintenance Services stated 
that the proposal submitted by Schaefer Johnson Cox Frey Architecture is 45% below what was originally budgeted for 
this project. 
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