

BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS MAY 14, 2015

**ITEMS REQUIRING BOCC APPROVAL
6 ITEMS**

**1. CHFRS-2P EMULSIFIED ASPHALT -- PUBLIC WORKS
FUNDING -- R175 PREVENTIVE MX-15**

(Request sent to eight vendors)

RFB #15-0046 SC #8000064103

	Qty.	Coastal Energy Corp.		Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc.	
		Price per Gallon	Extended Price	Price per Gallon	Extended Price
CHFRS-2P Emulsified Asphalt	92,000 gallons	\$2.41	\$221,720.00	\$2.17	\$199,640.00
Delivery timeline		24 hours		24 hours	
Pump charge per load		\$70.00		n/a	
Demurrage charge		\$70.00 per hour after 2 hours		n/a	

On the recommendation of Kristen McGovern, on behalf of Public Works, Tim Kaufman moved to **accept the low bid from Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions Inc. for an initial purchase of \$199,640.00 and establish contract pricing for one (1) year with two (2) one (1) year options to renew.** Linda Kizzire seconded the motion. The motion passed unanimously.

CHFRS-2P emulsified oil is a sealing and binding agent for chat seal and rock applied to county roads.

BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS MAY 14, 2015

**2. 2015 SUPER SEAL (R175-L) -- PUBLIC WORKS
FUNDING -- R175 PREVENTIVE MX-15**

(Request sent to six vendors)

RFB #15-0048 SC #8000064096

Engineer's Estimate: \$1,601,093.50	Andale Ready Mix Central, Inc.
2015 Super Seal (R175-L)	\$1,451,561.72
Bid bond	Yes
Acknowledge addenda	Yes
No Bid	Mies Construction, Inc.
	Musselman and Hall Contractors, LLC
	Vogts-Parga Construction, LLC
	Roadsafe Traffic Systems
	CMD Group

On the recommendation of Kristen McGovern, on behalf of Public Works, Linda Kizzire moved to **accept the bid from Andale Ready Mix Central, Inc. in the amount of \$1,451,561.72.** Tim Kaufman seconded the motion. The motion passed unanimously.

Super Seal is a cementitious material used to stabilize the subgrade of selected County roads.

Andale Ready Mix Central, Inc. is currently the only vendor experienced in this new process.

This application method for Super Seal has been in existence and practice worldwide for decades but has not been used in this area until recently. At this point in time, there is only one contractor in the local market who is equipped and experienced in this application method. Public Works continues to monitor the cost of this type of application against the cost of other methods and materials, that provide a similar end product to ensure that the county is getting the best possible value.

BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS MAY 14, 2015

**3. MS-1 EMULSIFIED OIL -- PUBLIC WORKS
FUNDING -- R175 PREVENTIVE MX-15**

(Request sent to eight vendors)

RFB #15-0053 SC #8000064104

		Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc.	
		Price per Gallon	Extended Price
MS-1 Emulsified Oil	75,000 gallons	\$2.13	\$159,750.00
Delivery date		24 hours	
No Bid		Missouri Petroleum	

On the recommendation of Kristen McGovern, on behalf of Public Works, Tim Kaufman moved to **accept the bid from Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc. for an initial purchase of \$159,750.00 and establish contract pricing for one (1) year with two (2) one (1) year options to renew.** Linda Kizzire seconded the motion. The motion passed unanimously.

MS-1 emulsified oil is used with the county's skim coat for revitalizing roads.

In surveying the vendors who did not respond, we found that several stated they could not be competitive with delivery of this product from their plant locations.

BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS MAY 14, 2015

**4. CITY SURFACE MIX-- PUBLIC WORKS
FUNDING -- R175 PREVENTIVE MX-15**

(Request sent to 20 vendors)

RFB #15-0054 SC #8000064105

		APAC-Kansas, Inc. Shears Division	
	Qty.	Price per Ton	Extended Price
City Surface Mix	2,000 Tons	\$48.25	\$96,500.00
Location of plant		3511 S. West St., Wichita	
Date available for pickup		immediately	
No Bid		Bingham Sand	
		Trinity Industries	
		South West Butler Quarry, LLC	

On the recommendation of Kristen McGovern, on behalf of Public Works, David Spears moved to **accept the bid from APAC-Kansas, Inc. Shears Division for an initial purchase of \$96,500.00 and establish contract pricing for one (1) year with two (2) one (1) year options to renew.** Tim Kaufman seconded the motion. The motion passed unanimously.

City Surface Mix is material used to patch potholes on county roads.

Trinity Industries and South West Butler Quarry, LLC could not supply the City Surface Mix. Bingham Sand could not quote a competitive price due to their distance from the county. Cornejo & Sons, LLC received the bid request on April 24, 2015, but did not respond.

BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS MAY 14, 2015

**5. DODGE CHARGER POLICE PACKAGE VEHICLES -- FLEET MANAGEMENT
FUNDING -- AWD/RWD DODGE CHARGER**

(Request sent to 23 vendors)

RFB #15-0057 SC #8000064156

	Qty.	Landmark Dodge		Davis-Moore Automotive, Inc.	
		Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
1. Dodge Charger AWD	7	\$29,128.00	\$203,896.00	\$28,883.00	\$202,181.00
2. Dodge Charger RWD	7	\$27,837.00	\$194,859.00	\$28,592.00	\$200,144.00
3. Manual	1	\$225.00	\$225.00	\$150.00	\$150.00
Total		\$398,980.00		\$402,475.00	
Delivery		90-120 days		60-90 days	
Acknowledge addendum		Yes		Yes	
No Bid		Resnik Motors			

On the recommendation of Gunda Angelica, on behalf of Fleet Management, David Spears moved to **accept the overall low bid from Landmark Dodge in the amount of \$398,980.00.** Tim Kaufman seconded the motion. The motion passed 2 to 1 with Linda Kizzire voting no.

These are replacement vehicles for Sheriff's Office; surplus will be sold on Purple Wave, Inc.

Question: Where is Landmark Dodge located? Independence, MO.

Question: Was a delivery timeline specified in the bid? No specific delivery date was requested.

Question: Why were only two bids received? Davis-Moore Automotive, Inc. regularly responds; they currently have the state contract for Dodge Chargers. Landmark Dodge had previously been awarded the state contract and subsequently became more active in submitting bids to the county.

Question: Did Eddy's Dodge in west Wichita submit a bid? No.

Linda Kizzire voiced concern for local vendors and their employees who pay state, county, real estate, property and motor vehicle taxes. She also noted that there was less than \$3,500.00 difference in the bids.

BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS MAY 14, 2015

**6. ERGONOMIC TASK CHAIRS-- FACILITIES DEPARTMENT AND RISK MANAGEMENT
FUNDING -- VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS**

(Request sent to 66 vendors)

RFP #15-0024 Contract

Midwest Single Source		Contract Furnishings ¹		ErgoGenesis Workplace Solutions, LLC	
Lorell High Performance Task Chair	Lorell Managerial Swivel Mesh Mid Back Task Chair	Global Vion Mesh High Back Task Chair	Global Vion High-Back Task Chair	ErgoGenesis Mesh Back Task Chair J2607/R2607	ErgoGenesis Executive Seating Task Chair
\$265.00 ea	\$265.00 ea	\$340.55 ea	\$384.65 ea	\$504.00 ea	\$784.00 ea
HON High Back Task Chair		Global Vion Mesh Mid-Back Task Chair	Global Vion 24/7 Mesh Mid-Back Task Chair	ErgoGenesis Mid Back Task Chair J757/R757	ErgoGenesis 24/7 Seating Task Chair
\$379.00 ea		\$323.40 ea	\$421.40 ea	\$618.00 ea	\$849.00 ea
Lorell Lower Mesh Back Fabric Seat Swivel Executive Task Chair		Global Vion Mid Back Task Chair	Global Vion 24/7 Mesh High Back Task Chair	ErgoGenesis High Back Task Chair J2407/R2407	ErgoGenesis XL Task Chair
\$445.00 ea		\$367.50 ea	\$438.55 ea	\$695.00 ea	\$856.00 ea
Lorell Lower Leather Back and Seat Swivel Executive Task Chair		Global Vion 24/7 High-Back Task Chair		ErgoGenesis High Back Task Chair J2507/R2507	
\$445.00 ea		\$482.65 ea		\$695.00 ea	
Lorell Lower Mesh Back and Leather Seat Swivel Executive Task Chair		Global Vion 24/7 Mid Back Task Chair		ErgoGenesis Bariatric Task Chair	
\$445.00 ea		\$465.50 ea		\$1257.00 ea	
Total Installation		Scott Rice Office Interiors		T.E. Barry & Associates	Roberts Hutch-Line
Kimball Wish Classic Task Chair	Global Truform Task Chair	ErgoCentric e-Centric Plus Task Chair	Steelcase Criterion Task Chair	Sitmatic Petite Beta2 Task Chair	AllSeating "You" Mid Back Task Chair
\$501.39 ea	\$ 391.13 ea	\$726.31 ea	\$668.39 ea	\$417.14 ea	\$645.00 ea
Kimball Wish Task Chair	Global Looover Task Chair	ErgoCentric geoCentric Task Chair	Steelcase Criterion Plus Task Chair	Sitmatic Super Beta2 Task Chair	AllSeating "You" High Back Task Chair
\$580.46 ea	\$425.89 ea	\$526.44 ea \$662.44 w/ Headrest ea	\$960.94 ea	\$565.71 ea	\$655.00 ea
Global Spree Task Chair	HumanScale Freedom Task Chair	Steelcase Leap Task Chair	Eurotech Ergohuman Task Chair	Seating Inc. Grid Task Chair	Office Master Big & Tall Task Chair
\$511.59 ea	\$799.52ea \$928.73 w/ Headrest ea	\$764.04 ea \$892.04 w/Headrest ea	\$588.79 ea	\$620.57 ea	\$669.75 ea \$739.75 w/ Headrest ea
HumanScale Liberty Task Chair		Steelcase Leap Plus Task Chair	Hon Endorse Task Chair	Seating Inc. Grid Small Edition Task Chair	Office Master 24/7 Series Task Chair
\$810.03 ea		\$1143.56 ea	\$403.50 ea	\$672.00 ea	
Dauphin Aiko Task Chair		Steelcase Amia Task Chair	Hon Ignition Task Chair	Seating Inc. Grid Heavy Duty Task Chair	\$669.75 ea \$739.75 w/ Headrest ea
\$532.54 ea		\$560.30 ea	\$370.00 ea	\$758.29 ea	

BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS MAY 14, 2015

John A. Marshall, Co.	Scott Rice Office Works KC	No Bid			
Herman Miller Mirra2 Task Chair	Sit On It Amplify Task Chair	Humanscale	Kansas Contract Design	AliMed Inc.	William Webb Furniture
		Davis Furniture Company	National Seating & Mobility	Modern Business Interiors	Marsha Geisert dba Integrated Facilities Group
\$650.52 ea	\$302.02 ea	Command & Control Environments	Business Interiors by Staples	Spectrum Industries, Inc.	

1 Additional \$45.00 fee for assembly, delivery and tutorial

On the recommendation of Kara Kingsley, on behalf of Facilities Department and Risk Management, Tim Kaufman moved to **accept the proposals from Midwest Single Source-Hon High Back Task Chair, Contract Furnishings-Global Vion Mesh Mid-Back Task Chair, Scott Rice Office Interiors-Steelcase Leap Task Chair, John A. Marshall Co.-Herman Miller Mirra2 Task Chair and establish contract pricing for three (3) years with two (2) one (1) year options to renew.** Linda Kizzire seconded the motion. The motion passed unanimously.

A review committee consisting of Tania Cole and Crystal Deselms-Facilities Department, Diana Mansouri-Risk Management, and Kara Kingsley-Purchasing reviewed all proposals to determine best ergonomic fit, durability and product specifications for Sedgwick County. The committee considered ergonomic specifications including adjustability, console fit, personal fit, individual use features and overall comfort, as well as cost and vendor service ability as determined by previous experience and reference checks. Chair selections include 24/7 rating (Steelcase Leap Task Chair and Herman Miller Mirra2 Task Chair), a mesh back (Global Vion Mesh Mid-Back Task Chair) and foam back (Hon High Back Task Chair), which are the most requested. This selection process will allow employees flexibility to ensure each chair is a proper ergonomic fit which reduces stress on the body and on-the-job injuries.

Total amount spent in 2014 was approximately \$66,000.00.