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1
Hydraulic Oil #68

Gallon (Bulk)
Champion  $5.33 Cross $5.55 AMSOIL AWJ $23.76 

HVJ $16.92

Mach 4 $6.15 Allied  $7.07 Universal  $5.99

2
Hydraulic Oil #68

55Gallon Drum
Champion  $305.87 Cross $305.25 AMSOIL AWJ $23.76 

HVJ $16.92

Mach 4 $338.25 Allied  $399.85 Universal  $329.45

3
Service Pro-Automotive all makes & models 

Antifreeze, Pre-mix
55 Gallon Drum

Champion  $236.18 Peak Global $379.50 AMSOIL ANT 

24.62/gal

Defendal $280.18 Valvoline $642.95 Service Pro $390.00

4
Eco Ultra Heavy Duty Extended Life Diesel Antifreeze, 

50/50 Pre-mix
55 Gallon Drum

Fleet Charge $380.47 Final Charge $521.40 AMSOIL ANT 

24.62/gal

Mach 4 $342.94 Allied $348.15 Universal $490.00

5 Mercon V ATF Gallon (Bulk) Global Trans $14.69 Cross $9.48 AMSOIL ATF 27.00 Mach 4 $10.76 Allied $9.71 Motor Craft $12.27

6 Dexron VI ATF Gallon (Bulk) Global Trans $14.69 Cross $9.48 AMSOIL ATL 27.00 Mach 4 $10.76 Allied $9.71 Universal  $8.79

7
Mercon LV ATF

55Gallon Drum
Global Trans $823.23 Cross $521.40 AMSOIL ATL 

27.00/gal

Motor Craft $772.50 Allied $545.05 Universal  $483.45

8
Mercon SP ATF

55Gallon Drum
Global Trans $823.23 Cross $521.40 AMSOIL ATL 

27.00/gal

Mach 4 $613.18 Allied $545.05 Universal  $483.45

9
Heavy Duty Synthetic Transmission Fluid SAE 50

5 Gallon Pail
Champion $86.23 Cross NA AMSOIL FTF 

33.08/gal

Phillips $142.82 No Bid No Bid Universal  $115.00

10
Autran Syn 295

5 Gallon Pail
Global Trans $81.95 BP $150.59 AMSOIL ATD 

31.64/gal

Valvoline $129.53 No Bid No Bid Valvoline $136.00

11
Valvoline Multi Purpose Grease (lithium #2) 

120 LB. Drum
Champion $193.91/keg HW MP/EP2 $241.27 AMSOIL GVC 4.37/lb Valvoline $324.14 Allied $223.20/keg Universal  $235.00

12
#2 Tube Grease (Mp/EP2)

14 OZ. Tube
Champion 17.43/10 pk HW Wheel 

Bear

$1.77 AMSOIL GVC 4.80 / 

GPTR2 5.12

Phillips $1.89 Allied $1.70 Universal  2.23/16-oz 

for 40 tubes

13
Windshield Washer Fluid

55Gallon Drum
Wipe R Clean $85.15 Four Seasons $66.39 NO BID NO BID Mach 4 $60.00 Allied $85.23 Universal  $90.00

14

Heavy Duty Synthetic Gear Lubricant 80W140

55Gallon Drum

Champion $968.08 Citgo $1,077.55 AMSOIL FGO 29.07 

SVO 41.13 

/gal

Phillips $1,569.39 Shell $1,901.90 Universal  $1,170.00

15
High Performance Rear Axle Lubricant 75w140

Quart
Champion $135.17 /5 

gal pail

Cross $6.27 AMSOIL SVO 11.15 Valvoline $9.25 Shell $13.15 Service Pro $7.50/qt for 

12 qts

16
15w40 Motor Oil Premium CJ4 oil

Gallon (Bulk)
Champion $8.23 Cross $7.03 AMSOIL OED 27 

15.80

Phillips $6.97 Allied $7.85 Universal  $7.15

16A Rerefined 15w40 Motor Oil Premium CJ4 oil Gallon (Bulk) $9.16 $7.00

17
15w40 Motor Oil Premium CJ4 oil

55Gallon Drum
Champion $469.65 Cross $386.65 AMSOIL OED 55 

15.89/gal

Phillips $405.35 Allied $431.75 Universal  $393.25

17A Rerefined 15w40 Motor Oil Premium CJ4 oil 55Gallon Drum $545.14 $385.00

18
5W20 Motor Oil

Gallon (Bulk)
CH. Synclean $6.69 Cross $5.77 AMSOIL OEM 27 

13.91

Phillips $6.70 Allied $6.80 Universal  $6.00

18A Refefined 5W20 Motor Oil Gallon (Bulk) $5.85

19
5W20 Motor Oil

55Gallon Drum
CH. Synclean $383.55 Cross $317.35 AMSOIL OEM 55 

14.00/gal

Phillips $390.50 Allied $374.00 Universal  $330.00

19A Rerefined 5W20 Motor Oil 55Gallon Drum $321.75

Y

Allied Oil & Tire Co. Universal Lubricants LLC

Vehicle Maintenance 

Program, Inc.

Auto Masters Corp. 

Headquarters

N Y Y Y

Parker Oil Co., Inc.

2.  OILS AND FLUIDS - FLEET MANAGEMENT

     FUNDING -- FLEET MANAGEMENT

     (Request sent to 22 vendors)

Champion Brands, LLC
Heathwood Oil Company 

Inc.

Boone Opportunities

Phillips Enterprises-

AMSOIL

Y

Petroleum Traders 

Corporation
NO BID

Acknowledge Addendum


