
BID OPENING OCTOBER 8, 2013

Item 

No.
Description Qty

Unit Of 

Measure
Unit Price

Extended 

Price
Unit Price

Extended 

Price

1
B.A.S.F., Plateau or comparable product, in 

15 gallon containers
45 Gallons $115.81 $5,211.45

2
Dow AgroSciences, Tordon 22K or 

comparable product in 1 gallon containers
36 Gallons $48.50 $1,746.00

3
Secure Ultra, Drift control or comparable in 

quart containers
120 Quarts $8.88 $1,065.60

4

Cornbelt Defoamer or comparable in one 

pint containers
48 Pints

5.52 

Lesco 

Recede 

Antifoam

$264.96 3.98 pt $191.04

5

Nufarm Triplet SF or comparable in one 

gallon containers

75 Gallons

23.72 

Three-

way 

Selective 

2.5 gal

$1,778.88 $29.44 $2,208.00

6

Nonionic Surfactant, Spreader-Activator in 

2.5 gallon containers

380 Gallons

22.32 

Lesco 

Spreader 

Sticker 

2.5 gal

$8,483.12 $7.87 $2,990.60

Cayman 

Chemical 

Company

Morgro 

Inc.

Item 

No.
Description Qty

Unit Of 

Measure
Unit Price

Extended 

Price

1

B.A.S.F., Plateau or comparable product, in 

15 gal containers                                                     

*special order delay

45 Gallons $115.29 $5,188.05

1.1 Substitute Panoramic 45 Gallons $110.29 $4,963.05

2
Dow AgroSciences, Tordon 22K or 

comparable product in 1 gallon containers
36 Gallons $46.49 $1,673.64

Red River Specialties

Van Diest Supply 

Company

       RFB #13-0097    Contract

John Deere Landscapes

No bid

No bid

No bid

Delivery date 2-10 days ARO
10 working days from 

PO receipt

No bid No bid

2.  WEED CHEMICALS -- NOXIOUS WEED DEPARTMENT 

      FUNDING -- NOXIOUS WEED DEPARTMENT 

      (Request sent to 24 vendors) 
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3

Secure Ultra, Drift control or comparable in 

quart containers 120 Quarts

7.69         

Poly 

Control 2

$922.80

4
Cornbelt Defoamer or comparable in one 

pint containers 48 Pints $5.56 $266.88

5

Nufarm Triplet SF or comparable in one 

gallon containers 75 Gallons

24.97           

Contains 

Trimee

$1,872.75

6

Nonionic Surfactant, Spreader-Activator in 

2.5 gallon containers 380 Gallons

8.04                  

Brewer 90-

10

$3,055.20

2-3 days APO, deliver 

for over $500
Delivery date 

No bid No bid
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