BID OPENING MAY 13, 2014

5. OILS AND FLUIDS -- FLEET MANAGEMENT
FUNDING -- FLEET MANAGEMENT

(Request sent to 22 vendors)

RFB #14-0053

Allied Oil & Tire Co.

Heathwood Qil Co., Inc.

UOM Brand Price Brand Price

1. Hydraulic Oil #68 Bulk by gallons Allied $5.75 Cross- Martin $6.12
2. Hydraulic Oil #68 55 gallon drum Allied $316.25 Cross- Martin $336.60
3. Coolant/antifreeze 55 gallon drum Allied/Kost $285.15 Peak $340.29
4. Mercon V ATF Bulk by gallons Allied/Kost $10.01 Cross- Martin $9.03
5. Dexron VI ATF Bulk by gallons Allied $10.01 Cross- Martin $9.03
6. Mercon LV ATF 55 gallon drum Allied $550.55 Cross- Martin $496.65
7. Mercon SP ATF 55 gallon drum Allied $550.55 Cross- Martin $496.65
8. Transmission Fluid SAE 50 5 gallon pail No Bid Citgo $99.65
9. Autran Syn 295 5 gallon pail Shell $166.40 BP $157.44
10. Valvoline Grease (lithium 2) 120 Ib. drum Allied $237.60 Heathwood $245.41
11. #2 Tube Grease (Mp/EP2) 14 o0z. tubes Allied $1.81 Heathwood $1.61
12. Windshield Washer Fluid 55 gallon drum Allied $85.25 4 Seasons Gard $69.88
13. Gear Lubricant 80W140 55 gallon drum Shell $1,762.20 Citgo $1,140.33
14. Rear Axle Lubricant 75W140 Quarts Shell $11.15 Motor Craft $1.427
15. 15W40 Motor Oil Bulk by gallons Eco Power $7.01 Cross- Martin $7.61
16. 15W40 Motor Oil 55 gallon drum Eco Power $385.55 Cross- Martin $418.55
17. 5W20 Motor Oil Bulk by gallons Performance Plus $5.92 Cross- Martin $6.28
18. 5W20 Motor Qil 55 gallon drum Eco Power $325.60 Cross- Martin $345.40
% Discount from List Price Offered 0% 0%

Acknowledge Addenda Yes Yes

Parker Oil Co., Inc. Universal Lubricants, LLC
UOM Brand Price Brand Price
1. Hydraulic Oil #68 Bulk by gallons Mach 4 $6.16]  Universal/Eco Ultra $5.65
2. Hydraulic Oil #68 55 gallon drum Mach 4 $338.80|  Universal/Eco Ultra $310.75
Universal/Eco Ultra or
3. Coolant/antifreeze 55 gallon drum Mach 4 $323.95/$595.10| Universal/Eco Ultra ELC $200.00/$300.00
50/50

4. Mercon VV ATF Bulk by gallons Mach 4 $10.09 Motorcraft $11.49
5. Dexron VI ATF Bulk by gallons Mach 4 $10.09 Universal/Dex VI $10.05
6. Mercon LV ATF 55 gallon drum Motorcraft $887.07 Motorcraft $616.11
7. Mercon SP ATF 55 gallon drum Mach 4 $554.95 No Bid

8. Transmission Fluid SAE 50 5 gallon pail Conoco Phillips $147.00 Universal Synzol $104.00
9. Autran Syn 295 5 gallon pail Valvoline $127.78| Shell SpyrxS6 HD ATF $175.00
10. Valvoline Grease (lithium 2) 120 Ib. drum Valvoline $335.55 Universal Hi-Tac $230.00
11. #2 Tube Grease (Mp/EP2) 14 oz. tubes Conoco Phillips $1.83| Universal Ultra Blue $90.00
12. Windshield Washer Fluid 55 gallon drum Mach 4 $60.00|  Universal Clear Vue $87.00
13. Gear Lubricant 80W140 55 gallon drum Conoco Phillips $1,895.56[ Universal Synzol 80/140 $1,400.00
14. Rear Axle Lubricant 75W140 Quarts Valvoline $11.95 No Bid

15. 15W40 Motor Oil Bulk by gallons Conoco Phillips $6.34[  Universal/Eco Ultra $6.90
16. 15W40 Motor Oil 55 gallon drum Conoco Phillips $348.70|  Universal/Eco Ultra $379.50
17. 5W20 Motor Oil Bulk by gallons Conoco Phillips $7.44]  Universal/Eco Ultra $5.99
18. 5W20 Motor Oil 55 gallon drum Conoco Phillips $409.20|  Universal/Eco Ultra $329.45

% Discount from List Price Offered

Cost + 15%

3%

Acknowledge Addenda

Yes

Yes

No Bid

Auto Masters

Champion Brands, LLC

Hampel Oil Distributors,
Inc.

Phillips Enterprises




