
BID OPENING AUGUST 12, 2014

2.  WEED CHEMICALS -- NOXIOUS WEEDS
     FUNDING -- NOXIOUS WEEDS
     (Request sent to 22 vendors) 

     RFP #14-0077

Units Qty. Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
1. Escort XP ounces 512 $3.52 $1,802.24 $3.51 $1,797.12 $11.94 $6,113.28
2. Escort XP ounces 512 $3.54 $1,812.48 $3.51 $1,797.12 No Bid No Bid
3. Monsanto Honcho Plus gallons 960 $14.79 $14,198.40 $14.59 $14,006.40 $19.08 $18,316.80
4. Riverdale Weedestroy AM-40 gallons 540 $12.04 $6,501.60 $12.04 $6,501.60 No Bid No Bid
5. Banvel 4E gallons 180 $80.00 $14,400.00 $67.35 $12,123.00 No Bid No Bid
6. B.A.S.F. Habitat gallons 50 $65.00 $3,250.00 $48.59 $2,429.50 $88.48 $4,424.00
7. Remedy Ultra gallons 64 $54.39 $3,480.96 $43.97 $2,814.08 $139.05 $8,899.20

Units Qty. Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
1. Escort XP ounces 512 $10.00 $5,120.00 $3.58 $1,832.96 $2.45 $1,254.40
2. Escort XP ounces 512 $10.00 $5,120.00 $3.58 $1,832.96 $2.55 $1,305.60
3. Monsanto Honcho Plus gallons 960 $19.00 $18,240.00 $14.64 $14,054.40 $14.87 $14,275.20
4. Riverdale Weedestroy AM-40 gallons 540 $19.00 $10,260.00 $13.00 $7,020.00 $12.81 $6,917.40
5. Banvel 4E gallons 180 $61.50 $11,070.00 No Bid No Bid $65.00 $11,700.00
6. B.A.S.F. Habitat gallons 50 $69.00 $3,450.00 $56.80 $2,840.00 $53.32 $2,666.00
7. Remedy Ultra gallons 64 $86.00 $5,504.00 $45.00 $2,880.00 No Bid No Bid

Grand total
Delivery date(s)

Berne Devlin dba Crop 
Production Services

$45,445.68
ASAP

$30,460.32 $38,118.60

Van Diest Supply Co.

$41,468.82
2-3 days ARO

 John Deere 
Landscapes

$37,753.28
2-10 days ARO

Delivery date(s) 5 days ARO 2-10 days ARO 5 days ARO

CWC Chemical, Inc. Red River Specialties, 
Inc. Alligare, LLC

Grand total $58,764.00


	14-0077

