
BID OPENING DECEMBER 2, 2014

1.  FUEL -- FLEET DEPARTMENT
     FUNDING -- FLEET DEPARTMENT
     (Request sent to 12 vendors) 

     RFB #14-0104

Mark-up Freight Surcharge Price/gal Total Cost Mark-up Freight Surcharge Price/gal Total Cost

1. Treated 87 octane E10 
unleaded gasoline $0.0890 $0.0000 $0.0000 $1.8750 $1.9640 $0.0500 $0.1800 $0.0000 $1.8950 $2.1250

2. Diesel fuel #1 $0.0940 $0.0000 $0.0000 $2.7736 $2.8676 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
3. Diesel fuel #2 $0.0940 $0.0000 $0.0000 $2.4736 $2.5676 $0.0500 $0.1800 $0.0000 $2.5280 $2.7580
4. Diesel fuel #1 dyed $0.0940 $0.0000 $0.0000 $2.7772 $2.8712 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
5. Diesel fuel #2 dyed $0.0940 $0.0000 $0.0000 $2.4772 $2.5712 $0.0500 $0.1800 $0.0000 $2.5315 $2.7615

6. Treated 87 octane E10 
unleaded gasoline $0.0490 $0.0000 $0.0000 $1.8750 $1.9240 $0.0114 $0.0239 $0.0000 $1.8950 $1.9303

7. Diesel fuel #1 $0.0540 $0.0000 $0.0000 $2.7736 $2.8276 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
8. Diesel fuel #2 $0.0540 $0.0000 $0.0000 $2.4736 $2.5276 $0.0064 $0.0283 $0.0000 $2.5280 $2.5627
9. Diesel fuel #1 dyed $0.0540 $0.0000 $0.0000 $2.7772 $2.8312 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
10. Diesel fuel #2 dyed $0.0540 $0.0000 $0.0000 $2.4772 $2.5312 $0.0084 $0.0298 $0.0000 $2.5315 $2.5697

No Bid

MJ Murphy, LLC Petroleum Traders Corporation

Tank Truck- 5,000 gallons or moreTank Truck- 5,000 gallons or more

Hampel Oil Distributors, Inc. Boone Opportunities

Tank Wagon - 5,000 gallons or lessTank Wagon - 5,000 gallons or less


	14-0104

