
     BID OPENING APRIL 14, 2015

8.  PRE-CAST REINFORCED CONCRETE BOX & END SECTIONS  -- PUBLIC WORKS
     FUNDING -- PUBLIC WORKS
     (Request sent to 14 vendors)  

     RFB #15-0039

Price per 
Lineal Foot @ 

48' to 84'

Price per 
Lineal Foot @ 

90' to 120'

Price per 
Lineal Foot @ 

126' to 162'

Price per 
Lineal Foot @ 
168' or more

Price per Each 
End Section

1. Reinforced concrete box 4' x 2' $177.15 $171.82 $170.40 $167.51 $1,884.37
2. Reinforced concrete box 4' x 3' $194.79 $189.47 $188.04 $185.15 $2,047.73
3. Reinforced concrete box 4' x 4' $215.77 $210.44 $209.02 $206.13 $2,173.58
4. Reinforced concrete box 5' x 2' $215.47 $212.40 $210.79 $207.58 $2,156.41
5. Reinforced concrete box 5' x 3' $241.65 $238.58 $236.97 $233.76 $2,370.96
6. Reinforced concrete box 5' x 4' $262.05 $256.76 $255.62 $250.80 $2,484.82
7. Reinforced concrete box 5' x 5' $262.05 $286.76 $285.62 $280.80 $2,722.32
8. Reinforced concrete box 6' x 2' $251.10 $247.73 $246.20 $245.32 $2,408.67
9. Reinforced concrete box 6' x 3' $285.50 $280.21 $279.07 $274.25 $2,659.04
10. Reinforced concrete box 6' x 4' $304.51 $301.13 $299.60 $298.72 $2,786.60
11. Reinforced concrete box 6' x 5' $325.74 $322.37 $320.83 $319.95 $2,971.49
12. Reinforced concrete box 6' x 6' $346.16 $342.79 $341.25 $340.37 $3,094.00
13. Reinforced concrete box 7' x 2' $299.49 $296.12 $294.58 $293.71 $2,732.54
14. Reinforced concrete box 7' x 3' $322.05 $318.68 $317.14 $316.26 $2,925.39
15. Reinforced concrete box 7' x 4' $345.16 $341.79 $340.25 $339.38 $3,064.07
16. Reinforced concrete box 7' x 5' $389.87 $386.50 $384.96 $384.08 $3,389.81
17. Reinforced concrete box 7' x 6' $411.24 $408.24 $406.95 $403.74 $3,527.01
18. Reinforced concrete box 7' x 7' $435.65 $432.65 $431.37 $428.15 no bid
19. Reinforced concrete box 8' x 2' $348.50 $345.50 $344.21 $341.00 $3,064.33
20. Reinforced concrete box 8' x 3' $372.63 $369.63 $368.34 $365.13 $3,266.60
21. Reinforced concrete box 8' x 4' $396.11 $393.11 $391.82 $388.61 $3,407.49
22. Reinforced concrete box 8' x 5' $418.77 $415.77 $414.48 $411.27 $3,600.94
23. Reinforced concrete box 8' x 6' $441.57 $438.57 $437.28 $434.07 $3,737.74
24. Reinforced concrete box 8' x 7' $463.71 $460.71 $459.43 $456.21 no bid
25. Reinforced concrete box 8' x 8' $487.72 $484.72 $483.43 $480.22 $4,129.65
26. Reinforced concrete box 9' x 3' $427.38 $424.38 $423.10 $419.88 $3,628.66
27. Reinforced concrete box 9' x 4' $452.39 $449.39 $448.10 $444.89 $3,778.70
28. Reinforced concrete box 9' x 5' $478.17 $475.17 $473.89 $470.67 $3,990.92
29. Reinforced concrete box 9' x 6' $502.24 $499.24 $497.96 $494.74 $4,135.34
30. Reinforced concrete box 9' x 8' $617.83 $614.83 $613.54 $610.33 $4,943.83
31. Reinforced concrete box 10' x 3' $545.04 $545.04 $545.04 $545.04 $4,413.17
32. Reinforced concrete box 10' x 4' $572.18 $572.18 $572.18 $572.18 $4,576.01
33. Reinforced concrete box 10' x 5' $599.58 $599.58 $599.58 $599.58 $4,797.92
34. Reinforced concrete box 10' x 6' $627.09 $627.09 $627.09 $627.09 $4,962.95
35. Reinforced concrete box 10' x 7' $653.67 $653.67 $653.67 $653.67 no bid
36. Reinforced concrete box 10' x 8' $836.40 $836.40 $836.40 $836.40 no bid
37. Reinforced concrete box 10' x 10' $905.87 $905.87 $905.87 $905.87 no bid
38. Reinforced concrete box 11' x 8' $934.28 $934.28 $934.28 $934.28 no bid
39. Reinforced concrete box 12' x 3' $845.91 $845.91 $845.91 $845.91 $6,285.48
40. Reinforced concrete box 12' x 4' $884.31 $884.31 $884.31 $884.31 $6,515.85
41. Reinforced concrete box 12' x 6' $962.57 $962.57 $962.57 $962.57 $7,042.94
42. Reinforced concrete box 12' x 7' $1,002.79 $1,002.76 $1,002.76 $1,002.76 no bid
43. Reinforced concrete box 12' x 8' $1,042.84 $1,042.84 $1,042.84 $1,042.84 no bid
44. Reinforced concrete box 12' x 10' $1,123.84 $1,123.84 $1,123.84 $1,123.84 no bid
45. Reinforced concrete box 14' x 14' $1,229.33 $1,229.33 $1,229.33 $1,229.33 no bid
46. Reinforced concrete box 14' x 16' $1,232.25 $1,232.25 $1,232.25 $1,232.25 no bid
47. Reinforced concrete box 16' x 4' $1,072.09 $1,072.09 $1,072.09 $1,072.09 $8,152.94
48. Reinforced concrete box 16' x 6' $1,152.09 $1,152.09 $1,152.09 $1,152.09 $8,690.45
49. Reinforced concrete box 16' x 8' $1,204.28 $1,204.28 $1,204.28 $1,204.28 no bid
50. Reinforced concrete box 16' x 10' $1,282.94 $1,282.94 $1,282.94 $1,282.94 no bid
51. Ea., Rubber gasket and geotextile fabric
52. Ea., Curb 9" x 9" per foot, cast with unit
53. Ea., Curb 12" x 12" per foot, cast with unit
Acknowledge addendum

Old Castle Precast, Inc.

Yes

$14.00 per linear foot
$18.67 per linear foot
$25.22 per linear foot
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8.  PRE-CAST REINFORCED CONCRETE BOX & END SECTIONS  -- PUBLIC WORKS
     FUNDING -- PUBLIC WORKS
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Price per 
Lineal Foot @ 

48' to 84'

Price per 
Lineal Foot @ 

90' to 120'
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Price per 
Lineal Foot @ 
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1. Reinforced concrete box 4' x 2' $234.16 $197.74 $185.59 $179.51 $2,904.95
2. Reinforced concrete box 4' x 3' $226.71 $190.28 $178.14 $172.06 $2,860.25
3. Reinforced concrete box 4' x 4' $238.75 $202.33 $190.18 $184.11 $2,932.51
4. Reinforced concrete box 5' x 2' $253.40 $216.96 $204.83 $198.75 $3,020.38
5. Reinforced concrete box 5' x 3' $244.98 $208.19 $196.04 $189.97 $2,969.90
6. Reinforced concrete box 5' x 4' $250.38 $213.96 $201.81 $195.74 $3,002.29
7. Reinforced concrete box 5' x 5' $259.48 $223.06 $210.91 $204.85 $3,056.89
8. Reinforced concrete box 6' x 2' $265.67 $228.92 $217.10 $211.03 $3,094.03
9. Reinforced concrete box 6' x 3' $256.43 $220.00 $207.86 $201.79 $3,038.60
10. Reinforced concrete box 6' x 4' $264.19 $227.77 $215.62 $209.54 $3,085.14
11. Reinforced concrete box 6' x 5' $274.25 $237.82 $225.68 $219.61 $3,145.52
12. Reinforced concrete box 6' x 6' $291.43 $254.99 $242.86 $236.78 $3,248.57
13. Reinforced concrete box 7' x 2' $288.16 $251.72 $239.59 $233.51 $3,228.95
14. Reinforced concrete box 7' x 3' $274.63 $238.21 $226.06 $220.00 $3,147.81
15. Reinforced concrete box 7' x 4' $301.45 $256.62 $241.68 $234.21 $3,308.70
16. Reinforced concrete box 7' x 5' $314.57 $276.22 $263.45 $257.06 $3,387.43
17. Reinforced concrete box 7' x 6' $324.73 $286.38 $273.60 $267.22 $3,448.38
18. Reinforced concrete box 7' x 7' $332.06 $293.71 $280.93 $274.54 $3,492.38
19. Reinforced concrete box 8' x 2' $288.18 $253.75 $242.28 $236.54 $3,229.08
20. Reinforced concrete box 8' x 3' $296.99 $260.75 $248.67 $242.63 $3,281.94
21. Reinforced concrete box 8' x 4' $308.11 $271.88 $259.80 $253.76 $3,348.66
22. Reinforced concrete box 8' x 5' $316.21 $279.96 $267.89 $261.85 $3,397.26
23. Reinforced concrete box 8' x 6' $324.27 $288.04 $275.95 $269.91 $3,435.62
24. Reinforced concrete box 8' x 7' $331.61 $295.37 $283.29 $277.26 $3,489.66
25. Reinforced concrete box 8' x 8' $351.84 $315.60 $303.52 $297.48 $3,611.04
26. Reinforced concrete box 9' x 3' $319.97 $283.73 $271.66 $265.62 $3,419.82
27. Reinforced concrete box 9' x 4' $337.11 $300.88 $288.80 $282.42 $4,022.66
28. Reinforced concrete box 9' x 5' $347.58 $311.35 $299.27 $293.23 $4,085.48
29. Reinforced concrete box 9' x 6' $358.73 $322.50 $310.42 $304.38 $4,152.38
30. Reinforced concrete box 9' x 8' $374.04 $337.80 $325.72 $319.68 $4,244.00
31. Reinforced concrete box 10' x 3' $351.66 $315.42 $303.34 $297.30 $4,109.96
32. Reinforced concrete box 10' x 4' $363.02 $326.77 $314.70 $308.66 $4,178.12
33. Reinforced concrete box 10' x 5' $369.35 $333.11 $321.04 $315.00 $4,216.10
34. Reinforced concrete box 10' x 6' $308.95 $344.71 $332.64 $326.60 $4,285.70
35. Reinforced concrete box 10' x 7' $390.36 $354.12 $342.05 $336.01 $4,342.16
36. Reinforced concrete box 10' x 8' $397.93 $361.70 $349.62 $343.57 $4,387.58
37. Reinforced concrete box 10' x 10' $462.39 $424.96 $412.50 $406.26 $4,772.00
38. Reinforced concrete box 11' x 8' $465.27 $427.17 $415.21 $408.69 $4,791.62
39. Reinforced concrete box 12' x 3' $401.00 $364.21 $352.63 $346.31 $4,406.00
40. Reinforced concrete box 12' x 4' $434.73 $398.94 $386.31 $381.05 $4,608.38
41. Reinforced concrete box 12' x 6' $454.73 $418.94 $406.31 $400.00 $4,728.38
42. Reinforced concrete box 12' x 7' $464.21 $428.42 $415.78 $410.58 $4,766.72
43. Reinforced concrete box 12' x 8' $483.15 $446.31 $434.20 $428.42 $4,898.90
44. Reinforced concrete box 12' x 10' $506.31 $470.52 $457.89 $456.84 $5,037.86
45. Reinforced concrete box 14' x 14' $838.04 $801.08 $788.04 $781.52 $7,028.24
46. Reinforced concrete box 14' x 16' $978.26 $941.30 $928.26 $921.73 $7,869.56
47. Reinforced concrete box 16' x 4' $746.73 $709.78 $696.73 $690.21 $6,480.38
48. Reinforced concrete box 16' x 6' $766.31 $728.26 $716.30 $709.79 $6,597.86
49. Reinforced concrete box 16' x 8' $796.74 $759.79 $747.42 $740.23 $6,780.44
50. Reinforced concrete box 16' x 10' $865.24 $828.36 $815.86 $809.56 $7,191.44
51. Ea., Rubber gasket and geotextile fabric $79.04 $79.04 $79.04 $79.04 $79.04
52. Ea., Curb 9" x 9" per foot, cast with unit $302.00 $302.00 $302.00 $302.00 $302.00
53. Ea., Curb 12" x 12" per foot, cast with unit $346.00 $346.00 $346.00 $346.00 $346.00
54. Reinforced concrete box 12' x 5' $444.73 $408.94 $396.31 $391.00 $4,505.00
Acknowledge addendum

No Bid Cretex Concrete Products Midwest, Inc.

Wichita Concrete Pipe Co.

Yes
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