
BID OPENING JUNE 9, 2015

2.  WEED CHEMICALS -- NOXIOUS WEEDS DEPARTMENT
     FUNDING -- NOXIOUS WEEDS DEPARTMENT
     (Request sent to 25 vendors)  

     RFB #15-0063

Unit Price 
per Gallon

Unit Price 
per Specified 

Container

Extended 
Price Unit Price

Unit Price 
per Specified 

Container

Extended 
Price Unit Price

Unit Price 
per Specified 

Container

Extended 
Price Unit Price

Unit Price 
per Specified 

Container

Extended 
Price

1. BASF Plateau 160 $133.441 $133.44 $21,350.40 $104.95 $104.95 $16,792.00 $125.00 $125.00 $20,000.00 $120.00 $120.00 $19,200.00
2. Non-ionic surfactant 360 $8.24 $20.60 $2,966.40 $8.99 $22.475 $3,236.40 $10.002 $25.00 $3,600.00
3. Gordon's Trimec 992 180 $24.95 $24.95 $4,491.00 $26.00 $26.00 $4,680.00

Unit Price
Unit Price 

per Specified 
Container

Extended 
Price Unit Price

Unit Price 
per Specified 

Container

Extended 
Price Unit Price

Unit Price 
per Specified 

Container

Extended 
Price

1. BASF Plateau 160 $101.97 $101.97 $16,315.20 $172.655 $172.65 $27,624.00 $121.85 $121.85 $19,496.00
2. Non-ionic surfactant 360 $8.113 $20.275 $2,919.60 $14.426 $36.05 $5,191.20 $8.028 $20.05 $2,887.20
3. Gordon's Trimec 992 180 $23.894 $23.89 $4,300.20 $29.857 $29.85 $5,373.00 $22.859 $22.85 $4,113.00

1 Alligare Panoramic 2SL
2 CWC Surfactant 90
3 Brewer 90-10
4 Vessel 3-Way Herbicide
5 Nufarm Imazapic 2SL
6 LESCO 90/10 non-ionic surfactant
7 LESCO Three-Way Selective
8 RRSI NIS 
9 Triplet SF

No Bid

CWC Chemical, Inc.Snyder Sales & Services, LLC Berne Devlin dba                                                 
Crop Production Services

Red River Specialties, Inc.
Acknowledge addendum

Sims Fertilizer & Chemical

Quantity Unit of 
Measure

no bid
no bid

Quantity Unit of 
Measure

gallons

Able to supply in specified container sizes Yes

Acknowledge addendum Yes Yes Yes

no bid

Cayman Chemicals

No Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes No

Able to supply in specified container sizes Yes Yes No

John Deere LandscapesVan Diest Supply Co.

gallons


	15-0063

