
BID OPENING MAY 10, 2016

3.  HVAC SUPPLIES -- FACILITIES DEPARTMENT
     FUNDING -- FACILITIES DEPARTMENT
     (Request sent to 45 vendors)  

     RFB #16-0051

Filter Size Price Per Each Brand Quoted Price Per Each Brand Quoted

1.  10x20x1 $2.03 Tri-Dim $2.03
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

2.  10x59x.5 $3.25 Tri-Dim $7.34
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

3.  11x16x1 $2.03 Tri-Dim $2.95
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

4.  11x45.75x1 $6.50 Tri-Dim $7.34
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

5.  12x20x1 $2.03 Tri-Dim $2.08
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

6.  12x24x1 $2.03 Tri-Dim $2.03
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

7.  12x24x2 $2.04 Tri-Dim $2.17
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

8.  14x20x2 $2.13 Tri-Dim $2.64
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

9.  14x24x2 $3.56 Tri-Dim $4.53
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

10.  14x25x1 $2.28 Tri-Dim $2.27
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

11.  14x25x2 $2.37 Tri-Dim $2.55
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

12.  15.75x65.75x1 $8.50 Tri-Dim $9.88
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

13.  15x20x2 $2.13 Tri-Dim $2.31
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

Tri-Dim Filter Corporation Wichita Air Filter Supply
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14.  16x16x2 $2.26 Tri-Dim $2.97
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

15.  16x20x1 $2.08 Tri-Dim $1.82
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

16.  16x20x2 $2.13 Tri-Dim $2.19
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

17.  16x20x4 $3.34 Tri-Dim $3.65
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

18.  16x24x1 $2.22 Tri-Dim $2.85
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

19.  16x24x2 $2.37 Tri-Dim $2.94
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

20.  16x25x1 $2.10 Tri-Dim $2.22
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

21.  16x25x2 $2.37 Tri-Dim $2.50
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

22.  16.25x25x1 $2.22 Tri-Dim $4.60
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

23.  16.875x16.875x1 $3.17 Tri-Dim $3.69
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

24.  17x19x1 $3.62 Tri-Dim $4.15
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

25.  18x18x1 $3.27 Tri-Dim $4.10
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

26.  18x20x2 $2.37 Tri-Dim $2.94
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

27.  18x24x2 $2.47 Tri-Dim $2.85
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

28.  19.5x30.5x2 $2.35 Tri-Dim $5.40
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

29.  20x20x1 $2.22 Tri-Dim $2.23
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply
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30.  20x20x2 $2.37 Tri-Dim $2.53
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

31.  20x21x1 $3.94 Tri-Dim $4.59
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

32.  20x22x1 $2.22 Tri-Dim $4.10
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

33.  20x24x1 $2.25 Tri-Dim $2.60
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

34.  20x24x2 $2.57 Tri-Dim $2.98
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

35.  20x25x1 $2.42 Tri-Dim $2.55
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

36.  20x25x2 $2.62 Tri-Dim $2.89
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

37.  20x20x2 $2.37 Tri-Dim $2.54
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

38.  20x30x1 $3.01 Tri-Dim $3.33
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

39.  20x32x1 $3.15 Tri-Dim $5.33
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

40.  22x30x1 $5.29 Tri-Dim $5.33
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

41.  24x24x1 $2.62 Tri-Dim $2.90
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

42.  24x24x2 $2.85 Tri-Dim $3.25
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

43.  25x25x1 $2.95 Tri-Dim $3.25
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

44.  25x29x4 $10.50 Tri-Dim $6.63
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

45.  33.5x9x1 $5.95 Tri-Dim $4.15
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply
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46.  69.75x10.875x.75 $10.50 Tri-Dim $8.27
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

47.  8.25x43.75x1 $5.78 Tri-Dim $5.93
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

48.  8.5 x 27.5 x .5 $2.50 Tri-Dim $3.33
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

49.  8.875x19.125x1 $2.50 Tri-Dim $2.97
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

50.  8.875x24.125x1 $2.50 Tri-Dim $3.35
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

51.  8.875x33.625x1 $2.85 Tri-Dim $4.15
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

52.  8.875x42.125x1 $2.95 Tri-Dim $5.93
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

53.  8.875x61.125x1 $3.50 Tri-Dim $7.35
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

54.  8x20x1 $3.30 Tri-Dim $2.97
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

55.  8x32x1 $4.00 Tri-Dim $3.69
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

56.  9x24x1 $2.98 Tri-Dim $3.35
Glasfloss ZL Pleat 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

57.  Merv 13 12x24x12 $31.00 Tri-Dim $61.15
Glasfloss Magna 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

58.  Merv 13 24x24x12 $42.00 Tri-Dim $87.50
Glasfloss Magna 
from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

59.  Fiber Filter 
9.75x21x.75x1

$1.50 Tri-Dim $2.29
Glasfloss Fiberglass 

Disposable from 
Wichita Air Filter

60.  Fiber Filter 22x22x.5 
(1/2")

$1.75 Tri-Dim $2.69
Glasfloss Fiberglass 

Disposable from 
Wichita Air Filter

Belt Type Price Per Each Brand Quoted Price Per Each Brand Quoted
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1.  4L240 $2.82 Continental $0.00 No Bid
2.  A41 $4.49 Continental $0.00 No Bid
3.  A42 $4.59 Continental $0.00 No Bid
4.  A46 $4.83 Continental $0.00 No Bid
5.   A51 $5.08 Continental $0.00 No Bid
6.  1- B46 $6.97 Continental $0.00 No Bid
7.  1-5vx530 $16.47 Continental $0.00 No Bid
8.  2-5vx500 $15.81 Continental $0.00 No Bid
9.  2-5vx530 $16.47 Continental $0.00 No Bid
10.  2-5vx590 $18.15 Continental $0.00 No Bid
11.  2-5vx630 $20.88 Continental $0.00 No Bid
12.  2-5vx710 $22.12 Continental $0.00 No Bid
13.  2-B60 $7.53 Continental $0.00 No Bid
14.  2-B62 $7.73 Continental $0.00 No Bid
15.  2-B72 $8.70 Continental $0.00 No Bid
16.  2-B78 $9.41 Continental $0.00 No Bid
17.  2-B82 $10.04 Continental $0.00 No Bid
18.  2-B87 $10.50 Continental $0.00 No Bid
19.  2-B88 $10.58 Continental $0.00 No Bid
20.  2-BX40 $7.43 Continental $0.00 No Bid
21.  2-BX60 $9.72 Continental $0.00 No Bid
22.  2-BX62 $9.95 Continental $0.00 No Bid
23.  2-BX70 $10.97 Continental $0.00 No Bid
24.  2-BX93 $14.56 Continental $0.00 No Bid
25.  2-CX60 $17.49 Continental $0.00 No Bid
26.  3-5vx1120 $35.51 Continental $0.00 No Bid
27.  3-5vx530 $16.47 Continental $0.00 No Bid
28.  3-B73 $8.80 Continental $0.00 No Bid
29.  3-B88 $10.58 Continental $0.00 No Bid
30.  3-B89 $10.70 Continental $0.00 No Bid
31.  3-BX103 $15.88 Continental $0.00 No Bid
32.  3-BX85 $13.28 Continental $0.00 No Bid
33.  3-BX88 $13.67 Continental $0.00 No Bid
34.  3L-210 $2.67 Continental $0.00 No Bid
35.  3L250 $2.67 Continental $0.00 No Bid
36.  4-5vx1180 $37.44 Continental $0.00 No Bid
37.  4L160 $2.82 Continental $0.00 No Bid
38.  4L170 $2.82 Continental $0.00 No Bid
39.  4L180 $2.82 Continental $0.00 No Bid
40.  4L190 $2.82 Continental $0.00 No Bid
41.  4L200 $2.82 Continental $0.00 No Bid
42.  4L210 $2.82 Continental $0.00 No Bid
43.  4l220 $2.82 Continental $0.00 No Bid
44.  4L-230 $2.82 Continental $0.00 No Bid
45.  4L-300 $3.04 Continental $0.00 No Bid
46.  4L440 `3.92 Continental $0.00 No Bid
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47.  4L450 $3.97 Continental $0.00 No Bid
48.  4L530 $4.31 Continental $0.00 No Bid
49.  4L550 $4.41 Continental $0.00 No Bid
50.  5VX450 $14.22 Continental $0.00 No Bid
51.  5VX690 $21.47 Continental $0.00 No Bid
52.  A20 $3.30 Continental $0.00 No Bid
53.  A21 $3.30 Continental $0.00 No Bid
54.  A24 $3.33 Continental $0.00 No Bid
55.  A26 $3.36 Continental $0.00 No Bid
56.  A28 $3.58 Continental $0.00 No Bid
57.  A36 $4.10 Continental $0.00 No Bid
58.  A37 $4.20 Continental $0.00 No Bid
59.  A39 $4.35 Continental $0.00 No Bid
60.  A40 $4.42 Continental $0.00 No Bid
61.  A42 $4.59 Continental $0.00 No Bid
62.  A43 $4.67 Continental $0.00 No Bid
63.  A45 $4.79 Continental $0.00 No Bid
64.  A46 $4.83 Continental $0.00 No Bid
65.  A46 (4L480) $4.35 Continental $0.00 No Bid
66.  A50 $5.00 Continental $0.00 No Bid
67.  A56 $5.38 Continental $0.00 No Bid
68.  A63 $5.83 Continental $0.00 No Bid
69.  AX36 $5.27 Continental $0.00 No Bid
70.  AX38 $5.52 Continental $0.00 No Bid
71.  AX39 $5.62 Continental $0.00 No Bid
72.  AX40 $5.69 Continental $0.00 No Bid
73.  AX42 $5.93 Continental $0.00 No Bid
74.  AX44 $6.11 Continental $0.00 No Bid
75.  AX48 $6.35 Continental $0.00 No Bid
76.  AX49 $6.41 Continental $0.00 No Bid
77.  AX50 $6.50 Continental $0.00 No Bid
78.  B57 $7.87 Continental $0.00 No Bid
79.  B60 $8.04 Continental $0.00 No Bid
80.  B66 $8.66 Continental $0.00 No Bid
81.  B68 $8.83 Continental $0.00 No Bid
82.  BX38 $7.58 Continental $0.00 No Bid
83.  BX41 $8.11 Continental $0.00 No Bid
84.  BX42 $8.26 Continental $0.00 No Bid
85.  BX44 $8.64 Continental $0.00 No Bid
86.  BX47 $9.12 Continental $0.00 No Bid
87.  BX48 $9.24 Continental $0.00 No Bid
88.  BX49 $9.39 Continental $0.00 No Bid
89.  BX52 $9.78 Continental $0.00 No Bid
90.  BX62 $10.62 Continental $0.00 No Bid
91.  BX63 $10.75 Continental $0.00 No Bid
92.  M401182 (A65) $5.93 Continental $0.00 No Bid
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Filter Size Price Per Each Brand Quoted Price Per Each Brand Quoted

1.  10x20x1 2.75 AIR HANDLER
2.  10x59x.5
3.  11x16x1
4.  11x45.75x1
5.  12x20x1 2.89 AIR HANDLER
6.  12x24x1 2.46 AIR HANDLER
7.  12x24x2 2.41 AIR HANDLER
8.  14x20x2 3.11 AIR HANDLER
9.  14x24x2
10. 14x25x1 2.69 AIR HANDLER
11. 14x25x2 3.54 AIR HANDLER
12. 15.75x65.75x1
13. 15x20x2 4.05 AIR HANDLER
14. 16x16x2 4.20 AIR HANDLER
15. 16x20x1 2.29 AIR HANDLER
16. 16x20x2 2.28 AIR HANDLER
17. 16x20x4 5.07 AIR HANDLER
18. 16x24x1 2.95 AIR HANDLER
19. 16x24x2 3.28 AIR HANDLER
20. 16x25x1 2.48 AIR HANDLER
21. 16x25x2 2.56 AIR HANDLER
22. 16.25x25x1
23. 16.875x16.875x1
17x19x1 3.48 AIR HANDLER
18x18x1 3.25 AIR HANDLER
18x20x2 3.49 AIR HANDLER
18x24x2 4.36 AIR HANDLER
19.5x30.5x2
20x20x1 2.48 AIR HANDLER
20x20x2 2.59 AIR HANDLER
20x21x1 3.84 AIR HANDLER
20x22x1 3.94 AIR HANDLER
20x24x1 3.46 AIR HANDLER
20x24x2 2.96 AIR HANDLER
20x25x1 2.76 AIR HANDLER
20x25x2 3.00 AIR HANDLER
20x20x2 2.59 AIR HANDLER
20x30x1 4.38 AIR HANDLER
20x32x1
22x30x1
24x24x1 3.53 AIR HANDLER
24x24x2 3.09 AIR HANDLER
25x25x1 4.35 AIR HANDLER
25x29x4 10.12 AIR HANDLER
33.5x9x1
69.75x10.875x.75

Grainger
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8.25x43.75x1
8.5 x 27.5 x .5
8.875x19.125x1
8.875x24.125x1
8.875x33.625x1
8.875x42.125x1
8.875x61.125x1
8x20x1 3.15 AIR HANDLER
8x32x1
9x24x1 3.64 AIR HANDLER
13 12x24x12 12.54 AIR HANDLER
A3 24x24x12 16.37 AIR HANDLER
Air Filter Size  Fiber Filter
 9.75x21x.75x1
22x22x.5 0.88 AIR HANDLER
Belts 1.49 DAYTON
A42 3.58 DAYTON
A46 3.78 DAYTON
A51 3.87 DAYTON
1- B46 5.05 DAYTON
1-5vx530 18.08 DAYTON
2-5vx500
2-5vx530
2-5vx590
2-5vx630
2-5vx710
2-B60 25.01 DAYTON
2-B62 29.27 DAYTON
2-B72 34.01 DAYTON
2-B78 32.53 DAYTON
2-B82 34.19 DAYTON
2-B87 36.29 DAYTON
2-B88
2-BX40
2-BX60
2-BX62
2-BX70
2-BX93
2-CX60
3-5vx1120
3-5vx530
3-B73 45.66 DAYTON
3-B88
3-B89
3-BX103
3-BX85
3-BX88
3L-210 1.76 DAYTON
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3L250 1.76 DAYTON
4-5vx1180
4L160 1.44 DAYTON
4L170 1.78 DAYTON
4L180 1.7 DAYTON
4L190 1.76 DAYTON
4L200 1.4 DAYTON
4L210 1.49 DAYTON
4l220 4.34 DAYTON
4L-230 1.49 DAYTON
4L-300 2 DAYTON
4L440 3.02 DAYTON
4L450 2.8 DAYTON
4l530 3.44 DAYTON
4L550 3.22 DAYTON
5VX450 14.18 DAYTON
5VX690 16.83 DAYTON
A20 1.84 DAYTON
A21 2.08 DAYTON
A24 3.76 DAYTON
A26 2.07 DAYTON
A28 2.46 DAYTON
A36 2.14 DAYTON
A37 2.8 DAYTON
A39 3.24 DAYTON
A40 2.39 DAYTON
A42 2.39 DAYTON
A43 3.31 DAYTON
A45 3.66 DAYTON
A46 DAYTON
A46 3.22 DAYTON
A50 3.78 DAYTON
A56 4.46 DAYTON
A63 5 DAYTON
AX36 4.98 DAYTON
AX38 5.16 DAYTON
AX39 5.8 DAYTON
AX40 5.42 DAYTON
AX42 5.58 DAYTON
AX44 6.88 DAYTON
AX48 5.98 DAYTON
AX49 6 DAYTON
AX50 8.1 DAYTON
B57 6.15 DAYTON
B60 6.45 DAYTON
B66 6.86 DAYTON
B68 7.27 DAYTON
BX38 7.88 DAYTON
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BX41 8.62 DAYTON
BX42 8.58 DAYTON
BX44 8.75 DAYTON
BX47 9.74 DAYTON
BX48 9.56 DAYTON
BX49 10.17 DAYTON
BX52 10.16 DAYTON
BX62 11.04 DAYTON
BX63 10.2 DAYTON
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