
BID OPENING JULY 26, 2016

     RFB #16-0073

Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
1. 2.5 Gallon Containers, Monsanto Round-Up, or 
comparable product 432 $22.45 $9,698.40 $9.55* per 

gallon $10,314.00

$44.87          
Prosecutor Pro 

069289
$19,383.84

2. 2.5 Gallon Containers Generic 2, 4D with 4# Al 
Dimethylamine salt of 2, 4- Dichlorophenoxyacetic 
acid per gallon

216 $24.35 $5,259.60 NO BID NO BID $9.70* per 
gallon $5,238.00

3. 1 Gallon Containers, Remedy Ultra (60.45% 
Triclopyr), or comparable product 64 $46.97 $3,006.08 $45.00 $2,880.00

$63.66          
Lesco 

Triclopyr 4 
Ester

$4,074.24

4. 1 Quart Containers Esplanade 200 SC (concentrate) 
(1.67 Lbs/Gal./Indaziflam) 4 $295.36 $1,181.44 NO BID NO BID $295.66 $1,182.64

3A.  Alternate Product:

Qty Van Diest Supply Company SiteOne Landscape Supply Sims Fertilizer & Chemical 

1A.  Alternate Product

3. WEED CHEMICALS -- NOXIOUS WEED DEPARTMENT 
     FUNDING -- NOXIOUS WEED DEPARTMENT 
     (Request sent to 29 vendors) 
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