
BID OPENING AUGUST 16, 2016

     RFB #16-0072

Line Item Description Estimated Quantity 
(annual) City Print, Inc. Quik Print Valley Offset 

Printing, Inc. Envision Print

1

Four (4) color logo letterhead, shell 
onlyPaper-8 ½ X 11, white, 24#, 25% 
cotton, laser imaging Logo: Four (4) color 
process-cyan, magenta, yellow, black.

100,000

64.50$                 64.25$                 48.66$                 No bid
Text ink:
Black 21,500 38.00$                 40.00$                 24.50$                 No bid
1-color 27,700 42.00$                 55.00$                 25.20$                 No bid
2-color 1,500 57.00$                 70.00$                 97.00$                 No bid
Text ink:
Black 10,000 52.00$                 90.00$                 56.00$                 No bid
2-color 5,000 68.00$                 120.00$               75.00$                 No bid
Text ink: 
Black 10,000 17.50$                 50.00$                 28.90$                 No bid
1-color 25,000 19.00$                 65.00$                 31.50$                 No bid
2-color 10,000 25.00$                 80.00$                 33.90$                 No bid

5 Logo Only Size/Paper-#10, 24#, white, 
25% cotton logo

Text ink: Four (4) 
color process- cyan, 
magenta, yellow, 
black 30,000 149.85$               149.50$               100.00$               No bid
Text ink: 
1-color 10,000 30.00$                 55.00$                 25.10$                 No bid

6 Letterhead envelopes using printed shells 
(as specified in item 5).

Letterhead stationary using printed 
shells(Specifications as item 1).

Letterhead stationary no shells Paper-8 ½ 
x 11, white, 20#, 25% cotton laser 
imaging.

2

3

Letterhead stationary no shells Paper- 8 ½ 
x 11, white, 20#.4

ENVELOPES

Unit Price (per 1,000) Virgin Stock

1. ON-CALL PRESS PRINTING SERVICES -- DIVISION OF INFORMATION & OPERATIONS 
     FUNDING -- VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS 
     (Request sent to 48 vendors) 
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Text ink:    
Black 100,000 .
1 side 36.20$                 54.00$                 31.28$                 96.00$                 
2 sides 40.70$                 78.00$                 34.88$                 138.00$               
1 color 100,000
1 side 36.20$                 63.00$                 32.94$                 102.00$               
2 sides 40.70$                 87.00$                 35.84$                 145.00$               
2 color 5,000 .
1 side 50.00$                 72.00$                 56.00$                 116.00$               
2 sides 57.00$                 108.00$               79.00$                 165.00$               
Text ink:
Black 250,000 .
1 side 38.50$                 57.00$                 29.52$                 96.00$                 
2 sides 43.20$                 81.00$                 31.52$                 138.00$               
1 color 125,000 .
1 side 38.50$                 66.00$                 29.86$                 102.00$               
2 sides 43.20$                 90.00$                 31.86$                 145.00$               
2 color 5,000 .
1 side 53.00$                 75.00$                 58.40$                 116.00$               
2 sides 60.00$                 111.00$               81.00$                 165.00$               
Text ink:
Black
one side 10,000 66.82$                 115.00$               65.90$                 96.00$                 
Text ink:
1 color
one side 5,000 66.82$                 130.00$               79.40$                 102.00$               
Text ink:
1 color
one side 5,000 86.82$                 123.00$               80.80$                 96.00$                 
Text ink:
1-color, one side 86.82$                 138.00$               85.40$                 102.00$               
1-color, two sides 92.82$                 178.00$               102.80$               138.00$               
Text ink:
Black
1-side 5,000 84.80$                 123.00$               79.00$                 96.00$                 

7 Size/paper: #10, 24#, white, regular

Size/paper: #10, 24#, white, window8

9 Size/paper: #10, 24#, white, regular, 
simple seal

Size/paper: #10, 24#, white, regular, 
simple seal10

Size/Paper: #10, 24#, white, window, 
simple seal11

Size/Paper: #10, 24#, white, window, 
simple seal12

Size/Paper: #10, 24#, White, Regular, 
Simple Seal, Security13
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Text ink:
1-color,1-side
5,000 84.80$                 138.00$               83.00$                 106.00$               
Text ink:
Black
one side 5,000 91.80$                 128.00$               84.80$                 98.00$                 
Text ink:
1-color,1-side
5,000 91.80$                 143.00$               89.40$                 106.00$               
Text ink:
Black 10,000
1 side 158.00$               172.00$               67.80$                 No bid
2 sides 163.00$               212.00$               85.40$                 No bid
Text ink:
Black 45,000 .
1 side 38.50$                 53.00$                 31.28$                 No bid
2 sides 43.20$                 77.00$                 33.28$                 No bid
1 color 30,000 .
1 side 38.50$                 62.00$                 32.00$                 No bid
2 sides 43.20$                 86.00$                 34.00$                 No bid
2 color 10,000
1 side 53.00$                 71.00$                 43.70$                 No bid
2 sides 60.00$                 107.00$               61.70$                 No bid
Text ink:
1 color, 1 side 85.00$                 143.00$               No bid No bid
1 color, 2 sides 89.00$                 183.00$               No bid No bid
Text ink:
1 color 30,000 97.00$                 148.00$               69.40$                 No bid
2 color 5,000 123.00$               178.00$               85.40$                 No bid
Text ink:
Black 7,500
1 side 54.60$                 156.00$               59.73$                 No bid
2 sides 60.00$                 196.00$               76.80$                 No bid
Text ink:
Black 5,000 61.60$                 158.00$               84.40$                 No bid

Size/Paper: #10, 24#, White, Regular, 
Simple Seal, Security14

Size/Paper: #10, 24# White, Window, 
Simple Seal, Security15

Size/Paper: #10, 24# White, Window, 
Simple Seal, Security16

Size/Paper: #9, Policy Brownkraft17

Size/Paper: #9, 24#, White, Regular18

Size/Paper: #11, 24#, White, Regular19

Size/Paper: #11, 24#, White Window20

Size/Paper: 6 x 9 Booklet21

Size/Paper: 6 X 9 Window Booklet22
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Text ink:
Black, 1 side,
10,000 30.00$                 40.00$                 50.00$                 No bid
Text ink:
Four (4) color logo
process, 1 side,

10,000

 $2,246.00 (5,000)     
$2,710.00 
(10,000)               

2 week lead 
outsourced 155.00$               130.00$               No bid

Text ink:
1 color 1,000 152.00$               188.00$               154.00$               No bid
Text ink:
1 color 5,000 40.40$                 113.00$               52.80$                 No bid

Test ink:
Black, 1 side, 1,000 115.00$               331.00$               378.00$               No bid
Text ink:
Three (3) color job,
black, red and gold,
1 side, 1,000 297.00$               230.00$               245.00$               No bid
Text ink:
Border copper 1,000 82.00$                 106.00$               154.00$               No bid
PMS 873 gold 1,000 82.00$                 106.00$               154.00$               No bid
Text ink:
Border copper 1,000 102.00$               110.00$               156.00$               No bid
PMS 873 gold 1,000 102.00$               110.00$               156.00$               No bid

Standard 3 part
1,000 sheets 32.63$                 220.00$               50.00$                 111.98$               
Standard 4 part
1,500 sheets 43.50$                 290.00$               68.00$                 115.00$               

27

Size/Paper: 9 x 11, Tyvek-imprinted only, 
stock provided23

Size/Paper: A-2 Invitation Envelope 
White Linen24

Certificates

26

Paper: 8 ½ X 11, #34625 Goes Border

Paper: 8 ½ x 11 70# White Offset28

Paper: 8 ½ x 11 24# White or 70# White 
Offset29

Paper: 8 ½ x 11 80# White Offset30

Size/Paper: 6.5 x 9.5 Booklet25

Size Paper: 6 3/4

Paper: 8 ½ x 11 20# coated front and back31

Carbonless pre-collated black transfer image
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Coated:
Front 65.50$                 70.00$                 29.00$                 100.00$               
Back 65.50$                 70.00$                 36.00$                 100.00$               
Front & Back 79.00$                 90.00$                 47.70$                 125.00$               
15,000 sheets .

Text ink:
Black 1,500 sheets 292.00$               290.00$               380.00$               96.00$                 

Text ink:
Black
1 side 476.00$               625.00$               No bid No bid
2 sides 548.00$               875.00$               No bid No bid

35 Typesetting $35/hr $60/hr $60/hr $50/hr

36 Set-up  1 color $35, 
progressive $150 no charge no charge 25.00$                 

37 Color wash (other than black) $18.00 $15.00 $15.00   $30.00 per color 

Coast to Coast 
Computer 

Products, Inc.
DOCS Wichita KK Office 

Solutions
Lee Printed 

Products

Rand Graphics, 
Inc. Snappy Print Southwest Paper 

Company, Inc.
The Envelope 

Guys, LLC
The Master's 
Touch, LLC

Veritiv 
Corporation

Paper: 8 ½ x 11, 20# Color Sequence: 
White; Canary; Pink; Gold; manila tag34

Miscellaneous

No Bids

Paper: 8 ½ x 11 20# color sequence: any32

Carbonless non pre-collated

Carbonless four-part straight

Carbonless five-part reverse

Paper: 8 ½ x 11 20#33
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