
BID OPENING APRIL 11, 2017

VARIOUS PAPER STOCK -- VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS

FUNDING -- VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS

(Request sent to 20 vendors)

RFB #17-0023 Contract

Description Weight

Pricing/case 

8.5x11 Pricing/case 11x17

Other Size (list if 

not specified)

Pricing/case 

8.5x11 Pricing/case 11x17

Other Size (list if 

not specified)

White 20 LB

$26.50 (option 1)                                    

$24.83 (option 2) $30.83 $24.83 $28.26

8.5 x 14 White 20 LB $39.22 $38.32

White 3 Hole 20 LB $30.83 $28.95

Blue 20 LB $42.69 $43.61 $39.47 $61.90

Canary 20 LB $42.69 $43.61 $39.47 $61.90

Ivory 20 LB $42.69 $43.61 $39.47 $61.90

Green 20 LB $42.69 $43.61 $39.47 $61.90

Pink 20 LB $42.69 $43.61 $39.47 $61.90

Goldenrod 20 LB $42.69 $43.61 $39.47 $72.32

Tan 20 LB $42.69 $43.61 $39.47 $72.32

Orchid 20 LB $42.69 $43.61 $39.47 No Bid

Salmon 20 LB $42.69 $43.61 $39.47 No Bid

Bright White Cover 100 LB $59.13 $57.83 No Bid No Bid

Index White 110 LB $43.20 $45.56 $83.05 $83.21

Index Blue 110 LB $45.56 No Bid $104.52 No Bid

Index Canary 110 LB $45.56 No Bid $104.52 No Bid

Index Cherry 110 LB $45.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Index Green 110 LB $45.56 No Bid $110.63 No Bid

Index Ivory 110 LB $45.56 No Bid $104.52 No Bid

Index Salmon 110 LB $45.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid

12 x 18 Bright White Laser 28/70 LB $35.21 No Bid

White Offset 70 LB $40.47 $40.72 No Bid No Bid

8.5 x 11 Kant Kopy K2 Carbonless 20 LB $135.83 No Bid

CFB Canary 20 LB $188.03 No Bid $186.03 No Bid

CFB Pink 20 LB $188.03 No Bid No Bid No Bid

CFB White 20 LB $186.04 No Bid $122.52 No Bid

CFB Blue 20 LB $188.03 No Bid No Bid No Bid

CB blue 20 LB $155.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid

SW Plus

Office Plus of Kansas, DBA Daniksco Business Solutions 

LLC
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CB white 20 LB $153.11 No Bid No Bid No Bid

CB pink 20 LB $155.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid

CB canary 20 LB $155.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid

CF canary 20 LB $111.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid

CF pink 20 LB $111.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid

CF blue 20 LB $111.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid

CF Manilla Tag 80 LB $157.72 No Bid No Bid No Bid

1 ream letter stationery boxes

$37.00 No Bid

2 ream letter stationery boxes

$75.00 No Bid

Business card box 6 1/2 x 3 5/8 

x 2 1/6 $118.00 No Bid

business card box 3 5/8 x 3 5/8 

x 2 1/6 $110.00 No Bid

8.5 x 11 2part Digital/Printer 

Pre-collated Reverse 

Carbonless

20 LB

$136.99 No Bid

8.5 x 11 4part Digital/Printer 

Pre-collated Reverse 

Carbonless

20 LB

$164.70 No Bid

8.5 x 11 5part Digital/Printer 

Pre-collated Reverse 

Carbonless

20 LB

$169.34 No Bid

8.5 x 11 3part Digital/Printer 

Pre-collated Reverse 

Carbonless

20 LB

$154.43 No Bid

8.5 x 14 3part Digital/Printer 

Pre-collated Reverse 

Carbonless

20 LB

$196.20 No Bid

Chipboard $44.37 (810 bdl) $63.84 (360 bld) No Bid No Bid

8.5 x 14 Chipboard $63.84 (540 bdl) No Bid

A2 White Linen Envelopes $44.80 No Bid

Fan Apart Adhesive Quart $32.03 $807.24

Veritiv Operating Company (Option 2)Veritiv Operating Company (Option 1)
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Description Weight

Pricing/case 

8.5x11 Pricing/case 11x17

Other Size (list if 

not specified)

Pricing/case 

8.5x11 Pricing/case 11x17

Other Size (list if 

not specified)

White 20 LB $26.05 $29.65 $30.35 $33.28

8.5 x 14 White 20 LB $37.75 $42.30

White 3 Hole 20 LB $29.95 $33.30

Blue 20 LB $43.45 $45.85 $45.00 $47.63

Canary 20 LB $43.45 $45.85 $45.00 $47.63

Ivory 20 LB $43.45 $45.85 $45.00 $47.63

Green 20 LB $43.45 $45.85 $45.00 $47.63

Pink 20 LB $41.50 $41.60 $45.00 $47.63

Goldenrod 20 LB $41.50 $41.60 $45.00 No Bid

Tan 20 LB $43.45 $45.85 $45.00 No Bid

Orchid 20 LB $41.50 $41.60 $45.00 No Bid

Salmon 20 LB $43.45 $41.60 $45.00 No Bid

Bright White Cover 100 LB $48.95 $64.60 No Bid No Bid

Index White 110 LB $44.20 $46.75 $38.60 $41.10

Index Blue 110 LB $44.65 $47.10 $42.06 $42.00

Index Canary 110 LB $44.65 $47.10 $42.06 $42.00

Index Cherry 110 LB $46.75 $49.25 $42.06 No Bid

Index Green 110 LB $44.65 $47.10 $42.06 $42.00

Index Ivory 110 LB $44.65 $47.10 $42.06 $42.00

Index Salmon 110 LB $46.75 $49.25 $42.06 No Bid

12 x 18 Bright White Laser 28/70 LB $52.50 $49.20

White Offset 70 LB $37.15 $43.25 $41.00 $43.30

8.5 x 11 Kant Kopy K2 Carbonless 20 LB $129.45 $168.00

CFB Canary 20 LB $163.75 $163.75 $91.25 No Bid

CFB Pink 20 LB $163.75 $163.75 $91.25 No Bid

CFB White 20 LB $162.15 $162.10 $91.25 No Bid

CFB Blue 20 LB $163.75 No Bid $91.25 No Bid

CB blue 20 LB $135.45 No Bid $75.30 No Bid

CB white 20 LB $133.90 $133.55 $75.30 No Bid

CB pink 20 LB $135.45 No Bid $75.30 No Bid

CB canary 20 LB $135.45 No Bid $75.30 No Bid

CF canary 20 LB $98.00 $65.45 $54.50 No Bid

CF pink 20 LB $98.00 $65.45 $54.50 No Bid

CF blue 20 LB $98.00 No Bid $54.50 No Bid

CF Manilla Tag 80 LB $173.20 No Bid $104.70 No Bid
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1 ream letter stationery boxes

$60.60 No Bid

2 ream letter stationery boxes

$69.45 No Bid

Business card box 6 1/2 x 3 5/8 

x 2 1/6 $75.00 No Bid

business card box 3 5/8 x 3 5/8 

x 2 1/6 $75.00 No Bid

8.5 x 11 2part Digital/Printer 

Pre-collated Reverse 

Carbonless

20 LB

$118.85 $66.30

8.5 x 11 4part Digital/Printer 

Pre-collated Reverse 

Carbonless

20 LB

$143.40 $79.90

8.5 x 11 5part Digital/Printer 

Pre-collated Reverse 

Carbonless

20 LB

$147.25 $82.10

8.5 x 11 3part Digital/Printer 

Pre-collated Reverse 

Carbonless

20 LB

$134.15 $74.90

8.5 x 14 3part Digital/Printer 

Pre-collated Reverse 

Carbonless

20 LB

No Bid $95.19

Chipboard $27.25 $27.75 No Bid No Bid

8.5 x 14 Chipboard $29.75 No Bid

A2 White Linen Envelopes $79.85 No Bid

Fan Apart Adhesive Quart $13.40 $37.90

Description Weight

White 20 LB

8.5 x 14 White 20 LB

White 3 Hole 20 LB

Blue 20 LB

Canary 20 LB

Ivory 20 LB

Green 20 LB

$40.90

Timbercreek Paper, Inc.

Pricing/case 8.5x11

$24.44

$26.66

$40.90

$40.90

$40.90

$40.90

$40.90

Pricing/case 11x17 Other Size (list if not specified)

$26.66

$40.90

$40.90

$32.00



BID OPENING APRIL 11, 2017

Pink 20 LB

Goldenrod 20 LB

Tan 20 LB

Orchid 20 LB

Salmon 20 LB

Bright White Cover 100 LB

Index White 110 LB

Index Blue 110 LB

Index Canary 110 LB

Index Cherry 110 LB

Index Green 110 LB

Index Ivory 110 LB

Index Salmon 110 LB

12 x 18 Bright White Laser 28/70 LB

White Offset 70 LB

8.5 x 11 Kant Kopy K2 Carbonless 20 LB

CFB Canary 20 LB

CFB Pink 20 LB

CFB White 20 LB

CFB Blue 20 LB

CB blue 20 LB

CB white 20 LB

CB pink 20 LB

CB canary 20 LB

CF canary 20 LB

CF pink 20 LB

CF blue 20 LB

CF Manilla Tag 80 LB

1 ream letter stationery boxes

2 ream letter stationery boxes

Business card box 6 1/2 x 3 5/8 

x 2 1/6

business card box 3 5/8 x 3 5/8 

x 2 1/6

$40.90

$40.90

$40.90

$40.90

$40.90

$56.40

$44.18

$46.59

$46.59

$46.59

$46.59

$46.59

$46.59

$39.18

$83.98

$83.98

$172.12

$130.35

$130.35

$130.35

$130.35

$107.44

$123.44

$107.44

$107.44

$107.44

$83.98

$40.90

$40.90

$40.90

$40.90

$40.90

$59.65

$46.60

$51.40

$51.40

$51.40

$51.40

$107.44

$107.44

No Bid

$51.40

$51.40

$41.64

$130.35

$107.44

$83.98

$83.98

$83.98

No Bid

No Bid

$130.35

No Bid

$27.84

$30.00

$42.15

$58.88

$55.30
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8.5 x 11 2part Digital/Printer 

Pre-collated Reverse 

Carbonless

20 LB

8.5 x 11 4part Digital/Printer 

Pre-collated Reverse 

Carbonless

20 LB

8.5 x 11 5part Digital/Printer 

Pre-collated Reverse 

Carbonless

20 LB

8.5 x 11 3part Digital/Printer 

Pre-collated Reverse 

Carbonless

20 LB

8.5 x 14 3part Digital/Printer 

Pre-collated Reverse 

Carbonless

20 LB

Chipboard

8.5 x 14 Chipboard

A2 White Linen Envelopes

Fan Apart Adhesive Quart

No Bids

$26.00

$95.05

$114.41

$118.41

$107.05

$136.24

$26.00

$26.00

$76.86

$22.37

Quill

Central Poly Co

Staples

KK Office Solutions


