BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS MAY 15, 2014

6. EMERGENCY VEHICLE PARTS -- FLEET MANAGEMENT
FUNDING -- NEW VEHICLE SETUP
(Request sent to 31 vendors)
RFB #14-0051 Contract

Part 911 Custom, LLC Ka-Comm., Inc. American I?mergency
Vehicles
1. Light bar: Code 3 #2747ACC No Bid $1,650.00 $3,045.25
2. Light bar Code 3 #2752ACC No Bid $1,775.00 $3,228.88
3. Deck lights: Code 3 #LX2FR/B No Bid $299.00 $332.42
4. Push bumper lights: Code 3 #TRX6RB No Bid $67.50 $76.44
5. LED light bracket: Code 3 #X3TLBKT No Bid $5.00 $5.53
6. LED button lights: Code 3 #HB6PAK-R No Bid $59.00 $65.88
7. LED button lights: Code 3 #HB6PAK-B No Bid $59.00 $65.88
8. Fog lamp: Code 3 #36PARCR No Bid $99.00 $107.23
9. Fog lamp: Code 3 #36PARCB No Bid $99.00 $107.23
10. Fog lamp bracket: Code 3 #DGCHR11FOGBKT No Bid $45.00 $12.33
11. Fog lamp bracket: Code 3 #FOGBKT-TH10 No Bid $35.00 $35.95
12. Siren: Code 3 #Z3 No Bid $665.82 $805.00
13. Speaker: Code 3 #C3100U No Bid $153.40 $173.86
14. Console with 2.0114 faceplate: D&R # No Bid $219.00 $222.95
15. Arm rest: D&R #901-0072A No Bid $80.00 $86.45
16. Cup holder: D&R #CA-0107LS No Bid $20.00 $27.30
17. Console with 2.0114 faceplate: D&R # No Bid $219.00 $250.25
18. Arm rest: D&R #SRC18SA-Tahoe No Bid $79.00 $64.61
19. Computer mounts: D&R #LT7600 No Bid $179.00 $182.52
20. Cage - (1/2 cage): Patriot #475-0184 No Bid $1,095.00 $2,205.38
21. Gun mount: Patriot # 475-0370 No Bid $225.00 $329.92
22. Rumbler - 3: Rumbler #3 No Bid $446.00 $609.55
23. Rumbler bracket: Rumbler #RB-CRG11 No Bid $28.00 $71.55
24. Laptop tray: D&R #907-0129B No Bid $99.00 $125.45
25. 29" floor plate: D&R #FLMNT-29 No Bid $52.00 $58.25
26. Leg kit: D&R #LGSUBO06 No Bid $55.00 $62.55
27. Push bumper: Go-Rhino #3160B No Bid $338.00 $366.80
28. Rear drawer: Adamson #OR36-010 $1,300.00 No Bid $878.60
29. Cage - full: Patriot #475-0865 $553.30* $570.00 $2,559.51
30. Rear barrier (recessed): Patriot #475-0863 $189.30* $354.00 $1,595.65
31. Window bar: DeeZee #LEO555 No Bid $172.00 $195.55
32. Rumbler bracket: Rumbler #RB-TAH08 No Bid $28.00 $74.25
33. Gun mount: Patriot #475-0051 No Bid $239.20 $364.16
34. Supervisor front W/S bar: Code 3 #SV888-1W No Bid $445.00 $582.40
35. Ticket book holder: D&R #CA-0104S No Bid $32.50 $37.44
Acknowledge Addenda No Yes Yes
. Adamson Industries Front Range Fire
No Bid Hitech EVS Corp Appara?tus
Carson Manufacturing Company, Inc.

On the recommendation of Joe Thomas, on behalf of Fleet Management, Tim Kaufman moved to accept the overall low bid
from Ka-Comm., Inc. and establish contract pricing for two (2) years with three (3) additional one -year options to renew.

Linda Kizzire seconded the motion. The motion passed unanimously.

These items are installed in Sheriff, Fire, and Public Works' vehicles. Sedgwick County spent approximately $46,000.00 on

emergency vehicle parts in 2013.

*Does not meet specifications.




