
BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS DECEMBER 11, 2014

1.  FUEL -- FLEET DEPARTMENT
     FUNDING -- FLEET DEPARTMENT
     (Request sent to 12 vendors) 

     RFB #14-0104  Contract

Mark-up Freight Surcharge Total Fees Mark-up Freight Surcharge Total Fees

1. Treated 87 octane E10 
unleaded gasoline $0.0890 $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0890 $0.0500 $0.1800 $0.0000 $0.2300

2. Diesel fuel #1 $0.0940 $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0940 no bid no bid no bid no bid
3. Diesel fuel #2 $0.0940 $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0940 $0.0500 $0.1800 $0.0000 $0.2300
4. Diesel fuel #1 dyed $0.0940 $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0940 no bid no bid no bid no bid
5. Diesel fuel #2 dyed $0.0940 $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0940 $0.0500 $0.1800 $0.0000 $0.2300

6. Treated 87 octane E10 
unleaded gasoline $0.0490 $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0490 $0.0114 $0.0239 $0.0000 $0.0353

7. Diesel fuel #1 $0.0540 $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0540 no bid no bid no bid no bid
8. Diesel fuel #2 $0.0540 $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0540 $0.0064 $0.0283 $0.0000 $0.0347
9. Diesel fuel #1 dyed $0.0540 $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0540 no bid no bid no bid no bid
10. Diesel fuel #2 dyed $0.0540 $0.0000 $0.0000 $0.0540 $0.0084 $0.0298 $0.0000 $0.0382

No Bid

Tank Truck- 5,000 gallons or more

Hampel Oil Distributors, Inc. Boone Opportunities

Tank Wagon - 5,000 gallons or lessTank Wagon - 5,000 gallons or less

ITEMS REQUIRING BOCC APPROVAL
2 ITEMS

MJ Murphy, LLC Petroleum Traders Corporation

Tank Truck- 5,000 gallons or more

On the recommendation of Gunda Angelica, on behalf of Fleet Management, Jennifer Dombaugh moved to accept the 
overall low bid from MJ Murphy, LLC at the prices listed above and establish contract pricing for one (1) year with 
two (2) one (1) year options to renew.  Linda Kizzire seconded the motion.  The motion passed unanimously. 
 
Contracted fuel price is based on the low Oil Price Information Service (OPIS) price market index from the preceding 
week for purchases incurred the following week, plus the vendor fees.  OPIS price will fluctuate on a weekly basis, but the 
fees do not fluctuate. 
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