
APPROVED FEBRUARY 20, 2015

     RFB #15-0003 Contract

Municipal 
Emergency Services, 

Inc-Mid Am
Galls, LLC Emergency Fire 

Equipment, Inc.
Weis Fire and Safety 

Equipment Co.

1.  Pair, Globe #1201400-050M, 14" boots $339.00 no bid no bid no bid
2.  Pair, Globe, 14" boots wide calf $470.50 no bid no bid no bid

3.  Each, Bullard #UST6F, helmets with 4" face shield $201.00 $243.93 $248.25
$216.19 year 1                
$222.28 year 2                
$228.57 year 3

4.  Each, Bullard #R330,  4" PPC hard coated face shield $49.59 $59.82 $59.74
$53.11 year 1                 
$54.66 year 2                 
$56.22 year 3

Acknowledge Addenda Yes Yes Yes Yes

No Bid Feld Fire Conrad Fire 
Equipment Elbeco Incorporated Oklahoma Police 

Supply, LLC

The recommendation of Purchasing and Sedgwick County Fire District #1 is to accept the low bid from Municipal Emergency Services, Inc-
Mid Am (MES-Mid Am) and establish pricing for one (1) year with two (2),  one (1) year options to renew.  
 
Total spend for these items is not to exceed $30,000.00 for the three year contract. MES was the only vendor to submit pricing for all four items 
listed in the RFB. 
 

ITEMS REQUIRING COUNTY MANAGER APPROVAL 
PER CHARTER RESOLUTION 65 

FEBRUARY 20, 2015 
 
 
1.  BOOTS AND HELMETS -- SEDGWICK COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT #1 
     FUNDING -- SEDGWICK COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT #1 
     (Request sent to 29 vendors) 


	15-0003

