BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS JULY 30, 2015

ITEMS REQUIRING BOCC APPROVAL

7ITEMS

1. VARIOUS FOUR WHEEL DRIVE TRUCKS -- FLEET MANAGEMENT
FUNDING -- 1/2 TON 4WD EXTENDED CAB, 1/2 TON 4WD EXTENDED CAB W/SHORT BED,

1 TON 4WD CREW CAB TRUCK

(Request sent to 101 vendors)

RFB #15-0065 SC #8000068168

Qty Eddy's Ford Davis-Moore Automotive, Inc.
' Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price | Extended Price

1A. 1/2 ton 4WD extended cab truck 4 $36,990.00 $147,960.00
1B. Set of manuals 1 $350.00 $350.00
1C. Make/model 2016 Ford F-150 no bid
1D. Days to delivery 90-120 days
Subtotal $148,310.00
2A. 1/2 ton 4WD extended cab truck
with short bed 1 $38,890.00 $38,890.00 $34,909.00 $34,909.00
2B. Set of manuals 1 $350.00 $350.00 $200.00 $200.00
2C. Make/model 2016 Ford F-150 2016 Dodge Ram 1500 Quad Cab
2D. Days to delivery 90-120 days 12-16 weeks
Subtotal $39,240.00 $35,109.00
3A. 1 ton 4WD crew cab truck 1 $42,150.00 $42,150.00
3B. Set of manuals 1 $200.00 $200.00
3C. Make/model no bid 2016 Dodge Ram 3500 Crew Cab
3D. Days to delivery 12-16 weeks
Subtotal $42,350.00
Acknowledge Addenda Yes Yes

Qty Rusty Eck Ford Don Hattan Chevrolet, Inc.

' Unit Price | Extended Price UnitPrice | Extended Price

1A. 1/2 ton 4WD extended cab truck 4
1B. Set of manuals 1
1C. Make/model no bid no bid
1D. Days to delivery
Subtotal
2A. 1/2 ton 4WD extended cab truck
with short bed 1 $33,900.00 $33,900.00
2B. Set of manuals 1 no bid $0.00 $0.00
2C. Make/model 2015 Chevrolet CK15753
2D. Days to delivery 60-90 days
Subtotal $33,900.00
3A. 1 ton 4WD crew cab truck 1 $42,147.00 $42,147.00 $43,200.00 $43,200.00
3B. Set of manuals 1 $177.00 $177.00 $0.00 $0.00
3C. Make/model 2016 Ford F-350 Crew Cab 2015 Chevrolet CK35943
3D. Days to delivery 12-16 weeks 60-90 days
Subtotal $42,324.00 $43,200.00
Acknowledge Addenda Yes Yes

No Bid

Landmark Dodge | Scholfield Hyundai

Midwest Superstore

On the recommendation of Kara Kingsley, on behalf of Fleet Management, David Spears moved to accept the bid for item 1 from
Eddy's Ford in the amount of $148,310.00; accept the low responsive bid for item 2 from Davis-Moore Automotive, Inc. in
the amount of $35,109.00; and accept the low bid for item 3 from Rusty Eck Ford in the amount of $42,324.00. Tim
Kaufman seconded the motion. The motion passed unanimously.

These are replacement vehicles for Public Works; surplus will be sold on Purple Wave.

Note: The deadline for ordering the 2015 model year trucks quoted by Don Hattan Chevrolet, Inc. was July 23, 2015. Since the
ordering deadline has passed, they are unable to fulfill any orders.
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