

BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS DECEMBER 3, 2015

4. PICK-UP AND DISPOSAL OF HAZARDOUS WASTE -- HOUSEHOLD HAZARDOUS WASTE

FUNDING -- HOUSEHOLD HAZARDOUS WASTE

(Request sent to 38 vendors)

RFP #15-0101 Contract

		Clean Harbors Environmental Services, Inc.	Heritage Environmental Services, LLC	Prewett Enterprises, Inc. dba B&P Enterprises	Rineco Environmental Services, LLC	Stericycle Environmental Solutions, Inc.	Tradebe Treatment and Recycling, LLC
1	Aerosols (55 gal)	\$175.00	\$165.00	\$245.00	\$190.00	\$120.00	\$177.00
2	Aerosols (YD3)	\$437.50	\$485.00	\$575.00	\$700.00	\$250.00	\$516.00
3	Lab packs (5 gal)	\$132.00	\$110.00	\$317.00	\$210.00	No Bid	\$153.00
4	Lab packs (15 gal)	\$189.00	\$195.00	\$425.00	\$300.00	No Bid	\$124.00
5	Lab packs (55 gal)	\$347.00	\$350.00	\$1,025.00	\$600.00	No Bid	\$414.00
6	Bulk flammable liquids (55 gal)	\$60.00	\$65.00	\$125.00	\$85.00	\$45.00	\$66.00
7	Off spec solids 12" or below (55 gal)	\$90.00	\$110.00	\$179.00	\$100.00	\$48.00	\$66.00
8	Off spec solids 13" - 24" (55 gal)	\$90.00	\$145.00	\$197.00	\$120.00	\$80.00	\$121.00
9	Off spec solids 25" - 36" (55 gal)	\$115.00	\$180.00	\$215.00	\$150.00	\$90.00	\$146.00
10	PCB rejection fee	no charge	no charge	\$0.00	no charge	n/a	no charge
11	Loosepack flammable (55 gal)	\$150.00	\$165.00	\$215.00	\$280.00	\$130.00	\$163.00
12	Loosepack flammable (YD3)	\$473.00	\$480.00	\$593.00	\$700.00	\$350.00	\$516.00
13	Mixed LP liquid poison (55 gal)	\$185.00	\$220.00	\$275.00	\$400.00	\$465.00	\$414.00
14	Mixed LP liquid poison (YD3)	\$587.00	\$660.00	\$875.00	\$1,464.00	n/a	\$775.00
15	Mixed LP solid poison (55 gal)	\$185.00	\$220.00	\$275.00	\$400.00	\$465.00	\$414.00
16	Mixed LP solid poison (YD3)	\$587.00	\$660.00	\$875.00	\$1,464.00	\$785.00	\$775.00
17	Mixed acids loosepacks (55 gal)	\$185.00	\$220.00	\$305.00	\$350.00	\$150.00	\$210.00
18	Bases loosepacks (55 gal)	\$185.00	\$220.00	\$245.00	\$350.00	\$150.00	\$199.00
19	Oxidizers (5 gal)	\$78.00	\$110.00	\$353.00	\$175.00	\$100.00	\$92.00
20	Oxidizers (15 gal)	\$111.00	\$195.00	\$521.00	\$225.00	\$200.00	\$164.00
21	Oxidizers (55 gal)	\$185.00	\$350.00	\$701.00	\$500.00	\$480.00	\$502.00
22	Isocyanate/anime loosepacks (55 gal)	\$185.00	\$250.00	\$305.00	\$825.00	\$300.00	\$570.00
23	Elemental mercury (5 gal)	\$15/month/flask*	Per LB Price	\$185.00	\$500.00	\$198.00	\$203.00
24	Elemental mercury (15 gal)	\$15/month/flask*	Per LB Price	\$365.00	\$715.00	\$627.00	\$710.00
25	Elemental mercury (55 gal)	\$15/month/flask*	Per LB Price	\$425.00	\$1,430.00	\$1,254.00	\$1,419.00
26	Elemental mercury (per pound)	\$15/month/flask*	\$12.00	\$71.00	\$4.40 min above	n/a	\$6.06
27	Thermostats/thermometers (5 gal)	\$404.25	Per LB Price	\$185.00	\$500.00	\$198.00	\$203.00
28	Thermostats/thermometers (15 gal)	\$807.45	Per LB Price	\$255.00	\$715.00	\$627.00	\$701.80
29	Thermostats/thermometers (55 gal)	\$1,345.05	Per LB Price	\$425.00	\$1,430.00	\$1,254.00	\$1,419.00
30	Thermostats/thermometers (per pound)	\$6.38	\$12.00	\$71.00	\$4.40 min above	n/a	\$6.06
31	Mercury debris (5 gal)	\$404.25	Per LB Price	N/A	\$500.00	\$198.00	\$200.60
32	Mercury debris (15 gal)	\$807.45	Per LB Price	N/A	\$715.00	\$627.00	\$388.80
33	Mercury debris (55 gal)	\$1,345.05	Per LB Price	N/A	\$1,430.00	\$1,254.00	\$597.00
34	Mercury debris (per pound)	\$6.38	\$12.00	N/A	\$4.40 min above	n/a	\$6.06
35	Mercury compounds (5 gal)	\$404.25	Per LB Price	\$515.00	\$500.00	\$198.00	\$200.60
36	Mercury compounds (15 gal)	\$807.45	Per LB Price	\$865.00	\$715.00	\$627.00	\$543.80
37	Mercury compounds (55 gal)	\$1,345.05	Per LB Price	\$1,705.00	\$1,430.00	\$1,254.00	\$865.00
38	Mercury compounds (per pound)	\$6.38	\$12.00	\$79.40	\$4.40 min above	n/a	\$6.06
39	Lithium grease (55 gal)	\$74.00	\$85.00	\$135.80	\$300.00	\$100.00	\$73.00
40	Grease (55 gal)	\$74.00	\$85.00	\$135.80	\$0.75/lb	\$100.00	\$73.00

BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS DECEMBER 3, 2015

41	Latex paint (bulk-55 gal)	\$100.00	\$85.00	\$135.80	\$250.00	\$114.00	\$73.00
42	Latex paint loosepack (YD3)	\$288.00	\$285.00	\$395.00	\$500.00	\$192.00	\$222.00
43	Latex paint loosepack (20 YD3 roll-off)	\$2,200.00	\$4,500.00	\$2,705.00	\$10,000.00	N/A	\$2,114.29
44	Fluorescents (per linear ft.)	\$0.15	\$0.10	\$203.00	\$0.10	\$0.22	\$0.20
45	Fluorescents (per box)	\$62.00	\$40.00	\$215.00	\$125.00	\$72.00	\$20.00
46	Crushed fluorescent bulbs (55 gal)	\$195.30	\$295.00	\$725.00	\$1,430.00	\$334.00	\$278.00
47	HID bulbs (per pound)	\$4.55	\$2.55	\$66.80	\$1.85	\$2.09	\$2.38
48	Compact bulbs (YD3)	\$4.43	2.55/LB	\$65.72	\$0.50/lb	.96/lb	\$535.50
49	PCB ballasts and/or capacitors (55 gal)	\$415.80	cannot accept	\$1,265.00	\$1,030.00	n/a	\$227.00
50	PCB fuels>50 and <499 (55 gal)	\$384.30	\$450.00	\$2,465.00	\$2,000.00	n/a	n/a
51	Flammable solids (rags, booms, etc) (55 gal)	\$185.00	\$125.00	\$215.00	\$375.00	\$117.00	\$129.00
52	Bulk acid (55 gal)	\$153.30	\$145.00	\$305.00	\$350.00	\$390.00	\$106.00
53	Bulk acid (YD3)	n/a	\$545.00	n/a	n/a	n/a	\$637.00
54	Bulk bases (55 gal)	\$153.30	\$145.00	\$245.00	\$350.00	\$390.00	\$106.00
55	Bulk bases (YD3)	n/a	\$545.00	n/a	n/a	n/a	\$593.00
56	Bulk pesticide solid (55 gal)	\$226.80	\$220.00	\$245.00	\$375.00	\$247.50	\$414.00
57	Bulk pesticide solid (YD3)	\$697.20	\$660.00	\$875.00	\$950.00	\$775.00	\$692.00
58	Bulk pesticide liquid (55 gal)	\$226.80	\$220.00	\$215.00	\$450.00	\$860.00	\$414.00
59	Bulk pesticide liquid (YD3)	\$697.20	\$660.00	n/a	n/a	n/a	\$692.00
60	Medications (55 gal)	\$226.80	\$220.00	\$459.80	\$350.00	\$262.00	\$135.00
61	DOT box w/pallet and 6 mil liner (YD3)	\$92.00	\$75.00 (new) \$45.00 (used)	\$215.00	\$90.00	\$82.00	\$75.00
62	Additional 6 mil liner	\$11.00	\$10.00	\$107.00	no charge	\$5.00	\$12.00
63	Labor-Field Chemist (per hour)	\$47.00	\$55.00	\$50.00	\$75.00	\$53.00	\$40.00
64	Labor-Technician (per hour)	\$37.00	\$45.00	\$33.60	\$50.00	\$45.00	\$40.00
Remote Collection Support							
65	Labor-Field Chemist (per hour)	\$47.00	\$55.00	\$50.00	\$75.00	\$53.00	\$40.00
66	Labor-Technician (per hour)	\$37.00	\$45.00	\$33.60	\$50.00	\$45.00	\$40.00
67	Transportation	\$650.00	\$980.00	\$750.00	\$1,750.00	\$959.00	\$3,692.00
68	Disposal	see above	see above	see above	see above	n/a variable	see above
69	Set-up	\$750.00	\$250.00	\$750.00	\$4,500.00	n/a	see above
No Bid	Prewett Enterprises, Inc. dba B&P Enterprises	Haz-Mat Response, Inc.		Green Bay Lead, Inc.	Safety Kleen, Inc.	MT2, LLC	Vanguard Environmental, Inc.
	Voegeli Scrap & Salvage	Geotechnical Services, Inc.		American Metropolitan Environmental, Inc.		Allied Environmental Consultants, Inc.	

*A flask is a 5-gallon bucket or less.

On the recommendation of Kara Kingsley, on behalf of Household Hazardous Waste (HHW), David Spears moved to **accept the overall low proposal from Clean Harbors Environmental Services, Inc. and establish contract pricing for one (1) year with three (3) one (1) year options to renew.** Linda Kizzire seconded the motion. The motion passed unanimously.

A committee comprised of Susan Erlenwein, Deborah Wampler and Charles Gunter-HHW and Kara Kingsley-Purchasing evaluated the proposals for content, qualifications, experience and methodology. Clean Harbors Environmental Services, Inc. offered the best value for the county's hazardous waste disposal needs.

2014 approximate waste shipped was 997,637 pounds; approximate spend was \$254,216.38.

Question: Is Clean Harbors Environmental Services, Inc. our current vendor? Kara Kingsley with Purchasing answered that they are one of our current vendors.