
BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS DECEMBER 31, 2015

4.  ELECTRONIC MONITORING SERVICE -- DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS
     FUNDING -- DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS
     (Request sent to 24 vendors)  

     RFP #15-0105

Axis Monitoring, 
LLC

Greenfeather 
Monitoring, LLC

Core Monitoring, 
LLC Premier Monitoring SecureTracks                              

GPS, Inc.

Advanced 
Monitoring of 

Kansas
1. GPS Active $6.50 $4.80 $7.90 $4.50 $6.95 $9.67
2. GPS Passive N/A N/A $7.50 $4.50 $5.25 no bid
3. GPS 2-Piece N/A N/A $7.50 N/A N/A no bid
4. In Home Alcohol w/GPS* $7.00-$12.50 $5.45-$8.40 $9.66 $3.50-$5.75 $8.75 no bid
5. RF w/Land Line N/A $3.55 $4.20 $2.55 N/A no bid
6. RF w/Cell $4.50 $5.50 $6.00 $3.05 N/A no bid
7. Self Insure yes unknown yes yes yes unknown

8. Install/Removal Included yes yes yes yes $45.00 install fee 
$45.00 removal fee yes

Sentinel Offender 
Services, LLC BI, Inc.

Safekey, LLC dba 
Guardian 

Monitoring

Rocky Mountain 
Offender 

Management 
Systems

Freedom 
Monitoring 

Solutions, LLC
DCCCA, Inc.

1. GPS Active $6.75 $5.09 $7.00 $9.49 $10.00
2. GPS Passive $6.25 $5.19 N/A N/A $9.00
3. GPS 2-Piece N/A $7.75 $8.00 N/A $12.00
4. In Home Alcohol w/GPS* $4.35-$6.00 $7.94 $8.00-$9.50 $4.99-$8.99 N/A
5. RF w/Land Line $3.00 $3.19 $4.00 $7.99 N/A
6. RF w/Cell $4.99 $4.39 $6.00 $8.74 N/A
7. Self Insure yes yes unknown yes yes
8. Install/Removal Included yes yes yes yes yes

no bid

*Prices very depending on type of alcohol test used.
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On the recommendation of Kara Kingsley, on behalf of  the Department of Corrections, Jennifer Dombaugh moved to reject all proposals submitted.  
Linda Kizzire seconded the motion.  The motion passed unanimously. 
 
The Department of Corrections has decided to recommend rejection of all proposals for electronic monitoring services due to revisions in the scope of work. 
This proposal will be re-issued with modifications in early 2016. 
 
Note: This recommendation was originally brought to the Board of Bids and Contracts on December 3, 2015 (who had recommended approval), and to the 
Board of County Commissioners on December 9, 2015, when the County Commissioners voted to refer the item back to the Board of Bids and Contracts. 
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