
BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS MARCH 31, 2016

7.  AMMUNITION - SHERIFF'S OFFICE

     FUNDING - SHERIFF'S OFFICE

     (Request sent to 15 vendors)

     RFB #16-0022  Contract

Unit of Measure          

per case
Price

Unit of Measure          

per case
Price

Unit of Measure          

per case
Price

Unit of Measure          

per case
Price

Speer Gold Dot 124 Grain +P 9MM 1000 ea $435.59 1000 ea $315.00

Federal Tactical Rifle Urban 55 Grain BTHP .223 

T223E
500 ea $326.86 1000 ea $330.00

Winchester 12 Ga. 1oz Segmented Slug RA12RS15S 1000 ea $530.00

Practice Ammunition

Unit of 

Measure          

per case

Price
Unit of Measure          

per case
Price

Unit of Measure          

per case
Price

Unit of Measure          

per case
Price

9MM 124 Grain Full Metal Jacket New Brass 1000 ea $173.00 1000 ea $237.39 1000 ea $195.00 1000 ea $191.29

.223 55 Grain Full Metal Jacket New Brass 1000 ea $270.00 500 ea $346.74 1000 ea $320.00 1000 ea $272.71

12 Ga. Bird Shot 7 1/2  2 3/4" per 1000 ea * $55.00 250 ea $78.72 1000 ea $240.00

Estimated Delivery Time 

Acknowledge Addendum

Unit of Measure          

per case
Price

Unit of Measure          

per case
Price

Unit of Measure          

per case
Price

Unit of Measure          

per case
Price

Speer Gold Dot 124 Grain +P 9MM 1000 ea $426.87 1000 ea $291.00

Federal Tactical Rifle Urban 55 Grain BTHP .223 

T223E
500 ea $320.32 500 ea $212.00

Winchester 12 Ga. 1oz Segmented Slug RA12RS15S 250 ea $193.00 250 ea $545.50

Practice Ammunition
Unit of Measure          

per case
Price

Unit of Measure          

per case
Price

Unit of Measure          

per case
Price

Unit of Measure          

per case
Price

9MM 124 Grain Full Metal Jacket New Brass 1000 ea $232.64 1000 ea $175.00 1000 ea $175.00 1000 ea $187.00

.223 55 Grain Full Metal Jacket New Brass 500 ea $192.86 500 ea $145.00 1000 ea $255.00 500 ea $330.00

12 Ga. Bird Shot 7 1/2  2 3/4" 250 ea $77.15 250 ea $68.00 250 ea $244.50

Estimated Delivery Time 

Acknowledge Addendum N Y N N

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

30 - 180 days 90 days 30 days 30-150 days

Duty Ammunition

Kiesler Police Supply, Inc.
Accuracy Inc. dba Ultramax 

Ammunition
Arms Unlimited Simmons Gun Specialties

No Bid No Bid

30 days 365 days Immediately - 6 months 30-60 days

Y Y Y N

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid

Duty Ammunition

Armscor Cartridge Inc. GT Distributors, Inc. Ray O'Herron Co. Inc. Clyde Armory Inc.

No Bid No Bid

On the recommendation of Kimberly Evans, on behalf of the Sheriff's Office, Jennifer Dombaugh moved to accept the overall low bids from Armscor Cartridge Inc. and Accuracy Inc. dba 

Ultramax Ammunition and establish contract pricing for two (2) years at the rates listed above.  Tim Kaufman seconded the motion. The motion passed unanimously.  

 

In 2015 Sheriff's Office spent $61,151.00 with Armscor Cartridge Inc. and Accuracy Inc. dba Ultramax Ammunition for duty and practice ammunition.    

 

*The original bid submitted by Armscor Cartridge Inc. for the Winchester 12 gauge ammunition was determined to be a non-judgmental error for the quoted case price.  The submitted bid listed 

the unit packing as 1,000 per case, however, the actual unit packing was 250 per case.  K.S.A .75-6904 states if there is a suspected error by the bidder, a request for verification can be made.  

After verification, the bidder can withdraw submission within two days.  If the bidder does not respond within two days it is considered to be “verified” and  accepted "as is".  Armscor chose to 

leave the bid "as is" and sell at the stated price per 1,000. 


