BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS MAY 12, 2016

4. ON-CALL TRANSLATION SERVICES -- VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS

FUNDING -- VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
(Request sent to 88 vendors)

RFP #16-0034 Contract

Bridging The Gap
Interpreting, LLC

All World Language
Consultants, Inc.

1. Rates for standard service

$60.00 per hour in person (2
hour minimum) plus round
trip mileage @ $.054 per mile

$65.00 per hour in person
interpretation, $1.25 per
minute telephonic
interpretation

2. Rates for evenings, weekends, and holidays

$60.00 per hour in person (2
hour minimum) plus round
trip mileage @ $.054 per mile

$70.00 per hour in person
interpretation, $1.25 per
minute telephonic
interpretation

3. Rates for emergency service

$60.00 per hour in person (2
hour minimum) plus round
trip mileage @ $.054 per mile

$70.00 per hour in person
interpretation, $1.25 per
minute telephonic
interpretation

4. Monthly Flat Rate for 18th Judicial District Court

$15,000.00

No Bid

JRivera Associates, Inc.

Interlingual Services

1. Rates for standard service

$40.00-$90.00* per hour in
person, $39.00 per hour
telephonic, $0.17 per word
translation.

$42.50 per hour in person and
telephonic interpretation

2. Rates for evenings, weekends, and holidays

$40.00-$90.00* per hour in
person $39.00 per hour
(depending on language),
$45.00 - $50.00 telephonic,
$0.17- $0.21 per word
translation.

No Bid

3. Rates for emergency service

$50.00-$90.00* per hour in
person, $55.00 telephonic,
$0.26 per word translation.

No Bid

4. Monthly Flat Rate for 18th Judicial District Court

$11,250.00

$10,000.00

Multilingual Links, LLC

Propio Language Services

1. Rates for standard service

$45.00 per hour (2 hour
minimum), $45.00 per hour in
person , $0.33 per word
document translation

$1.45 - $2.95 per video-
remote, maximum monthly
charge per department is
$50.00 or $300.00 maximum
for entire county. $0.55 -
$0.94 per minute telephonic.
$0.10 - $0.26 per word
document translation $25.00
minimum

2. Rates for evenings, weekends, and holidays

$45.00 per hour in person (2
hour minimum )

same as above
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3. Rates for emergency service

$55.00 per hour in person (2
hour minimum)

same as above

4. Monthly Flat Rate for 18th Judicial District Court

$19,300.00

No Bid

World Wide Interpreters

Foreign Language
Interpreter Services Inc.

1. Rates for standard service

$85.00 per hour in person
translation. $0.54 per minute
telephonic interpretation.
$45.00 per page document
translation.

$35.00-$45.00 per hour in

person interpretation plus

$0.40 per mile outside of
Wichita**

2. Rates for evenings, weekends, and holidays

$110.00 per hour in person
translation. $0.56 per minute
telephonic interpretation.
$50.00 per page document
translation.

same as above

3. Rates for emergency service

$110.00 per hour in person
translation. $0.56 per minute
telephonic interpretation.
$55.00 per page document
translation.

same as above

Monthly Flat Rate for 18th Judicial District Court

$26,532.50

No Bid

Access 2 Interpreters

Indus Translation Services

1. Rates for standard service

$0.18 - $0.30 per word ($65.00
per document minimum, plus
$40.00 per hour formatting fee)

$0.15 - $0.22 per word
document translation

2. Rates for evenings, weekends, and holidays

No Bid

$0.15 - $0.22 per word
document translation

3. Rates for emergency service

$15.00 next day turn around

less than 360 words. Rush fee

$80.00 for documents in non-
editable format.

$0.15 - $0.22 per word
document translation

4. Monthly Flat Rate for 18th Judicial District Court

No Bid

No Bid

Reliable Interpretations &
Translations

Telelanguage

1. Rates for standard service

$29.00 per hour in person
translation (2 hour minimum)

$79.00 - $89.00 per hour in
person translation. $1.29 per
minute telephonic
interpretation. $0.23 - $0.34 per
word document translation.

2. Rates for evenings, weekends, and holidays

No Bid

$79.00 - $89.00 per hour in
person translation. $1.29 per
minute telephonic
interpretation. $0.23 - $0.34 per
word document translation.
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$79.00 - $89.00 per hour in
person translation. $1.29 per
3. Rates for emergency service No Bid minute telephonic
interpretation. $0.23 - $0.34 per
word document translation.

$19,750.00 On Site $13,350.00

4. Monthly Flat Rate for 18th Judicial District Court No Bid . .
Telephonic Interpretation

Confluent Translations

Corporate Translation Services dba CTS Language Link

Optimal Phone Interpreters

No Bids Interpreting Solutions, LLC

Reyes-Alcala Hispanic Consulting Service

Leyda's Services

Carmazzi Global Solutions

On the recommendation of Kristen McGovern, on behalf of various county departments, Tim Kaufman moved
to accept the proposals from Bridging The Gap Interpreting, LLC, All World Language Consultants,
Inc., JRivera Associates, Inc., Foreign Language Interpreter Services, Inc. and Propio Language
Services for items 1-3, Interlingual Services items 1 & 4, Reliable Interpretations & Translations for
item 1 only, and establish contract pricing for three (3) years with two (2) one (1) year options to renew.
Linda Kizzire seconded the motion. The motion passed unanimously.

In evaluating the county's past and current usage of translation services it was determined to be in the county's
best interests to establish contracts with more than one vendor. Having this flexibility will minimize possible
scheduling conflicts and provide more options in choosing the best rates based on the anticipated length of the
service call.

*Range based on selected language.
**20 miles or more outside of Wichita
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