
BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS JUNE 2, 2016

4.  HVAC SUPPLIES -- FACILITIES DEPARTMENT

     FUNDING -- FACILITIES DEPARTMENT

     (Request sent to 45 vendors)  

     RFB #16-0051 CONTRACT

Filter Size Price Per Each Brand Quoted Price Per Each Brand Quoted Price Per Each Brand Quoted

1.  10x20x1 $2.03 Tri-Dim $2.03

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$2.75 Air Handler

2.  10x59x.5 $3.25 Tri-Dim $7.34

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

No Bid No Bid

3.  11x16x1 $2.03 Tri-Dim $2.95

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

No Bid No Bid

4.  11x45.75x1 $6.50 Tri-Dim $7.34

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

No Bid No Bid

5.  12x20x1 $2.03 Tri-Dim $2.08

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$2.89 Air Handler

6.  12x24x1 $2.03 Tri-Dim $2.03

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$2.46 Air Handler

7.  12x24x2 $2.04 Tri-Dim $2.17

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$2.41 Air Handler

8.  14x20x2 $2.13 Tri-Dim $2.64

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$3.11 Air Handler

9.  14x24x2 $3.56 Tri-Dim $4.53

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

No Bid No Bid

10.  14x25x1 $2.28 Tri-Dim $2.27

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$2.69 Air Handler

11.  14x25x2 $2.37 Tri-Dim $2.55

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$3.54 Air Handler

Tri-Dim Filter Corporation Wichita Air Filter Supply Grainger
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12.  15.75x65.75x1 $8.50 Tri-Dim $9.88

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

No Bid No Bid

13.  15x20x2 $2.13 Tri-Dim $2.31

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$4.05 Air Handler

14.  16x16x2 $2.26 Tri-Dim $2.97

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$4.20 Air Handler

15.  16x20x1 $2.08 Tri-Dim $1.82

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$2.29 Air Handler

16.  16x20x2 $2.13 Tri-Dim $2.19

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$2.28 Air Handler

17.  16x20x4 $3.34 Tri-Dim $3.65

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$5.07 Air Handler

18.  16x24x1 $2.22 Tri-Dim $2.85

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$2.95 Air Handler

19.  16x24x2 $2.37 Tri-Dim $2.94

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$3.28 Air Handler

20.  16x25x1 $2.10 Tri-Dim $2.22

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$2.48 Air Handler

21.  16x25x2 $2.37 Tri-Dim $2.50

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$2.56 Air Handler

22.  16.25x25x1 $2.22 Tri-Dim $4.60

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

No Bid No Bid

23.  16.875x16.875x1 $3.17 Tri-Dim $3.69

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

No Bid No Bid

24.  17x19x1 $3.62 Tri-Dim $4.15

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$3.48 Air Handler
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25.  18x18x1 $3.27 Tri-Dim $4.10

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$3.25 Air Handler

26.  18x20x2 $2.37 Tri-Dim $2.94

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$3.49 Air Handler

27.  18x24x2 $2.47 Tri-Dim $2.85

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$4.36 Air Handler

28.  19.5x30.5x2 $2.35 Tri-Dim $5.40

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

No Bid No Bid

29.  20x20x1 $2.22 Tri-Dim $2.23

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$2.48 Air Handler

30.  20x20x2 $2.37 Tri-Dim $2.53

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$2.59 Air Handler

31.  20x21x1 $3.94 Tri-Dim $4.59

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$3.84 Air Handler

32.  20x22x1 $2.22 Tri-Dim $4.10

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$3.94 Air Handler

33.  20x24x1 $2.25 Tri-Dim $2.60

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$3.46 Air Handler

34.  20x24x2 $2.57 Tri-Dim $2.98

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$2.96 Air Handler

35.  20x25x1 $2.42 Tri-Dim $2.55

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$2.76 Air Handler

36.  20x25x2 $2.62 Tri-Dim $2.89

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$3.00 Air Handler

37.  20x20x2 $2.37 Tri-Dim $2.54

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$2.59 Air Handler
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38.  20x30x1 $3.01 Tri-Dim $3.33

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$4.38 Air Handler

39.  20x32x1 $3.15 Tri-Dim $5.33

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

No Bid No Bid

40.  22x30x1 $5.29 Tri-Dim $5.33

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

No Bid No Bid

41.  24x24x1 $2.62 Tri-Dim $2.90

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$3.53 Air Handler

42.  24x24x2 $2.85 Tri-Dim $3.25

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$3.09 Air Handler

43.  25x25x1 $2.95 Tri-Dim $3.25

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$4.35 Air Handler

44.  25x29x4 $10.50 Tri-Dim $6.63

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$10.12 Air Handler

45.  33.5x9x1 $5.95 Tri-Dim $4.15

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

No Bid No Bid

46.  69.75x10.875x.75 $10.50 Tri-Dim $8.27

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

No Bid No Bid

47.  8.25x43.75x1 $5.78 Tri-Dim $5.93

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

No Bid No Bid

48.  8.5 x 27.5 x .5 $2.50 Tri-Dim $3.33

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

No Bid No Bid

49.  8.875x19.125x1 $2.50 Tri-Dim $2.97

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

No Bid No Bid

50.  8.875x24.125x1 $2.50 Tri-Dim $3.35

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

No Bid No Bid
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51.  8.875x33.625x1 $2.85 Tri-Dim $4.15

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

No Bid No Bid

52.  8.875x42.125x1 $2.95 Tri-Dim $5.93

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

No Bid No Bid

53.  8.875x61.125x1 $3.50 Tri-Dim $7.35

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

No Bid No Bid

54.  8x20x1 $3.30 Tri-Dim $2.97

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$3.15 Air Handler

55.  8x32x1 $4.00 Tri-Dim $3.69

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

No Bid No Bid

56.  9x24x1 $2.98 Tri-Dim $3.35

Glasfloss ZL Pleat 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$3.64 Air Handler

57.  Merv 13 12x24x12 $31.00 Tri-Dim $61.15

Glasfloss Magna 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$12.54 Air Handler

58.  Merv 13 24x24x12 $42.00 Tri-Dim $87.50

Glasfloss Magna 

from Wichita Air 

Filter Supply

$16.37 Air Handler

59.  Fiber Filter 9.75x21x.75x1 $1.50 Tri-Dim $2.29

Glasfloss Fiberglass 

Disposable from 

Wichita Air Filter

No Bid No Bid

60.  Fiber Filter 22x22x.5 (1/2") $1.75 Tri-Dim $2.69

Glasfloss Fiberglass 

Disposable from 

Wichita Air Filter

$0.88 Air Handler

Belt Type Price Per Each Brand Quoted Price Per Each Brand Quoted Price Per Each Brand Quoted

1.  4L240 $2.82 Continental $0.00 No Bid $1.49 Dayton

2.  A41 $4.49 Continental $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.  A42 $4.59 Continental $0.00 No Bid $3.58 Dayton

4.  A46 $4.83 Continental $0.00 No Bid $3.78 Dayton

5.   A51 $5.08 Continental $0.00 No Bid $3.87 Dayton

6.  1-B46 $6.97 Continental $0.00 No Bid $5.05 Dayton

7.  1-5vx530 $16.47 Continental $0.00 No Bid $18.08 Dayton
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8.  2-5vx500 $15.81 Continental $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

9.  2-5vx530 $16.47 Continental $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

10.  2-5vx590 $18.15 Continental $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

11.  2-5vx630 $20.88 Continental $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

12.  2-5vx710 $22.12 Continental $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

13.  2-B60 $7.53 Continental $0.00 No Bid $25.01 Dayton

14.  2-B62 $7.73 Continental $0.00 No Bid $29.27 Dayton

15.  2-B72 $8.70 Continental $0.00 No Bid $34.01 Dayton

16.  2-B78 $9.41 Continental $0.00 No Bid $32.53 Dayton

17.  2-B82 $10.04 Continental $0.00 No Bid $34.19 Dayton

18.  2-B87 $10.50 Continental $0.00 No Bid $36.29 Dayton

19.  2-B88 $10.58 Continental $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

20.  2-BX40 $7.43 Continental $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

21.  2-BX60 $9.72 Continental $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

22.  2-BX62 $9.95 Continental $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

23.  2-BX70 $10.97 Continental $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

24.  2-BX93 $14.56 Continental $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

25.  2-CX60 $17.49 Continental $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

26.  3-5vx1120 $35.51 Continental $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

27.  3-5vx530 $16.47 Continental $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

28.  3-B73 $8.80 Continental $0.00 No Bid $45.66 Dayton

29.  3-B88 $10.58 Continental $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

30.  3-B89 $10.70 Continental $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

31.  3-BX103 $15.88 Continental $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

32.  3-BX85 $13.28 Continental $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

33.  3-BX88 $13.67 Continental $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

34.  3L-210 $2.67 Continental $0.00 No Bid $1.76 Dayton

35.  3L250 $2.67 Continental $0.00 No Bid $1.76 Dayton

36.  4-5vx1180 $37.44 Continental $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

37.  4L160 $2.82 Continental $0.00 No Bid $1.44 Dayton

38.  4L170 $2.82 Continental $0.00 No Bid $1.78 Dayton

39.  4L180 $2.82 Continental $0.00 No Bid $1.70 Dayton

40.  4L190 $2.82 Continental $0.00 No Bid $1.76 Dayton

41.  4L200 $2.82 Continental $0.00 No Bid $1.40 Dayton

42.  4L210 $2.82 Continental $0.00 No Bid $1.49 Dayton

43.  4l220 $2.82 Continental $0.00 No Bid $4.34 Dayton

44.  4L-230 $2.82 Continental $0.00 No Bid $1.49 Dayton

45.  4L-300 $3.04 Continental $0.00 No Bid $2.00 Dayton

46.  4L440 $3.92 Continental $0.00 No Bid $3.02 Dayton

47.  4L450 $3.97 Continental $0.00 No Bid $2.80 Dayton

48.  4L530 $4.31 Continental $0.00 No Bid $3.44 Dayton
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49.  4L550 $4.41 Continental $0.00 No Bid $3.22 Dayton

50.  5VX450 $14.22 Continental $0.00 No Bid $14.18 Dayton

51.  5VX690 $21.47 Continental $0.00 No Bid $16.83 Dayton

52.  A20 $3.30 Continental $0.00 No Bid $1.84 Dayton

53.  A21 $3.30 Continental $0.00 No Bid $2.08 Dayton

54.  A24 $3.33 Continental $0.00 No Bid $3.76 Dayton

55.  A26 $3.36 Continental $0.00 No Bid $2.07 Dayton

56.  A28 $3.58 Continental $0.00 No Bid $2.46 Dayton

57.  A36 $4.10 Continental $0.00 No Bid $2.14 Dayton

58.  A37 $4.20 Continental $0.00 No Bid $2.80 Dayton

59.  A39 $4.35 Continental $0.00 No Bid $3.24 Dayton

60.  A40 $4.42 Continental $0.00 No Bid $2.39 Dayton

61.  A42 $4.59 Continental $0.00 No Bid $2.39 Dayton

62.  A43 $4.67 Continental $0.00 No Bid $3.31 Dayton

63.  A45 $4.79 Continental $0.00 No Bid $3.66 Dayton

64.  A46 $4.83 Continental $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

65.  A46 (4L480) $4.35 Continental $0.00 No Bid $3.22 Dayton

66.  A50 $5.00 Continental $0.00 No Bid $3.78 Dayton

67.  A56 $5.38 Continental $0.00 No Bid $4.46 Dayton

68.  A63 $5.83 Continental $0.00 No Bid $5.00 Dayton

69.  AX36 $5.27 Continental $0.00 No Bid $4.98 Dayton

70.  AX38 $5.52 Continental $0.00 No Bid $5.16 Dayton

71.  AX39 $5.62 Continental $0.00 No Bid $5.80 Dayton

72.  AX40 $5.69 Continental $0.00 No Bid $5.42 Dayton

73.  AX42 $5.93 Continental $0.00 No Bid $5.58 Dayton

74.  AX44 $6.11 Continental $0.00 No Bid $6.88 Dayton

75.  AX48 $6.35 Continental $0.00 No Bid $5.98 Dayton

76.  AX49 $6.41 Continental $0.00 No Bid $6.00 Dayton

77.  AX50 $6.50 Continental $0.00 No Bid $8.10 Dayton

78.  B57 $7.87 Continental $0.00 No Bid $6.15 Dayton

79.  B60 $8.04 Continental $0.00 No Bid $6.45 Dayton

80.  B66 $8.66 Continental $0.00 No Bid $6.86 Dayton

81.  B68 $8.83 Continental $0.00 No Bid $7.27 Dayton

82.  BX38 $7.58 Continental $0.00 No Bid $7.88 Dayton

83.  BX41 $8.11 Continental $0.00 No Bid $8.62 Dayton

84.  BX42 $8.26 Continental $0.00 No Bid $8.58 Dayton

85.  BX44 $8.64 Continental $0.00 No Bid $8.75 Dayton

86.  BX47 $9.12 Continental $0.00 No Bid $9.74 Dayton
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87.  BX48 $9.24 Continental $0.00 No Bid $9.56 Dayton

88.  BX49 $9.39 Continental $0.00 No Bid $10.17 Dayton

89.  BX52 $9.78 Continental $0.00 No Bid $10.16 Dayton

90.  BX62 $10.62 Continental $0.00 No Bid $11.04 Dayton

91.  BX63 $10.75 Continental $0.00 No Bid $10.20 Dayton

92.  M401182 (A65) $5.93 Continental $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

On the recommendation of Britt Rosencutter, on behalf of the Facilities Department, Jennifer Dombaugh moved to accept the overall low bid from 

Tri-Dim Filter Corporation and establish contract pricing for one (1) year, with two (2) one year options to renew.  Tim Kaufman seconded the 

motion.  The motion passed unanimously. 

 

A review committee consisting of Greg Tuxhorn -  Facilities Department and Britt Rosencutter - Purchasing, reviewed bids received and chose Tri-Dim 

Filter Corporation based on low pricing and having the most complete inventory available for Sedgwick County's needs. 


