BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS AUGUST 4, 2016

4. WEED CHEMICALS -- NOXIOUS WEEDS
FUNDING -- NOXIOUS WEEDS
(Request sent to 29 vendors)

RFB #16-0073 Contract

ot Van Diest Supply Company | SiteOne Landscape Supply Sims Fertilizer & Chemical
Y Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
. $44.87 .
L. 2.5 Gallon Containers, Monsanto Round-Up, or 432|  $22.45 $9.698.40 |Prosecutor Pro| $19.38384 | SU57PE | ¢10314.00
comparable product gallon
069289
2. 2.5 Gallon Containers, Generic 2, 4D with 4# Al . . $9.70* per
Dimethylamine salt of 2, 4- Dichlorophenoxyacetic acid 216 $24.35 $5,259.60 No Bid No Bid gallon $5,238.00
$63.66
i 0,
3. 1 Gallon Containers, Remedy Ultra (60.45% 64 $46.97 $3.006.08 _Lesco $4.074.24 $45.00 $2.880.00
Triclopyr), or comparable product Triclopyr 4
Ester
4. 1 Quart Containers, Esplanade 200 SC (concentrate) . .
(1.67 Lbs/Gal/Indaziflam) 4 $295.36 $1,181.44 No Bid No Bid $295.66 $1,182.64

On the recommendation of Kristen McGovern, on behalf of Noxious Weeds, Tim Kaufman moved to accept the bid from Van Diest Supply
Company for the amounts listed above and establish contract pricing for (1) year. Linda Kizzire seconded the motion. The motion passed
unanimously.

*The original bid submitted by Sims Fertilizer & Chemical was determined to be a non-judgmental error for the quoted 2.5 gallon size containers.
The unit price was for 2.5 gallon size containers and price submitted was for only 1 gallon. K.S.A. 75-6904 states if there is a suspected error by
the bidder, a request for verification can be made. After verification, the bidder can withdraw submission within two days. If the bidder does not
respond within two days its considered to be "verified" and accepted "as is". Sims Fertilizer & Chemical chose to withdraw their bid.

Questions and Answers

David Spears said: “Just want to note that Sims did pull back their bid.”

Joe Thomas responded: “Yes, due to a non-judgmental error.”
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