
BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS SEPTEMBER 1, 2016

    BOOTS and HELMETS -- SEDGWICK COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT #1
    FUNDING -- SEDGWICK COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT #1
    (Request sent to 37 vendors)

     RFB #16-0076  Contract 

Emergency Fire 
Equipment Co.

Whitmer Public 
Safety Group, 

Inc.

Conrad Fire 
Equipment, Inc.

Wies Fire & 
Safety Equipment 

Co.

Municipal 
Emergency 

Services, Inc.

1. Globe 14” Boots # 1201400-050M, all sizes No Bid $378.00 ea.
$311.49 ea. 

Honeywell Pro 
Nighthawk 5555

No Bid $368.00 ea.

2. Bullard Helmets with 4” Face Shield # UST6F, all colors $278.50 ea. $243.00 ea.
$220.45 ea. 

Honeywell Ben 
Low Rider

$239.18 ea. $224.00 ea.

3. Bullard 4” PPC, Hard Coated Face Shield # R330 $68.00 ea. $61.00 ea.
$42.68 ea. 
Honeywell 
Faceshield

$59.09 ea. $55.90 ea.

4. Globe 14” Boots wide calf, all sizes No Bid $527.05 ea. N/A No Bid $502.00 ea.
Acknowledge Addendum No Yes Yes Yes Yes

No Bids Mid-Continent 
Safety, LLC

Max Fire 
Apparatus, Inc. Feld FireMorning Pride Manufacturing, LLC

On the recommendation of Kristen McGovern, on behalf of Sedgwick County Fire District #1, Jennifer Dombaugh moved to accept the low responsive bid 
from Municipal Emergency Services, Inc. and establish contract pricing for two (2) years with two (2) additional one (1) year options to renew.  
Tim Kaufman seconded the motion. The motion passed unanimously.  
 
Conrad Fire Equipment, Inc. offered alternate items that did not meet specifications.  
 
Questions and Answers 
 
Tim Kaufman asked: "The Conrad bid is not responsive to the specs that were issued?" 
 
Joe Thomas responded: "Right. They offered a substitute but did not meet the specifications." 
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