
BOCC APPROVAL SEPTEMBER 6, 2017
BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS AUGUST 31, 2017

3. WEED CHEMICALS – NOXIOUS WEEDS DEPARTMENT
    FUNDING – NOX. WEEDS
   (Request sent to 23 vendors)

    RFB  #17-0078 S/C #8000113601

Unit 
Quantity Unit Size Description Price per 

specified size
Sims Fertilizer 
and Chemical

Van Diest 
Supply Co.

Red River 
Specialties, 

LLC

432 1. 2.5 
Gallon

Monsanto Round-Up, or 
comparable product. Must have 
41% AI Glyphosate, in the form 
of its isopropylamine salt, with 
14% surfactant. Specimen label 
use areas must include Roundup 
Ready crops; and many non-crop 
areas including roadsides.

(Per 2.5 Gallon) $24.93 $23.85 $25.30

72 2. 2.5 
Gallon

Generic 2,4D with 4# AI 
Dimethylamine salt of 2, 4-
Dichlorophenoxyacetic acid per 
gallon. Specimen label use areas 
must include small grains, 
pastures, rangelands, and other 
crops; and non-crop areas such as 
turf and roadside. Must also be 
labeled for aquatic weed control.

(Per 2.5 Gallon) $24.68 $22.75 $25.00

64 3. 1 Gallon
Remedy Ultra (60.45% 
Triclopyr), or approved 
comparable product.

(Per 1 Gallon) $58.00 $46.49 $60.75

4 4. 1 Quart Esplanade 200 SC (19.05% 
Indaziflam) (Per 1 Quart) $310.00 $303.36 $303.36

96 5. 1 Quart
Milestone Specialty Herbicide- 
40.6% Aminopyralid- pasture and 
roadside label

(Per 1 Quart) $70.75 $70.75 $70.75

72 6. 1 Gallon BASF Plateau (23.6% Imazapic) 
or comparable approved product (Per 1 Gallon) $133.25 $99.89 $119.00

144 7. 2.5 
Gallon

Non-ionic Surfactant, minimum 
90% (Per 2.5 Gallon) $21.25 $20.60 $20.00

96 8. 1 Quart Poly Control or similar approved 
drift control (Per 1 Quart) $23.00 $9.49 $8.00

96 9. 1 Quart Defoamer (Per 1 Quart) $58.50 $11.42 $10.00
2 Days 2-3 Days 3-5 DaysLead time after PO is placed
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Unit 
Quantity Unit Size Description Price per 

specified size
Morning Star 

Industries, Inc.
Helena 

Chemical

VM 
Distribution 
Partners Div. 
of Asplundh 
Tree Expert 

Co.

432 1. 2.5 
Gallon

Monsanto Round-Up, or 
comparable product. Must have 
41% AI Glyphosate, in the form 
of its isopropylamine salt, with 
14% surfactant. Specimen label 
use areas must include Roundup 
Ready crops; and many non-crop 
areas including roadsides.

(Per 2.5 Gallon) $30.60 $26.42 $28.38

72 2. 2.5 
Gallon

Generic 2,4D with 4# AI 
Dimethylamine salt of 2, 4-
Dichlorophenoxyacetic acid per 
gallon. Specimen label use areas 
must include small grains, 
pastures, rangelands, and other 
crops; and non-crop areas such as 
turf and roadside. Must also be 
labeled for aquatic weed control.

(Per 2.5 Gallon) $31.20 $68.96 $28.13

64 3. 1 Gallon
Remedy Ultra (60.45% 
Triclopyr), or approved 
comparable product.

(Per 1 Gallon) $81.60 $58.95 $62.89

4 4. 1 Quart Esplanade 200 SC (19.05% 
Indaziflam) (Per 1 Quart) $364.03 $303.36 $303.96

96 5. 1 Quart
Milestone Specialty Herbicide- 
40.6% Aminopyralid- pasture and 
roadside label

(Per 1 Quart) $95.26 $79.38 $79.39

72 6. 1 Gallon BASF Plateau (23.6% Imazapic) 
or comparable approved product (Per 1 Gallon) $144.00 $115.00 $109.00

144 7. 2.5 
Gallon

Non-ionic Surfactant, minimum 
90% (Per 2.5 Gallon) $72.00 $25.87 $24.13

96 8. 1 Quart Poly Control or similar approved 
drift control (Per 1 Quart) $26.40 $12.82 No Bid

96 9. 1 Quart Defoamer (Per 1 Quart) $21.00 $12.84 No Bid
3-7 Days 14 Days 10 DaysLead time after PO is placed
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Unit 
Quantity Unit Size Description Price per 

specified size

SiteOne 
Landscape 

Supply

432 1. 2.5 
Gallon

Monsanto Round-Up, or 
comparable product. Must have 
41% AI Glyphosate, in the form 
of its isopropylamine salt, with 
14% surfactant. Specimen label 
use areas must include Roundup 
Ready crops; and many non-crop 
areas including roadsides.

(Per 2.5 Gallon) $38.47

72 2. 2.5 
Gallon

Generic 2,4D with 4# AI 
Dimethylamine salt of 2, 4-
Dichlorophenoxyacetic acid per 
gallon. Specimen label use areas 
must include small grains, 
pastures, rangelands, and other 
crops; and non-crop areas such as 
turf and roadside. Must also be 
labeled for aquatic weed control.

(Per 2.5 Gallon) $48.22

64 3. 1 Gallon
Remedy Ultra (60.45% 
Triclopyr), or approved 
comparable product.

(Per 1 Gallon) $54.44

4 4. 1 Quart Esplanade 200 SC (19.05% 
Indaziflam) (Per 1 Quart) No Bid

96 5. 1 Quart
Milestone Specialty Herbicide- 
40.6% Aminopyralid- pasture and 
roadside label

(Per 1 Quart) No Bid

72 6. 1 Gallon BASF Plateau (23.6% Imazapic) 
or comparable approved product (Per 1 Gallon) $134.89

144 7. 2.5 
Gallon

Non-ionic Surfactant, minimum 
90% (Per 2.5 Gallon) $33.34

96 8. 1 Quart Poly Control or similar approved 
drift control (Per 1 Quart) No Bid

96 9. 1 Quart Defoamer (Per 1 Quart) $8.86
2-10 DaysLead time after PO is placed

On the recommendation of Kristen McGovern on behalf of the Noxious Weeds Department, Bid Board unanimously 
voted to accept the low bid for items 1 - 6 to Van Diest Supply Co., the low bid for items 7 and 8 to Red River 
Specialties, LLC and the low bid for item 9 to SiteOne Landscape Supply for an initial purchase of $30,114.08 and 
establish contract pricing for one (1) year.

The department is dedicated to increasing crop production by reducing weed competition thus increasing the profit and 
sustainability of our agriculture partners. This is done through discounted herbicide sales for noxious weeds, custom 
prescribed vegetation management plans and educational messages.
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Questions and Answers 

Richard Powell: These are regular ongoing purchases we make on an annual basis to address this problem?

Kristen McGovern: That is correct.

Thomas Stolz: I'm getting a little bit away from Bid Board here, this is more of a policy question, is this for farmers for 
their land? They can come and purchase these at reduced prices from the county. Is that is that the spirit of this?

Deborah Sanchez, Administrative Specialist, Public Works: Not only farmers but any Sedgwick County resident. 

Thomas Stolz: Interesting policy decision. Do we do anything for bagworms (jokingly)?

Richard Powell: What could I do for the Bermuda (jokingly)?
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