BID OPENING MARCH 27, 2018

1. ROAD IMPOVEMENTS -- PUBLIC WORKS
FUNDING - PUBLIC WORKS
(Request sent to 46 vendors)

RFB # 18-0014

_ Comeio . | ¢t | conaruaton |, P | Company

2018 Cold Mix&Gravel Road Sons, L.L.C. Inc. ’ Co. Inc. Materials, LLC Inc. ’
Replacement Program (R342) ’
Base Bid $514,767.00 | $644,695.18 | $607,549.40 | $452,447.70 No Bid
Engineer's Estimate Alternate #1:
$1.336.612.00 $310,736.25 | $295,293.60 | $287,007.30 | $287,007.30

Total| $825,503.25 | $939,988.78 | $894,556.70 | $739,455.00
Base Bid $514,767.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $494,499.00
Engineer's Estimate Alternate #2:
$1.308.275.55 $370,513.00 $401,651.30

Total| $885,280.00 $896,150.30
Bid Bond Y Y Y Y Y
Acknowledge Addendum Y Y Y Y Y

. Unruh Pearsor_1 NowaK . .
No Bid . Construction, | Construction | Wildcat Construction Co., Inc.
Excavating
LLC Co., Inc.
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