
BOCC APPROVAL AUGUST 1, 2018
BOARD OF BIDS AND CONTRACTS JULY 26, 2018
2.   WEED CHEMICALS -- NOXIOUS WEEDS
      FUNDING -- NOX. WEEDS
      (Request sent to 23 vendors)

      RFB #18-0047 S/C #8000130883 and #8000130885

Unit Size Product Description
Unit 
Qty.

Unit 
Price Ext. Price Unit 

Price Ext. Price Unit 
Price Ext. Price Unit 

Price Ext. Price

2.5 Gallon
1. Generic Glyphosate, must have 41% AI Glyphosate, in the form of its 
isopropylamine salt, with 14% surfactant. Specimen label use areas must 
include Roundup Ready crops; and many non-crop areas including roadsides.

432 $27.45 $11,858.40 $37.06 $16,009.92 $30.00 $12,960.00 $27.925 $12,063.60

2.5 Gallon

2. Generic 2,4D with 4# AI Dimethylamine salt of 2, 4-
Dichlorophenoxyacetic acid per gallon. Specimen label use areas must include
small grains, pastures, rangelands, and other crops; and non-crop areas such 
as turf and roadside. Must also be labeled for aquatic weed control.

72 $22.18 $1,596.96 $34.98 $2,518.56 $26.02 $1,873.44 $22.825 $1,643.40

8 Oz. 3. Escort XP (60% Metsulfuron methyl) or approved generic alternative 64 $16.56 $1,059.84 $23.52 $1,505.28 No Bid No Bid $15.76 $1,008.64
16 Oz. 4. Escort XP (60% Metsulfuron methyl) or approved generic alternative 64 $31.68 $2,027.52 $45.12 $2,887.68 No Bid No Bid $31.52 $2,017.28
1 Quart 5. Esplanade 200 SC (19.05% Indaziflam) 4 $309.76 $1,239.04 $369.71 $1,478.84 No Bid No Bid $309.76 $1,239.04

2.5 Gallon 6. Milestone Specialty Herbicide- 40.6% Aminopyralid- pasture and roadside 
label, for Government Use 12 $692.50 $8,310.00 $929.50 $11,154.00 No Bid No Bid $692.50 $8,310.00

1 Gallon 7. BASF Plateau (23.6% Imazapic) or comparable approved product 72 $96.99 $6,983.28 $144.00 $10,368.00 $113.17 $8,148.24 $96.79 $6,968.88
2.5 Gallon 8. Non-ionic Surfactant, minimum 90% 144 $20.48 $2,949.12 $33.00 $4,752.00 $30.31 $4,364.64 $19.95 $2,872.80

1 Quart 9. Poly Control or similar approved drift control 96 $9.74 $935.04 $15.00 $1,440.00 No Bid No Bid $7.94 $762.24
1 Quart 10. Defoamer 96 $8.99 $863.04 $12.00 $1,152.00 $7.94 $762.24 $11.42 $1,096.32

No Bid CWC Chemical United Laboratories, Inc.

Crop Production 
Services

Morning Star 
Industries, Inc.

SiteOne Landscape 
Supply

Van Diest Supply 
Company

On the recommendation Kristen McGovern, on behalf of Noxious Weeds, Jennifer Dombaugh moved to accept the low bids for items 1, 2, 5, 6, and 10 from Crop Production Services and 
items 3 - 9 from Van Diest Supply Company for an initial purchase of $37,497.28 and establish contract pricing for one (1) year. Scott Hadley seconded the motion. The motion passed 
unanimously.

The department is dedicated to increasing crop production by reducing weed competition thus increasing the profit and sustainability of our agriculture partners. This is done through 
discounted herbicide sales for noxious weeds, custom prescribed vegetation management plans and educational messages. 

Note: SiteOne Landscape Supply withdrew their bid per K.S.A. 75-6904 (bids with nonjudgmental mistakes). The bid price for item 10 was for pints not quarts. 

Questions and Answers

Linda Kizzire: Are these items the public can go in and purchase from the Noxious Weed Department?

Mark Furry: Some of them are and some of them aren't. Some of them are exclusively for our use. The Esplanade is for in-house use only. The rest of them are for sale to the public.

Linda Kizzire: Are you happy with having two different vendors to provide the chemicals for you?

Mark Furry: Yes, that's typically what we get.


