OCA 230100

Wik 1GT~20 5
First Published in The Wichita Eagle on

CLEAN COPY DATE

ORDINANCE NO. I - @"5

AN ORDINANCE ADOPTING THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL
CODE, PUBLISHED BY THE INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL, INC,,
2012 EDITION, AND AMENDING, ADDING AND DELETING VARIOUS
SECTIONS OF ARTICLE 2 OF THE WICHITA/SEDGWICK COUNTY
UNIFIED BUILDING AND TRADE CODE.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF WICHITA,
KANSAS:
Section 1. Section 2.4.010 of the Wichita/Sedgwick County Unified Building and Trade

Code (the “UBTC™), is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 2.4.010. — Adoption of the International Residential Code. The International
Residential Code, as published by International Codes Council, Inc., 2012 Edition, is hereby

adopted, subject to such amendments as set forth hereinafter.

Section 2. Section 2.4.020 of the UBTC is hereby amended to read as foliows:

Sec. 2.4.020. — Permit Required.
Section R105.1 of the International Residential Code is amended to read as follows:

R105.1 Required Any owner or authorized agent who intends to construct, enlarge, alter,
repair, move, demolish, or change the occupancy of a building or structure, or to erect,
install, enlarge, alter, repair, remove, convert or replace any electrical, gas, mechanical or
plumbing system, or to cause any such work to be done, shall first make application to the
building official and obtain the required permit.

Wichita Jurisdiction Only

Whenever any work for which a permit is required by this Code has commenced without
first obtaining said permit, a civil penalty fee equal to the amount of the permit fee, as
determined by the Code Official, shall be collected in addition to the permit fee.



Section 3. Section 2.4.035 of the UBTC is hereby added to read as follows:
Sec. 2.4.035 — Exclusion of “hoop houses” from building code requirements.

A “hoop house” is defined as the following: A poly-tunnel (also known as a poly-house,
hoop greenhouse or hoop house, or high tunnel) made of polyethylene usually semi-
circular, square or elongated in shape. The interior heats up due to solar radiation from
the sun, thus warming plants, soil, and other things inside the building faster than heat can
escape the structure. Air warmed by the heat from hot interior suraces is retained in the
building by the roof and wall. Hoop houses, within this definition, are for residential use
only.

Structures that meet the definition of “hoop houses” are exempted from building permit
requirements or engineering specifications within this jurisdiction.

Section 4. Section 2.4.130 of the UBTC is hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec. 2.4.130. — Exterior Walls is deleted.

Section 5. Section 2.4.135 of the UBTC is hereby added to read as follows:

Sec. 2.4.135. — Three- and Four-family Dwellings.

Sec. R302.3.2 of the International Residential Code is hereby added to read as follows:

Dwelling units in three- and four-family dwellings shall be separated from each other by a
wall having not less than a two-hour fire-resistance rating. Fire-resistance-rated
floor/ceiling and wall assemblies shall extend to and be tight against an exterior wall, and
wall assemblies shall extend from the foundation to the underside of the roof sheathing.

The roof shall be a minimum of class C roof covering, and the roof decking or sheathing
is of non-combustible materials or approved fire-retardant-treated wood for a minimum
distance of two feet from the center of the wall. There shall be no penetrations through
this area of the roof deck or sheathing.

Exception: Where buildings, or portions thercof, are arranged above or below adjacent
units, an automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all units.

Section 6. Section 2.4.138 of the UBTC is hereby added to read as follows:
Sec. 2.4.138. — Opening Protection.

Section R302.5.1 of the International Residential Code is amended to read as follows:
2



R302.5.1 Opening protection. Openings from a private garage directly into a room used
for sleeping purposes shall not be permitted. Other openings between the garage and
residence shall be equipped with solid wood doors not less than 1 3/8 inches (35 mm) in
thickness, solid or honeycomb-core steel doors not less than 1 3/8 inches (35 mm) thick,
or 20-minute fire-rated doors.

Section 7. Section 2.4.160 of the UBTC is hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec. 2.4.160. — Stairway illumination.

Section R303.7 of the International Residential Code is amended to read as follows:

R303.7 Stairway Hiumination: All interior and exterior stairways shall be provided with
means to illuminate the stairway.

Section 8. Section 2.4.170 — Hazardous locations (former title) of the UBTC is hereby
amended to read as follows:

Sec. 2.4.170. — Reserved.

Section 9. Section 2.4.225 of the UBTC is hereby added to read as follows:

Sec. 2.4.225. — Drainage.

Section R310.2.2 of the International Residential Code is amended to read as follows:

R310.2.2 Drainage. Window wells shall be designed for proper drainage by connecting

to the existing foundation drainage system required by Section R405.1 or by an approved

alternative method. If no existing foundation drainage system has been installed, the

entire window well area shall have a minimum depth of 12 of washed gravel or crushed

rock below the floor level.

Exception: A drainage system for window wells is not required when the foundation is

on well-drained soil or sand-gravel mixture soils according to the U.S. Soil Classification

System, Group I Soils, as detailed in Table 405.1.

Section 10. Section 2.4.230 of the UBTC is hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec. 2.4.230. — Landings at doors.

Section R311.3.1 of the International Residential Code is amended to read as follows:

R311.3.1 Floor elevations at the required egress doors. The floor or landing at the
3



exterior door shall not be more than 1.5 inches (38 mm) lower than the top of the
threshold. The landing shall be permitted to have a slope not to exceed 0.25 unit vertical
in 12 units horizontal (2-percent).

Exceptions:

The exterior landing at an exterior doorway shall not be more than 8 (203 mm) inches
below the top of the threshold, provided that the door, other than an exterior storm or
screen door, does not swing over the landing.

Section 11, Section 2.4.235 of the UBTC is hereby added to read as follows:
Sec. 2.4.235. — Floor elevations for other exterior doors.
Section R311.3.2 of the International Residential Code is amended to read as follows:

R311.3.2 Floor elevations for other exterior doors. Doors other than the required egress
door shall be provided with landings or floors not more than 8 inches below the top of the
threshold.

Exception:

A landing is not required where a stairway of four or fewer risers is located on the
the door, provided the door does not swing over the stairway.

Section 12. Section 2.4.240 of the UBTC is hereby amended to read as follows:
Sec. 2.4.240. - Riser height.

Section R311.7.5.1 of the International Residential Code is amended to read as follows:

Riser height: The maximum riser height shall be 8 (203 mm) inches. The riser shall be
measured vertically between leading edges of the adjacent treads. The greatest riser height
within any flight of stairs shall not exceed the smallest by more than 3/8 inch (9.5 mm).

Section 13. Section 2.4.250 of the UBTC is hereby amended to read as follows:
Sec. 2.4.250. — Tread depth.

Sections R311.7.5.2 and R3.11.7.5.2.1 of the International Residential Code are amended
to read as follows:

R311.7.5.2 Tread depth. The minimum tread depth shall be 9 inches (228.6 mm). The
tread depth shall be measured horizontally between the vertical planes of the foremost
projection of adjacent treads and at a right angle to the tread's leading edge. The greatest

4



tread depth within any flight of stairs shall not exceed the smallest by more than 3/8 inch
(9.5 mm).

R311.7.5.2.1 Winder and circular treads. Winder and circular treads shall have a

minimum tread depth of 9 inches (228.6 mm) measured as above at a point 12 inches

(305 mm) from the side where the treads are narrower. Winder and circular treads shall

have a minimum tread depth of 6 inches (152 mm) at any point. Within any flight of

stairs, the largest winder or circular tread depth at the 12-inch (305 mm) walk line shall

not exceed the smallest by more than 3/8 inch (9.5 mm).

Section 14. Section 2.4.270 — Landings for stairways (former title) of the UBTC is
hereby amended to read as follows:

See. 2.4.270. — Reserved.

Section 15. Section 2.4.280 of the UBTC is hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec. 2.4.280. — Handrails,

Section R311.7.8.1 of the International Residential Code is amended to read as follows:

R311.7.8.1 Height. Handrail height, measured vertically from the sloped plane adjoining
the tread nosing, or finished surface of ramp slope, shall be not less than 32 inches (864
mm) and not more than 38 inches (965 mm).

Exceptions:

1. The use of a volute, turnout or starting easing shall be allowed over the lowest tread.

2. When handrail fittings or bendings are used to provide continuous transition between
flights, transitions at winder treads, the transition from handrail to guardrail, or used
at the start of a flight, the handrail height at the fittings or bendings shall be permitted
to exceed the maximum height.

Section 16. Section 2.4.290 of the UBTC is hereby amended to read as follows:
Sec. 2.4.290. — Handrails continuity.

Section R311.7.8.2 of the International Residential Code is amended to read as follows:

R311.7.8.2 Continuity. Handrails for stairways shall be continuous for the full length of
the flight, from a point directly above the top riser of the flight to a point directly above
5



the lowest riser of the flight. Handrail ends shall be returned to the wall or shall terminate
in newel posts or safety terminals at the top of each flight of stairs. Handrails adjacent to
a wall shall have a space of not less than 1.25 (32.5mm) inches between the wall and the
handrails.

Graspable portions of the handrail may not end up completely continuous from the top
riser to the bottom riser. The raii shall return to the wall.

Exceptions:
(1) Handrails shall be permitted to be interrupted by a newel post at the turn.

(2)  The use of a volute, turnout or starting easing, or starting newel shall be allowed
over the lowest tread.

Section 17. Section 2.4.300 of the UBTC is hereby amended to read as follows:
Sec. 2.4.300. — Handrail grip size.

Section R311.7.8.3 of the International Residential Code is amended to read as follows:

R311.7.8.3 Handrail grip size. All required handrails shall be of one of the following
types or provide equivalent graspability.

1. Type 1. Handrails with a circular cross section shall have an outside diameter of at
least 1% inches (32 mm) and not greater than 2 inches (51 mm). If the handraii is
not circular it shall have a perimeter dimension of at least 4 inches (102 mm) and
not greater than 6% inches (160 mm) with a maximum cross section of dimension
of 2% inches (57 mm).

2. Type II. Handrails with a perimeter greater than 6% inches (160 mm) shall provide
a graspable finger recess area on the outboard side of the profile. The finger recess
shall begin within a distance of % inch (19 mm) measured vertically from the
tallest portion of the profile and achieve a depth of at least 5/16 inch (8 mm)
within 7/8 inch (22 mm) below the widest portion of the profile. This required
depth shall continue for at least 3/8 inch (9.5 mm) to a level that is not less than
1% inches {45 mm) below the tallest portion of the profile. The minimum width of
the handrail above the recess shall be 1% inches (32 mm) to a maximum of 2%
inches (70 mm). Edges shall have a minimum radius of 0.01 inch (0.25 mm).

Section 18. Section 2.4.310 of the UBTC is hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec. 2.4.310. — Guard opening limitations.



Section R312.1.3 of the International Residential Code is amended to read as follows:
R312.1.3 Guard opening limitations. Required guards on open sides of stairways, raised
floor areas, balconies and porches shall have intermediate rails or ornamental closures
which do not allow passage of a sphere 4 % inches (114.3 mm) or more in diameter.
Required guards shall not be constructed with horizontal rails or other ornamental pattern
that results in a ladder effect.

Exceptions:

1. The triangular openings formed by the riser, tread and bottom rail of a guard at the
open side of a stairway are permitted to be of such a size that a sphere 6 inches (152 mm)

cannot pass through.

2. Openings for required guards on the sides of stair treads shall not allow sphere 4 '
inches (114.3 mm) to pass through.

Section 19. Section 2.4.315 of the UBTC is hereby created to read as follows:
Sec. 2.4.315. — Sec. R312.2 deleted.

Section R312.2 Window fall protection of the International Residential Code is hereby
deleted in its entirety.

Section 20. Section 2.4.318 of the UBTC is hereby created to read as follows:
Sec. 2.4.318. — Sec. R313 deleted.

Section R313 Automatic fire sprinkler systems of the International Residential Code is
hereby deleted in its entirety.

Section 21. Section 2.4.320 of the UBTC is hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec. 2.4.320. — Single- and multiple-station smoke alarms.

Section R314.3 of the International Residential Code is amended to read as follows:

R314.3 Location. Single and multiple-station smoke alarms shall be installed in the
following locations:

1. Outside of each separate sleeping area in the immediate vicinity of the bedrooms.

2. On each additional story of the dwelling, including basements and cellars but not
including crawl spaces and uninhabitable attics. In dwellings or dwelling units with split

7



levels and without an intervening door between the adjacent levels, a smoke alarm
installed on the upper level shall suffice for the adjacent lower level provided that the
lower level is less than one full story below the upper level.

Section 22. Section 2.4.325 of the UBTC is hereby added to read as follows:

Sec. 2.4.325. - Interconnection.

R314.5 Interconnection. Where more than one smoke alarm is required to be installed
within an individual dwelling unit in accordance with Section R314.3, the alarm devices
shall be interconnected in such a manner that the actuation of one alarm will activate all
of the alarms in the individual unit. Physical interconnection of smoke alarms shall not be
required where wireless alarms are installed & all alarms sound on activation of one
alarm. The alarm shall be clearly audible in all bedrooms over background noise levels
with all intervening doors closed.

Section 23. Section 2.4.332 of the UBTC is hereby added to read as follows:

Sec. 2.4.332. — Carbon monoxide alarms.

R315.1 Carbon monoxide alarms of the International Residential Code is amended to
read as follows:

R313.1 Carbon monoxide alarms. For new construction, an approved carbon monoxide
alarm shall be installed in dwelling units within which fuel-fired appliances are installed
and in dwelling units that have attached garages in the following locations:

1. QOutside each sleeping room in the immediate vicinity of the bedrooms.

2. On each additional story of the dwelling, including basements in the immediate
vicinity of the bedrooms or mechanical room.

Section 24. Section 2.4.335 of the UBTC is hereby added to read as follows:
Sec. 2.4.335. — Section R315.3 deleted.

Section R315.3 of the International Residential Code is hereby deleted in its entirety.
Carbon monoxide detectors are not required in existing homes.

Section 25. Section 2.4.350 of the UBTC is hereby amended to read as follows:
Sec. 2.4.350. — Protection against decay.

Section R317.1 of the International Residential Code is amended to read as follows:
8



R317.1 Location required. Protection from decay shall be provided in the following
locations by the use of naturally durable wood or wood that is preservative treated in
accordance with AWPA U1 for the species, product, preservative and end use.
Preservatives shall be listed in Section 4 of AWPA Ul.

1. Wood joists or the bottom of a wood structural floor when closer than 18 inches
(457 mm) or wood girders when closer than 12 inches (305 mm) to the exposed
ground in crawl spaces or unexcavated area located within the periphery of the

building foundation.

2. All wood framing members that rest on concrete or masonry exterior foundation
walls and are less than 6 inches (152 mm) from the exposed ground.

3. Sills and sleepers on a concrete or masonry slab that is in direct contact with the
ground unless separated from such slab by an impervious moisture barrier.

4. The ends of wood girders entering exterior masonry or concrete walls having
clearances of less than 0.5 inch (12.7 mm) on tops, sides and ends.

5. Wood siding, sheathing and wall framing on the exterior of a building having a
clearance of less than 6 inches (152 mm) from the ground.

6. Wood structural members supporting moisture-permeable floors or roofs that are
exposed to the weather, such as concrete or masonry slabs, unless separated from
such floors or roofs by an impervious moisture barrier.

Section 26. Section 2.4.360 — Section R319.1.1 deleted (former title) of the UBTC is

hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec. 2.4.360. — Section R318.1.1 deleted.

Section R318.1.1 of the International Residential Code is hereby deleted.

Section 27. Section 2.4.370 — Section R320.1.2 deleted (former title) of the UBTC is

hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec. 2.4.370. — Section R318.1.2 deleted.

Section R318.1.2 of the International Residential Code is hereby deleted.

Section 28. Section 2.4.380 — Section R324 deleted (former title) of the UBTC is hereby
S



amended to read as follows:
Sec. 2.4.380. — Section R322 deleted.
Section R322 of the International Residential Code is hereby deleted.
Section 29. Section 2.4.455 of the UBTC is hereby added to read as follows:
Sec. 2.4.455. — Section R405.1 deleted.
Section R405.1 of the International Residential Code is hereby deleted.
Section 30. Section 2.4.480 — Section R502.2.2 created (former titie) of the UBTC is
hereby amended to read as follows:
Sec. 2.4.480. — Decks.
Section R507 of the International Residential Code is amended to read as follows:
R507 Decks. The "City of Wichita Standard for Residential Wood Framed Decks" may be
used to design and construct decks to comply with the requirements of this section. Decks
which fall outside of the scope of the standard will require design by a Kansas licensed
architect or engineer. Where supported by attachment to an exterior wall, decks shall be
positively anchored to the primary structure and designed for both vertical and lateral
loads as applicable. Such attachment shall not be accomplished by the use of toenails or
nails subject to withdrawal. Where positive connection to the primary building structure
canniot be verified during inspection, decks shall be self-supporting. For decks with
cantilevered framing members, connections to exterior walls or other framing members,
shall be designed and constructed to resist uplift resulting from the full live load specified
in Table R301.5 acting on the cantilevered portion of the deck.
Section 31. Section 2.4.490 — Section R506.2.3 deleted (former title) of the UBTC is
hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec. 2.4.490. — Section R506.2.2 deleted.

Section R506.2.2 of the International Residential Code is hereby deleted.
Section 32.  Section 2.4.510 of the UBTC is hereby amended to read as follows:

Sec. 2.4.510. — Cement, fiber-cement and glass mat gypsum backers.

10



Section R702.4.2 of the International Residential Code is amended to read as follows:
R702.4.2 Cement, fiber-cement or glass mat gypsum backers in compliance with ASTM
C 1288, C 1325 or C 1178 and installed in accordance with manufacturers’

recommendations shall be used as backers for wall tile in shower areas and wall panels in
shower areas.

This ordinance shall be included in the Code of the City of Wichita, Kansas, and shall be
effective upon its passage and publication once in the official city paper, but no sooner than July

1,2015.

PASSED by the governing body , this U _WAX dayof bLW_ , 2015.

11



[EGAL PUBLICATION

DATE
Y THE

- ¥o. ol "
L A WAL RESIDENTIAL CODE, PUBLISHED §

ﬂmmwc ,m’:;eoleOLu, AND AMENOING ADDING AND DELETING
£ m“w"ub, {5 THE WICHITA/SEDGWICK COUNTY UNIFIED BUILDING
AR
i

THE CITY OF WICHITA, KANSAS:
“%m Upified Buacang arg Trade Code (iR “GBTC . s

Code. The Inerratrons Resigentlal Cooe, a5
inc., 22 Eghion, it herehy adonlpd SuDIECT fo sk amendrnenis as

- trtematiznal
TN T i
|

e 6.yt e UBTC s PecebY BMEOURA 10 762035 dlows

Joaas Resndential Code i3 amended fa read as b

¢ nr sutherized agent whe intends fo censiruc!, enlarae, alter, repmr move, !
e qocucency ol a Duicing or slructure, or | erect, insial, evarge, aite:, "eRai, remese, |

"dommaish, oy ewcincai, Uss. meChaNicnl 0r plumBing svstem or 15 CaWsE anv such wirk o be done,

wuz:ls?rmr:::ﬂ" Tion o M briikdiskd OHicial and cbiain he required cermil.

n 380

weork lor Which & permil Is required by this Code has commenced wilkoul hrst obtainiog said
. aver B¢ iy fae Baud; 10 1he amount of Ihe permit feg, 25 determined by the Code Officlal, shall be
+ permil. 3 civll oot e permil fet.

ed -m ‘4 13501 fhe UBTC 15 hereby added laread as folaws:

E :35 & xcussgn of “HO0R NOUTRS® from bulking code roquirements.
?‘mﬁ e v afined 43 It [odowind: A polv-tunrel (also Knawn 2.3 poly-NoUse, hoop Freenhoyse or Rook
housk, o gh tonnel) made of polvelyléne usualty semu-circular, square or elongaied in shape. The interlor
heats up due 1o solar TaciBtoA frorn the sun, i warming phants, 503, end olher inings insice the building faster
Ihan heat can sscasd the skructure Air warmed by the hest [rom bet Inferior suraces is reiaingd In the building
by Ine roof and wail Hooo bowses, within ths defindiion, are for residenlisi usa only
Siruciures that meel the defnilion of “hoop houses® arg exempled iram buiiding permit requirements of
enginearing specifications within Ihis lurisdiclion.
sachan 4. Section 2430 of the UBTC |5 hereby amended ta read as fodows:
Sec. 2413 - Exterlar Wabs is deleted.

Section 5. Sechion 14,135 of the UBTC is hereoy acded Y read as fodows.
Sec 24135, - Three- and Four-famby i

Sec. RI02.3.7 of the Infernations! Residenilat Code is hereby added o raad as folows:

Dweling ity i Sree- prd four-kamily dwellings shal be senarated irom each other by a wall having no! less
npn a hwo-hour fire-resislance rating, Fire-resisfance-rated foor/cailing 2and wall assembiies shall exiend o
and be Iighl apains] an exierior wail, and wall assemblies shal exiend from the foungation Jo Ihe underside of
he roof sheaiting. - . )

The roof shak be & minimum of ctass € root covering, and Ihe roof deciing o sheathing is of nan-combustible
malerials or apsrovad fire-relaraant- wrealed wood for a minimum distance of twa feed from g Center of the
wall, There sha be no pensirations Ihrougs this arex of e root deck or sheathing,

Excertan: Where bulidings, or portions ereod, are arrangsd sbove of below adiacen) units, an automalic
sarlakler system shall be provided throughaut alf units.

Secllan &, Seciion 24,138 of the UBTC is hereby added fo read as fobows:
$u¢. L4138, - Opening Protection.

Seclion RFLS.) of te laternalicand Residentiat Codi Is amended fo reac as follows:

R7.5.1 Opening pratection. Openings trom b privala garage directiy inta 2 room used for sleeping surposes
shatt not be permilied. Oiver openings belween te garage and residence shall be equipoed with sofid wood
doars ot hess than 1 378 inches 135 mm) in thickness, selid or honeycomb-core steel doars not less than | 318
tnches (35 mm) thick, or 20-miaute fire—raled doses.

Section 7. Section 24163 of Ihe UBTC it herstry amanded lo read by folowy:

Sac. L4160, - Stalrway Sumination -

Section R3L7 of the International Residentiat Code |s amerded 10 reac as follows:
R0 Stairway Rurmins!ior A interlor aad exterior slairways shad be provided with means ko uminate the
slairway

Sectlon 3. Section 2 & 170 - Hazardous locations (former THlle) of he UBTC s hereoy amended 10 read as oilows:
Sag 24170 - Reserved

Saction ¥, Seclion 2.4.225 of the UBTC Is hareby added ko read as follows:
S LATS, - Drainage.
Saction R210.2.2 of the imernational Residential Code is amendad 1o read as folows:

R310.2.7 Drairags. Windaw wels shall b deslgned lor proger drainage by connecting (o the #xitling foundalion
rainage system réquired by Section R425.1 of by an eporavad alternative mathod. If no axisling foundation
drainace System has been insalled, the entire window wel area shall hava 3 Minisum cesth of 12° of washed
graves or crushed rock below the fioor level

Excepfion: A drainage sysiem jor window wabs [s nof required when the feundation is.on welkdrained sof or
sand-gravel mixturs solls secording fa the U.S. Soll Classification System, Group | Softs, as detafied in Tabie

4054,

Sectton H. Seciion 2.4.130 of the UBTC Is heraby amended 1o resd a3 follows:!

Sec 24.730. - Landings 21 doors.

Saction K311,15 of the Inbernalionsl Hesideniial Code is amended To radd as follows:

RITILI Flodr aievations at tha required egress deors. The fioor or landing al the ¢xtarier door shel not be more
1han 1.6 inches {38 mm) lawar {han tha fop of the threshold, The landing shell be permitied fo have & siope not 1o
gc;;&iml verdical in 12 unils horizontal {2-percent).

The sxerior landing at an exterior soorwey shall net be more than B (20 rmen} inches Delow the fop of the
thresnaty, provided 1hat ihe door, other Ihan an exterior siorm or screen £60r, does nol 3wing over the landiog.
Section 1, Seclion 24135 of the UBTC is heraby added to read as bollows:
Sec, ZA.135, - Floar elgwations tor other exterior doory,
Sechon R311.12 of [he international Residential Code is Amanded Jo read #s fBows:
R31E12 Fioor elevalions for othar exisrior doors. Doors ather 1han the reduited egress oo shall ba Arovided
with landings or loors nel more Ihan 8 inches belaw the top of the threshold.
Excepfion:
” A Nanging i3 not required whers & stairway of four or fewer risqrs i localed on the the door, provided the door
% 083 nat Swing over Ine staurway

: Sectlon k2 Sackion 2.4.240 of the UBTC is hereby amended to reed a5 fokows:

241 - height.

" S;Fﬂun RIN1.75.1 of the Internalional Resldeniial Cocle is amended 10 rean a3 fuilows: .

o ”“: jghl: The maximum riser height shad be § (203 mm} inches. The riser shall be measured verlically
R entaading ecges oi the adiacent Ireads. The greales! risec height wilhin amy flight of stales shall not exceed
=8 smalfest by more Ihan 3/8 inch {9.5 mm).

. *!" 6 43, Sectin 24250 of the LBTC is herebr amended lo raed as follows:

. - Trend depth,
Sechors R311.7 5.2 aad RY.1
7487 Tread depth. Tha

| of the International Residential Code are amended to read S foows:
" Almum fread depth shall be 9 inches (2204 mm). The traad deplh shall be
~ pmared horionta between fe veriical sianesof L foremas! poieclion uf adiacan Ireacs and ol 8 oant
" by ocre g o 30t e reales!fead deoth witin an gt of stairs sha not exceed Ihe smatest
- R3N ).
! Jimi\ f) Wincer and circutar ireads, Winder and Circular treads sball have a minimum i-aad depth of § inches
o Wiy gy eosured 25 above 3t a point 12 inches (308 mem} from the side where 1he fraads are narrawer
e - Mgt o1 ,m;"fhfﬂf Ireads shall hava & minimur Iread deeth of § inchés {152 mem) a7 any point, Wilhin any
ETiadny by o 18ges! winder or circular tread cepth at the 12-is <h (305 mm) walk fine shall nal exceed lhe
%“-S'cot: then 378 inch (9.5 mym},
Sc2iom w - Landings for stairways iormer ie) of the UBTC is hareby amended lo read as follows.

ST Sechon 7.4
sdra

LATH . i,

. m ﬂ?sm ol the UBTC 15 hereby amended 1o read as follows:
it LOIRER ; "
A Lagh ?QL‘;J: Ne+salional Resicenial Code Is amendad Io read as folows:
S0 inge ot caens s'lo"m'". measurad vertically from Ing sicced Mane soioiring Ihe iread noslag, or
Pe, shail be not less Than 32 inches (864 mml and not mors than 3 inches (943 mmy,
4 ¥0lta g
QPSR gy 0% o ariing easing sl oo eflowe oyer she lowes! Ireac.
Jranulion hltm Bre ised lo provide c iransiion | Tilgns, Iransitions 3t
Mg gt bem handrait 1o guardrail, or Lsad al ihe siari i & flignt, the handrall height al
B e e Derrritted 1o exceed the maximurn heighs
iy o h‘iETC 15 fiereby amended Jo read 85 iolows!

~ ﬂMNWMlm;u [

by amended 10 read as follows:

Sachion 18 Sechion 24310 0f the GBTC 18
Sec. 24310, - Guars cpeaing hmitations.
Section R312.1.3 of the Internationzi Reside
RIIZ 13 Guarg poenng hmilalions Reus
gng norches 3nall have intermedizte rails
incties {113 mm) of mose In diameles. R
grnamental patiern Mal resulls ir & [dce fiect,
Exceptions:
{ The iranguiar cpenings formea oy e 7
perrnifted to be of such a SiZe that a son
7 Gpemnas Yo requird Quards on ine
Boas lreush
Section 19, Sechon 1.4 31 of tnz YBT3
Sec. LAITS, - Sec. RI12.2 deteted.
Saclion R112.2 inoow fak protechonof}
Soction 10, Secton 74318 of the UBIC &
Sec. LAJHL - Sec. RI1i duted
Saction RI1 Automalic fire sprinkiar sys
enlirery. .
Sackion 21. Section 2.4.320 of the UBTC s
Sec. 14,120, - Single- and multiphe-station
Saclion RI14.3 of the Inlernationa| Resid
R714.3 Locatlon. Siagle and muttiple-s!
1. Quiside of each separale sleéping area
2 On each sckdiional slory of the dweling
unirhabifable aliics i dwellings or dwe
adlacen] fevels, a smoke alsrm installe
thal the kower lavel is tess 1han one ful 3
Section 72, Section 24325 of the UBTL &6
Sec. 2.4.325, - Wtercomection.
‘RI4F (mierconnection Where more
cwelling unil in accordance wilk Seclion §
the aciuation of one alarm will activale al
iarms shal 2ot be required where wirel
The alarm shail be clearty aucibb in afl b
Saction 73 Section 2.4.332 of the UBTC ks
Sec, 2.4.172, - Carbon monpxide alarms,
R115.1 Carbon moraxide alarms of the I
R315.1 Carbon manoxide alerms, For ng
In dwelling uaits within which fuei-fired a
garages in [he folowling focations:
E. Custsige 4ach sloeping raoim in the
2. On each addiiional siory of the dwelllngiacis
mechanical room.
Section 24, Secfion 74335 of the UBTCIs
Sec. L4135, - Section RI5.] dateted,
Section RA15. of the International ResideliBal Code i hereby delated in its entirely. Carbon menoxide datecto
are nbt required 2 exisling homes.
Sechion 25, Saction 24350 of tha UBTC is
Set 24.350, - Proteciion against decay.
Section R117.1 of the infsrnational Resida
R3111 Location nequired Protection fro
naturaly durahle wood or wood Hiat Is piis
product, preservative and end usd. Pres
1. Wood [oists or the boHar of a wood s

ial Coce 15 amended 10 #gad ab lollows.

f cuards on cren 1ioes of SIKrWaYS, raised figor zreas, balcones
ornamental ciosures which 4o nol aliow pasiesa of a sphere 4 %4
ired quards snall no! be constructed with noritontat ralis o ofher

r. e éad 57 botlom raif of o gudrd al the coen slde of 3 statrway are
inches [152 mmi cannat pass through.
5 of 3tair Ireads shall no! a¥ow sphere 4 ' inches (1143 mm) fo

ohv oraater ko read as folows:

International Reswaeniial Code is nerecy deieted in s entlraly.
2QY CrEAIEd 10 reau ab 10w,

of Ing Internationai Residentis Code is hareby deleted in s

ey amendet 1o read as lollows:

ke 3L
pl Coc2 18 ATERTE0 10 FE30 83 10/0Wws.
smoke aiarms shalf be instatied In tha folowing locations:
The Fnmediate victnity of tha bedrooms
nciuding basernenls and cellars but nos Including craw! spaces s
g unifs with spiTt levels and wilhout an inlervaning door belwees th
bn the uppyr level shak sutice for 1he adiacent lower tavel provids:
ry below the ugpar leval.

eby addes to read as follows:

Al one smicks alarm is recuired fo be nstatied withip an individu
4.3, the slarm devices shall ba interconnecied in such a manner th
I 1he atarms in Ihe individual unil. Physical interconneciion of smok
aiarms are inslalled & al alarms sound on activation of one alern
aes aver Backgeound noise ievats with af intervening doors close
by added ¥ read as iollows: ®

naliongl Reskientix Code ts amented lo read 25 follows:
onstruclion, an appraved carbor monoide darm shal e inslalie
lFances are instalied and in dwelling unils that have altached

iale vichity of the bedrooms.
g basements i the Emmedinte vicknily of e bedrooms o

reby atded fo rand as follows:

by amenced to reac a1 folows:

2l Code is amended fo read &4 fobows:
rincay shat be provided In fhw following tocations by the use of
ative treated in accordance wilh AWPA Ul for the spacies,
attves shall be listed in Secliond of AWPA UL
urst floor wiven ciosar tan 1Binches (457 mm) or wood glrders

when closer inan 12 Incties (35 men} igline expased grolind in Crawl spaCes or unexcavated area localed
within the periphery of the buliding fouliBation.
2. AB wood framing members that rest i concrete or masonry exterior Rundation was and are less Iha
Inches (157 mm) from the exposed gro
3 Siis and slespers on A CONCIete of M.
such slah by an impervicus molsture 3
4, The ands of wood glrders eniering exh
{127 mm} on tops, sides and ends.
5, Wood siting, sheathing and wall frami]
{152 emn) from the ground.
& Wood siructurat members supperiingld
such as comcrate of masoncy slabos,
barrier,
Sachion 26, Sectlon 243480 - Section R
fotaws.
Sor, LAMA - Section RIEL LI deieind.
Section RI14.1.1 of he international Res
Saction I7. Sechion 2470 - Secrion R320.1
$pc. 24,370 - Section RILL!.2 deleted.
Section R330.1.2 of the International Res
Saction 78, Section 2.4.380 - Seclion R4
Sec. 24380, - Section RAZ2 dalefed.
Saction R322 of Iha infernational Reside
saction 29, Section 2.4455 of the UBTC ig
Sac, 14455 - Section R30S ] delehed.

Section R405.1 of Ihe International Resld|
Sectlon 30. Section 2,4.480 - Section REELD
Sec. TAASD, - Decks.

Section RS07 o 'he International Residel

R307 Dechs. The *City of Wichiia Slang
comsiruct decks ta compty with ihe re
standard wil require design Dy a Xansa
axierior wati, decks shall be posiiively
lateral wads as applicante, Such AHaCH
withdrawal. Whare casilive connection
gecks shail be seif-supnoriing. For de
or oiher framing members, skall be g
wpecified in Table RI01.5 acting on Ihe
Sectien 31. Seclian 2.4.490 - Sechion R504.2
Sac, 2449, - Section RE04.2.2 delatod.
Sectton RE06.2.2 of the International R
Sechon 32 Section 24.510 of the UBTC &
Sec. 14510 - Coment, fiber-coment andilass mat gypsim backers.

Saction RT024 2 of the Interrations! Reslientizl Coce is amended to raad 8s follows:
R702.42 Cement, fiber-cement or oiéseinal gvasuim backers in comepliance wilh ASTM C 1288, C 1325

sab that i In direct contact with the ground uniess separated fr

or Masonry or concraie walls having clearances of fess than 051

on the exterior of a building having a ciearance of iess than & inc.

nishre-permeatie foors or roods thal are exposed fo the weatt
&43 separaied from such floors o roods by an imasrvious molst

' deloted (Yormer fite) of te BBTC is herety amended to rea

lial Code s herety thteled,
iolgtad (darmer tlig) of the UBTC (& hereoy amendad lo read as folk

ntial Code is hereby deleied.
lelect ormar Tille) of he UBTL s herehy amended to read&s fok

il Code s hereby deteted.
ereby adoad 10 read as foflows:

liai Code is hereby deleied,
reated (Former 1ithe) of e WS TC Ia Tty amentiad o read as ioh

2l Code Is amended 1o read a3 fodows:

d for Residential Wood Framed Dacks’ may be used fo design
brements of this section. Decks which Jed oulside of the scope o
icensed archilect or enginser Where supperled by altachment
ared 16 the primary siruchore and desighed for both verlica
nl shal not be accompiished by the Lsa of teenalis or nails subit
Iha primary bufkhing siructure canhol be veréfied during inspec
with canklevered framing members, conasctians o exleriar
pne and consiructed 1o resist uekil residting Irom ine fult five
twvarad portion of the deck.

delered fiormer lille) of e UB TC is hereby amenoed foread as 1o/

bnfial Coce is hereby deleres.
eredy amended fo read as [oliows:



