
OCA 230100

First Published in The Wichita Eagle on Q 1 q ` 7 " 

IS

CLEAN COPY DATE

ORDINANCE NOM

AN ORDINANCE ADOPTING THE INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL

CODE, PUBLISHED BY THE INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL, INC., 

2012 EDITION, AND AMENDING, ADDING AND DELETING VARIOUS

SECTIONS OF ARTICLE 2 OF THE WICHITA /SEDGWICK COUNTY

UNIFIED BUILDING AND TRADE CODE. 

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE GOVERNING BODY OF THE CITY OF WICHITA, 

fLI7MM11

Section 1. Section 2.4. 010 of the Wichita/ Sedgwick County Unified Building and Trade

Code ( the " UBTC "), is hereby amended to read as follows: 

Section 2. 4. 010. — Adoption of the International Residential Code. The International

Residential Code, as published by International Codes Council, Inc., 2012 Edition, is hereby

adopted, subject to such amendments as set forth hereinafter. 

Section 2. Section 2. 4.020 of the UBTC is hereby amended to read as follows: 

Sec. 2. 4. 020. — Permit Required. 

Section R105. 1 of the International Residential Code is amended to read as follows: 

R105.1 Required. Any owner or authorized agent who intends to construct, enlarge, alter, 
repair, move, demolish, or change the occupancy of a building or structure, or to erect, 
install, enlarge, alter, repair, remove, convert or replace any electrical, gas, mechanical or
plumbing system, or to cause any such work to be done, shall first make application to the
building official and obtain the required permit. 

Wichita Jurisdiction Only

Whenever any work for which a permit is required by this Code has commenced without
first obtaining said permit, a civil penalty fee equal to the amount of the permit fee, as
determined by the Code Official, shall be collected in addition to the permit fee. 



Section 3. Section 2. 4. 035 of the UBTC is hereby added to read as follows: 

Sec. 2. 4.035 — Exclusion of "hoop houses" from building code requirements. 

A " hoop house" is defined as the following: A poly - tunnel ( also known as a poly- house, 
hoop greenhouse or hoop house, or high tunnel) made of polyethylene usually semi- 
circular, square or elongated in shape. The interior heats up due to solar radiation from
the sun, thus warming plants, soil, and other things inside the building faster than heat can
escape the structure. Air warmed by the heat from hot interior suraces is retained in the
building by the roof and wall. Hoop houses, within this definition, are for residential use
only. 

Structures that meet the definition of "hoop houses" are exempted from building permit
requirements or engineering specifications within this jurisdiction, 

Section 4. Section 2. 4. 130 of the UBTC is hereby amended to read as follows: 

Sec. 2. 4. 130. — Exterior Walls is deleted. 

Section 5. Section 2. 4. 135 of the UBTC is hereby added to read as follows: 

See. 2.4.135. — Three- and Four - family Dwellings. 

Sec. R302.3. 2 of the International Residential Code is hereby added to read as follows: 

Dwelling units in three- and four- family dwellings shall be separated from each other by a

wall having not less than a two -hour fire- resistance rating. Fire - resistance -rated
floor /ceiling and wall assemblies shall extend to and be tight against an exterior wall, and
wall assemblies shall extend from the foundation to the underside of the roof sheathing. 

The roof shall be a minimum of class C roof covering, and the roof decking or sheathing
is of non - combustible materials or approved fire - retardant - treated wood for a minimum

distance of two feet from the center of the wall. There shall be no penetrations through

this area of the roof deck or sheathing. 

Exception: Where buildings, or portions thereof, are arranged above or below adjacent

units, an automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all units. 

Section 6. Section 2. 4. 138 of the UBTC is hereby added to read as follows: 

Sec. 2.4. 138. — Opening Protection. 

Section R302.5. 1 of the International Residential Code is amended to read as follows: 



R302.5.1 Opening protection. Openings from a private garage directly into a room used
for sleeping purposes shall not be permitted. Other openings between the garage and
residence shall be equipped with solid wood doors not less than 1 3/ 8 inches ( 35 mm) in

thickness, solid or honeycomb -core steel doors not less than 1 3/ 8 inches ( 35 mm) thick, 

or 20- minute fire -rated doors. 

Section 7. Section 2. 4. 160 of the UBTC is hereby amended to read as follows: 

Sec. 2. 4.160. — Stairway illumination. 

Section R303. 7 of the International Residential Code is amended to read as follows: 

R303. 7 Stairway Illumination: All interior and exterior stairways shall be provided with
means to illuminate the stairway. 

Section 8. Section 2. 4. 170 — Hazardous locations ( former title) of the UBTC is hereby

amended to read as follows: 

Sec. 2.4.170. — Reserved. 

Section 9. Section 2. 4.225 of the UBTC is hereby added to read as follows: 

Sec. 2. 4.225. — Drainage. 

Section R310.2.2 of the International Residential Code is amended to read as follows: 

R310.2. 2 Drainage. Window wells shall be designed for proper drainage by connecting
to the existing foundation drainage system required by Section R405. 1 or by an approved
alternative method. If no existing foundation drainage system has been installed, the
entire window well area shall have a minimum depth of 12" of washed gravel or crushed

rock below the floor level. 

Exception: A drainage system for window wells is not required when the foundation is

on well- drained soil or sand - gravel mixture soils according to the U.S. Soil Classification
System, Group I Soils, as detailed in Table 405. 1. 

Section 10. Section 2.4.230 of the UBTC is hereby amended to read as follows: 

Sec. 2. 4. 230. — Landings at doors. 

Section R311. 3. 1 of the International Residential Code is amended to read as follows: 

R311. 3. 1 Floor elevations at the required egress doors. The floor or landing at the



exterior door shall not be more than 1. 5 inches ( 38 mm) lower than the top of the

threshold. The landing shall be permitted to have a slope not to exceed 0. 25 unit vertical
in 12 units horizontal ( 2- percent). 

Exceptions: 

The exterior landing at an exterior doorway shall not be more than 8 ( 203 mm) inches
below the top of the threshold, provided that the door, other than an exterior storm or
screen door, does not swing over the landing. 

Section 11. Section 2. 4.235 of the UBTC is hereby added to read as follows: 

Sec. 2. 4.235. — Floor elevations for other exterior doors. 

Section R311. 3. 2 of the International Residential Code is amended to read as follows: 

R311. 3. 2 Floor elevations for other exterior doors. Doors other than the required egress

door shall be provided with landings or floors not more than 8 inches below the top of the
threshold. 

Exception: 

A landing is not required where a stairway of four or fewer risers is located on the
the door, provided the door does not swing over the stairway. 

Section 12. Section 2. 4. 240 of the UBTC is hereby amended to read as follows: 

Sec. 2. 4.240. — Riser height. 

Section R311. 7. 5. 1 of the International Residential Code is amended to read as follows: 

Riser height: The maximum riser height shall be 8 ( 203 mm) inches. The riser shall be

measured vertically between leading edges of the adjacent treads. The greatest riser height
within any flight of stairs shall not exceed the smallest by more than 3/ 8 inch (9.5 mm). 

Section 13. Section 2.4.250 of the UBTC is hereby amended to read as follows: 

Sec. 2. 4.250. — Tread depth. 

Sections R311. 7. 5. 2 and R3. 11. 7. 5. 2. 1 of the International Residential Code are amended

to read as follows: 

R311. 7.5.2 Tread depth. The minimum tread depth shall be 9 inches ( 228. 6 mm). The

tread depth shall be measured horizontally between the vertical planes of the foremost
projection of adjacent treads and at a right angle to the tread's leading edge. The greatest

4



tread depth within any flight of stairs shall not exceed the smallest by more than 3/ 8 inch
9.5 mm). 

R311. 7. 5. 2. 1 Winder and circular treads. Winder and circular treads shall have a

minimum tread depth of 9 inches ( 228. 6 mm) measured as above at a point 12 inches

305 mm) from the side where the treads are narrower. Winder and circular treads shall

have a minimum tread depth of 6 inches ( 152 mm) at any point. Within any flight of
stairs, the largest winder or circular tread depth at the 12 -inch ( 305 mm) walk line shall

not exceed the smallest by more than 3/ 8 inch ( 9. 5 mm). 

Section 14. Section 2. 4. 270 — Landings for stairways ( former title) of the UBTC is

hereby amended to read as follows: 

Sec. 2.4.270. — Reserved. 

Section 15. Section 2. 4. 280 of the UBTC is hereby amended to read as follows: 

Sec. 2. 4.280. — Handrails. 

Section R311. 7. 8. 1 of the International Residential Code is amended to read as follows: 

R311. 7. 8. 1 Height. Handrail height, measured vertically from the sloped plane adjoining
the tread nosing, or finished surface of ramp slope, shall be not less than 32 inches ( 864
mm) and not more than 38 inches ( 965 mm). 

Exceptions: 

1. The use of a volute, turnout or starting easing shall be allowed over the lowest tread. 

2. When handrail fittings or bendings are used to provide continuous transition between

flights, transitions at winder treads, the transition from handrail to guardrail, or used

at the start of a flight, the handrail height at the fittings or bendings shall be permitted

to exceed the maximum height. 

Section 16. Section 2.4.290 of the UBTC is hereby amended to read as follows: 

Sec. 2. 4.290. — Handrails continuity. 

Section R311. 7. 8. 2 of the International Residential Code is amended to read as follows: 

R311. 7. 8.2 Continuity. Handrails for stairways shall be continuous for the full length of
the flight, from a point directly above the top riser of the flight to a point directly above

5



the lowest riser of the flight. Handrail ends shall be returned to the wall or shall terminate

in newel posts or safety terminals at the top of each flight of stairs. Handrails adjacent to
a wall shall have a space of not less than 1. 25 ( 32.5mm) inches between the wall and the

handrails. 

Graspable portions of the handrail may not end up completely continuous from the top
riser to the bottom riser. The rail shall return to the wall. 

Exceptions: 

1) Handrails shall be permitted to be interrupted by a newel post at the turn. 

2) The use of a volute, turnout or starting easing, or starting newel shall be allowed
over the lowest tread. 

Section 17. Section 2. 4.300 of the UBTC is hereby amended to read as follows: 

Sec. 2. 4.300. — Handrail grip size. 

Section R311. 7. 8. 3 of the International Residential Code is amended to read as follows: 

R311. 7. 8.3 Handrail grip size. All required handrails shall be of one of the following
types or provide equivalent graspability. 

1. Type I. Handrails with a circular cross section shall have an outside diameter of at

least 1'/ 4 inches ( 32 mm) and not greater than 2 inches ( 51 mm). If the handrail is

not circular it shall have a perimeter dimension of at least 4 inches ( 102 mm) and

not greater than 6%4 inches ( 160 mm) with a maximum cross section of dimension

of 21/4 inches ( 57 mm). 

2. Type II. Handrails with a perimeter greater than 6'/4 inches ( 160 mm) shall provide

a graspable finger recess area on the outboard side of the profile. The finger recess

shall begin within a distance of 3/ 4 inch ( 19 mm) measured vertically from the
tallest portion of the profile and achieve a depth of at least 5/ 16 inch ( 8 mm) 

within 7/ 8 inch ( 22 mm) below the widest portion of the profile. This required

depth shall continue for at least 3/ 8 inch ( 9. 5 mm) to a level that is not less than

1'/ 4 inches ( 45 mm) below the tallest portion of the profile. The minimum width of

the handrail above the recess shall be 1'/ 4 inches ( 32 mm) to a maximum of 23/4

inches ( 70 mm). Edges shall have a minimum radius of 0. 01 inch (0.25 mm). 

Section 18. Section 2. 4.3 10 of the UBTC is hereby amended to read as follows: 

Sec. 2.4.310. — Guard opening limitations. 

0



Section R312. 1. 3 of the International Residential Code is amended to read as follows: 

R312.1. 3 Guard opening limitations. Required guards on open sides of stairways, raised
floor areas, balconies and porches shall have intermediate rails or ornamental closures

which do not allow passage of a sphere 4 %2 inches ( 114. 3 mm) or more in diameter. 

Required guards shall not be constructed with horizontal rails or other ornamental pattern

that results in a ladder effect. 

Exceptions: 

1. The triangular openings formed by the riser, tread and bottom rail of a guard at the
open side of a stairway are permitted to be of such a size that a sphere 6 inches ( 152 mm) 
cannot pass through. 

2. Openings for required guards on the sides of stair treads shall not allow sphere 4V2

inches ( 114. 3 mm) to pass through. 

Section 19. Section 2. 4. 315 of the UBTC is hereby created to read as follows: 

Sec. 2. 4.315. — Sec. R312. 2 deleted. 

Section R312.2 Window fall protection of the International Residential Code is hereby
deleted in its entirety. 

Section 20. Section 2. 4.318 of the UBTC is hereby created to read as follows: 

Sec. 2. 4.318. — Sec. R313 deleted. 

Section R313 Automatic fire sprinkler systems of the International Residential Code is

hereby deleted in its entirety. 

Section 21. Section 2. 4. 320 of the UBTC is hereby amended to read as follows: 

Sec. 2. 4.320. — Single- and multiple- station smoke alarms. 

Section R314.3 of the International Residential Code is amended to read as follows: 

R314.3 Location. Single and multiple- station smoke alarms shall be installed in the

following locations: 

1. Outside of each separate sleeping area in the immediate vicinity of the bedrooms. 

2. On each additional story of the dwelling, including basements and cellars but not
including crawl spaces and uninhabitable attics. In dwellings or dwelling units with split

7



levels and without an intervening door between the adjacent levels, a smoke alarm
installed on the upper level shall suffice for the adjacent lower level provided that the
lower level is less than one full story below the upper level. 

Section 22. Section 2.4. 325 of the UBTC is hereby added to read as follows: 

Sec. 2. 4.325. — Interconnection. 

R314.5 Interconnection. Where more than one smoke alarm is required to be installed

within an individual dwelling unit in accordance with Section R314.3, the alarm devices
shall be interconnected in such a manner that the actuation of one alarm will activate all

of the alarms in the individual unit. Physical interconnection of smoke alarms shall not be

required where wireless alarms are installed & all alarms sound on activation of one

alarm. The alarm shall be clearly audible in all bedrooms over background noise levels
with all intervening doors closed. 

Section 23. Section 2.4.332 of the UBTC is hereby added to read as follows: 

Sec. 2. 4.332. — Carbon monoxide alarms. 

R315. 1 Carbon monoxide alarms of the International Residential Code is amended to

read as follows: 

R315. 1 Carbon monoxide alarms. For new construction, an approved carbon monoxide

alarm shall be installed in dwelling units within which fuel -fired appliances are installed
and in dwelling units that have attached garages in the following locations: 

1. Outside each sleeping room in the immediate vicinity of the bedrooms. 

2. On each additional story of the dwelling, including basements in the immediate
vicinity of the bedrooms or mechanical room. 

Section 24. Section 2. 4.335 of the UBTC is hereby added to read as follows: 

Sec. 2. 4. 335. — Section R315.3 deleted. 

Section R315. 3 of the International Residential Code is hereby deleted in its entirety. 
Carbon monoxide detectors are not required in existing homes. 

Section 25. Section 2. 4.350 of the UBTC is hereby amended to read as follows: 

Sec. 2. 4.350. — Protection against decay. 

Section R317. 1 of the International Residential Code is amended to read as follows: 
8



R317.1 Location required. Protection from decay shall be provided in the following
locations by the use of naturally durable wood or wood that is preservative treated in
accordance with AWPA U1 for the species, product, preservative and end use. 

Preservatives shall be listed in Section 4 of AWPA Ul. 

Wood joists or the bottom of a wood structural floor when closer than 18 inches

457 mm) or wood girders when closer than 12 inches ( 305 mm) to the exposed

ground in crawl spaces or unexcavated area located within the periphery of the
building foundation. 

2. All wood framing members that rest on concrete or masonry exterior foundation
walls and are less than 6 inches ( 152 mm) from the exposed ground. 

3. Sills and sleepers on a concrete or masonry slab that is in direct contact with the
ground unless separated from such slab by an impervious moisture barrier. 

4. The ends of wood girders entering exterior masonry or concrete walls having
clearances of less than 0. 5 inch ( 12. 7 mm) on tops, sides and ends. 

5. Wood siding, sheathing and wall framing on the exterior of a building having a
clearance of less than 6 inches ( 152 mm) from the ground. 

6. Wood structural members supporting moisture - permeable floors or roofs that are
exposed to the weather, such as concrete or masonry slabs, unless separated from
such floors or roofs by an impervious moisture barrier. 

Section 26. Section 2. 4. 360 — Section R319. 1. 1 deleted ( former title) of the UBTC is

hereby amended to read as follows: 

Sec. 2. 4.360. — Section 8318. 1. 1 deleted. 

Section R318. 1. 1 of the International Residential Code is hereby deleted. 

Section 27. Section 2. 4. 370 — Section R320. 1. 2 deleted ( former title) of the UBTC is

hereby amended to read as follows: 

Sec. 2. 4.370. — Section R318. 1. 2 deleted. 

Section R318. 1. 2 of the International Residential Code is hereby deleted. 

Section 28. Section 2. 4.380 — Section R324 deleted ( former title) of the UBTC is hereby
9



amended to read as follows: 

Sec. 2.4.380. — Section R322 deleted. 

Section R322 of the International Residential Code is hereby deleted. 

Section 29. Section 2. 4. 455 of the UBTC is hereby added to read as follows: 

Sec. 2.4. 455. — Section R405. 1 deleted. 

Section R405. 1 of the International Residential Code is hereby deleted. 

Section 30. Section 2.4.480 — Section R502.2.2 created ( former title) of the UBTC is

hereby amended to read as follows: 

Sec. 2. 4. 480. — Decks. 

Section R507 of the International Residential Code is amended to read as follows: 

R507 Decks. The " City of Wichita Standard for Residential Wood Framed Decks" may be
used to design and construct decks to comply with the requirements of this section. Decks
which fall outside of the scope of the standard will require design by a Kansas licensed
architect or engineer. Where supported by attachment to an exterior wall, decks shall be
positively anchored to the primary structure and designed for both vertical and lateral
loads as applicable. Such attachment shall not be accomplished by the use of toenails or
nails subject to withdrawal. Where positive connection to the primary building structure
cannot be verified during inspection, decks shall be self - supporting. For decks with
cantilevered framing members, connections to exterior walls or other framing members, 
shall be designed and constricted to resist uplift resulting from the full live load specified
in Table R301. 5 acting on the cantilevered portion of the deck. 

Section 31. Section 2.4.490 — Section R506.2. 3 deleted ( former title) of the UBTC is

hereby amended to read as follows: 

Sec. 2. 4. 490. — Section R506.2.2 deleted. 

Section R506.2. 2 of the International Residential Code is hereby deleted. 

Section 32. Section 2.4. 5 10 of the UBTC is hereby amended to read as follows: 

Sec. 2. 4. 510. — Cement, fiber- cement and glass mat gypsum backers. 

H



Section R702.4. 2 of the International Residential Code is amended to read as follows: 

R702.4.2 Cement, fiber- cement or glass mat gypsum backers in compliance with ASTM

C 1288, C 1325 or C 1178 and installed in accordance with manufacturers' 

recommendations shall be used as backers for wall tile in shower areas and wall panels in

shower areas. 

This ordinance shall be included in the Code of the City of Wichita, Kansas, and shall be

effective upon its passage and publication once in the official city paper, but no sooner than July

1, 2015. 

I

PASSED by the governing body, this I day of 2015

0

Sublett, City Clerk

17,01e , Mayor

VC, 



seclron ll xln'11 Lt1a M me UBTC is roman
RdlgaEyyyal] as 19, 1015 DATE ac 141P G.- Of ng MNMtoni

lollowS. Oq--- SKliop gjjl ltd : 1- 1d t fnilimel 8¢51 lel< ca 1 emmdetl 10 reedal
svN, inat. 18 raised floor Man, baron' sCO E PUBLISHED BY

2 R] D.I] G edme, wl'mifabms. Reou OLsT! pr, Can Whldd Ml abpw oessagv ola. M1ae /' h
yfpp(g164HE . ypMEpTip AND MENDING

ETHE
I7yltEWKHITA,

ND
MENKNGADDNG ANDBUILDING arc p,l shall hoe mlamedale rails

cd S.. 1143 mm) amore b tliamelar. R

ormOSQMM wwres

Won guards MOP MI M San .tmd00 withNi fails a Other

YDF THECRVDF WICHli A. kAll$A5: ITH CrrY l` VV H 1 A
OmamenhloapemlMlmulhlrandca led. 

CF
Teds Cosa line • UBTC' 1. n i Euddefioni and bhl: em: a!YOly guards, Me. enil0edaslairweyery

ag4b.WIMV
I

eearled ,Feaoemla: COO', as asMOdmmw 4, 
1 TA w- wigubrcownsslormMayllter

parm.L' led to beo! wcn asrzethat open rl,Nd6inches mM l mass 1idged 6 0 inch 11113 mail bwc. 3012 EdIbO, n herehr aMnlyd w0ea Ih turn ametmmis

cMl7Edll[
ln shertthy Gpemn9s b rapuaN quarts an : ies - 

Ir@Eh$ hadhtonis Of Stair tee05 sraR not allow spMO
rn

CpaaCMa. 

pt_RC s. pNyjp30af tlleuBTC SnereOr emenOM to read as bllowf
I Pa » ibrwOli

svtlionl9seic2i315oimUB' CiS My oxaler' roread e2, fogowc
e' -- 

Ialer iull o+ al Reiaa % "vI COCA SamentlN lO ANC as n' nwsawl who intend, to < MMr,Ic!, ml39e ale, ep , move! U,,-,UI5. Sn. R313. 2dekledherl! en 81117 WIn. WIM'. DrolalmOld INefndll. al Resae!IIialCOdeBSweaY Ulkl¢d in 2,k enlRaM, mRWE Maine, or

RMWIcAwn naMd. Aw. rHr. Cre, ar loerxlnshu, w1. g u', eca - a` 4' t( gal, yq nlecMa G lo' plumn nq mnm pr if came a,, s V wwh to he dwce Sans, A Sacem E A 318 Of 1st UBT CR tgYQU iti glwu ea trx"4w4. 
non

R ptO' ,
N onswe dmciel and Nation: M reNtrd Mythil, Son 1414 - Sec R313 asset" 

SKRQrR3I3AWoMk5reUvr, k4lMZI dooft. lnlwniftmbl Residential CO. i1 herebloaleted In its
4_ lyµ NCn eobml 5( e1WiRd bV toil Cede M5 W. OnEdCall Wilnodl fi... Obt& nlM Yid ynllrQlY. m r]d114meLMk amount of let cerMl h¢,NMertrdtwd by ibe Code DMClei MnRW Sedhoolf 5xoon U.YNOIIMUBTC is WyamQMeehi raatl as tdbwc

y' rnil. edvB N^allrmev¢rrNllaM
COIerfN, napyvon a of the UBTC is haaby Woad to rod a2, follows: Svc lalA- S. 0- aM- ffi* - stnlon Oh. Mann, 

Satli. 2SxItm 2, 4035 bops npuwsv inm bull . 0 aaWU' tnWn. Earlier, 81143 of the lMwMbonal Rea iOOd to smelled to rend as 1pwwi. In IN beowng5% 11. 075- Eamntmtlputp rsdefiiwd Of following; ASdY -Wrol Also ko wn as a Qtly- horse, (was Temh. sE armyThe Interior RIW L. tky, SMO Kai hw[ 101e - Slat smoke aw, d Mall Me inelaNN
bOlbM: 

p- laovIpyi' y11ph tIYRb nlde 01 pdY<InY Bile VWLh WIY -CbGl a,.. 1- pr ther" a M In shell. 
ham IM Son, IN,... m' lams, swT.. 0' IN, Word, !" Id. the oumins fasla 1 LnitLde of 046 SLpel soohne YN IM ITRIQdWIe victory Of IM bedrMU. am Cenen Wl Ml showing aewI spaces an

Male, dgelo, pwrdatmIMll he Cen' tCOM Me 1: 1UC1ure. Airwarm¢tl by IN Met U. lgllntella W( CNis relain' tl lnlM awaiting sOn a l" Mae d the tweqd11161n dWdiaganar N Aid. banmenlsURts with MRjHdyN,. M1 wilWpl anlmervenlno ddorbelweenth
by IM rOOraM'. YeY 6bip (allies, wdhln Ihn dErenther, eN for, nW. nllal Use cry

h. P houses• rya " wr led Irm WIaIM permit rassiOnykMn or pnlnhabletesdtscenl levels, a srnNe all i. W n IM Voila hove) Id Sllfbch M IN 01st t bwa bval ahvda
SIIVLIIIes ' her mewl be ttflN11m of
Mhisseenq spedecaNdS WIIMn INS IYdXiClbn but the bwwhvel is hSS in. awful rYbelowtheuOOorwel

KNOtSKI. 14INof ON UBTC Is Mreby amended in read alloNows Sece. M Sall. 2.4325 of IM UBTCh ebYadderchrindesblbws: 
Sec UTA- Eandm MIS is Mend. 
5e . I SKIOO 14135 of lie UBTC is henry, adtled b read es bays. 

sec 2.4135, - WKCNaaclimk

R) i4 ImerconrecMd Wnea maw oM snroka awrm % revved ro b installed wlkn an iMlvwlu
See143t • The'- NO Four -hmblr DvvthM
K. R30211 Of ON shorTaltmal ResldenllOCoda is haWY addd W read s2, follow, dwelfiM Unlit lo mna With S. Nn 43, Ieelarm Grim mil be wlammwtled In slch a roamer IN

DwOf1 Uahm Wee -hand bur -earNy dwern Shat W sPnaralW harm wd Whes, by a wall having Mt was the xlUdind d hnealann win E& y. le al the ahrms In IN wdividlial lade. Phvsiral inlamnneclbn Of Slndk
tome Mo-Wa Pse- rwstarcs retire. Fee- rwshnca -reNO awlIMAN and - U asSemdbs slue extend to ehaN Ntbe reoWretl riot' weal slams ere inclalhO L an Kim, stared m Wlvalbn Olt One alvn
at WINIIaNVnl meslerm wMl, ad wdassembWS Srutl eslm0lmmthe bvrtalion to the underMAe of TMShrmshWWd¢arhalaanewal p OYabadyvu Mod evess " Oh " banrvealM dMrsdPSW
IM roof Neat" 
TMmolt Na/ W a llvmwm d class [ rmtcoverbq. alt One rot dmklrw a5haastdrg is d narcdn tiM Sxlan 31 Seceim 2. 4X] 2 d IM UBTC is eWad breed N Whew, - 

Mhhave M aW.vw bra- rNarNnl -VNted WWd 4a a miry = dhl' Me of his feel from IN emlw of IN sec, Um- Caebll el Dxp alVm[ 

wait There sal be M penetration, IaroUgh this arse of lh molt catch a$Malhly, R315. 1 Carom mwNxide ahem, of the In ft Reveal Reslohntlt Cods IS ammNd to read Nltnborn
EeRpllOa Mae dWldiMS. or Mdflns therNlt, are Mranged above a below Witivinl unlIs, an submNa R3 IS I Carbon mOM+ae abrms. Fa all analrucII., mapproved cartmmmetitt awem sal be lntlalb
salnkler' roam shall W amted MrougMul ell fait. in dweNM units within wind tai -fired lanes are MMW old In dweaft mil, thal have eltachedSadbn 4 all. Ulm a the UBTC 4 ww adad is reed N bRnwe garages w IM bawlM Malnm: 
ec 1ll IL - DsalM Ihal' Won

Sawn Rm25.1 Of Me blemallanM Residential COME Is amended In law al bawi: 1. OUnf Odd Mveowg room in the inigh, Ialavld 4iy of the be6'oaN. 

RL125. 1 DAmfM prP,Wft ONMIMfrom a WhaleMM" s, Mnctl We armm UMW Or sleedM W' DOM 20n eadedilbnMslarvdlM tivw ObaSanen% b let trrmedlne Odal OF IN laahaomsa

pools Ml W OMMOReO. DIM hNnegs Mlwam IN straps arof restea. shoe We POW with Sdt wend mahaWmom

Oran MI hN than 12 / 3 ( that135mm1 in thirkMN, sdid Q, MMymmE- cwesleel doors not kN than 1311 Stem 24 SecIw UNS M IM UBTC Is rate added to recall N,U. 
blow ( IS mw) thick, a 2 dddrhdf fi,- a1W doe, 
Section 7. Sttfbn 24160 of we UBTC h Wa aMllttad W readNboor, sac U= - Sed1m 971517 dh

Sec Ul6R - stak" y NurrtleahR - When R3151 of IM Interawasel RoScat 1. 1 CO0e is MfNV del b] hmlrelY. Carbon moculd, Oledp
Section Rml7 of IN l WNtime RWd- IW Cady is amwtM to read as heave, are Ml rNufd In attMp Maio. 
R3d275f, OlNdr, wrwm Al lnhrbr ad aderear sherval SM/ W Provided with meets to lPVlllMle the Setion a Secflan 2A. 300 MI flat UBTC is lebYBfnme WIW" b . 

stairwayWe. L Section 241N - RalN , KOOM( Mma iliac of Ina URIC Ur Onhd a, blow, for0.]A77. IPM Imlle

lnlaMMawld
Rest I[ oMls Mimdedtoread asbaws: 

Set Ulm- Reserve/ 
Wall 9.$ adim 14M Of Ina UBTC Is M W added b read at WANG R317. I Location raccored. Prolnefflow AM dission SMI to Oroylded In ON Renewed M lI Wlhe use d
W"" L - MWw MMyn durable weed m ww Metlsp Marveling thesed In ,. ma will AWPA IN M nasvtof

Section R31121 d the lld. I M Raidmlul Code hatredad to reed as flaw, adpd, Preservalw ad end use all Once has noon b Sec91. 4 of AWPA UI. 
R] b,21 Mawne. WIhOOw wen dui be dNhned M a. er dretnage by mnnMwp lO IM.. hitMbat01M

bySxfM RILS. labv enapproved altemaMemelhd. lfwO61111bUW' Ibn I. Mod IMMOVIINWlOmplawaod sit aMflpar when dew MmlBbdN (1Ammlawdae ghttn
dreWOe mom reWiaad
drNllage system hN item Wlnlletl, IM mllaewWow wet area SnapMwe mlMmumdmin ollY dwsNM when of most 121ndu,( m5 ran) eXPMad wMlM beat macaw ulerossatN One 1pWed

grata st MEM rod hbw' the fora eve. 
Eaeallae AEndepe Meth, la wblMw wen h not rwulred whin IN louedalldn k. wwlFdaaload sego

wltwn the marisWry d the bl", M

2M wend hsmlMm Wrs HIM rest thancraves a masonry Ntaflf wmttlM wale eat the Ross Intl
sed. ft* rrjz" SOOsaacaroft ltd the US, SoChNifidtton Stem, Group l Son. a wised b Table IMei (152 mm) from let espied

I. SeCTan 11 Sedim Ulm of le UBTC Is Maly emmdad to net as babw, 15th wed ehepenmatblareleame ads lMth in direct M IW with Me ndavd units s faWar

Sec UM - lNtbg3 a dean
Stun R31111 of IM lderMlimal RNtanlaal Cede h amelted to read N follow, 

slab sob to m imervldru mdMae
TM ends of wood 9lyden emedM eK a masol a mlaele wage having clearances d last flue 03A

R3I111 FbaMewhoce Or Me fin fdred earns doors. The hear aledln9al lheasaaM door Nail Mt W- a 727 mm) m wry, MdN and aid, 

INn IS " as IN mm) bond Iran the lop of MW thaaMt. The laadlm 5Mp be senMMed to have a s not to 5. Wwd Mdirs, shealhlM ad Well hs onth' Nkrbr d a Wibbw ROHM a d. rma Bless than 6 ill
aCnd Ln. 1 veMOM in 12 hail, Withal (2- poicast 1152 mm) horn the shooed. 

Ea[ eM101n: TN ealaM IaIMM at m'+ laiw doorway shall Of W rare Ian B ( 203 mm) inrhes below the 1. d IM A Wood Orscaral members suand l piste- Dermwahe loon a roofs that as yeoasM b Me weak
IalVnlp, NpwNb that the cm, OdEv than an eituKK Slam a wremNor, does.. Ivy, wv IN want. on as Smcrdo Q, masonry 5wll. SeparalM bran shod door, a redo by as hMerVbus mean

Swim It. seen. 14M et IN UBTC Is herd, etlded to read as follows ba( riw, 

Sec UM- Fame tlwalloNMatnbryinr doom Sid. 2L Section 24M - Sanded, R311 i da IM IMma am) Of the UBTC is Mdy amaaed 10 read
dM R31132 of the Intarnalioml Reswenllal Coo. hamanded to reed Is f0awp. 

foaows. 
R] II.IS FIOa MewlMd la plha'+ lavaooS.Maaofn" 11Mnlhe rmui, w press Only shall he provthN
anal ImMNS a fleas . 1 ., a in. a inches WWw toe his of Ina Mreddd: Saelanl -SMbn R51LI. 1 dekhl

Eandiwe Section R311. 1. 1 of Me MhmatiOMIR IhlCdln MthYMeld. 

AlamtM, I mlrmubed w Ef. O irww,. fflapr fewer rivers % bcatd. they five tta, awidetl the hoar Sxfi. 17. 5eclion24m- 5edim 0.]A( badlMlmr11I01d M ¢UBTCIShadYSmeMedloreaA as wry
Man MI swi, ON, bee Melrway La. 143M - Sad. R11L11dtlele6
ad. 11 Swim 1410 d the UBTC h Mrebv amwdW to red as wnhws: 

seeUlla. - strar nelMK Sxllon R311rw2 lnferWI. R4Slam R111. 75. I d Ina lhishowew ReMMnilw COME is amended to reed as blow, Smhon IL $eclbn 1. 4m0 - SMim Rmd

OM
HdyMwdN) Metedkld( IamttllllelMind UBTC %MrWVamended to read NloN

Rho Ml w, TM m odium rlsa bawl NW be B DIB mm) Sides. The that Shan W rcwamred yerlialy pas, 14180.- Sedbn8322 Cehlel
b . nt.", wandlM aMecml Inds. The ordialrlsw Mbnlwilllnem NOM Of sldeisssil Mtesewed Wind R332o1 IN inerrmadml Resda I Cade bnaeMdeleted
she SnWliNl be rraeM. LtiMA (9. 5 mm1. 
S' Cit4eitWkn142%ottUUBTCh WrebYalwidellaredasfobws, 

Aston"., KRm UaS5ojNU8TCi Order added wreadas ltMbw, 

Nc3A1R- iraadttplh SK. 2453 - Section R40LI 1h@hd

Seat Rill 7. 52 and 83.11. 7. 5.2. t of IM International RdMkwMI COME doe a mM to read as News: Scott. R405. 1 d the blermfioml Rasa IWCWehb. r Nd 2,h
81( 1717 Treed depth TM minimum ahead fth NW W 91MnN ( n&6 irl The these depth shall be Section A Sol 1. 4480 - Section Rm22 ruln, UMMM, 11%) of IM UBTC Is Mehl ar dad to read asltd

M nsrhdi Wlwean the verlkal Mann of IN hrda t aaxlion of Maw, leads am at a nghl
4ablo Me tns(I leading The deeb Right of Slain sha0 rot OenM IN, lka1 SE, Used - DALMgt, " Iest bead within any

maelMn we tMn( 93 mm) Section RS) 7 of to Information Revide ICdels. m WlareMasfl : 

IWiWatnO dreWar heads. Made add " War beds Mull have a mbdmum land depth of 9Incas R5$7 DKh, TM- aty of MIMI St. o far ReW. IW Wod FranW Dock,' troy W USM to desbn
11Bb mail roamed aS' boor M a pond 12 codes ( 305 mm) from the sine where the treads are narrows1Yltar m0

cattrtat dedS to MHO, Men IM rV rehers; o1 INS sects.. Dec" which lad oufste of IM scope o
b, ellathmmlUrWO leads Nan Lava a mMimum (read di of 6 inches', 152 rmm) a7 my Willi. Within any

dnh let IM standard wdI ndol deelso by a Kart taped srtbiled a engineer Ware swerfedhmal wider a Grows, tread deposit IN 12 - i1 Je ( 305 mm; walk Gee shall MI noted
Wmare( ban31s, in

minor wait dxii shall W mosli eN dsHW w IM abnary shvdwe at 09MgnW M both valld

195 m; it, Stairways lama leas) d Ma UBTC ls Aaeby amended to read as highs, lateral beds as toothache. Sladsalla nlynll MlWxmmdisAM by lee ... f lemal %aneth - bit
IM aMal W wedged duals its. 1leserv' d

11. Lean 142N of IN USTCis hardy ameded to red a1 follOWS: 
withdrawal. Mere msillw CCMMIm

oaths Nan be S¢ IhsuPpabpp. For OAK MamNY WIwVh SVUUUrwWilh caobidyred hsminq memher ,, cmlaMnib" UH01fid If. or other frarNM metrben, 5ball to of nto ad C. SVUCharl to resist uoll" Whol Iran IN
Rm178JOf IM nlamlional ResteWal Code 1, ammled b read as fdww, 

waMl. lta y. 4. gn, SmiMdtn Table Rml. S CIre do In, C wWaed carbon of the dale. 
meesurd"" IctnV, fora era LPGd Vldl,e adloining lh < ir¢fid p4s p9, eswlag olremvsbce, pall be not k551han] 1 rcMSIB6a mail end M: more than minds, l96S mmL 5xIm 31. Wifim 2490 - Sedmn R506. Mod Owithwafel of IN UBTC I, Macy amhodal loan as ltd

a' msae, IaMUia
SK, Wit. - Seestpn RSYa. iUehhl

Madm9 ad" " it Me aNwed Ova the Owes, trendNItMS Pf WMagL
SKOME 119061.20 IM InferaMi. 1 Ress MiM Code is RMKY dale,.. 

anu,N lP prhvtde Cdhni trandtpn belwe0nrY9m5, 11NSiboM at
halr. vlOn hen haMl the at

55cb. 31 Section 21510 of IN UBTC' alameded to read N taw, 
1. guardrail, or user at the Marl o s night, mndmiiWight

NM M Oerhi to E., d ire height
504 E. 1S10.- Cammt, f4a c' meN hit, meat YY05anhad.'eli

maatmum

Ige hp G the UBTC nberebv emeMedlo reed as idbwi: SIRd 0.70242 of the lntemallorwl Res nital Cott% ammttd to rest asWhe, 
1' RMA 2 Cemml, fiber- cemenl or qb I gypsum backers in cmlw in. wtM ASTIR C 1216, L pit


