BID OPENING MARCH 3, 2020

1. PERSONAL PROTECTIVE EQUIPMENT (PPE) ACCESSORIES -- FIRE DISTRICT #1

FUNDING -- FIRE DISTRICT #1
(Request sent to 43 vendors)

RFB #20-0018

1st Due Emergency Response
Solutions LLC dba 1st Due

Danko Emergency Equipment

No Bid

Personal Protective Equipment (PPE) Accessories Unit Costs Unit Costs

Boots:

Globe 14" Boots #1201400-050M, all sizes No Bid No Bid

Honeywell 1411 Pro Nighthawk 5555, all sizes No Bid $389.20

Hoods:

PGI BarriAire Gold - Particulate No Bid $80.80

Fire Dex H41 Interceptor - Particulate $99.00 $121.18

Helmets

Bullard Helmets with 4" Face Shield # UST6F, all colors No Bid $269.16

Bullard 4" PPC, Hard Coated Face Shield # R330 No Bid $62.75

Bullard LTX - Blue with 4" Face Shield No Bid $185.26

Gloves

Fire Dex, Dex- Pro Leather Glove # G2L, all sizes $73.95 $87.50
Mieko Giblin dba Jerry Municipal Emergency Services
Ingram/Fire & Rescue (MES)

Personal Protective Equipment (PPE) Accessories Unit Costs Unit Costs

Boots:

Globe 14" Boots #1201400-050M, all sizes No Bid No Bid

Honeywell 1411 Pro Nighthawk 5555, all sizes $423.00 $330.00

Hoods:

PGI BarriAire Gold - Particulate $99.00 No Bid

Fire Dex H41 Interceptor - Particulate $125.00 $108.00

Helmets

Bullard Helmets with 4" Face Shield # UST6F, all colors $285.00 $253.00

Bullard 4" PPC, Hard Coated Face Shield # R330 $66.50 $58.00

Bullard LTX - Blue with 4" Face Shield $199.00 $173.00

Gloves

Fire Dex, Dex- Pro Leather Glove # G2L, all sizes $84.95 $80.00

Kansas Fire Equipment Co. Lafe T. Williams

LifeSaver Learning, Inc.

Northern Safety & Industrial

Shoe Corporation of Birmingham, Inc.
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