BoCC Approved April 1, 2020

6. PICK-UP, TRANSPORTATION, AND DISPOSAL OF HAZARDOUS WASTE -- ENVIRONMENTAL RESOURCES
FUNDING -- ENVIRONMENTAL RESOURCES

(Request sent to 22 vendors)

RFP #20-0006 Contract

Clean Harbors Heritage Stericycle Tradebe
Item |Description Environmental Services, Hazmat, Inc. Environmental Environmental Environmental
Inc. Services Solutions, Inc. Services, LLC
1 [Aerosols (55 gal) $186.00 $175.00 $165.00 $140.00 $216.00
2 |Aerosols (Cu Yd. Bx.) $466.00 $650.00 $495.00 $452.27 $650.00
3 |Freon (55 gal) $254.25 $175.00 $450.00 $151.16 $80.00
4 |Lab packs (5 gal)* $122.85 $75.00 $135.00 $220.00 $107.00
5 |Lab packs (15 gal)* $211.00 $125.00 $175.00 $315.00 $200.00
6 |Bulk flammable liquids (55 gal) $67.20 $80.00 $65.00 $65.00 $78.00
7 |Off spec solids 12" or below (55 gal) $96.00 $150.00 $105.00 $72.00 $127.00
8 |Off spec solids 13" - 24" (55 gal) $112.00 $175.00 $105.00 $110.23 $146.00
9 |Off spec solids 25" - 36" (55 gal) $112.00 $350.00 $125.00 $130.83 $174.00
10 |Loose pack flammable (55 gal) $168.00 $225.00 $165.00 $168.95 $216.00
11 |Loose pack flammable (Cu Yd. Bx.) $529.20 $700.00 $495.00 $453.30 $580.00
12 [Mixed LP liquid poison (55 gal) $217.19 $225.00 $220.00 $340.00 $456.00
13 |Mixed LP liquid poison (Cu Yd. Bx.) $635.00 $700.00 $625.00 No Bid $910.00
14 [Mixed LP solid poison (55 gal) $217.19 $225.00 $220.00 $265.37 $456.00
15 [Mixed LP solid poison (Cu Yd. Bx.) $635.00 $700.00 $625.00 $620.95 $910.00
16 |Mixed acids loose pack (55 gal) $197.00 $275.00 $220.00 $194.69 $266.00
17 |Bases loose pack (55 gal) $197.00 $275.00 $220.00 $198.81 $256.00
18 [Oxidizers (5 gal) $83.00 $150.00 $85.00 $188.57 $119.00
19 [Oxidizers (15 gal) $118.00 $225.00 $165.00 $268.76 $207.00
20 [Oxidizers (55 gal) $206.85 $550.00 $350.00 $340.00 $482.00
21 |Elemental mercury (5 gal) $26.00/1b, $639.00 min $275.00 $70.00/1bs. $220.00 $279.00
22 | Thermostats/thermometers ( 5 gal) $6.80/1b, $431.00 min $175.00 $11.00/1bs. $220.00 $279.00
23 |Mercury debris (5 gal) $6.80/1b, $431.00 min $125.00 $11.00/1bs. $220.00 $279.00
24 |Mercury compounds (5 gal) $6.80/1b, $431.00 min $175.00 $786.00 $220.00 $79.00
25 [Latex paint loose pack (20 Cu Yd. roll-off) $445.00/1b, $2,343.00 min $1,500.00 $2,100.00 $8,432.00 $3,523.00
26 |Fluorescents (per linear ft.) $0.16/ft, $62.00 min $0.25 $0.17 $0.15 $0.39
27 [Fluorescents (per 4-foot box) $62.00 $18.00 $65.00 $33.60 $24.00
28 [Fluorescents (per 8-foot box) $62.00 $18.00 $65.00 $45.60 $29.00
29 |Crushed fluorescent bulbs (55 gal) $208.00 $275.00 $595.00 $335.59 $333.00
30 [HID bulbs (per pound) $4.85/1b, $62.00 min $7.50 $2.95 $2.09 $3.01
31 |Compact bulbs (Cu Yd. Bx.) $4.72/1b, $62.00 min $350.00 $0.66/bulb $435.00 $335.00
32 |PCB ballasts and/or capacitors (55 gal) $443.00 $450.00 $595.00 $685.00 $261.00
33 |Flammable solids (rags, booms, etc.) (55 gal) $163.00 $275.00 $145.00 $257.50 $166.00
34 |Bulk acid (55 gal) $242.00 $275.00 $165.00 $340.00 $153.00
35 [Bulk bases (55 gal) $208.00 $275.00 $165.00 $340.00 $153.00
36 |Bulk pesticide solid (55 gal) $163.00 $325.00 $240.00 $265.37 $456.00
37 |Bulk pesticide solid (Cu Yd. Bx.) $163.00 $650.00 $695.00 $620.95 $910.00
38 |Bulk pesticide liquid (55 gal ) $242.00 $325.00 $240.00 $340.00 $471.00
39 |Bulk pesticide liquid (Cu Yd. Bx.) $743.00 $650.00 No Bid No Bid $835.00
40  [Medications (55 gal) $242.00 $350.00 $250.00 $230.00 $206.00
41 [DOT box w/pallet and 6 mil liner: Cu Yd. Bx. $98.00 $85.00 $75.00 $65.00 $131.00
42 | Additional 6 mil liner for Cu Yd. Bx. $11.70 $25.00 $15.00 $11.00 $25.00
43 |Labor-Field Chemist (per hour) @ Facility $50.00 $75.00 $50.00 $51.00 $50.00
44 |Labor-Technician (per hour) @ Facility $45.00 $65.00 $42.00 $45.00 $45.00
45 [Transportation from HHW Facility $692.00 $650.00 $800.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00
REMOTES
46 |Labor-Field Chemist (per hour) $50.00 $75.00 $50.00 $51.00 $50.00
47 |Labor-Technician (per hour) $45.00 $65.00 $42.00 $45.00 $45.00
48 |Transportation (per mile) N/A $3.00 $2.40 $3.03 $2.75
49 |Disposal See Above $500.00 See Above See Above Prlceq above as
Unit Rates
50 |Set-up $799.00 $2,500.00 $795.00 $5,522.00 $2,275.00

No Bid

Safety Kleen, Inc.

Waste Connections of Kansas

On behalf of Environmental Resources, recommend to accept the overall low proposal from Clean Harbors Environmental Services, Inc. and establish contract
pricing for one (1) year with three (3) one (1) year options to renew.

A committee comprised of Susan Erlenwein - Environmental Resources; Charles Gunter and Cody Corbett - Household Hazardous Waste; Lela Sturchio - Accounts
Payable; and Britt Rosencutter - Purchasing evaluated all proposals received based on the criteria set forth in the RFP and unanimously chose Clean Harbors
Environmental Services, Inc.

Notes:
*Packing Group 1 or chemicals that can only be stored with like products.

For 2019, approximate waste shipped was 1,261,138 pounds and approximate spend was $354,000.00.
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