BoCC APPROVED APRIL 1, 2020

SEDGWICK COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT #1
ITEM REQUIRING BOCC APPROVAL
(2 ITEMS)

1. PERSONAL PROTECTIVE EQUIPMENT (PPE) ACCESSORIES -- SEDGWICK COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT #1

FUNDING -- SEDGWICK COUNTY FIRE DISTRICT #1
(Request sent to 43 vendors)

RFB #20-0018 Contract

1st Due Emergency Response

Danko Emergency

Solutions LLC dba 1st Due Equipment
Personal Protective Equipment (PPE) Accessories Unit Costs Unit Costs
Boots:
Globe 14" Boots #1201400-050M, all sizes, per pair No Bid No Bid
Honeywell 1411 Pro Nighthawk 5555, all sizes, per pair No Bid $389.20
Hoods:
PGI BarriAire Gold - Particulate, per each No Bid $80.80
Fire Dex H41 Interceptor - Particulate, per each $99.00 $121.18
Helmets
Bullard Helmets with 4" Face Shield # USTG6F, all colors, per each No Bid $269.16
Bullard 4" PPC, Hard Coated Face Shield # R330, per each No Bid $62.75
Bullard LTX - Blue with 4" Face Shield, per each No Bid $185.26
Gloves
Fire Dex, Dex- Pro Leather Glove # G2L, all sizes, per pair $73.95 $87.50

Mieko Giblin dba Jerry Municipal Emergency
Ingram/Fire & Rescue Services (MES)

Personal Protective Equipment (PPE) Accessories Unit Costs Unit Costs
Boots:
Globe 14" Boots #1201400-050M, all sizes, per pair No Bid No Bid
Honeywell 1411 Pro Nighthawk 5555, all sizes, per pair $423.00 $330.00
Hoods:
PGI BarriAire Gold - Particulate, per each $99.00 No Bid
Fire Dex H41 Interceptor - Particulate, per each $125.00 $108.00
Helmets
Bullard Helmets with 4" Face Shield # USTG6F, all colors, per each $285.00 $253.00
Bullard 4" PPC, Hard Coated Face Shield # R330, per each $66.50 $58.00
Bullard LTX - Blue with 4" Face Shield, per each $199.00 $173.00
Gloves
Fire Dex, Dex- Pro Leather Glove # G2L, all sizes, per pair $84.95 $80.00

No Bid

Kansas Fire Equipment Co.

Lafe T. Williams

LifeSaver Learning, Inc.

Northern Safety & Industrial

Shoe Corporation of Birmingham, Inc.

On behalf of Sedgwick County Fire District #1, recommend to accept the low bids from 1st Due Emergency Response Solutions
LLC dba 1st Due, Danko Emergency Equipment, and Municipal Emergency Services (MES) for the rates listed above to
establish contract pricing for two (2) years with two (2) one (1) year options to renew.

The personal protective equipment (PPE) for this bid contract includes the following structural firefighting accessories: structural
protective boots, gloves, helmets, and hoods. These items are designed to be worn in conjunction with structural firefighting coat and
pants to provide firefighters with the maximum protection against heat and particulates per NFPA 1971 standards. These items are in
constant need of replacement during the course of a firefighter’s career due to normal wear and tear and useful life expectancy of the

PPE.

Note:

Sedgwick County Fire District #1 has worked with each of these vendors in the past and they continue to provide our organization with
the most current safety equipment to keep our firefighters as safe as possible.

The annual expected cost of these replacement PPE accessories is between $39,000.00-$50,000.00.
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